
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

1 All Electric Powered, Plug-in, 4-Door Sedan: 19

Price Each: $28,988.00 No Bid No Bid $30,686.75 $30,268.58 $30,149.00 $28,999.00

Price Total: $550,772.00   $583,048.25 $575,103.02 $572,831.00 $550,981.00

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 5.86% 4.42%

Price Differential: $32,276.25 $24,331.02

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2021 Chevrolet Bolt EV 

1FB48

  2021 Chevrolet  Bolt LT 

1FB48

2021 Nissan Leafs 

17019 (Execption 40 KW 

Port Portable Quick 

Charger Only)

2020 Nissan Leaf 2021 Chevy Bolt

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine Offered 

(Include SAE Net HP):

Electric Drive Unit (200 

hp 2 266# Torque) 

(150KW 360W-r

  GM electric - ENO - HP 

200

Nissan Electric SAE HP 

147

Leaf S 40 KwH Not Provided

Transmission Offered: Electric Drive Unit MMF  Automatic 1 Automatic 1 Spd Automatic Electric Drive 200 HP

Warranty: 3 yr/36K Bumper To 

Bumper, 8 yr/100,000, 

Hybrid/Electric 

Component Warranty

  3 yr or 36000K BTB, 5 yr 

or 100,000 Drivetrain 

Hybrid + Ele Com 

100,000K

3yr or 36K BTB, 5 yr 

60,000K Powertrain

36 mo 36,000 mile B2B, 

60 mo 60,000 Powert. 96 

mo 100,000 miles 

Batteries

3 yr/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 5 yr 100,000 

Powertrain

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Gunn  Chev   Gunn Chevrolet LTD Gunn Nissan Any New Nissan Dealer Local Dealer

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 16550 I35 North,             

Selma TX 78154

 16550 I35 North,             

Selma TX 78154

750 NE Loop 410, San 

Antonio, Texas 78209

Not Provided Local Dealer

Delivery 150 Days   120 Days 120 Days 120 Days 90-120 Days

Production Cut-off date: August 30, 2021   6/21 6/2021 12-15-20 10-1-21

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date: June 30, 2021   6/21 6/2021 11-15-20 10-1-21

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes  Not Provided Not Provided No No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

2 Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan: 7

Price Each: No Bid $26,998.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Total:  $188,986.00      

Year, Make & Model Offered:  2021 Toyota Camry LE 

Hybrid

     

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):  Toyota Camry 2.5L 4 

Cyl, 208 HP

     

Transmission Offered:  Electronic Variable      

Warranty:  3 yr/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 8 yr 80,000 

Powertrain

     

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:  Local Dealer      

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:  Local Dealer      

Delivery:  90-120 Days      

Production Cut-off date:  10-1-21      

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:  10-1-21      

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:  No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

3 1 Ton - 4 Door 4x2 Diesel Long Bed Truck – Dual Rear Wheel 

(DRW): 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid $43,043.00 $45,554.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Total:   $43,043.00 $45,554.50    

Year, Make & Model Offered:   2021 Ram 3500, Crew 

Cab, 4X2

2021 Chevrolet 3500 

Crew Cab 2WD 

CC30943

   

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):   6.7 L I6 Cummins Turbo 

Diesel, 360 HP

GM Diesel L5P SAE 

HP445 6.6L Turbo Charg

   

Transmission Offered:   6 Spd Auto 68RFE Allison 10 Spd    

Warranty:

 

  3 Year/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 5Yr/100,000 

Powertrain

3yr or 36000K BTB, 5yr 

or 100,000K Powe Train

   

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:   Ancira Chrysler Jeep & 

Dodge

Gunn Chevrolet LTD    

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:   10807 IH-10 West, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

16550 I35 North,             

Selma TX 78154

   

Delivery:   150-200 Days 120 Days    

Production Cut-off date:   5/30/2021 5/21    

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:   5/15/2021 5/21    

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:  Yes Not Provided

3/9



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

4 1 Ton - 4 Door 4x4 Diesel Long Bed Truck – Dual Rear Wheel 

(DRW): 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid $42,752.00 $45,709.50 No Bid $44,806.00 No Bid

Price Total:   $42,752.00 $45,709.50  $44,806.00  

Year, Make & Model Offered:   2021Ram 3500 Crew 

Cab 4X4

2021 Chevrolet 3500 

Crew Cab 4WD 

CK30943

 2021 Ford F350  

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):   6.7 L I6 Cummins Turbo 

Diesel, 360 HP

GM Diesel L5P 6.6L 

Turbo Charge SAE HP 

445

 F350 DRW Crew Cab 

4x4 XL 475

 

Transmission Offered:   6 Spd Auto 68RFE Allison  10  Sp Auto  

Warranty:   3 Year/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 5Yr/100,000 

Powertrain

3yr or 36000K BTB, 5yr 

or 100,000K Powe Train

 36 mo 36,000 miles B2B 

5 yr 60,000 powert.

 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:   Ancira Chrysler Jeep & 

Dodge

Gunn Chevrolet LTD  Any New Ford Dealer  

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:   10807 IH-10 West, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

16550 I35 North,             

Selma TX 78154

 Not Provided  

Delivery:   150-200 Days 120 Days  120 Days  

Production Cut-off date:   5/30/2021 5/21  Unknown at this date  

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:   5/15/2021 5/21  Unknown                 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:   Yes No No  
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

5 1 Ton Regular Cab Diesel Truck - Dual Rear Wheel (DRW) with 

Traffic Utility Storage: 2

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $56,985.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Total:    $113,971.00    

Year, Make & Model Offered:    2021 Chevrolet 84" Reg 

Cab Chassis

   

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):    GM Diesel L5P ^.6L 

Turbo Charge HP 445

   

Transmission Offered:    Allison 10 Spd    

Warranty:    3yr or 36,000K BTB and 

5yr or 100,000K 

Powertrain

   

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:    Gunn Chevrolet LTD    

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:    16550 IH 35 N, Selma, 

Texas 78154

   

 Traffic Utility Bed and Front Bumper Pole Pull Offered: Utec Bed Divesified PPF-

203
Traffic Utility Bed and Front Bumper Pole Pull Warranty: 3 Yr Bed, 1 Yr on Pole 

Pull
Delivery: 120 Days

Production Cut-off date: 5/21

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:    5/21    

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:    No    
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

6 1 Ton Regular Cab Diesel - Dual Rear Wheel (DRW), 15’ Stake 

Bed w/Lift Gate: 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid $53,319.00 $61,080.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Total:   $53,319.00 $61,080.50    

Year, Make & Model Offered:   2021 Ram 5500 Reg 

Cab 4X4, 120 CA

2021 Chevrolet MD 

CC5403 120" CA 

   

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):   6.7 L I6 Cummins Turbo 

Diesel, 360 HP

Duramax L5D 6.6L 

Diesel V8

   

Transmission Offered:   6 Spd Auto Aisin 

AS69RC

Allison A1700RDS 6 Spd    

Warranty:   3 Year/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 5Yr/100,000 

Powertrain

3yr or 36,000K BTB and 

5yr or 100,000K 

Powertrain

   

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:   Ancira Chrysler Jeep & 

Dodge

Gunn Chevrolet LTD    

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:   10807 IH-10 West, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

16550 IH 35 N, Selma, 

Texas 78154

   

Stake Bed and Lift Gate Offered: Axton Platform Bed and 

Stakes with Tommy Gate

UTEC Bed, Tommy Gate

Stake Bed and Lift Gate Warranty: 3 Years on Platform and 

2 Years on the Lift Gate

Utec, Lift Gate 3 yrs

Delivery:   150-200 Days 120 Days    

Production Cut-off date:   5/30/2021 6/21    

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:   5/15/2021 6/21    

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

7 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick Up, Long Bed, Single Rear Wheel 

(SRW), Gray, Blue or Black in Color: 1

Price Each:  No Bid No Bid $34,659.00 $30,025.50 No Bid $30,688.00 No Bid

Price Total:   $34,659.00 $30,025.50  $30,688.00  

Year, Make & Model Offered:    2021 Ram 3500 Crew 

Cab 4X2 Big Horn

2021 Chevrolet 3500 

Double Cab Gas 2WD 

CC30953

 2021 Ford F350  

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):   6.4 L V8 Hemi MDS GM6.6L V8 Gas, 401 HP  F350 Super Cab SRW 

164" Bed SRX 385 HP.

 

Transmission Offered:   8 Spd Auto 8HP75-LCV MYD 6 Spd Automatic 

HD

 6 Sp. Auto  

Warranty:   3 Year/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 5Yr/100,000 

Powertrain

3yr or 36,000K, 5yr or 

100,000K Powertrain

 36 mo 36,000 miles B2B 

5 yr 60,000 powert.

 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:   Ancira Chrysler Jeep & 

Dodge

Gunn Chevrolet LTD  Any New Ford Dealer  

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:   10807 IH-10 West, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

16550 IH 35 N, Selma, 

Texas 78154

 Not Provided  

Delivery:   150-200 Days 120 Days  120 Days  

Production Cut-off date:   5/30/2021 6/21  Unknown  

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:   5/15/2021 6/21  Unknown                 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:   

Yes No 

No  
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

8 1 Ton Single Cab Pick Up, Long Bed, Single Rear Wheel 

(SRW): 2

Price Each: No Bid No Bid $36,336.00 $37,728.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Total:   $72,672.00 $75,457.00    

Year, Make & Model Offered:   2021 Ram 3500 Reg 

Cab 4X2

2021 Chevrolet 1 Ton 

Reg cab CC30903

   

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):   6.7 L I6 Cummins Turbo 

Diesel, 360 HP

Duramax 6.6L Turbo 

Diesel V8 445 HP

   

Transmission Offered:   6 Spd Auto 68RFE MGM Allison 10 Spd    

Warranty:   3 Year/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 5Yr/100,000 

Powertrain

3 yr or 36000K BTB, 5 yr 

or 100,000K Power Train 

   

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:   Ancira Chrysler Jeep & 

Dodge

Gunn Chevrolet LTD    

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:   10807 IH-10 West, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

16550 I35 North,             

Selma TX 78154

   

Delivery:   150-200 Days 120 Days    

Production Cut-off date:   5/30/2021 6/21    

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:   5/15/2021 6/21    

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:  Yes No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020

For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

Caldwell Country 

Chevrolet

Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet

6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 

Expy

2152 N Wheeler

Item Description  Quantity

Caldwell,                            

TX 77836                         

979-567-6116

Silsbee,                                     

TX 77656                          

409-880-9191

San Antonio, 

TX 78230                      

210-558-2627

Selma,

TX 78154                     

210-599-5000  

San Antonio,

TX 78209    

San Angelo,       

TX 76901

Jasper,           

TX 75951

9 7 Passenger Mini Van: 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid $24,916.00 No Bid No Bid $25,278.00 No Bid

Price Total:   $24,916.00   $25,278.00  

Additional Price for Color:  $200.00 $0.00  

Year, Make & Model Offered:   2021 Chrysler Voyager   2021, Ford Transit 

Connect 7 Pass

 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):   3.6L V6 24 V VVT 

W/ESS

  Tranit Connect XL Long 

Wheel Base 162 HP

 

Transmission Offered:   9 Spd 948TE Auto   8 Sp Auto  

Warranty:   3 Year/36,000 Bumper to 

Bumper, 5Yr/100,000 

Powertrain

  36 mo 36,000 miles B2B 

5 yr 60,000 powert.

 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:   Ancira Chrysler Jeep & 

Dodge

  Any New Ford Dealer  

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:   10807 IH-10 West, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

  Not Provided  

Delivery:   150-200 Days   155 Days  

Production Cut-off date:   5/30/2021   2-21  

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:   5/15/2021   Unknown                 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:   Yes No  

10 DELETED: 1

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

 
Total: $550,772.00 $188,986.00 $271,561.00 $954,846.25 $575,103.02 $673,603.00 $550,981.00
Total Award: $550,772.00 $188,986.00 $236,902.00 $143,996.50

9/9


