City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(’
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 IL 60131
Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Regulatory [Prefabricated
Sians Sian Tvoes
1 R1-1 30"X30" 10,000
Unit Price $24.10 $48.50 No Bid
Total Price $241,000.00 $485,000.00
2 R1-1 36"x36 1,000
Unit Price $34.65 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $34,650.00 $69,600.00
3 R1-2 Yield 36" 500
Unit Price $18.40 $39.00 No Bid
Total Price $9,200.00 $19,500.00
4 R1-3 All-Way 6"x18" 4,000
Unit Price $3.72 $5.80 No Bid
Total Price $14,880.00 $23,200.00
5 R2-1 30 MPH 24"x30" 1,000
Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid
Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00
6 R2-1 35 MPH 24"x30" 1,000
Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid
Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00
7 R2-1 40 MPH 24"x30" 1,000
Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid
Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00
8 R2-1 45 MPH 24"x30" 1,000
Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid
Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00
9 R3-1 No Left turn 24"x24" 500
Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid
Total Price $8,245.00 $16,575.00
10 R3-2 No right turn 24"x24" 500
Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid
Total Price $8,245.00 $16,575.00
11 R3-1 No right turn 24x24" 250
Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid
Total Price $4,122.50 $8,287.50
12 R3-4 No U turn 24x24" 250
Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid
Total Price $4,122.50 $8,287.50
13 R3-7R Right Lane must turn right 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No Bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
14 R3-7L Left Lane must turn left 30x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No Bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
15 R5-1 Do not enter 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No Bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
16 R3-1 No left turn 36X36" 500
Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $18,270.00 $34,800.00

Prepared by Purchasing 5/13/2019

Page 1



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Loca
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(!
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Regulatory
Signs
17 R3-2 No right turn 36X36" 500
Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $18,270.00 $34,800.00
18 R3-1 No Left turn 36X36" 250
Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $9,135.00 $17,400.00
19 R3-4 No U Turn 36X36" 250
Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $9,135.00 $17,400.00
20 R3-7R Right lane must turn right 36X36" 300
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $10,854.00 $20,880.00
21 R3-7L Left lane must turn left 36X36" 300
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $10,854.00 $20,880.00
22 R5-1 Do not enter 36x36" 300
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $10,854.00 $20,880.00
23 R3-17 Bike lane 30"x24" 500
Unit Price $20.10 $46.40 No Bid
Total Price $10,050.00 $23,200.00
24 R4-7 Keep right symbol 24"x30" 500
Unit Price $20.10 $46.40 No Bid
Total Price $10,050.00 $23,200.00
25 R5-1a Wrong Way 36"x24" 300
Unit Price $24.12 $46.40 No Bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
26 R6-1R One Way state type 36"x12" 1,000
Unit Price $12.06 $23.20 No Bid
Total Price $12,060.00 $23,200.00
27 R6-1L One way state type 36"x12" 1,000
Unit Price $12.06 $23.20 No Bid
Total Price $12,060.00 $23,200.00
28 R9-3 No Ped Crossing 24"x24" 300
Unit Price $16.49 $30.95 No Bid
Total Price $4,947.00 $9,285.00
29 R10-12 Left turn on green (Ball) 30"x36" 500
Unit Price $30.53 $58.00 No Bid
Total Price $15,265.00 $29,000.00
30 R10-4B L/R Push button for crossing 5"x7 3/4" 1,000
Unit Price $3.35 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $3,350.00
31 R10-4B L/R Push button for crossing 9x12" 1,000
Unit Price $4.85 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $4,850.00
32 W10-1 36"D 300
Unit Price $35.72 $69.60 No Bid
Total Price $10,716.00 $20,880.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(]
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
School
Signs
33 S1-1 FYG 36" 2,000
Unit Price $47.64 $95.00 No Bid
Total Price $95,280.00 $190,000.00
34 S4-1 20 MPH FYG 24"x48" (COSA to provide 1,000
Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid
Total Price $35,230.00 $75,200.00
35 S4-1 25 MPH FYG 24"x48" (COSA to provide 500
Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid
Total Price $17,615.00 $37,600.00
36 S5-1 20 MPH FYG 24"x48" (COSA to provide 1,000
Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid
Total Price $35,230.00 $75,200.00
37 S5-1 25 MPH FYG 24"x48" (COSA to provide 500
Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid
Total Price $17,615.00 $37,600.00
38 S5-2A 10"x24" 1,000
Unit Price $7.26 $20.80 No Bid
Total Price $7,260.00 $20,800.00
39 S6-1 OH FYG 36"x84" (COSA to Provide 300
Unit Price $117.45 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $35,235.00
40 S7-1C FYG 24"x36" No Arrows 500
Unit Price $33.54 $62.40 No Bid
Total Price $16,770.00 $31,200.00
41 S7-1T 18"'x24" 2.000
Unit Price $12.18 $31.20 No Bid
Total Price $24,360.00 $62,400.00
42 W16-7P FYG 12"x24" 1,000
Unit Price $11.74 $20.80 No Bid
Total Price $11,740.00 $20,800.00
43 W16-9P FYG 12"x24" 1,000
Unit Price $11.74 $20.80 No bid
Total Price $11,740.00 $20,800.00
Warning
Signs
44 W1-1R Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
45 W1-1L Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
46 W1-2R Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
47 W1-2L Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
48 W1-3R Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(!
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Warning
Sinns
49 W1-3L Arrow Symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
50 W1-4R Arrow Symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
51 W1-4L Arrow Symbol 30"x30" 300
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00
52 W1-1R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
53 W1-1L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
54 W1-2R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
55 W1-2L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
56 W1-3R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
57 W1-3L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
58 W1-4R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
59 W1-4L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200
Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid
Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00
60 W1-6 Single arrow 48"x24" 1,000
Unit Price $32.16 $61.75 No bid
Total Price $32,160.00 $61,750.00
61 W1-7 Double arrow 48"x24" 1,000
Unit Price $32.16 $61.75 No bid
Total Price $32,160.00 $61,750.00
62 W1-8 Chevron arrow 18"x24" 1,500
Unit Price $12.06 $23.20 No bid
Total Price $18,090.00 $34,800.00
63 W2-1 Cross intersection 30"x30" 200
Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid
Total Price $5,026.00 $9,700.00
64 W3-1 Stop ahead symbol 30"x30" 750
Unit Price $26.29 $61.50 No bid
Total Price $19,717.50 $46,125.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(]
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Warning
Signs
65 W3-3 Signal ahead symbol 30"x30" 750
Unit Price $26.77 $61.50 No bid
Total Price $20,077.50 $46,125.00
66 D11-1 Bike route 24"x18" 1,000
Unit Price $12.18 $23.20 No bid
Total Price $12,180.00 $23,200.00
67 OM-3R Delineator 12"x36" 400
Unit Price $12.06 $23.20 No bid
Total Price $4,824.00 $9,280.00
68 OM-3L Delineator 12"x36" 400
Unit Price $12.06 $23.20 No bid
Total Price $4,824.00 $9,280.00
69 W8-19 12x72" 100
Unit Price $24.12 $46.40 No bid
Total Price $2,412.00 $4,640.00
No Parking
Signs
70 R7-18 12x18" 2,000
Unit Price $7.04 $15.00 No Bid
Total Price $14,080.00 $30,000.00
71 R7-1L 2,000
Unit Price $6.55 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $13,100.00
72 R7-1R 2,000
Unit Price $6.55 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $13,100.00
73 R7-1DBL 2,000
Unit Price $6.55 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $13,100.00
74 R7-201aP 1,000
Unit Price $2.78 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $2,780.00
Pre-Sheeted
Sign Blanks
75 9"x12" 500
Unit Price $3.35 $4.90 No Bid
Total Price $1,675.00 $2,450.00
76 12"x36" 800
Unit Price $12.06 $19.50 No Bid
Total Price $9,648.00 $15,600.00
77 18'x24" 5,000
Unit Price $12.06 $19.50 No Bid
Total Price $60,300.00 $97,500.00
78 24"x24" 500
Unit Price $16.08 $26.00 No Bid
Total Price $8,040.00 $13,000.00
79 24"x30" 1,000
Unit Price $20.10 $32.50 No Bid
Total Price $20,100.00 $32,500.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(]
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Pre-Sheeted
Sign Blanks
80 30"x30 Yellow 3,000
Unit Price $25.13 $40.75 No Bid
Total Price $75,390.00 $122,250.00
81 9'x24" 3,000
Unit Price $6.69 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $20,070.00
82 9"x30" 3,000
Unit Price $8.06 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $24,180.00
83 9"x36" 2,000
Unit Price $9.62 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $19,240.00
84 9"x42" 2,000
Unit Price $11.18 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $22,360.00
85 9"x48" 2,000
Unit Price $12.06 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $24,120.00
86 9"x564" 1,000
Unit Price $13.59 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $13,590.00
87 18"x72" 500
Unit Price $36.18 No Bid No Bid
Total Price $18,090.00
88 12"x18" 5,000
Unit Price $6.55 $9.75 No Bid
Total Price $32,750.00 $48,750.00
89 12"x6" 1,000
Unit Price $2.78 $3.25 No Bid
Total Price $2,780.00 $3,250.00
90 12"x30" 1,000
Unit Price $10.01 $16.25 No Bid
Total Price $10,010.00 $16,250.00
91 12"x36" 1,000
Unit Price $12.06 $19.50 No Bid
Total Price $12,060.00 $19,500.00
92 30"x30" 700
Unit Price $25.13 $40.75 No Bid
Total Price $17,591.00 $28,525.00
93 36"x36" 500
Unit Price $36.18 $58.50 No Bid
Total Price $18,090.00 $29,250.00
94 18"x18" Yellow 500
Unit Price $9.45 $14.90 No Bid
Total Price $4,725.00 $7,450.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(]
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Sign
Blanks
95 30" Octagonal (Stop), .080" thickness, Wt. 5.84# 200
Unit Price $14.26 No Bid $15.44
Total Price $2,852.00 $3,088.00
96 36" Octagonal (Stop), .100" thickness, Wt. 10.52# 200
Unit Price $25.35 No Bid $27.78
Total Price $5,070.00 $5,556.00
97 30" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 7.03# 500
Unit Price $15.78 No Bid $16.33
Total Price $7,890.00 $8,165.00
98 36" Circle,. 100" thickness, Wt. 9.94# 100
Unit Price $25.26 No Bid $31.67
Total Price $2,526.00 $3,167.00
99 36" Pentagon,. 100" thickness, Wt. 9.50# 300
Unit Price $24.07 No Bid $28.08
Total Price $7,221.00 $8,424.00
100 18" x 18" Square A/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 2.53# 500
Unit Price $5.76 No Bid $5.87
Total Price $2,880.00 $2,935.00
101 9" x 12" Horizontal Rectangle, .080" thickness, 500
Unit Price $2.02 No Bid $2.68
Total Price $1,010.00 $1,340.00
102 9" x 24" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 2.64# 500
Unit Price $6.11 No Bid $6.39
Total Price $3,055.00 $3,195.00
103 9" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.30# 500
Unit Price $7.69 No Bid $7.98
Total Price $3,845.00 $3,990.00
104 9" x 36" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.96# 500
Unit Price $9.21 No Bid $9.55
Total Price $4,605.00 $4,775.00
105 9" x 42" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 4.62# 500
Unit Price $10.93 No Bid $11.08
Total Price $5,465.00 $5,540.00
106 9" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 5.28# 500
Unit Price $12.05 No Bid $12.63
Total Price $6,025.00 $6,315.00
107 9" x 54" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 5.94# 500
Unit Price $14.06 No Bid $14.19
Total Price $7,030.00 $7,095.00
108 12" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness 300
Unit Price $9.76 No Bid $10.66
Total Price $2,928.00 $3,198.00
109 18" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 3.38# 500
Unit Price $7.57 No Bid $7.84
Total Price $3,785.00 $3,920.00
110 18" x 60" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 13.19# 100
Unit Price $30.41 No Bid $32.62
Total Price $3,041.00 $3,262.00
111 18" x 72" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 15.83# 500
Unit Price $36.45 No Bid $39.12
Total Price $18,225.00 $19,560.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(!
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated  |Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Sign
Blanks
112 24" x 30 Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 5.63# 800
Unit Price $12.64 No Bid $13.08
Total Price $10,112.00 $10,464.00
113 6" x 18" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. .84# 1,000
Unit Price $2.00 No Bid $2.46
Total Price $2,000.00 $2,460.00
114 30" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 10.55# 1,000
Unit Price $18.96 No Bid $19.61
Total Price $18,960.00 $19,610.00
115 5" x 7 3/4" Vertical Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. .24# 200
Unit Price $0.86 No Bid $12.05
Total Price $172.00 $2,410.00
116 12" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6# 500
Unit Price $7.76 No Bid $7.84
Total Price $3,880.00 $3,920.00
117 24" x 24" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 4.5# 500
Unit Price $10.11 No Bid $10.46
Total Price $5,055.00 $5,230.00
118 24" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6.75# 500
Unit Price $15.06 No Bid $15.68
Total Price $7,530.00 $7,840.00
119 36" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle ©, .080" thickness, Wt. 13.5# 500
Unit Price $30.66 No Bid $31.38
Total Price $15,330.00 $15,690.00
120 36" x 36" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, 500
Wt. 10.13#
Unit Price $22.90 No Bid $23.54
Total Price $11,450.00 $11,770.00
121 12" x 18" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 1.69# 1,500
Unit Price $3.78 No Bid $4.10
Total Price $5,670.00 $6,150.00
122 24" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle/Vertical Rectangle ©,. 100" 1,000
thickness, Wt. 11.26#
Unit Price $25.47 No Bid $26.14
Total Price $25,470.00 $26,140.00
123 30" x 60" Horizontal Rectangle Vertical Rectangle © .100" 500
thickness, Wt. 17.59#
Unit Price $39.96 No Bid $40.86
Total Price $19,980.00 $20,430.00
124 36" Equilateral Triangle .100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500
Unit Price $13.47 No Bid $16.49
Total Price $6,735.00 $8,245.00
125 48" x 60" Vertical Rectangle, .100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500
Unit Price $63.57 No Bid $65.38
Total Price $31,785.00 $32,690.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign(
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave
Estimated San Marcos, Franklin Park,
Annual AL 36536-1850 IL 60131
ltem Description Quantity 251-972-1308
Sign
Blanks
126 12x18 1,500
Unit Price $3.78 No Bid $4.10
Total Price $5,670.00 $6,150.00
127 12 x6 1,500
Unit Price $1.34 No Bid $1.72
Total Price $2,010.00 $2,580.00
Delivery 30-45 days 45 days 45 days
Payment Terms Net 30 days Net 30 days 2% 10 days

Estimated Total: $1,913,415.00 $2,750,885.00 $275,304.00
Estimated Total Award: $1,913,415.00
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