L.C
12/17/20
Item No. 8

orpiNance  2020-12-17-0 916

APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH ANCIRA MOTOR COMPANY,
CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET, GUNN CHEVROLET LTD AND
SILSBEE TOYOTA TO PROVIDE 35 LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES FOR A
TOTAL COST OF $1,120,656.50. FUNDING IN THE AMOUNT OF
$1,033,692.50 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2021 EQUIPMENT
RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET, AND $89,964.00 IS
AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2021 GENERAL FUND BUDGET.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light duty vehicles for
the City’s fleet, including 26 sedans, one minivan, seven one-ton trucks of varying configurations,
and one flatbed truck, for use by various departments; and

WHEREAS, Ancira Motor Company submitted the low bid for items 3, 4, 6, 8, and 9 for a total
cost of $236,902.00, Caldwell Country Chevrolet submitted the low bid for item 1 for a total cost
of $550,772.00, Gunn Chevrolet LTD submitted the low bid for items 5 and 7 for a total cost of
$143,996.50 and Silsbee Toyota submitted the low bid for item 2 for a total cost of $188,986.00;
NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Ancira Motor Company (Items 3, 4, 6, 8, and 9), Caldwell
Country Chevrolet (Item 1), Gunn Chevrolet LTD (Items 5 and 7) and Silsbee Toyota (Item 2) for
a total cost of $1,120,656.50, is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all
required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. A copy of the bid
tabulation sheet is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit 1.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $1,120,656.50 is available as part of
the Fiscal Year 2020 Carry Forward and Fiscal Year 2021 Adopted Budget approved by City
Council per the table below:

Amount | Fund Cost Center |General Ledger
$426,060.50, 72001000 | 3503200001 5709080
$607,632.00, 72001000 | 3503200001 5709080

$86,964.000 11001000 | 3616010003 5709080
Total Amount: $1,120,656.50

SECTION 3. Payment in the amount up to $236,902.00 is authorized to Ancira Motor Company
and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 4. Payment in the amount up to $550,772.00 is authorized to Caldwell Country
Chevrolet and should be encumbered with a purchase order.
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- SECTION 5. Payment in-the amount up to $143,996.50 is authorized to Gunn Chevrolet LTD
and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 6. Payment in the amount up to $188.986.00 is authorized to Silsbee Toyota and
should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 7. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject to
concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost
Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 8. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 17" day of December, 2020.

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Ha Hone

Tina J. Flores, City Clerk _~Andrew Segovia, City Attorney

[}



File Number: 20-6738 Enactment Number: 2020-12-17-0916

x City of San Antonio

CITY OF

SAN ANTONIO

City Council

December 17,2020

Item: 8 Enactment Number:
File Number: 20-6738 2020-12-17-0916

Ordinance approving contracts with Ancira Motor Company, Caldwell Country Chevrolet,
Gunn Chevrolet LTD and Silsbee Toyota to provide 35 light duty vehicles for a total cost of
$1,120,656.50. Funding in the amount of $1,033,692.50is available from the FY 2021
Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund Budget, and $89,964.00 is available from the
FY 2021 General Fund Budget.[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy
Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Councilmember John Courage made a motion to approve. Councilmember Manny Pelaez
seconded the motion. The motion passed by the following vote:

Aye: 11 Nirenberg, Treviiio, Andrews-Sullivan, Viagran, Rocha Garcia,
Gonzales, Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage and Perry

Office of the City Clerk Printed on 12/17/20)
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Exhibit 1



Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name*

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off date

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date

3 yr/36K Bumper To|
Bumper, 8 yr/100,000,
Hybrid/Electric
Component Warranty|
Gunn Chey|

16550 135 North,
Selma TX 78154

150 Days|
August 30, 2021

June 30, 2021

Yes|

3 yr or 36000K BTB, 5 yr|
or 100,000 Drivetrain
Hybrid + Ele Com
100,000K]

Gunn Chevrolet LTD

16550 135 North,
Selma TX 78154

120 Days
6/21

6/21

Not Provided|

3yr or 36K BTB, 5 yr|
60,000K Powertrain

Gunn Nissan

750 NE Loop 410, San
Antonio, Texas 78209

120 Days
6/2021

6/2021

Not Provided

36 mo 36,000 mile B2B,
60 mo 60,000 Powert. 96
mo 100,000 miles
Batteries|

Any New Nissan Dealer]|

Not Provided

120 Days
12-15-20

11-15-20

No|

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I
Opened September 18, 2020
For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P O Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte [2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity | TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-5582627 210-599-5000
1 All Electric Powered, Plug-in, 4-Door Sedan: 19
Price Each $28,988.00] No Bid No Bid $30,686.75) $30,268.58 $30,149.00 $28,999.00
Price Total $550,772.00) $583,048.25 $575,103.02] $572,831.00 $550,981.00)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 5.86% 4.42%
Price Differential: $32,276.25 $24,331.02
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2021 Chevrolet Bolt EV] 2021 Chevrolet Bolt LT 2021 Nissan Leafs 2020 Nissan Leaf| 2021 Chevy Bolt|
1FB48| 1FB48| 17019 (Execption 40 KW
Port Portable Quick
Charaer Oniv)
Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine Offered Electric Drive Unit (200] GM electric - ENO - HP| Nissan Electric SAE HP Leaf S 40 KwH Not Provided
(Include SAE Net HP): hp 2 266# Torque), 200 147
(150KW 360W-ri
Transmission Offered: Electric Drive Unit MMF Automatic 1 Automatic 1 Spd Automatic| Electric Drive 200 HP|

3 yr/36,000 Bumper to|
Bumper, 5 yr 100,000
Powertrain

Local Dealerl

Local Dealerl

90-120 Days
10-1-21

10-1-21

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020
For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD Gunn Nissan LTD Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte [2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
item Description Quantity [TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-599-5000
2 Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan: %
Price Each: No Bid| $26,998.00 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total: $188,986.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2021 Toyota Camry LE
Hybrid

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off date:

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date

Toyota Camry 2.5L 4
Cyl, 208 HP|

Electronic Variable]

3 yr/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 8 yr 80,000
Powertrain

Local Dealeri

Local Dealer]
90-120 Days|
10-1-21
10-1-21

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address

Delivery:
Production Cut-off date:
Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date

6.7 L 16 Cummins Turbo
Diesel, 360 HP

6 Spd Auto 68RFE]

3 Year/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5Yr/100,000{
Powertrain|

Ancira Chrysler Jeep &
Dodgey

10807 IH-10 West, San
Antonio, TX 78230
150-200 Days|
5/30/2021

5/15/2021

Yes|

GM Diesel L5P SAE
HP445 6.6L Turbo Charg

Allison 10 Spd|

3yr or 36000K BTB, Syr
or 100,000K Powe Train

Gunn Chevrolet LTD

16550 135 North,
Selma TX 78154
120 Days

5/21

5/21

Not Provided

Opened: September 18, 2020
For Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LO PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 |H-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte [2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity|TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-599-5000
3 1 Ton - 4 Door 4x2 Diesel Long Bed Truck — Dual Rear Wheel
(DRW) 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid| $43,043.00 $45,554.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total: $43,043.00 $45,554.50
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2021 Ram 3500, Cre 2021 Chevrolet 3500,
Cab, 4X2] Crew Cab 2WD
CC30943
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020
For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company [Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 |H 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte |2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity | TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-599-5000
4 1 Ton - 4 Door 4x4 Diesel Long Bed Truck — Dual Rear Wheel
(DRW) 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $42,752.00 $45,709.50 No Bid $44,806.00 No Bid
Price Total $42,752.00 $45,709.50 $44,806.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2021Ram 3500 Crew| 2021 Chevrolet 3500 2021 Ford F350
' Cab 4x4 Crew Cab 4WD

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)

Transmission Offered

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

6.7 L 16 Cummins Turbo)
Diesel, 360 HP|

6 Spd Auto 68RFE

3 Year/36,000 Bumper t
Bumper, 5Yr/100,000]
Powertrain
Ancira Chrysler Jeep &

Doda
10807 IH-10 West, Saa

CK30943

GM Diesel L5P 6.6L]
Turbo Charge SAE HP
445

Aliison|

3yr or 36000K BTB, 5Syr
or 100,000K Powe Train

Gunn Chevrolet LTD

16550 135 North,

F350 DRW Crew Cab
4x4 XL 475

10 Sp Auto|

36 mo 36,000 miles B2B
5 yr 60,000 powert

Any New Ford Dealer

Not Provided

Antonio, TX 7823 Selma TX 78154
Delivery 150-200 Day: 120 Days 120 Days
Production Cut-off date: 513012021 521 Unknown at this date|
Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date 511512021 5/21 Unknown
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date Yes| No No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 18, 2020
For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local .
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P O Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W Houston Harte |2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity |TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-599-5000
5] 1 Ton Regular Cab Diesel Truck - Dual Rear Wheel (DRW) with
Traffic Utility Storage: 2
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $56,985.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Totat: $113,971.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2021 Chevrolet 84" Reg|
Cab Chassis|

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered’

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Traffic Utilty Bed and Front Bumper Pole Pull Offered
Traffic Utility Bed and Front Bumper Pole Pull Warranty:
Delivery:

Production Cut-off date.
Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

GM Diesel L5P .6
Turbo Charge HP 44
Allison 10 Sp

3yr or 36,000K BTB and]
Syr or 100,000K]
Powertrain

Gunn Chevrolet LTD

16550 IH 35 N, Selma,
Texas 78154

Utec Bed Divesified PPF]
203

3 YrBed, 1 Yron Pole
Pul

120 Days|

5/21

5/21

No

519




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened September 18, 2020
For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 [H35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte 2152 N Wheeter
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity |TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-599-5000
6 1 Ton Regular Cab Diesel - Dual Rear Wheel (DRW), 15’ Stake
Bed wiLift Gate: 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid $53,319.00] $61,080.50} No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $53,319.00 $61,080.50

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address

Stake Bed and Lift Gate Offered

Stake Bed and Lift Gate Warranty:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off date:

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2021 Ram 5500 Reg
Cab 4X4, 120 CA

6.7 L 16 Cummins Turbo
Diesel, 360 HP

6 Spd Auto Aisin|
ASB9RC|

3 Year/36,000 Bumper to|
Bumper, 5Yr/100,000|
Powertrain

Ancira Chrysler Jeep &
Dodge;

10807 IH-10 West, San|
Antonio, TX 78230

Stakes with Tommy Gate)

3 Years on Platform and
2 Years on the Lift Gate

150-200 Days
5/30/2021
5/15/2021

Yes|

2021 Chevrolet MD
CC5403 120" CA|
Duramax L5D 6.6L
Diesel V8

Allison A1700RDS 6 Spd

3yr or 36,000K BTB and|
Syr or 100,000K
Powertrain

Gunn Chevrolet LTD

16550 IH 35 N, Selma,
Texas 78154

Axton Platform Bed and|UTEC Bed, Tommy Gate|

Utec, Lift Gate 3 yrs|

120 Days|
6/21
6/21

No|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened September 18, 2020
For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company [Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.0O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 1H 35N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte (2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-593-5000
7 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick Up, Long Bed, Single Rear Wheel
(SRW), Gray, Blue or Black in Color: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $34,659.00 $30,025.50 No Bid $30,688.00 No Bid|
Price Total: $34,659.00] $30.025.50 $30,688.00

Year, Make & Modei Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)

Transmission Offered:

Warranty*

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery:

Production Cut-off date:

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2021 Ram 3500 Crew
Cab 4X2 Big Horn|

6.4 L V8 Hemi MDS

8 Spd Auto 8HP75-LCV|

3 Year/36,000 Bumper to|
Bumper, 5Yr/100,000|
Powertrain

Ancira Chrysler Jeep &
Dodgej

10807 [H-10 West, San|
Antonio, TX 78230
150-200 Days|

5/30/2021

5/15/2021

Yes|

2021 Chevrolet 3500
Double Cab Gas 2WD
CC30953

GM6.6L V8 Gas, 401 HP

MYD 6 Spd Automatic|
HD

3yr or 36,000K, Syr o
100,000K Powertrain|

Gunn Chevrolet LTD|

16550 IH 35 N, Selma,
Texas 78154

120 Days|

6/21

6/21

2021 Ford F350|

F350 Super Cab SRW|
164" Bed SRX 385 HP.
6 Sp. Auto|

36 mo 36,000 miles B2B|
5 yr 60,000 powert.

Any New Ford Dealer|
Not Provided

120 Days

Unknown

Unknown

No

719



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened September 18, 2020
For: Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P.O. Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W. Houston Harte [2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity | TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-599-5000
8 1 Ton Single Cab Pick Up, Long Bed, Single Rear Wheel
(SRW) 2
Price Each: No Bid No Bid| $36,336.00 $37,728.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total: $72,672.00 $75,457.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2021 Ram 3500 Reg 2021 Chevrolet 1 Ton
Cab 4x2 Reg cab CC30903
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): 6.7 L 16 Cummins Turbo| Duramax 6.6L Turbo
Diesel, 360 HP] Diesel V8 445 HP

Transmission Offered

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off date:

Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

6 Spd Auto 68RFE]|

3 Year/36,000 Bumper toj
Bumper, 5Yr/100,000]
Powertrain|

Ancira Chrysler Jeep
Dodgej
10807 IH-10 West, Sar
Antonio, TX 78230
150-200 Days
5/30/2021
5/15/2021

MGM Allison 10 Spd!

3 yr or 36000K BTB, 5 yr
or 100,000K Power Train

Gunn Chevrolet LTD

16550 I35 North,
Selma TX 78154
120 Days

6/21

6/21

Yes|

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened September 18, 2020
For Light Duty Vehicles Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Caldwell Country Silsbee Toyota Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Gunn Nissan LTD. Jim Bass Ford Lake Country Chevrolet
Chevrolet
6100013162 LD PO Box 27 P O Box 815 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35 N 750 NE Loop 410 4032 W Houston Harte |2152 N Wheeler
Expy
Caldwell, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, San Angelo, Jasper,
Item Description Quantity | TX 77836 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78209 TX 76901 TX 75951
979-567-6116 409-880-9191 210-558-2627 210-599-5000
9 7 Passenger Mini Van 1
Price Each: No Bid| No Bid| $24,916.00| No Bid No Bid $25,278.00 No Bid|
Price Total $24,916 00 $25,278.00
Additional Price for Color $200.00] $0.00)
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2021 Chrysler Voyager] 2021, Ford Transit|
Connect 7 Pass|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) 3.6L V624 VW Tranit Connect XL Long|
WIESS| Wheel Base 162 HP
Transmission Offered: 9 Spd 948TE Auto 8 Sp Auto|
Warranty 3 Year/36,000 Bumper to| 36 mo 36,000 miles B2B
Bumper, 5Yr/100,000! 5 yr 60,000 powert
Powertrain
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Ancira Chrysler Jeep & Any New Ford Dealer
Dodgey
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 10807 IH-10 West, San| Not Provided
Antonio, TX 78230
Delivery 150-200 Days 155 Days|
Production Cut-off date 5/30/2021 2-21
Last day order can be placed without missing the cut-off date 5/15/2021 Unknown
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes| No
10 DELETED 1
Payment Terms Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $550.772.00 $188 986.00 $271,561.00 $954,846.25 $575.103.02, $673 603.00 $550.981.00)
Total Award: $550,772.00| $188,986.00 $236,902.00 $143,996.50,

9/9






