
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 8, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: A/C for SWMD Cart Stickers Drileck Enterprises dba Fast 

Signs San Antonio NW

Cenveo Dri-Stick Decal Corporation, 

dba Rydin

Express Business Systems, 

Inc

International Nameplate U.S. Inc. Nitsom Promotional Manufacturing 

Corp.

SAT Radio Communications LTD, 

dba Industrial Communications

Trinity Graphic & Packaging 

Solutions, LLC

JF 8714 Fredericksburg # 103 5101 S. Zarzamora 700 Phoenix Lake, Ave. 9155 Trade Place 2905 W. Mashall Avenue 250 Consumers Road, Suite 502 1019 E. Euclid Ave. 1 Lodge Street

Item Description
Est. Annual  

Qty

San Antonio,

TX 78240

210-697-7446

San Antonio,

TX 78211

Streamwood,

IL 60107

San Diego, 

CA 92126

Longview, 

TX 75604

North York,

ON M2J 4V6

San Antonio,

TX 78212

Cranston,

RI 02920

1 4 1/2" x 12" Custom Cart Stickers 158,000 Withdrew Response NAS

Deleted

8,001 to 15,000

Unit Price $0.30 No bid $0.488 $1.78 0.035 $4.50 No bid $0.28

Extended Price $4,500.00 $7,320.00 $26,700.00 525.00 $67,500.00 $4,200.00

15,001 to 50,000

Unit Price $0.30 No bid $0.429 $1.61 0.31 $4.50 No bid $0.23

Extended Price $15,000.00 $21,450.00 $80,500.00 15,500.00 $225,000.00 $11,500.00

50,001 to 100,000

Unit Price $0.30 No bid $0.376 $1.46 0.31 $4.50 No bid $0.21

Extended Price $30,000.00 $37,600.00 $146,000.00 31,000.00 $450,000.00 $21,000.00

100,001 to 150,000

Unit Price $0.30 $0.3668544 $0.369 $1.34 0.31 $4.50 $0.12 $0.21

Extended Price $45,000.00 $55,028.16 $55,350.00 $201,000.00 46,500.00 $675,000.00 $18,000.00 $31,500.00

2 4 1/2" x 20" Custom Cart Stickers 72,500

Deleted

8,001 to 15,000

Unit Price $0.53 No bid $0.808 $2.67 0.51 $7.50 No bid $0.38

Extended Price $7,950.00 $12,120.00 $40,050.00 7,650.00 $112,500.00 $5,700.00

15,001 to 72,500

Unit Price $0.53 $0.556606 $0.737 $2.43 0.48 $7.50 $0.21 $0.31

Extended Price $38,425.00 $40,353.94 $53,432.50 $176,175.00 34,800.00 $543,750.00 $15,225.00 $22,475.00

3 2.75" x 12" Custom Cart Stickers 9,000

Deleted

3,001 to 6,000

Unit Price $0.32 No bid $0.558 $1.10 0.33 $4.20 No bid $0.33

Extended Price $1,920.00 $3,348.00 $6,600.00 1,980.00 $25,200.00 $1,980.00

6,001 to 9,000

Unit Price $0.32 $0.436555 $0.399 $0.99 0.30 $4.20 $0.52 $0.27

Extended Price $2,880.00 $3,929.00 $3,591.00 $8,910.00 2,700.00 $37,800.00 $4,680.00 $2,430.00

4 3.5" x 9.75" Custom Cart Stickers 18,000

Deleted

3,001 to 6,000

Unit Price $0.28 No bid $0.620 $1.13 0.35 $4.79 No bid $0.35

Extended Price $1,680.00 $3,720.00 $6,780.00 2,100.00 $28,740.00 $2,100.00

6,001 to 18,000

Unit Price $0.28 $0.3174444 $0.454 $1.03 0.28 $4.79 $0.31 $0.23

Extended Price $5,040.00 $5,714.00 $8,172.00 $18,540.00 5,040.00 $86,220.00 $5,580.00 $4,140.00

6100011383
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5 Additional Set Up Fee 1

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $125.00

Extended Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $125.00

Prompt Payment Discount Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total $152,395.00 Incomplete $206,103.50 $711,255.00 147,795.00 $2,251,710.00 Incomplete $107,150.00

Total Award $91,345.000


