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12/17/20 

Item No. 9 

ORDINANCE (2.0 2 0 - l 2 - 1 7. - 0 9 1 7 
APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH ASSOCIATED SUPPLY 

COMPANY, INC., DBA ASCO EQUIPMENT, HARRIS 

COUNTY RENTALS, DBA TEXAS STATE RENTALS, AND 

H&V EQUIPMENT SERVICES, INC., FOR A TOTAL COST 

OF $543,277.91. FUNDING IN THE AMOUNT OF $51,009.21 

IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2021 GENERAL FUND 

BUDGET, $298,390.00 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2021 

SOLID WASTE OPERATING AND MANAGEMENT FUND 

BUDGET, AND $193,878.70 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 

2021 EQUIPMENT RENEW AL AND REPLACEMENT 

FUND BUDGET. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with various light and 
heavy equipment needed for road maintenance, movement of raw materials and supply 
management; and 

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by H&V Equipment Services, Inc., (Item 2), and Harris County 
Rentals, dba Texas State Rentals (Item 5), City Businesses as defined by the City's Local 
Preference Program, are within three percent of the lowest bids, which were from, Nueces Power 
Equipment (Item 2) and Associated Supply Company, Inc., dba ASCO Equipment (Item 5), 
bidders which are not City Businesses; and 

WHEREAS, H&V Equipment Services, Inc., submitted the low bid for item 2 for a total cost of 
$127,773.00, Harris County Rentals, dba Texas State Rentals, submitted the low bids for items 3 
and 5 for a total cost of $364,606.91, and Associated Supply Company, Inc., dba ASCO 
Equipment, submitted the low bid for item 4 for a total cost of $50,898.00; NOW 

THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by H&V Equipment Services, Inc. (Item 2), Harris County 
Rentals, dba Texas State Rentals (Items 3 and 5), and Associated Supply Company, Inc., dba 
ASCO Equipment (Item 4), for a total cost of $543,277.91 are hereby accepted, subject to and 
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates 
and endorsements. The bid tabulation is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes 
as Exhibit I. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that pursuant to the City's Local Preference 
Program, passed by Ordinance No. 2013-03-21-0167, as amended, H&V Equipment Services, 
Inc., (Item 2), and Harris County Rentals, dba Texas State Rentals (Item 5), City Businesses, are 
entitled to award. 
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. SECTION 3. F1:1nding fbrthis ordinance in the amount of$543,277.91 is available as part of the 
Fiscal Year 2020 Carry Forward and Fiscal Year 2021 Adopted Budget approved by City 
Council per the table below. 

Amount Fund Cost Center General Ledger 
$127,773.00 72001000 3503200001 5709080 

$40,656.70 72001000 3503200001 5709080 
$25,449.00 72001000 3503200001 5709080 
$25,449.00 11001000 1902010001 5709060 
$25,560.21 11001000 1706070001 5709060 

$298,390.00 55001000 5556040001 5501055 
Total Amount: $543,277.91

SECTION 4. Payment in the amount up to $127,773.00 is authorized to H& V Equipment 
Services, Inc., and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 5. Payment in the amount up to $364,606.91 is authorized to Harris County Rentals, 
dba Texas State Rentals, and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 6. Payment in the amount up to $50,898.00 is authorized to Associated Supply 
Company, Inc., dba ASCO Equipment, and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 7. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy 
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject 
to concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund 
Numbers, SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund 
Centers, SAP Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, 
and SAP GL Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 8. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight or more 
affirmative votes; otherwise, it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 17th day of December, 2020.

R 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

2 



File Number. 20-702-1 

Item: 9 

File Number: 20-7024 

City of San Antonio 

City Council 

December 17, 2020 

Enac/ment Number.· 2020-12-17-0917 

Enactment Number: 

2020-12-17-0917 

Ordinance approving contracts with Associated Supply Company, dba ASCO Equipment, 

Harris County Rentals, dba Texas State Rentals, and H&V Equipment Services for an 

estimated total cost of $543,277.91. Funding in the amount of $51,009.21 is available from 

the FY 2021 General Fund Budget, $298,390.00 is available from the FY 2021 Solid Waste 

Operating and Management Fund Budget, and $193,878.70 is available from the FY 2021 

Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund Budget. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; 

Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Councilmember John Courage made a motion to approve. 

seconded the motion. The motion passed by the following vote: 

Councilmember Manny Pelaez 

Aye: 11 Nirenberg, Trevino, Andrews-Sullivan, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, 

Gonzales, Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage and Perry 

Office of the City Clerk Printed 011 I l/17/W 
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Exhibit I 



Opened: August 7, 2020 
For: Light and Heavy Equipment 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

LOCAL 

H & V Equipment 
Services, Inc. 

LOCAL 

Harris County Rentals 
dba Texas State Rentals 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

Company, Inc. OBA Asco Handling 
Equipment 

16100012978 GDL 13307 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio 

Associated Supply 
!
American Material 

2102 E Slayton Rd 3651 Mars Hill Road 

Item 

2 

Description 

Deleted 

Articulated Wheeled Loader 12 5 Cubic Yard 
Bucket 
Price Each· 

Total: 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 
local bid: 
Price differential 

Year, Make & Model of Loaded Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include 
SAE Net HP): 

Transmission Offered· 

Attachments: Bucket (Include SAE, Cubic Yard, 
Size) 

Loader Warranty· 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 

Production Cut�off Date 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without Missing Cut• 

Can Bidder Provide Bid Items After Cut-Off Date. 

San Antonio 
Quantity ITX 78222 

(210) 648-5885 

$127,773.00 

TX 78220 
1(512) 557-8454 

$137,191.13 
(unit price is $134,850) 

Lubbock 
TX 79404 

1(210) 305-3230 

$128,976.00 

$127,773 0011 $137,191 13 $128,976.00 

0.81% 

$1,023.00: 
2020 Doosan DL200-51

(includes HEIT Bexar 
County) 

2020 Sany SW305KI 2020 Case 6216 151HP 

Perkins 1204F 142.1 HPII Deutz TCD6.1 (184 HP) 
(Compatible with Jaltest) 

FPT F4H FE 613W 

Hydrostatic Dual Motor ZF 48/3R ZF Powershift 
Auto/Manual 

2.5 Cubic Yardll 3 Cubic Yard Bucket with 
I

2.5 yd w Bolt on Cutting 
Quick Coupler Edge 

3 Year / 3,000 Hour Fullll5 YR 15000 HR Warranty I 36m/3,000 HR Factory 
Machine 

H & V Equipment Harris County Rentals! Asco Equipment 
Services, Inc. dba Texas State Rentals 

3307 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 1920 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78220 

150 Calendar Days 120 Calendar Days 180 Calendar Days 

12-31-2020 9-15-2020 10-7-2020 

11-7-2020 9-15-2020 10-7-2020 

No Yes Yes 

Watkinsville 
GA 30677 

No Bid 

Exhibit I 

LOCAL 

Anderson Machinery 
Company, Inc. 

9415 NE Loop 410 

San Antonio 
TX 78219 

$170,195.00 

$170,195.00 

2020 Liugong 848H 
Wheel Loader 

Cummins QSB6. 7 Tier 4 
Final, 167 HP 

ZF Power Shift 
Transmission 

3.5 Cubic Yard Bucket 

Three (3) Year/3,000 hr 
Warranty Fiver (5) 

Year/7,000 PT & Hyd 
Warranty (T errns and 
Conditions based on 

Liugong Manufacturing) 

Anderson Machinery 
Company, Inc 

9415 NE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78219 

90-120 Calendar Days 

10-31-20 

10-31-20 

No 



Opened: August 7, 2020 
For: Light and Heavy Equipment 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

LOCAL 
H & V Equipment 
Services, Inc. 

LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

dba Texas State Rentals Company, Inc. OBA Asco Handling 
Equipment 

16100012978 GDL 13307 SE Loop 410 

Harris County Rentals 
!
Associated Supply 

I
Ameri�an Material 

803 SE Loop 410 2102 E Slayton Rd 3651 Mars Hill Road 

Item Description 

Articulated Wheeled Loader/ min. 4 Cubic Yard 
Bucket 
Price Each: 
Total· 

Year, Make & Model of Loaded Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include 
SAE Net HP) 

Transmission Offered: 

Loader Warranty: 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 

Production Cut-off Date: 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without Missing Cut-

Can Bidder Provide Bid Items After Cut-Off Date: 

San Antonio 
Quantity ITX 78222 

1210) 648-5885 

$217,773.00 
$435,546.00 

San Antonio 
TX 78220 
512) 557-8454 

$169,523.35 
$339,046.70 

Lubbock 
TX 79404 

1(210) 305-3230 

$222,100.00 
$444,200.00 

2020 Doosan DL300-5 2020 Sany SW405KII 2020 Case 8216 206HP 

Scania DC09 5 Cylinderll Deutz TCD7.8 (262 HP) 
271 HP (Compatible with Jaltest) 

ZF Transmission 4 
forward and 3 reverse 

Dana 

FPT F4H FE 6135 

2F 4F/3R Powershift 
Auto/Manual Shift 

3 Year / 3,000 Hour Fullll 5YR / 5000 HR Warrantyll 36yr/3,000 HR Factory 
Machine 

H & V Equipmentll Harris County Rentalsll 
Services. Inc. dba Texas State Rentals 

3307 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78220 

150 Calendar Days 30 Calendar Days 

12-31-2020 9-1-2020 

12-31-2020 9-1-2020 

No Yes 

Asco Equipment 

1920 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78220 

150 Calendar Days 

10-30-2020 

10-30-2020 

Yes 

Watkinsville 
GA 30677 

No Bid 

LOCAL 
Anderson Machinery 
Company, Inc. 

9415 NE Loop 410 

San Antonio 
TX 78219 

$224,497.00 
$448,994.00 

2020 Liugong 856H 
Wheel Loader w/4.25 
Cubic Yard Bucket & 
Werk Brau WL4GRK 
120" Wide Grappler 

R;:tkP. 

Cummins QSB6 7 Tier 4 
Final, 225 HP 

ZF 4WG200 Power Shift 
Transmission 

Three (3) Year/3,000 hr 
Warranty Fiver (5) Year 

PT & Hyd Warranty 
(Terms and Conditions 

based on Liugong 
Manufacturing) 

Anderson Machinery 
Company, Inc 

9415 NE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78219 

90-120 Calendar Days 

10-31-20 

10-31-20 

No 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened· August 7, 2020 
For Light and Heavy Equipment LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL 

H & V Equipment Harns County Rentals Associated Supply American Material Anderson Machinery 

Services, Inc. dba Texas State Rentals Company, Inc OBA Asco Handling Company, Inc 
Equipment 

6100012978 GDL 3307 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 2102 E Slayton Rd 3651 Mars Hill Road 9415 NE Loop 410 
San Antonio San Antonio Lubbock 

Item Description Quantity TX 78222 TX 78220 TX 79404 Watkinsville San Antonio 

11210\ 648-5885 1512\ 557-8454 1210\ 305-3230 GA 30677 TX 78219 

4 6,000 lb Pneumatic Tired Forklift Bi-Fuel 
2 LP/Gasoline 

Pnce Each· No Bid $26,849 24 $25,449 00 $29,024 00 No Bid 
Total: S53,698.48 $50,898 0( $58,048.00 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 5.50% 
Pnce differential $2,800.48 

Year, Make & Model of Forklift Offered· 2020 Llugong 2020 Doosan G30N-7 2020 G30N-7DF Ooosan 
CLG2030G-3 DE Forklift 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include PSI (2.4L) (62 HP) Nissan K25 2.5L 62.7 HP Nissan 63HP 
SAE Net HP): 

Transmission Offered Liugong Doosan Single Speed Powershift 

Powers hi ft 

Forklift Warranty: 3 YR / 6000 HR 2yr/3,000 HR Standard See Quote 
Powertrain 3yr/6,000 HR 

OCDB 5yr/10,000HR 

Forklift Warranty Service Prov1der Facility Name Harns County Rentals Asco Equipment Associated Supply 
dba Texas State Rentals Company 

Forklift Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 803 SE Loop 410 1920 SE Loop 41C 1920 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78220 

Delivery: 30 Calendar Days 150 Calendar Days 45 Calendar Days 

Production Cut-off Date 9-1-2020 10-30-2020 N/A 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without M1ssin9 Cut- 9-1-2020 10-30-2020 NIA 

Can Bidder Provide Bid Items After Cut-Off Date Yes Yes Yes 



Opened: August 7, 2020 
For: Light and Heavy Equipment 

6100012978 GDL 

Item Description Quantity 

5 6,000 lb. Pneumatic Tired Forklift- LP 1 
Price Each 
Total: 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 
Price differential 

Year, Make & Model of Forklift Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include 
SAE Net HP): 

Transmission Offered: 

Forklift Warranty: 

Forklift Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Forklift Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 

Production Cut-off Date 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without Missing Cut-

Can Bidder Provide Bid Items After Cut-Off Date: 

Payment Terms 

Total 
Total Award 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

LOCAL 

H & V Equipment 
Services, Inc. 

3307 SE Loop 41 O 
San Antonio 

TX 78222 
I r210\ 648-5885 

No Bid 

Net 30 

$563,319.00 
s121,nJ.001 

LOCAL 

Harris County Rentals 

dba Texas State Rentals 

803 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio 

TX 78220 
(5121 557-8454 

$25,560.21 
$25,560.21 

0.44% 

$111.21 

2020 Liugong 20306-3 
LP6 

PSI 2.4L (62 HP) 

Liugong 

3 YR / 6000 HR 

Harris County Rentals 

dba Texas State Rental 

803 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78220 

30 Calendar Days 

9-1-2020 

9-1-2020 

Yes 

Net30 

$555,496.52 
$364,606,9111 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL 

Associated Supply American Material Anderson Machinery 

Company, Inc. OBA Asco Handling Company, Inc. 
Eouioment 
2102 E Slayton Rd 3651 Mars Hill Road 9415 NE Loop 410 
Lubbock 
TX 79404 Watkinsville San Antonio 

(210\ 305-3230 GA 30677 TX 78219 

$25,449.00 $28,373.00 No Bid 
$25,449.00 $28,373.00 

2020 Doosan G30N-7 2020 G30N-7LP Doosan 
Forklift 

Nissan K25 2.5L 62.7 HP Nissan 63HP 

Doosan Single Speed Powershift 

Powershift 

2yr/3,000 HR Standard See Quote 
3yr/6,000 HR PT 

5yr/10,000HR OCDB 

Asco Equipment Associated Supply 
Company 

1920 SE Loop 410 1920 SE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78220 

150 Calendar Days 45 Calendar Days 

10-30-2020 NIA 

10-30-2020 N/A 

Yes Yes 

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

$649,523.00 $86,421.00 $619,189.00 
sso,asa.001 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: August 7, 2020 
For· Light and Heavy Equipment NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

Boss JCB Holt Cat Nueces Power ROMCO Equipment Co. 
Equipment 

6100012978 GDL 3744 SE Loop 410 5665 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 1042 SE Loop 410 

Item Description Quantity San Antonio San Antonio Converse San Antonio 

TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78109 TX 78220 

1 Deleted 

2 
Articulated Wheeled Loader/ 2.5 Cubic Yard 

1 
Bucket 
Price Each: $138,050.00 No Bid S126,750.00 $152,971.00 

Total: $138,050.00 $126,750.00 $152,971.00 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 
Price differential 

Year, Make & Model of Loaded Offered· 2020 JCB 427 2020 or 2021 Hyundai 2020 Volvo L60H 
HL740 ATM 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include Cummins, QSB 179 HP Cummins QSB 6.7 154 Volvo Tier 4 Final 164 

SAE Net HP): Net HP HP, 6 Cylinder 

Transmission Offered: ZF Transmission ZF Transmiss10n Volvo Automatic Power 

Shift, 4 speed forward 
and reverse 

Attachments: Bucket (Include SAE, Cubic Yard, 2.5 Cubic Yard Hyundai 3.0 Yd(2) Volvo Hook on Bucket 

Size) Bucket with Bolt on Edge, 2.6 
Cubic Yard 

Loader Warranty: 2 Year/ 2000 Hours 3 Yr/ 3,000 Hour Full 12 Months, 2500 Hours 
Machine Full Machine 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Boss TX Nueces Power ROMCO Equipment Co 
Equipment 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 1042 Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78222 Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78220 

Delivery. 40 Calendar Days 180 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days 

Production Cut�off Date Unknown 10-31-2020 11-30-2020 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without Missing Cut- 9-30-2020 10-31-2020 11-30-2020 

Can Bidder Provide Bid Items After Cut-Off Date No No, please call No 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: August 7, 2020 
For: Light and Heavy Equipment NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

Boss JCB Holt Cat Nueces Power ROMCO Equipment Co. 

Equipment 

6100012978 GDL 3744 SE Loop 410 5665 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 1042 SE Loop 410 

Item Description Quantity San Antonio San Antonio Converse San Antonio 
TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78109 TX 78220 

3 
Articulated Wheeled Loader I min. 4 Cubic Yard 

2 
Bucket 
Price Each $220,250.00 No Bid $169,975.00 $262,423.00 
Total: $440,500.00 $339,950.00 $524,846.00 

Year, Make & Model of Loaded Offered· 2020 JCB 457 2020 or 2021 Hyundai 2020 Volvo L 11 OH 

HL960 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include TTTTU, 6R1000, 258 HP Cummins QSB 6.7 222 Volvo Tier 4 Final, 256 
SAE Net HP): Net HP HP, 6 Cylinder 

Transmission Offered: ZF ZF Transmission Volvo Automatic Power 

Shift, 4 Speed Forward 

and Reverse 

Loader Warranty. 2 Year I 2000 Hour 3 Yr/ 3,000 Hour Full 12 Months, 2500 Hours 

Machine Full Machine 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Boss TX Nueces Power ROM CO Equipment Co 

Equipment 

Loader Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 104;! SE Loop 410 
San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78220 

Delivery: 135 Calendar Days 180 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days 

Production Cut-off Date. Unknown 10-31-2020 11-30-2020 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without Missing Cut- 9-30-2020 10-31-2020 11-30-2020 

Can Bidder Provide 81d Items After Cut-Off Date: No No, nlease call No 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: August 7, 2020 

For Light and Heavy Equipment NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

Boss JCB Holt Cat Nueces Power ROMCO Equipment Co 

Equipment 

6100012978 GDL 3744 SE Loop 410 5665 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 1042 SE Loop 410 

Item Description Quantity San Antonio San Antonio Converse San Antonio 

TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78109 TX 78220 

4 
6,000 lb Pneumatic Tired Forklift Bi-Fuel 

2 
LP/Gasoline 
Pnce Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Total 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid. 
Price differential 

Year, Make & Model of Forklift Offered· 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include 

SAE Net HP)· 

Transm1ss1on Offered: 

Forklift Warranty: 

Forklift Warranty Serv,ce Provider Fac1hty Name 

Forklift Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery 

Production Cut-off Date 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without Miss1n9 Cut-

Can Bidder Provide Bid Items After Cut-Off Date· 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened August 7, 2020 
For: Light and Heavy Equipment NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

Boss JCB Holt Cat Nueces Power ROMCO Equipment Co. 

Equipment 

6100012978 GDL 3744 SE Loop 410 5665 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 1042 SE Loop 410 

Item Description Quantity San Antonio San Antonio Converse San Antonio 

TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78109 TX 78220 

5 6,000 lb. Pneumatic Tired Forklift- LP 1 

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Total: 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 
Price differential 

Year, Make & Model of Forklift Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include 

SAE Net HP): 

Transmission Offered 

Forklift Warranty 

Forklift Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Forklift Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 

Production Cut-off Date: 

Last Day Order can be Placed Without Missing Cut-

Can Bidder Provide Bid Items After Cut-Off Date: 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Total $578,550.00 No Bid $466,700.00 $677,817.00 

Total Award 


