

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: August 11, 2017 For: Carpet Tile, Luxury Vinyl Tile and Cove Wall Base, Removal & Installation 6100009244			Local Azteca Designs, Inc. 6852 Alamodowns Parkway San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 375-1900		Local Gomez Flooring 38116 Binz-Engelman Ste-B-125 San Antonio, TX 78219		Non-Local One Stop Services Inc. 5401 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78238	
		DT						
Item	Description	Quantity						
1	Kardean - Art Select Dusk Oak -HC03 36" x 6" Vinyl Planks Total MFR: Kardean Model: Art Select Dusk Oak HC3	1	\$25,140.00	\$20,000.00	No Bid			
2	Shaw Carpet Total MFR: Shaw Model: 5T105	1	\$77,180.00	\$76,424.00	No Bid			
3	Shaw Broadloom Carpet Total MFR: Shaw Model: 60766	1	\$2,045.00	\$2,500.00	No Bid			
4	Cove Base Total MFR: Roppe Model: 700 Series	1	\$7,715.00	\$10,560.00	No Bid			
5	Demo - Removal & Disposal of existing Carpet Total	1	\$3,840.00	\$10,775.00	No Bid			
6	DELETED							
7	DELETED							
8	Furniture Moving Total	1	\$13,000.00	\$13,065.00	No Bid			
9	Moisture, Alkalinity and Bond Testing Total	1	\$500.00	\$300.00				
	Payment Terms		1%, 7 days	Net 30	Net 30			
	Total:		\$129,420.00	\$133,624.00	No Bid			
	Total Award:		\$129,420.00					

Item 6 & 7 were deleted and will not be re-solicited