
City of San Antonio  Bid Tabulation

Opened:  April 21, 2014

For:  Annual Contract for Supply of Trees NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL

AgH20 Holdings, LLC Alfaro Tree Sales Inc.

6100004211 RS 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 10755 Pearsall Road

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 

Quantities

Round Rock,  

TX , 78664                     

512- 484-7611

Atascosa, 

TX, 78002                                             

Supply of Trees NAS

1 Deleted

2 Deleted

3 Deleted

4 Deleted

5 Deleted

6 Deleted

7 Deleted

8 Deleted

9 Deleted

10 Deleted

11 Deleted
5 Gallon Size Trees

12 Burr Oak 100
Price per Tree $35.00 No bid
Extended Price: $3,500.00

13 Cedar Elm  (TX Fall Elm) 500
Price per Tree $36.00 No bid
Extended Price: $18,000.00

14 Chinquapin Oak 100
Price per Tree $40.00 No bid
Extended Price: $4,000.00

15 Desert Willow 50
Price per Tree $41.00 No bid
Extended Price: $2,050.00

16 Eve's Necklace 50
Price per Tree $45.25 No bid
Extended Price: $2,262.50

17 Lacey Oak 100
Price per Tree $45.25 No bid
Extended Price: $4,525.00

18 Live Oak 500
Price per Tree $40.00 No bid
Extended Price: $20,000.00

19 Mexican Buckeye 50
Price per Tree $48.00 No bid
Extended Price: $2,400.00

20 Mexican Olive 100
Price per Tree $35.00 No bid
Extended Price: $3,500.00

21 Mexican Plum 50
Price per Tree $45.00 No bid
Extended Price: $2,250.00

22 Mexican White Oak 100
Price per Tree $49.00 No bid
Extended Price: $4,900.00

23 Pecan 300
Price per Tree $70.00 No bid
Extended Price: $21,000.00

24 Texas Mountain Laurel 500
Price per Tree $44.00 No bid
Extended Price: $22,000.00

25 Texas Red Oak 100
Price per Tree $45.00 No bid
Extended Price: $4,500.00

26 Texas and Mexican Redbud 50
Price per Tree $45.00 No bid
Extended Price: $2,250.00
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City of San Antonio  Bid Tabulation

Opened:  April 21, 2014

For:  Annual Contract for Supply of Trees NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL

AgH20 Holdings, LLC Alfaro Tree Sales Inc.

6100004211 RS 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 10755 Pearsall Road

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 

Quantities

Round Rock,  

TX , 78664                     

512- 484-7611

Atascosa, 

TX, 78002                                             

27 Texas Persimmon 50
Price per Tree $50.00 No bid
Extended Price: $2,500.00

15 Gallon Size Trees
28 Burr Oak 100

Price per Tree $80.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $8,000.00 $11,500.00

29 Cedar Elm 500
Price per Tree $75.00 $110.00
Extended Price: $37,500.00 $55,000.00

30 Chinquapin Oak 100
Price per Tree $85.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $8,500.00 $11,500.00

31 Desert Willow 25
Price per Tree $100.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $2,500.00 $2,875.00

32 Deleted

33 Lacey Oak 50
Price per Tree $125.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $6,250.00 $5,750.00

34 Live Oak 500
Price per Tree $75.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $37,500.00 $57,500.00

35 Mexican Buckeye 50
Price per Tree $90.00 $110.00
Extended Price: $4,500.00 $5,500.00

36 Mexican Plum 50
Price per Tree $82.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $4,100.00 $5,750.00

37 Alamo Sycamore 150
Price per Tree $85.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $12,750.00 $17,250.00

38 Mexican White Oak (Monterrey Oak) 150
Price per Tree $75.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $11,250.00 $17,250.00

39 Mexican Wild Olive 50
Price per Tree $100.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $5,000.00 $5,750.00

40 Deleted

41 Sierra Red Oak 50
Price per Tree $90.00 $120.00
Extended Price: $4,500.00 $6,000.00

42 Texas Red Oak 50
Price per Tree $85.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $4,250.00 $5,750.00

43 Texas Mountain Laurel 200
Price per Tree $85.00 $110.00
Extended Price: $17,000.00 $22,000.00

44 Texas and Mexican Redbud 100
Price per Tree $76.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $7,600.00 $11,500.00

45 Texas Persimmon 150
Price per Tree $98.00 $115.00
Extended Price: $14,700.00 $17,250.00

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Award $305,537.50

Deleted:  Items 1 - 11, 32 and 40 will be re-bid at a later date
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