City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. [Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD |4697 FM 1516 North |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY [Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
1 Articulated Wheeled Loader / 2.5 Cubic 2
Yard Bucket:
Price Each: $121,500.00 $135,500.00 $132,231.00 No Bid No Bid $129,589.88 $168,718.00
Total: $243,000.00 $271,000.00 $264,462.00 $259,179.76 $337,436.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 8.83% 38.86%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $21,462.00 $94,436.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: Hyundai HL940 TM 2018 Case 621G 2019 Caterpillar 2019 John Deere 2019 Komatsu
Wheel Loader 926M 524L WA270-8
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Hyundai HL940TM FPT FAHFE613W,| Cat C7.1 ACERT 141 John Deere Power| Komatsu SAA6D107E
(Include SAE net HP): 162 HP net hp Tech PVS 6068 (152 3 (149 Net
hp) Hp)
Warranty: 3 yr./3,000 Hr| 3yr. /3000 hours| 12 months/unlimited 1 Year Unlimited 1 Year/Unlimited
hours, total machine Hours Hours

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power Associated Supply Holt Cat RDO Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce

Equipment] Company Industries

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4697 FM 1516 N, 1920 SE Loop 410, 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 19275 N. IH 35, New 3740 SE Loop 410,

Converse, TX 78109|| San Antonio, Texas| San Antonio, Texas Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio,

78220 78222 TX 78222

Delivery: 150 Days| 180 Days 135 Days 30-90 Days 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date: Oct 31, 2019 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/31/2019 9/30/2019

Last day order can be placed without 10/30/19 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/1/2019 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No No No

date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. [Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD |4697 FM 1516 North |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY [Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
2 Articulated Wheeled Loader / min. 4 Cubic 1
Yard Bucket:
Price Each: $164,887.00 $206,250.00 $213,277.00 No Bid No Bid $217,488.90 $243,698.00
Total: $164,887.00 $206,250.00 $213,277.00 $217,488.90 $243,698.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 29.35% 47.80%
Price Differential: $48,390.00 $78,811.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2019 Hyundai HL960 2019 Case 821G 2019 Caterpillar 2019 John Deere 2019 Komatsu
Wheel Loader 950GC WAS380-8
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins QSB 6.7, FPT FAHFE613S,| Cat C7.1 ACERT, 225 John Deere Power| Komatsu SAA6D170E
(Include SAE net HP): 225 HP| 211 hp net hp Tech PSS 6090 (232 3 (191 Net Hp)
hp)
Warranty: 3 yr./3,000 Hr| 3yr. /3000 hours| 12 months/unlimited 1 Year Unlimited 1 Year/Unlimited
hours, total machine Hours Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power Associated Supply Holt Cat RDO Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce
Equipment] Company Industries
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4697 FM 1516 N, 1920 SE Loop 410, 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 19275 N. IH 35, New 3740 SE Loop 410,
Converse, TX78109| San Antonio, Texas| San Antonio, Texas Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio,
78220 78222 TX 78222
Delivery: 150 Days| 180 Days 135 Days 30-90 Days 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/31/19 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/31/2019 9/30/2019
Last day order can be placed without 10/30/19 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/1/2019 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No No No

date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. [Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD (4697 FM 1516 North |2102 E. Slayton Rd. 5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY [Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
3 Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader 1
w/Attachments:
Price Each: No Bid $38,250.00 $47,800.00 $41,949.00 $46,119.00 $38,837.14 No Bid
Total: $38,250.00 $47,800.00 $41,949.00 $46,119.00 $38,837.14
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 24.97% 9.67% 20.57%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $9,550.00 $3,699.00 $7,869.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018 Case SR175 2019 Caterpillar| 2019 GEHL R165 w/ 2019 Gehl R190 2219 John Deere
226D3| 66" Dirt Bucket & 66" 316GR
Brush Grapple
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered ISM N844LTA-DI-F50,| Cat C2.2 CRDI, 65.8 Yanmar 4TNV98C- Yanmar 4TNV98C-| Yanmar 4TNV86CHT
(Include SAE net HP): 64 hp| net hp|NMS2 Tier 4, 68.4 Net NMS T4f, 68 Net (61HP)
HP
Warranty: 24 Month/2,000 hri 12 months/2,000( Two (2) Years, 2,000 12 Months| 2 Year or 2,000 hours
Factory Warranty| hours, total machine|hrs. (whichever comes
first)
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Associated Supply Holt Cat| Anderson Machinery H&E Equipment| RDO Equipment Co.
Company| Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1920 SE Loop 410, 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 9415 NE Loop 410, 5327 Tex-Con Rd,| 19275 N. IH 35, New
San Antonio, Texas|| San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX| Braunfels, TX 78132
78220 78222 78219 78220
Delivery: 180 Days 90 Days 60-90 Days 30 Days 30-90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 8-30-2019 Unknown 10-31-19 12/1/2019 10/31/2019
Last day order can be placed without 8-30-2019 Unknown 9-30-19 12/1/2019 10/1/2019
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No| No No Yes No
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. [Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD (4697 FM 1516 North |2102 E. Slayton Rd. 5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY [Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
4 Enclosed Tracked (Low Ground Pressure) 1
Skid Loader w/Attachments:
Price Each: No Bid $48,250.00, No Bid $61,937.00 $65,693.00 $51,705.65 $64,499.00
Total: $48,250.00, $61,937.00 $65,693.00 $51,705.65 $64,499.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 28.37% 36.15% 25.19%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $13,687.00 $17,443.00 $16,249.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2019 Case TR310 2019 GEHL RT255 w/ 2019 Gehl RT255 2019 John Deere 2019 Takeuchi
70" Dirt Bucket w/ 326G TL10V2
Cutting Edge, & 24"
Planetary Auger
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered FPT F5HFL463A Deutz TD 3.6 L4 Deutz TD 3.6 L4| Yanmar 4TNV98CT Kobota V3307CR-
(Include SAE net HP): F001, 68 hp Tier 4, 70.7 Net HP 70.7 HP (970HP)[ TE4B (74.3 Net Hp)
Warranty: 24 Month/2,000 hr Two (2) Years, 2,000 12 Months| 2 Year or 2,000 hours 2 Yr/2,000 Hours
Factory Warranty hrs (whichever comes

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Associated Supply|

first)

Anderson Machinery

H&E Equipment

RDO Equipment Co.

Waukesha-Pearce

Company| Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1920 SE Loop 410, 9415 NE Loop 410, 5327 Tex-Con Rd,| 19275 N. IH 35, New 3740 SE Loop 410,

San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX| Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio,

78220 78219 78220 TX 78222

Delivery: 180 Days| 60-90 Days 30 Days 30-90 Days 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date: 8-30-2019 10-31-19 12/1/2019 10/31/2019 9/30/2019

Last day order can be placed without 8-30-2019 9-30-19 12/1/2019 10/1/2019 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No Yes No No

date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. [Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD |4697 FM 1516 North |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY [Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
5 Wheeled Material Handler: 1
Price Each: $395,000.00 No Bid $317,411.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $431,520.00
Total: $395,000.00 $317,411.00 $431,520.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018-2019 Liebuerr 2019 Caterpillar| 2019 Sennebogen
LU30 MH3022 821
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Liebuerr D934 Cat C7.1, 169 net hp| Cummins OSB4.5-
(Include SAE net HP): C130 (140 Hp)-Meets
or exceeds all other
specifications
Warranty: 1yr/ 1,000 Hr 12 months/unlimited 1 Yr/2,000 Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power Holt Cat Waukesha-Pearce
Equipment Industries
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4697 FM 1516 N, 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 3740 SE Loop 410,
Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, Texas San Antonio,
78222 TX 78222
Delivery: 150 Days 175 Days| 180 Days™
Production Cut-off Date: 10/31/19 Unknown 9/30/2019
Last day order can be placed without 10/30/19 Unknown| 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30, Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $802,887.00 $563,750.00 $842,950.00 $103,886.00 $111,812.00 $567,211.45 $1,077,153.00
Total Award: $407,887.00 $86,500.00 $317,411.00
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