City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Local
Opened: April 24, 2014
BuyBoard BuyBoard BuyBoard
For: Brush Collection Grapplers and Roll Off Hoist Trucks Freightliner of Austin Waste Systems Equipment, Inc. |Grande Truck Center
6100004279 LD |1701 Smith Rd. 300 Western Park 4562 |IH-10 East
Austin, San Antonio, San Antonio,
o TX 78721 TX 78228 TX 78219
Item Description QTY |512-389-0000 888-889-2783 210-666-7112
1A Brush Collection Grappler Truck Chassis (Minimum 14
GVWR 37.000-Ibs.):
Price Each: $86.571.00 No Bid $90.416.00
Price Total: $1,211,994.00) $1,265,824.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 4.44%)
bid:
Price differential: $53.830.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis: 2015 Freightliner M2-106 2015 Western Star 4700 SB
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 1 year, 100K Miles 1 year
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include Cummins ISL 9 - 330 HP. Cummins ISL 8.9 - 330 H.P.
SAE Net HP): 1000 Ib ft Toraue
Enaine Warrantv: 2 yr. 250K Miles| 2 years or 250,000 miles
Specific Make & Model of Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS| Allison 3000 RDS
Transmission Warrantv: 5 years Unlimited Miles| 60 Month
Warranty Service Provider Name: Doggett Freightliner of South Grande Truck Center
Texas. LLC.
Warranty Providers Address: 8700 IH 10 East, Converse, TX| 4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio,
78109 TX 78219
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2014 July 3, 2014
Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off
date: 12/1/2014 July 1, 2014
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes| No
1B Truck Body, and Knuckle Boom Loader, mounted on 14

Item 1A:
Price Each: No Bid $79,112.49 No Bid
Price Total: $1,107,574.86)

Make & Model of Loader:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Providers Name:

Warranty Providers Address:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off
date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Rotobec M-22 w/ 045 Bucket

12 Months or 2,000 Hours of Use|

Waste Systems Equipment, Inc.

300 Western Park, San Antonio,
TX 78228

December 31, 2014

December 30, 2014

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Local
Opened: April 24, 2014
BuyBoard BuyBoard BuyBoard
For: Brush Collection Grapplers and Roll Off Hoist Trucks Freightliner of Austin Waste Systems Equipment, Inc. |Grande Truck Center
6100004279 LD |1701 Smith Rd. 300 Western Park 4562 |IH-10 East
Austin, San Antonio, San Antonio,
o TX 78721 TX 78228 TX 78219
Item Description QTY |512-389-0000 888-889-2783 210-666-7112
2A Brush Collection Grappler Truck Chassis (Minimum 2
GVWR 64,000-Ibs.):
Price Each: $117,246.00 No Bid $120,098.00
Price Total: $234,492.00 $240,196.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 2.43%
bid:
Price differential: $5.704.00|
Year. Make & Model Cab & Chassis: 2015 Freightliner SD114 2015 Western Star 4700 SB
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 1 vear - 100K Miles 1 vear|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include Detroit DD13 435 HP Detroit DD13 12.8 435 H.P. 1550
SAE Net HPY): Ib. ft. Toraue
Engine Warranty: 2 yrs - Unlimited Miles - All / 5 yrs 2 years or 250,000 miles
- 500K Miles (Maior Comp.)
Specific Make & Model of Transmission Offered: Allison 4500 RDS Allison 4500 RDS|
Transmission Warrantv: 5 yrs. Unlimited Miles 60 Month|
Warranty Service Provider Name: Doggett Freightliner of South Grande Truck Center|
Texas. LLC.
Warranty Providers Address: 8700 IH 10 East, Converse, TX 4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio,
78109 TX 78219
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2014 July 3, 2014
Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off 12/1/2014
date: July 1, 2014
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Nol
2B Roll Off Tilt Frame Hoist and Knuckle Boom Loader, 2
mounted on ltem 2A:
Price Each: No Bid $96,784.00) No Bid
Price Total: $193,568.00

Make & Model of Loader:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Providers Name:

Warranty Providers Address:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off
date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Rotobec M-22 w/ 045 Bucket
5 Years
Waste Systems Equipment, Inc.

300 Western Park, San Antonio,
TX 78228

December 31, 2014

December 30, 2014

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Local
Opened: April 24, 2014
BuyBoard BuyBoard BuyBoard
For: Brush Collection Grapplers and Roll Off Hoist Trucks Freightliner of Austin Waste Systems Equipment, Inc. |Grande Truck Center
6100004279 LD |1701 Smith Rd. 300 Western Park 4562 IH-10 East
Austin, San Antonio, San Antonio,
o TX 78721 TX 78228 TX 78219
Item Description QTY [512-389-0000 888-889-2783 210-666-7112
3A Cab and Chassis, Minimum 66,000 Ibs. GVWR: 9
Price Each: $116,984.00 No Bid $119,169.00
Price Total: $1,052,856.00 $1,072,521.00|
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 1.87%
bid:
Price differential: $19.665.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis: Freightliner 114 SD 2015 Western Star 4700 SA|
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 1yr- 100K Miles 1 year|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include Detroit DD13 435 HP Detroit DD13 12.8 435 H.P. 1550
SAE Net HP): Ib. ft. Toraue,
Engine Warranty: 2 yr. - Unlimited Miles - All / 5 yr. 2 years or 250,000 miles|
500K Miles Major Comp
Specific Make & Model of Transmission Offered: Allison 4500 RDS Allison 4500 RDS|
Transmission Warrantv: 5 yr - Unlimited Miles 60 Month|
Warranty Service Provider Name: Doggett Freightliner of South Grande Truck Center|
Texas. LLC.
Warranty Providers Address: 8700 IH 10 East, Converse, TX 4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio,
78109 TX 78219
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2014 July 3, 2014
Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off 12/1/2014
date: July 1, 2014
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Nol
3B Roll Off Tilt Frame Hoist with Tarp System, Mounted 9
on ltem 3A:
Price Each: No Bid $44,947.00] No Bid
Price Total: $404,523.00

Make & Model of Roll Off Tilt Frame Hoist:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Providers Name:

Warranty Providers Address:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off
date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Stellar SI751740R

5 Years

Waste Systems Equipment, Inc.

300 Western Park, San Antonio,
TX 78228

December 31, 2014

December 30, 2014

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Local
Opened: April 24, 2014
BuyBoard BuyBoard BuyBoard
For: Brush Collection Grapplers and Roll Off Hoist Trucks Freightliner of Austin Waste Systems Equipment, Inc. |Grande Truck Center
6100004279 LD |1701 Smith Rd. 300 Western Park 4562 IH-10 East
Austin, San Antonio, San Antonio,
o TX 78721 TX 78228 TX 78219
Item Description QTY [512-389-0000 888-889-2783 210-666-7112
4 Cooperative Fee Each 1

Cooperative Fee Each $400.00
Cooperative Fee Total $400.00
Pavment Terms Net 30
Total $1,212,394.00] $1,706,065.86 $1,313,117.00]
Total Award $1.212.394.00 $1.706.065.86 $1.313.117.00
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