

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 8, 2016 For: Aggressive Driving Program Vehicles 610008208		LD	Non Local	Local	Local	Non Local	Non Local	Non Local
Item	Description	Quantity	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051 817-410-7541	Jordan Ford 13010 IH 35 North San Antonio, TX 78233 210-477-8084	Brasada Ford LTD, dba Northside Ford 12300 San Pedro San Antonio, TX 78216	Cowboy Dodge 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. Silsbee, TX 77656	Jim Bass Ford, Inc. 4032 W. Houston Harte Expressway San Angelo, TX 76901	Silsbee Ford 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. Silsbee, TX 77656
1	Dodge Charger Pursuit: Price Each: Total: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Year, Make & Model Offered: Engine Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	8	\$22,885.00 \$183,080.00 2% \$179,418.40 2017 Dodge Charger Pursuit 3.6L V6 3yr/36,000 mile, 5yr/100,000 limited powertrain Boerne Dodge - Boerne, TX, Any authorized Dodge Dealer Any Dodge Dealer 75-90 days April 30, 2017 order late June 2017 build 4/30/17 No	No Bid	No Bid	\$23,895.00 \$191,160.00 2017 Dodge Charger V6, 5 spd. Trans 36 Mo/36,000 Bumper to Bumper, 5 Yr/100,000 Powertrain Ancira Dodge 10807 IH 10 W., San Antonio, TX 78230 120-160 Days, Due to production start up in January 5-31-17 5-31-17 No	No Bid	No Bid
2	Police Vehicle - Ford Mustang: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Engine Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Payment Terms Total:	2	No Bid	\$23,193.00 \$46,386.00 0.51% \$233.72 2017 Ford Mustang V-6 3 Yr/36,000 Miles Bumper to Bumper, 5 Yr/60,000 Miles Powertrain Jordan Ford 13010 IH 35 North, San Antonio, TX 78233 90-120 Days TBD TBD No	\$24,779.00 \$49,558.00 7.38% \$3,405.72 2017 Ford Mustang V6 Deluxe Model # P8A 3.7L 6V-TI VCT 3 Year, 36,000 Miles Bumper to Bumper, 5 Year 100,000 Miles Powertrain Northside Ford 12300 San Pedro, San Antonio, TX 78216 90 Days Not Available Not Provided No	No Bid	\$24,444.00 \$48,888.00 2017 Ford Mustang 3.7L V6 3 Years or 36,000 Miles Comprehensive, 5 Ywars or 60,000 Miles Powertrain Jim Bass Ford, Inc or Any Ford Dealer Nationwide 4032 W. Houston Harte Expwy or Any Ford Dealer Nationwide 100 Days 5/31/2017 5/31/2017 No	\$23,076.14 \$46,152.28 2017 Ford Mustang V6 - 3.7L 36Mo/36,000 Bumper to Bumper Red McCombs 8333 IH -10 Frontage Rd., San Antonio, TX 78230 90-120 Days 5-31-17 5-31-17 No
Total Award:			\$183,080.00	\$46,386.00				