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ANORDINANCE 2017 -08-31 -0601

AUTHORIZING CONTRACTS WITH THE AKANA GROUP INC., C&M
GOLF & GROUNDS EQUIPMENT, HOLT TEXAS, LTD., SAGELINE
INC., AND TUTTLE MOTOR COMPANY TO PROVIDE CITY
DEPARTMENTS WITH TRACTORS AND LANDSCAPING EQUIPMENT
FOR AN ESTIMATED TOTAL COST OF $1,594,054.18 OVER A TWO
YEAR PERIOD, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND
REPLACEMENT FUND AND STORM WATER FUND.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide various departments of the City of San Antonio
with tractors and landscaping equipment for a various mowing, vegetation projects, and park
maintenance projects throughout the City; and

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Holt Texas, LTD. (Items 1, 5, and 6), H&V Equipment (Item
1), The Akana Group Inc. (Item 4), Ag-Pro Texas (Items 5 and 6), and Ewald Kubota (Item 6),
failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements; and

WHEREAS, the lowest responsive bids were submitted by Tuttle Motor Company for items 1
and 5, Holt Texas, LTD. for item 2, C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment for items 4 and 10, The
Akana Group Inc. for item 6, and Sageline Inc. for items 7-9; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bids from Tuttle Motor Company (Items 1 and 5), Holt
Texas, LTD. (Item 2), C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment (Items 4 and 10), The Akana Group
Inc. (Item 6), and Sageline Inc. (Items 7-9) to provide the City of San Antonio with tractors and
landscaping equipment for an estimated total cost of $1,594,054.18 over a two year period are
hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance
deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto
and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for
inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids from Holt Texas, LTD. (Items 1, 5,
and 6), H&V Equipment (Item 1), The Akana Group Inc. (Item 4), Ag-Pro Texas (Items 5 and
6), and Ewald Kubota (Item 6) failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $397,778.02 is available as part of
the Fiscal Year 2017 budget per the table below:
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Amount General Ledger Cost Center Fund
$309,843.86 5501055 3503200001 72001000
$87,934.16 5501000 2304020007 29070000
Total $397,778.02

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount is authorized to The Akana Group,
Inc., C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment, Holt Texas, LTD, Sageline, Inc., and Tuttle Motor
Company and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 5. Additional funding for this ordinance in an amount up to $1,196,276.16 will be
encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is authorized to the vendors
identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2018 budget and
such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their terms as evidenced by
subsequent ordinances.

SECTION 6. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 7. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 31* day of August, 2017.

@AYO

Ron Nirenberg
ATTEST ﬁ } APPROVED AS TO FORM:
-W M. Vacdk, City "Clefk /‘%ﬁrew S’egov1a City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 8 (in consent vote: 7, 8, 10, 11, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28A, 28B )
Date: 08/31/2017

Time: 09:24:59 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: An Ordinance authorizing contracts with The Akana Group, Inc., C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment,

Holt Texas, LTD, Sageline, Inc., and Tuttle Motor Company to provide City departments with tractors
and landscaping equipment for an estimated total cost of $1,594,054.18 over a two year period, funded
by the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund and the Storm Water Fund. [Ben Gorzell, Chief
Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Result: Passed
Voter Group P:::etn ¢ Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District | X X
William Cruz Shaw District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X X
Clayton H. Perry District 10 X

http://cosaweb/voteinterface/Default.aspx 8/31/2017
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017 Non-Local Local Local Local
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Non-ocal Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company [Holt Texas, LTD. C&M Gol & Grounds |The Akana Group nc. |Snge||na Inc. Ag-Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc.[DeWinnie Equi D ie Equi D ie Equij
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment Company Company [Company
6100008940 D 508 Ave H, 5865 S.E. Loop 410 |13250 Lookout Rd., 1701 W NW Highway, | 1300 W. University 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut Street [11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.  [11002 Bandera Rd.
Ste. 100 Ave.
em Description Estimated |Poteel, San Antonio, San Antonio, p Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonie, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 78085 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250
830-742-3515 210-648-1111 210-857-3511 571-228-6843 512-930-4054 830-379-5477
1 4x4 Utiiity Tractor: 14 NAS
Price Each: $62,480. $58,500.00| No Bidi $§64,236.35] No Bid $83,250.00] No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Total: $874,720. $791,000.00| $899,308.80 $885,500.00
Make & Model Offered: Case Farmall 1104 Massey F John Deere 5115M| John Deere 5115M
5711 Utility Tractor]
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered case IHFPT Tief Agco Power 4 Cyil John Deere John Deere Power|
(Include SAE net HP): 4B/Final 110 Enginej Max Engine HP 110§ PowerTech Diesel| Tech PWL 115 HPj
HP 80 PTO HFj Engine|
Warmanty: 2 Yrj2000 Hrs3 24 Month/2000 Hour 2 Years/2000 Hours| 2 Years or 2000 Hours
Whichever comes| Factory Warranty| Factory Warranty|
Firs
|Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tuttle Motor Compan Holt Caf Not Provided| Ag-Proj
|Waranty Service Provider Facility Address: 509 Ave H, Poteet, 5665 S.E. Loop 410, Not Provided| 3030 N. Austin,
7808 San Antonio, TX| Seguin, TX 78155
Delivery: 120 Days| 45 Days 180 Days
2 Compact Tractor with 5 foot Shredder: 4 .
Price Each: No Bid $15,250. No Bid $27,272.70] No Bid $22,875.00) No Bid} No Bidi No Bidi No Bid|
Total: $61,000. $109.080.80 $91,500.00!
Make & Model Offered: Massey Ferguson John Deere 3033R| John Deere 3033R/|
1726E and Woods] Compact Utikity] John Deere MX5|
RCS Shredder| Tractor (24PTO HP)
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 24.0 Rated HP Yanmar Diesel Engine| ‘Yanmar - 3TNVBSC -
(Include SAE net HP): Shibaura 3 Cylinder 32.2 HP| MJT 33 HP|
Liquid Cooled Diesel
Warranty: MF 1728E-24) 2 Years/2000 Hours| 3033R - 2 yrs. or 2000
Month/2000 Hou Factory Warranty] Hrs. / MX5 - 1 Year -|
Factory Warranty] Gearbox 5 Years|
Woods RC5 - 1 Yea
factory Warranty on
Cutter/3 Yeary]
Warrantv on Gaarhox
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Holt Cat} Not Provided| Ag-Pro|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5885 S.E. Loop 410, Not Provided! 3030 N. Austin,|
San Antonio, T( Seguin, TX 78155
78:
Delivery: 120 Da 45 Days 180 Days|
3 Delated:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/24/2017 1of 10
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017 Non-Local Local Local Local
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company [Holt Texas, LTD. C&M Golf & Grounds {The Akana Group Inc. [Sagetine Inc, Ag-Pro Texas Alamao Group (TX) Inc.[DeWinnie Equi DeWinnie Equi D i
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment ICompany ICompany Company
16100008840 Lo 509 Ave H, 5665 S.E. Loop 410  |13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 W NW Highway, | 1300 W. University  |3030 N. Austin 1502 € Walnut Streel [11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.
Ste. 100 Ave.
em Description Estimated |Poteet, San Antonio, San Antonio, p H Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 78065 | TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 [TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250
830-742-3515 210-648-1111 210-6857-3511 571-220-6843 512-930-4054 830-378-5477
4 Single Operator Grounds Sprayer: 1 NAS
Price Each: No Bidi No Bid $26,721. $0,026.04 No Bid No Bid No Bidi No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Total: $26,721, $9,026.04|
Make & Model Offered: Smithco Spray Staf§  Frontier LS1125 3-pi
1754 Mounted Liquid
Sprayer - Altachmani|
Only]
p Make & Model of Engine Offered Smithco 1754, 31 HA NA|
{Include SAE net HP):
Warranty: 2Yry 2 Years/2000 Hours|
Factory Waranty)
'Wamanty Service Provider Facility Name: CA&M Golf & Grounds Not Provided|
‘Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 13250 Lookout Rd., Not Provided|
San Antonio, TX]
78233
Delivery: 30 Daysy 45 days|
5 15’ Ft Batwing Mower Deck: 20
NAS NAS
Price Each: $15,495. $12,500.00] No Bid $19,885.89) No Bid $11,750.00{ $18.,004.00f No Bid| No Bidi No Bid|
Total: $309,800. $250,000.00] $397,317.80 $235,000.00] $360,080.00|
Make & Model Offered: Rhino 415 Woods BW180XHD) John Deere CX15 Flex| John Deere MX15; Alamo Industrial -
wing Rotary Cutter - Eagle 15" Flex Wing|
540 RPM - Stump| Rotary Mower|
Jumpers - Single
Suction Blades|
Warranty: 1 yr. machine, 2 yrs. 1 Year Factory] 2 Years/2000 Hours| 1Year/5 Years| Mower wamanty - 1
Ltd Driveline, 8 yrs § Warranty on Machine/| Factory Year Limited and|
gearbox, 2 yrs. seals] 8 Year on Gearbox] Gearbox warranty -
Warranty] 5 Year Limited
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tuttle Motor Compan: Holt Cat| Not Provided| Ag-Pro| H & V Equipment|
Services Inc.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 509 Ave H, Poleet, 5865 S.E. Loop 410, Not Provided| 3030 N. Austin,| 3307 S East loop 410,
7808 San Antonio, TX| Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX|
78. 78
Delivery: 45 Days| &0 Dizy:I 45 days| 180 Days| 120 Dizy:I
Prepared by Purchasing 7/24/2017
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

(Opened: June 14, 2017 Noa-Local Local Local Local
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Bid1 Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid3
For: Annuai Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company {Holt Texas, LTD. C&M Golf & Grounds |The Akana Group Inc. [Sageline Inc. Ag-Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc.[DeWinnie E DeWinnie Equi D i i
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment Company Company [Company
8 LD 508 Ave H, 5665 S.E. Loop 410 | 13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 W NW Highway, | 1300 W. University 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut Street [11002 Bandera Rd.  [11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.
Ste. 100 Ave.
item Description Estimated |Poteet, San Antonie, San Antonia, p Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 78065 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250
830-742-3515 210-648-1111 210-657-3511 571-229-5843 512-830-4054 830-379-5477
8 84” inch Mower Deck: 2
NAS NAS
Price Each: No Bid| $5.700.004 No Bid $9.959.18) No Bid $7,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bidi No Bid|
Total: $11,400.00] $19.918.32 $14,300.00]
Make & Model Offered: Woods BB8400X| 2017 Bush Hog 327 Brown 884
(Warranty: 1 Year Factory] 2 Years/2000 Hours} 1 Year / 80 Days on|
Warranty on Machine/] Factory Warranty]
6 Year on Gearbox]
Warranty]
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Holt Cat| Not Provideds Ag-Pro|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 S.E. Loop 410, Not Provided! 3030 N. Austin,
San Antonio, TX| Seguin, TX 78155
78
Delivery: 80 Days 45 days} 180 Days
7 52" Zero Tum Mowers- GASOLINE 3
Engines:
Price Each: No Bid| No Bid! No Bidi $7.909. 36,459, No Bid| No Bid $8,974.13} $8,623.48| $9,395.27
Total: $23.728. $19.377.00¢ $26,922.30] $25,870.38] $28,185.81
Prompt Payment Discount: 1% 1%| 1%|
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $26,653.17, $25,611.68] $27,803,95]
Discount:
Percentage between lowest rasponsive 38%| 24%) 44%,
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $7.276.17, $6,234 88| $8,526.95
Make & Model Offered: John Deere Z815E] Bad Boy Outlaw 541 Exmark,| Gravely, Pro-Tum 252| Gravely, Pro-Tum 452
Commercial ZTraK BBOS4ZT7408 LZST40AKC524A2| 992288 982273
P Make & Modef of Engine Offered Not Provided] T47cc Kohle Kohler Command Kawasaki FX850V, Kawasaki FX850V]
I(Include SAE net HP): Confidant 25HP} ECV 740 EFI, 25HP] 27 HP 27 HP]
Warranty: 2 Years/2000 Hours§ Defects in material of] 5 Year or 1250 Hours, 2 Years| 3 Years|
Factory Warranty] workmanship 2 years] First 2 years no hour]|
limited|
|Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Not Provided] Texas Tractor Country D D D
c c C
Warmanty Service Provider Facility Address: Not Provided] 1175 FM 306, New 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 11002 Bandera Rd.,
Braunfels, TX 781 San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, TX]
782501 78250 782501
Delivery: 45 daysj 30 Da 45 Days| 45 Days| 45 Days|

Prepared by Puichasing 772472017
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017 Non-Local Local Local Local
Non-l.ocal Local Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Non-Locat Non-Local Bid1 Bid 2 Bid 3
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company [Hoit Texas, LTD. C&M Golf & Grounds |The Akana Group Inc. [Sageline Inc. Ag-Pro Texas Alama Group (TX) Inc.|DeWinnie D D: i i
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment [Company [Company Company
61 LD 508 Ave H, 5665 S.E.Loop 410 |13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 W NW Highway, [1300 W. University 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut Street 11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.
Sle. 100 Ave.
tem Description Estimated [Poteet, 'San Antonio, San Antonio, L Seguin, Seguin, San Anlonio, San Antonlo, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 78065 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250
830-742-3515 210-648-1111 210-6857-3511 571-228-6843 512-930-4054 B830-379-5477
8 60" Zero Tum Mowers (Diesel): 12
Price Each: No Bid No Bid| No Bid $18,500.2! No Bid No Bid $12,992.93 $12,092.93| $12,992.93|
Total: $234,003 ¢ $142,788, $155,815.16] $155,015.164 $155,915.16
Prompt Payment Discount: 1% 1%| 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $154,356.01 $154,356.01 $154,356.01
Discount:
Percentage between lowest responsive 8%) 8%| 8%
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $11,568.01 $11,568.01 $11,568.01
Make & Model Offered: John Deere Z897R]l Bad Boy 61" Compacy Exmark, Exmark,| Exmark,
Diesel W80 in. &) Diesel B8D61247CA] LZS802DKUE05A1 LZS802DKUB0SA1 LZS802DKUB0SA1
gauge Side Discharge
Decky
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Not Provided] 1100cc Cat Diesef Kubota Diesel, D802] Kubota Diesel, D902 Kubota Diesel, D902
(Include SAE net HP): 24.9 HP} 25HP] 25HP] 25HP|
Warranty: 2 Years/2000 Hours] Defects in material o] 2 Years| 2 Years| 2 Years|
Factory Warmanty] workmanship 2 years|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Not Provided} Texas Tractor Country D E D Equij D E
c ot [t
Warranty Service Provider Facliity Address: Not Provided] 1175 FM 306, Newt 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 11002 Bandera Rd.j 11002 Bandera Rd.,
Braunfets, TX 781300 San Antonie, TX| San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX|
78250 782504 782501
Delivery: 45 days] 30 Daysj 45 Days| 45 Days| 45 Days
9 80" Zero Turn Mowers (Gasaline): 4
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.132.63] $6.559.00 No Bid| No Bid $9,796.83) $8,804.97| $10,004.45]
Total: $32,530.52 323‘236.@ $39,187.32] $35,219.88 $40,377.80;
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%| 1% 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $38,795.45] $34,867.68| $30,874.02|
Discount:
Percentage between lowest responsive 48%| 33% 52%
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $12,559.45] $8,631.88) $13,738,02
Make & Model Offered: John Deere Z8156]  Bad Boy Outlaw 61'] Exmark,| Gravely, Pro-Tum 260| Gravely Pro-Tum 450|
Commercial ZTark BB061ZTT7408 LZS749AKCB04A1 982269 982274/
Specific Make & Modei of Engine Offered Not Provided] T4Tcc Kothe: Kohler Command|  Kawasaki FX850V,|  Kawasaki FXB21V,
(Include SAE net HP): Confidant 25 HF} ECV 749 EFI, 26.5HP] 27 HP 31 HP|
'Warranty; 2 Years/2000 Hours] Defects in material o/ 5 Year or 1250 Hours, 2 Years| 3 Years|
Factory Warmranty] workmanship 2 years| First 2 years no hour]
limited|
[Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Not Provided]l Texas Tractor Country DA D Equij D E
(o] c C
Warranty Service Provider Facllity Address: Nol Provided! 1175 FM 306, New 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 11002 Bandera Rd.,
Braunfels, TX 781 San Antonio, TX| San Antonie, TX| San Antonio, TX
78250 78250 782501
Delivery: 45 days{ 30 Da 45 Days 45 Days| 45 Days
Prepared by Purchasing 7/24/2017 4ol 10



June 14, 2017

City of San Antonio Bid Tabuiation

Non-Local Local Local Local
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Bid1 Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company [Hol Texas, LTD. IC&M Golf & Grounds |The Akana Group Inc. [Sagetine Inc. Ag-Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc.[DeWinnie D DeWinnie
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment Company [Company [Company
Lo 500 Ave H, 5865 S.E. Loop 410 13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 W NW Highway, (1300 W. University 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut Street |11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.  |11002 Bandera Rd.
Ste. 100 Ave.
item Description Estimated {Poteet, San Antonio, San Antonio, p Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 78065 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250
830-742-3515 210-648-1111 210-857-3511 571-228-6843 512-930-4054 830-379-5477
10 3 Wheeled Infield Tractor w/ Attachments. 3
Price Each: No Bid| No Bid $17.422. No Bid Na Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| Na Bid| No Bid|
Tolal: $52,266.
Make & Model Offered: Smithco Sand Star 1
PN# 45-001
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Vanguard 18]
|(Include SAE net HP). HP/12kW OHV|
Gasoline]
Warranty: 2 Years}
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: C&M Golf & Grounds|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 13250 Lookout Rd.
San Antonio, T
78233
Delivery: 3Q Days|
Payment Terms: Net 304 Net 308 Net ‘M‘ Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30} 1% - 10 Days| 1% - 10 Days| 1% - 10 Days
Itern 3 was deleted and will be rebid at a laler date.
Prepared by Purchasing 7/2472017
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

(Opened: June 14, 2017 Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bid 4 Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3 Neon-Local Non-Local Alt1 Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnie Equipment |Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment H&V H&V Turt Pt Turf Inc,
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment o Manufacturing, Inc.  [Products Products
6100008940 Lo 11002 Bandera Rd.  |1800 W IH10 3307 S.E.Loop 410  |3307 S.E. Loop 410  |3307 S.E. Loop 410 [105 S Old Hwy 81 8468 Salma Parkway 9468 Selma Parkway [1300 W. Universily
Ave,
ltem Description Estimated |San Antonio, Seguin, San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio Moundridge, Selma, Selma, Georgetown,
Quantity |TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS 67107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78628
1 4x4 Utility Tractor: 14 NAS
Price Each: No Bid| $66,537.00) No Bid No Bid| $60,764.71 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid No Bid|
Total: $931,518.00| $850,705.94)
Make & Model Offered: Kubota M8-111SHC| Kioti PX1153 PCB|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kubota V3800 Tier 4| Daedong DLO3-LEAO7
(Include SAE net HP): DEV 108.8 Net HP] 110 HP|
(Warranty: 24 Mos/2000 Hours| One Year 2000 Hrs. to;
Whichever Occurs) include all required|
First, Powertrain 38| Under 4.2.3)
Mos/3000 WOF|
Warranty Service Provider Facitity Name: Ewald Kubota) H & V Equipment]
Services|
‘Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1900 W IH10, 3307 S. E. Loop 410,
Seguin, TX 78158 San Antonio, TX|
Delivery: 60 Days| 45 Days|
2 Compact Traclor with 5 foot Shredder: 4
Price Each: No Bid $22,840.001 $17.483.53 No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Total: $91,796.00] $69,934.12|
Make & Mode! Offered: Kubota L2501 Kioti CK 2610 HST]
ROPS|
Specific Make & Madel of Engine Offered Kubota D1703 23.8| Daedong 3A165LWM-|
i(Include SAE net HP) HP V24,5 HP
|Warranty: 24 Mos/1500 Hours| 1 Year 2000 Hours to|
Whichever Occurs| include ail required
First, PT 38 Under 4.2.3
WOF|
|Wamranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota| H & V Equipment}
Services|
Warmranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1800 W IH10,| 3307 S. E. Loop 410,
Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX|
76222
Delivery: 80 Days 45 Days
3 Deleted:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/24/2017 6of 10



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

(Opened: June 14, 2017 Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bid4 Non-Local Bid1 Bid 2 Bid3 Non-Local Non-Local A1 Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnie Equipment |Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment H & V Equi M &V E Professional Turt Professional Tur{ Sageline Inc.
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Company Manufacturing, Inc.  [Products Products
6100008940 LD 11002 Bandera Rd. {1800 W IH10 3307 S.E.Loop 410 {3307 S.E. Loop 410  |3307 S.E. Loop 410 [105 S Old Hwy 81 8468 Salma Parkway 9468 Selma Parkway [1300 W. Universily
Ave.
item Description Estimated |San Antonio, Seguin, San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio Moundridge, Seima, Seima, Georgetown,
Quantity |TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS 67107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78628
4 Single Operator Grounds Sprayer: 1
Price Each: No Bidi No Bid| No bid| No Bid No Bid| No Bid $31,008.66) No Bid No Bid|
Total: $31,008 66
Make & Model Offered: Toro MP 1750 (Toro
41188)
P Make & Model of Engine Offered Kohler, 27 HP|
(Include SAE net HP).
Warranty: 2 years or 1500 hours|
whichever occurs firsy
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Professional Turf]
Products;
‘Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 9468 Selma Parkway,
Seima, TX 78154
Delivery: 15-30 Days;
5 15" Ft Batwing Mower Deck: 20
Price Each: No Bid| $16,289.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid! No Bid| No Bod| No Bid|
Total: $325,980.00]
Make & Model Offered: Rhino 4150
Warranty: 1Yr
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1900 W IH10,
Seguin, TX 78155)
Delivery: 45 Days|
Prepared by Purchasing 7/24/2017 Tol10



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017 Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bid4 Non-local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3 Non-Local Non-Local Alt1 Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnie Equipment TEwald Kubota H & V Equipment H&V H&V P Turf P Turf inc.
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment [Company Manufacturing, Inc.  [Products Products
6100008940 Lo 11002 Bandera Rd. {1800 W IH10 3307 S.E.Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 |3307 S.E. Loop 410  |105 S Old Hwy 81 8468 Seima Parkway 9468 Seima Parkway |1300 W. University
Ave.
Rem Description Estimated |San Antonio. Seguin, San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio Moundridge, Selma, Seima, |Georgetown,
Quantity |TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS 87107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78628
6 84" inch Mower Deck: 2
NAS
Price Each: No Bidi $9.300.004 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid! No Bidi No Bid
Tolal: $18,600.00|
Make & Model Offered: Rhino 484!
{Warranty: 1Yr
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubotal
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1800 W IH10,|
Seguin, TX 78155
Delivery: 45 Days|
7 52" Zero Turn Mowers- GASOLINE 3
Engines:
Price Each: $7.564.00} No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid $8,487.00| $8,246.23) $7.244.16 $6.999.00
Total: $22,602.00] $25,481.00] §24,738 89 $21,732.48 $20,987.00|
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $22,465.08|
Discount:
|Percentage between lowest responsive 16%)
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $3,082.08
Make & Model Offered: Cub Pro Z 554L] Grasshopper 225/52 Toro 74906 Toro 74955 Bad Boy Outiaw|
Extreme 54"
B8OS4FX850)
pecific Make & Modei of Engine Offered Kotiler C Kohter Command Pro Kohfer 25 HP} 25 HP Kohler|  852cc Kawasaki FX|
l{include SAE net HP): ECV 748 EFI, 26.5HP] Model CH742, 747cc| Command Pro W/527] 27 HP
Herizontal Crankshaft, Turbo Force Deck|
25HP]
[Warranty: 3 Years) 5 Years or 1,250 Engine 3 years, Not Provided| Defects in material or]
hours, first 3 years no| Product 5 years of] workmanship 2 years|
hour i 1500 hours
occurs first]
Warranty Service Providaer Facility Name: DeWinnie Equipment D f Tur] P i Turf] Texas Tractor Country|
Company] Products| Products]
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 9468 Selma Parkway,| 9468 Selma Parkway), 1175 FM 306, New|
San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, TX| Selma, TX 78154 Selma, TX 78154| Braunfels, TX 78130
782501 782505
Delivery: 45 Days| 30 Days| 15-30 Da Not Provided} 30 Days|
Prepared by Purchasing 7/24/2017
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

(Opened: June 14, 2017 Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bid 4 Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid3 Non-Local Non-Local Alt1 Bid 2
For Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnie Equipment [Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment H&V H&V b Turf P Turf tnc.
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment [Company Manufacturing, Inc.  [Products Products
8100008940 Lo 11002 Bandera Rd.  |1900 W IH10 3307 S.E.Loop 410  |3307 S.E. Loop 410  |3307 S.E. Loop 410  [105 S Old Hwy 81 9488 Selma Parkway 0468 Seima Parkway |1300 W. University
Ave.
Item Description Estimated |San Antonio, Seguin, San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio Moundridge, Setma, Seima, |Georgetown,
Quantity |TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS 67107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78628
8 80" Zaro Turn Mowers (Diesel); 12
Price Each: $12,892.93) No Bid| No Bid No Bid| No Bid| $11.997.00; $12,314.36| No Bid| $13,100.00;
Total: $155,815.18) $143 964,00 $147,772.32 $157,200.00]
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $154,356.01
Discount:
Parcantage between lowest responsive 8%
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $11,568.01
Make & Model Offered: Exmark, Grasshopper 325D/61 Toro 74267 Bad Boy Diesel 617
LZSS02DKUG05A1 B8AB135PK
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kubota Diesel, D902 Kubota D802, 898cc, Kubota 25 HP| 1500¢cc Perkins LC,
(Include SAE net HP): 25HP] Cast-iron Block, 3- Diesel 35 HP|
Cylinder, Horizontal
Crankshaft. 25HP|
Warranty: 2 Years] 5 Years or 1,250| Engine 2 Years| Defects in material orj
hours, first 3 years no Product 4 Yrs, or workmanship 2 years;
hour kmitation) 1,200 Hoursj
whichever occurs first
(Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: DeWinnie Equipment D P Turf] Texas Tractor Countryf
Company] Products
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 9468 Selma Parkway, 1175 FM 308, New|
San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, TX| Selma, TX 78154 Braunfels, TX 78130
782504 78250
Defivery: 45 Days 30 Days| 15-30 Days| 30 Days|
9 60" Zero Turn Mowers (Gasoline): 4
Price Each: $8,244.00{ No Bidi No Bidi No Bid No Bid| $8,697.00 $8,482.78 $7,846.16 $7,288.00
Tolal: $32,976.00{ $34,788.00] $33,931.12 $31,384.64 $29,196.00)
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $32,646.24/
Discount:
Percentage between lowest responsive 24%
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $6,410.24
Make & Modei Offered: Cub Pro Z 5601 Grasshopper 3298/81 Toro 74915 Toro 74958 Bad Boy Outlaw|
Extreme 817
Ba081FX850]
[Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki FX850V,| Vanguard Big Block; Kohler 25 HP} 25 HP Kohler|  B52cc Kawasaki FX|
I{Include SAE net HP): 27 HP Model 5424, 895cc, Command Pro EFI W/ 27 HP]
Aluminum Block, V- 60" Turbo Force Deck|
Twin. Horizonta
Crankshaft, 26HP|
Warranty: 3 Years| 5 Years or 1,250| Engine 3 yrs., rest 5] Not Provided] Defects in material or]
hours, first 3 years no, yrs. or 1500 hours| workmanship 2 years
hour occurs firsy
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: DeWinnie Equipment| D Equi P Tur] F Turf| Texas Tractor Country]
Company] Products Products|
Warranty Service Provider Facllity Address: 11002 Bandera Rd. | 11002 Bandera Rd.,| 9468 Seima Parkway,| 9468 Selma Parkway, 1175 FM 308, New|
San Antoniio, TX| $San Antonio, TX| Selma, TX 78154 Selma, TX 78154] Braunfels, TX 78130
782504 78250]
Delivery: 45Da 30 Days| 15-30 Days| Not Provided| 30 Days}
Prepared by Puichasing 7/24/2017
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabuiation

(Opened: June 14, 2017 Locai Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bid4 Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid3 Non-Local Non-Local Alt1 Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnie Equipment [Ewald Kubota H&V H&V H &V Turt P Turf tnc.
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment [Company Manufacturing, Inc. Products Products
8100008840 LD 11002 Bandera Rd.  |1800 W IH10 3307 S.E.Loop 410 (3307 S.E. Loop 410  |3307 S.E. Loop 410  |105 S Ok Hwy 81 9468 Selma Parkway |8488 Selma Parkway |1300 W. University
Ave.
item Description Estimated |San Antonio, Seguin, San Antonio San Anlonio San Antonio Moundridge, Seima, Seima, Georgetown,
Quantity |TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS 67107 TX 78154 ITX 78154 TX 78828
10 3 Wheeled Infield Tractor w/ Attachments: 3
Price Each: No Bid| No Bidj No Bid| No Bid No Bid| No Bid $22,928.58] No Bid No Bid|
Total: $68,785.74)
Make & Model Offered Toro Sand Pro 3040
(08703)!
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 16 HP|
(Include SAE net HP):
Warranty: 2 years or 1500 hours
whichever occurs first
'Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Professional Turf]
Products)
'Warranty Service Provider Facliity Address: 9488 Seima Parkway,
Selma, TX 78154
Delivery: 15-30 Days|
Payment Terms: 1% - 10 Days Nel 304 Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30§ Net 30} Net 30§ Net 30|
Item 3 was deleted and will be rebid at a later date.
Prepared by Purchasing 7/24/2017

100f 10



