

**City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation**

Opened: July 17, 2015 For: Administrative Sedans Fire and Police (Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid) 6100006216			BuyBoard	BuyBoard	BuyBoard
	LD		Silsbee Toyota 1396 Hwy 327 East Silsbee, TX 77657 409-880-9191	Benson Honda Imports 9400 San Pedro Ave. San Antonio, TX 78716 210-341-3311	Silsbee Ford 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191
Item	Description	Quantity			
1	2015 or Newer Toyota Camry Four Door Sedans, Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid Price Each: Total:  Year, Make & Model Offered: Engine Offered: Vehicle Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Service Provider Address:  Delivery  Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	14	\$24,895.75 \$348,540.50  2015 Toyota Camry Hybrid 2.5 L, 4 Cyl  36 mo./36,000 Bumper to Bumper Red McCombs Toyota 8333 10 West Interstate 10, San Antonio, TX 78230 90 Days  7/30/15 7/30/15  Yes	No Bid	No Bid
2	2015 or Newer Honda Insight Four Door Sedans, Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid Price Each: Total:  Year, Make & Model Offered: Engine Offered: Vehicle Warranty:  Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Service Provider Address:  Delivery  Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	11	No Bid	\$19,990.00 \$219,890.00  2015 Honda Insight 5 DR LX 1.3 Liter 3 Year/36,000 Miles Limited Warranty, 5 Years/60,000 Miles Limited Powertrain Warranty Benson Honda 9400 San Pedro Ave., San Antonio, TX 78216 30 Days  Sept 2015 Sept 2015  Yes	No Bid

**City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation**

Opened: July 17, 2015 For: Administrative Sedans Fire and Police (Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid) 6100006216 LD			<b>BuyBoard</b>	<b>BuyBoard</b>	<b>BuyBoard</b>
Item	Description	Quantity	Silsbee Toyota 1396 Hwy 327 East Silsbee, TX 77657 409-880-9191	Benson Honda Imports 9400 San Pedro Ave. San Antonio, TX 78716 210-341-3311	Silsbee Ford 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191
3	2015 or Newer Ford Fusion Four Door Sedans, Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid Price Each: Total:  Year, Make & Model Offered: Engine Offered: Vehicle Warranty:  Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Service Provider Address:  Delivery  Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	3	No Bid	No Bid	\$23,831.75 \$71,495.25  2016 Ford Fusion 2.0 L I4 36 mo./36,000 Bumper to Bumper Red McCombs Ford I-10, San Antonio, TX 78205 90 Days  July 2016 July 2016  Not Provided
4	Buy Board Fee:  Payment Terms:  Total:	1	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
			\$348,940.50	\$220,290.00	\$71,895.25
	<b>Total Award:</b>		<b>\$348,940.50</b>	<b>\$220,290.00</b>	<b>\$71,895.25</b>