
LOC/jIm 
12117/15 
Item No.9 

AN ORDINANCE 20 15 -1 2 -1 7 - 1 057 

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING 
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL COST OF $370,404.00: (A) WESTERN STATES FIRE 
PROTECTION COMPANY FOR FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, 
MAINTENANCE & REP AIR, (B) RCO CONSTRUCTION, L.L.C FOR 
PAVER REPAIRS AT THE ALAMODOME, (C) CAPPS VAN & 
TRUCK RENTAL FOR RENTAL OF VARIOUS VEHICLES, (D) BIO­
RAD LABORATORIES, INC. FOR HIV TESTS AND SUPPLIES, AND 
(E) WEST PUBLISHING CORPORATION D/B/A WEST, A THOMSON 
REUTERS BUSINESS, FOR WEST PUBLISHING CORPORATION 
RESEARCH LICENSES AND MATERIALS. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Western 
States Fire Protection Company for fire sprinkler inspection, maintenance & repair, (B) RCO 
Construction, L.L.C. for paver repairs at the Alamodome, (C) Caps Van & Truck Rental for 
rental of various vehicles, (D) Bio-Rad Laboratories, Inc. for HIV tests and supplies, and (E) 
West Publishing Corporation d/b/a West, a Thomson Reuters Business, for West Publishing 
Corporation research licenses and materials; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves two low bid contracts, one contract awarded to other than 
the low bidder(s) because the low bidder(s) did not meet the City'S specifications or 
requirements, one contract which provides for a procurement necessary to protect the public 
health or safety, and one sole source contract; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Western States 
Fire Protection Company for fire sprinkler inspection, maintenance & repair, (B) RCO 
Construction, L.L.C. for paver repairs at the Alamodome, (C) Caps Van & Truck Rental for 
rental of various vehicles, (D) Bio-Rad Laboratories, Inc. for HIV tests and supplies, and (E) 
West Publishing Corporation d/b/a West, a Thomson Reuters Business, for West Publishing 
Corporation research licenses and materials on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached 
bid tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all 
required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid 
tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. 
Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the 
Finance Department. 
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LOqjlm 
121l7/15 
Item No.9 

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will 
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2016 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal 
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals. 

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the low bid from Northstar Fire Protection of 
Texas for fire sprinkler inspection, maintenance & repair failed to meet the City's specifications 
and/or requirements. 

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 17th day of December, 2015. 

Ivy R. Taylor 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

ity Attorney 
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Agenda Item: 9 ( in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,14,15, 16A, 16B, 16C, 18, 19,20,21,22,23,24, 
25,26 ) 

Date: 12117/2015 

Time: 10:36:15 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for 
an estimated annual cost of $370,404.00: (A) Western States Fire Protection Company for fire 
sprinkler inspection, maintenance & repair, (B) RCO Construction, L.L.C for paver repairs at 
Alamodome, (C) Capps Van & Truck Rental for rental of various vehicles, (D) Bio-Rad Laboratories, 
Inc. for HIV tests and supplies, and (E) West Publishing Corporation d/b/a West, a Thomson Reuters 
Business for West Publishing Corporation Research licenses and materials. [Ben Gorzell, Chief 
Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ivy R. Taylor Mayor x 

Roberto C. Trevino District 1 x x 

Alan Warrick District 2 x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x x 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 
Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-Local local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

IA City Hall- NAS 

100 Military Plaza - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $95.00 

Subtotal $190.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $95.0C $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $190.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

lA Subtotal $685.00 $150.00 
IB City Hall-

100 Military Plaza - standpipe and hose system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $190.00 

Subtotal $380.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $95.0C $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $190.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.0C 

1B Subtotal $875.00 $150.00 
2A Cliff Morton Development Business Service 

Center (DBSq (One Stop) -1901 S. Alamo - wet 

system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 YrTesting 1 $210.00 

2A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
2C Cliff Morton Development Business Service 

Center (DBSq (One Stop) -1901 S. Alamo - wet 

system 2 

Quarterly Inspection 2 
Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

2C Subtotal $585.00 $200.00 
3A Emergency Operations Center at Brooks City 

Base - 8130 Inner Circle- wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

3A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-Local Local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

3B Emergency Operations Center at Brooks City 

Base - 8130 Inner Circle - pre-action 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $150.00 

Subtotal $300.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $450.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $600.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

3B Subtotal $1,710.00 $200.00 
4 Fire Training Academy-

300 S. Callaghan - wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

4 Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
5 Fire Training Academy Gym- 300 S. Callaghan -

wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

5 Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
6A Frank Wing Municipal Court Building-

401 S. Frio - wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

6A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
6B Frank Wing Municipal Court Building-

401 S. Frio - wet system 2 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

6B Subtotal $585.00 $200.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

6C Frank Wing Building Municipal Court-

401 S. Frio - wet system 3 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $250.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

6C Subtotal $585.00 $250.00 
7A International Center Building-

203 S. St. Mary's St. - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

7A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
7B International Center Building-

203 S. St. Mary's St. - dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

7B Subtotal $735.00 $200.00 
8A Municipal Plaza Building-

114 W. Commerce - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $95.00 

Subtotal $190.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $95.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $285.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

8A Subtotal $780.00 $150.00 
8B Municipal Plaza Building-

114 W. "Commerce - standpipe and hose system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $95.00 

Subtotal $190.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $95.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $285.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

8B Subtotal $780.00 $150.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

8C Municipal Plaza Building-

114 W. Commerce - fire pump 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $95.00 

Subtotal $190.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $95.00 $250.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $760.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

8C Subtotal $1,255.00 $250.00 
9 NE Service Center Tool Yard (BLDG 1)-

4500 Wurzbach Parkway - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $150.00 

Subtotal $300.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

9 Subtotal $960.00 $150.00 
10 NE Service Center Tool Yard (BLDG 2) 

4500 Wurzbach Parkway - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $150.00 

Subtotal $300.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.00 

5 YrTesting 1 $210.00 

10 Subtotal $960.00 $150.00 
IIA Police Academy-

1220 SE Loop 410 - wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

11A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
liB Police Academy-

1220 SE loop 410 - wet system 2 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

11B Subtotal $585.00 $200.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

IIC Police Academy-

1220 SE loop 410 - wet system 3 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $250.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

llC Subtotal $585.00 $250.00 
12A Public Safety Technical Center (IT50) -

515 S. Frio - 1 pre-action 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

12A Subtotal $735.00 $200.00 
12B Public Safety Technical Center (ITSO) -

515 S. Frio - wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

12B Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
12C Public Safety Technical Center (ITSO) -

515 S. Frio - wet system 2 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

12C Subtotal $585.00 $200.00 
13 Public Safety Technical Center (Central Police 

Patrol) - 515 S. Frio - dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $21O.0( 

13 Subtotal $735.0C $200.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local Local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

14A Municipal Records Building B-

131 EI Paso - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0( 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0( 

S Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

14A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
14B Municipal Records Building B-

131 EI Paso - standpipe and house 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0( $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0( 

5 Yr Testing 1 $21O.0( 

14B Subtotal $585.0C $150.00 
15A SE Service Center Auto Shop -

7412 S. New Braunfels - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0( 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

15A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
15B SE Service Center Auto Shop -

7412 S. New Braunfels - dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.0C 

15B Subtotal $585.0C $200.00 
16A Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 

8039 Challenger - pre-action system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.0C 

16A Subtotal $735.0C $200.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local Local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

16B Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 

8039 Challenger - pre-action system 2 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $275.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

16B Subtotal $735.00 $275.00 

16C Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 

8039 Challenger - pre-action system 3 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $300.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

16C Subtotal $735.00 $300.00 
16D Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 

8039 Challenger - wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

160 Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
16E Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 

8039 Challenger - wet system 2 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0( 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

S Yr Testing 1 $210.0( 

16E Subtotal $585.0( $200.00 
16F Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 

8039 Challenger wet system 3 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0( $250.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0( 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.0( 

16F Subtotal $585.0( $250.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-Local Local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

17A Public Safety HQ 

315 South Santa Rosa - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.0C 

17 A Subtotal $735.0(1 $150.00 
17B Public Safety HQ 

315 South Santa Rosa - dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

17B Subtotal $735.00 $200.00 
17C Public Safety HQ 

315 South Santa Rosa - electric pump 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $250.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $600.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

17C Subtotal $1,035.00 $250.00 
18 East Pre k - 4 SA 

5230 Eisenhower Road - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $150.00 

Subtotal $300.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $225.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

18 Subtotal $885.00 $150.00 
19A Plaza De Armas - 115 Military Plaza, wet 

system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

19A Subtotal $735.00 $150.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

J9B Plaza De Armas - 115 Military Plaza, dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.00 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

19B Subtotal $885.00 $200.00 
20A Callaghan Service Center BLDG 1 -

110 S. Callaghan - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

20A Subtotal $735.00 $150.00 
20B Callaghan Service Center BLDG 1 -

110 S. Callaghan - dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $300.0C 

3 YrTesting 1 $150.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $21O.0C 

20B Subtotal $885.0C $200.00 
2JA Callaghan Service Center BLDG 2 -

110 S. Callaghan - wet system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $225.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.0C 

21A Subtotal $660.0( $150.00 
21B Callaghan Service Center BLDG 2 -

110 S. Callaghan - dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0( 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0( $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $225.0( 

3 Yr Testing 1 $150.0( 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.0( 

21B Subtotal $810.0( $200.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

22A SAPO Property and Evidence Facility 

555 Academic Court - wet system 1 

Quarterly Inspection 2 
Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $150.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $21O.0C 

22A Subtotal $585.00 $150.00 
22B SAPO Property and Evidence Facility 

555 Academic Court - wet system 2 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0C 

5 YrTesting 1 $21O.0C 

22B Subtotal $585.0C $200.00 
22C SAPO Property and Evidence Facility 

555 Academic Court - wet system 3 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $250.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

22C Subtotal $585.00 $250.00 
22D SAPO Property and Evidence Facility 555 

Academic Court - wet system 4 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $275.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

220 Subtotal $585.00 $275.00 
22E SAPD Property and Evidence Facility 

555 Academic (ourt - wet system 5 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.0C 

Subtotal $150.0C 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.0C $300.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.0C 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

22E Subtotal $585.00 $300.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 16, 2015 Non-local local 

Western States Fire Northstar Fire Protection of 

For: Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Protection Co. Texas 

6100006066 U 13122 Lookout Way 12819 Wetmore Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Estimated Annual TX 78233 TX 78247 

Item Description Quantity 210-967-4731 

22F SAPD Property and Evidence Facility 

555 Academic Court - wet system 6 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $325.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

22F Subtotal $585.00 $325.00 
22G SAPD Property and Evidence Facility 555 

Academic Court - dry system 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $200.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $150.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

22G Subtotal $585.00 $200.00 
22H SAPD Property and Evidence Facility 

555 Academic Court - electric pump 

Quarterly Inspection 2 

Price Per $75.00 

Subtotal $150.00 

Semi-Annual Inspection 1 $75.00 $250.00 

Annual Inspection 1 $600.00 

5 Yr Testing 1 $210.00 

22H Subtotal $1,035.00 $250.00 
23 Deleted 

Subtotal $37,930.00 $10,225.00 

24 Labor Rates 

Normal Business Hours - Monday through 

Friday 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 

A Labor Rate per Hour: 20 

Price Per $80.00 $85.00 

Subtotal $1,600.00 $1,700.00 

Overtime Hours - Monday through Friday 

5:01 p.m. to 7:59 a.m., all day on weekends and 

City recognized holidays. 

B Labor Rate per Hour: 15 

Price Per $120.00 $125.00 

Subtotal $1,800.00 $1,875.00 

25 Repair Parts Mark Up to Contractor Invoice 
30% 10% 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 

Incomplete 

Deleted: Item 23 will be rebid at a later date. 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 23, 2015 

For: Annual Contract for Paver Repairs at Alamodome Local 
RCO Construction, L.L.C. 

6100005663 JG 5418 Hwy 90 W. 

Estimated 
San Antonio, 

Item Description 
Annual Qty 

TX 78227 
210-739-5085 

1 Paver Repair at Alamodome 4,500 
Price Per Square Foot $8.86 
Total Price $39,870.00 

Payment Terms Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $39,870.00 
Estimated Annual Award $39,870.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: November 6, 2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL 
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC. 
6100006697 MC 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach 

Dallas, 

Item Description TX 75247 San Antonio, 
210-630-6555 TX 78209 

I 1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive: 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford F150, 
or proven equal 

A Regular Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 $60.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
153.06% 

Price Differential $36.29 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.9 $360.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
116.91% 

Plice Differential $194.03 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $735.0G $1,210.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
64.63% 

Price Differential $475.00 

Makes & Models Offered Chevy Silverado, Dodge Ram, Ford F150; 
rates include full coverage 

B Extended Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 $60.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
153.06% 

Price Differential $36.29 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.9 $360.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
116.91% 

Price Differential $194.03 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $735.00 $1,210.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
64.63% 

Price Differential $475.00 
Makes & Models Offered Chevy Silverado, Dodge Ram, Ford F150; 

rates include full coverage 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 $60.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
153.06% 

Price Differential $36.29 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.9 $360.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
116.91% 

Price Differential $194.03 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate Each $735.00 $1,210.00 

Rental- Flat Monthly Rate - Extended Price $105,840.00 $174,240.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
64.63% 

Price Differential $68,400.00 
Makes & Models Offered Chevy Silverad~, Dodge Ram, Ford F150; 

rates include full coverage 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: November 6,2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL 
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC. 

6100006697 MC 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach 
Dallas, 

Item Description TX 75247 San Antonio, 
210-630-6555 TX 78209 

II 1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford F150, 
or proven equal 

A ReqularCab No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.7 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.9 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $735.0C 

Makes & Models Offered 

B Extended Cab No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.9 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $735.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.9 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $735.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

III 3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250, 
or proven equal 

A ReqularCab No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $2~:;: 2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188. 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

B Extended Cab No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.5S 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

IV 3/4 Ton Pick UP Trucks. 4 Wheel Drive 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250, 
or proven equal 

A ReqularCab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 $79.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
193.24% 

Price Differential $52.06 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 $439.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
132.79% 

Price Differential $250.42 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 $1,430.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
71.26% 

Price Differential $595.00 
I Makes & Models Offered F250 Chevv 2500 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: November 6, 2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL 
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC. 
6100006697 MC 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach 

Dallas, 

Item Description TX 75247 San Antonio, 
210-630-6555 TX 78209 

B Extended Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 $79.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
193.24% 

Price Differential $52.06 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 $439.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
132.79% 

Price Differential $250.42 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 $1,430.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
71.26% 

Price Differential $595.00 
Makes & Models Offered F250, Chevy 2500 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 $79.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
193.24% 

Price Differential $52.06 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 $439.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
132.79% 

Price Differential $250.42 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 $1.430.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
71.26% 

Price Differential $595.00 
Makes & Models Offered Ford F250, Chevy 2500 

V Full Size Sport Utility Vehicles 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Tahoe, Ford 
Expedition, or proven equal 

A Regular 2 Wheel Drive 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $35.00 $89.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
154.29% 

Price Differential $54.00 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $245.00 $534.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
117.96% 

Price Differential $289.00 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $1,085.00 $1.845.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
70.05% 

Price Differential $760.00 
Makes & Models Offered Chevy Tahoe, GMC, Yukon, Nissan Armada, 

Ford Expedition 
rates include full coveraQe 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: November 6,2015 NON·LOCAL LOCAL 
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC. 

6100006697 MC 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach 
Dallas, 

Item Description TX 75247 San Antonio, 
210-630-6555 TX 78209 

B 4 Wheel Drive No Bid 
1 Rental· Flat Daily Rate $38.23 
2 Rental· Flat Weekly Rate $268.63 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $1,185.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

VI Small Size Sport Utility Vehicles 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford Escape, Jeep Liberty, 
or proven equal 

A 2 Wheel Drive, Gasoline Powered 
1 Rental· Flat Daily Rate $23.71 $56.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
136.19% 

Price Differential $32.29 

2 Rental· Flat Weekly Rate $165.97 $336.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
102.45% 

Price Differential $170.03 

3 Rental· Flat Monthly Rate $735.00 $1,232.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
67.62% 

Price Differential $497.00 
Makes & Models Offered Ford Escape, Kia Sportage, Jeep Compass, 

Jeep Patriot, Hyundai Tucson 
rates include full coverage 

B 4 Wheel Drive, Gasoline Powered No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

C Hybrid Powered No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 

Makes & Models Offered 

VII Mid Size Sedan 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Malibu, Ford 
Fusion, or proven equal 

A Gasoline Powered No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $22.10 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $154.70 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $685.00 

B Hybrid Powered No Bid 
1 Rental· Flat Daily Rate $25.32 
2 Rental· Flat Weekly Rate $177.31 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $785.0C 

Makes & Models Offered 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: November 6, 2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL 
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC. 

6100006697 MC 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach 
Dallas, 

Item Description TX 75247 San Antonio, 
210-630-6555 TX 78209 

VIII Compact Size Sedan 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Cruze, Ford 
Focus, or proven equal 

A Gasoline Powered 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $22.1C $37.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
67.42% 

Price Differential $14.90 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $154.7C $222.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
43.50% 

Price Differential $67.30 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $685.0C $792.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
15.62% 

Price Differential $107.00 

Makes & Models Offered Chrysler 200, Dodge Avenger, Nissan Cube, 
Volkswagen Jella, Kia Soul 
rates include full coverage 

B Hybrid Powered No Bid 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $25.3 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $177.31 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $785.0C 

Makes & Models Offered 

IX Cargo Van 
Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford Econoline, GMC 
Express, or proven equal 

A Gasoline Powered 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $25.33 $55.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
117.13% 

Price Differential $29.67 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $177.3 $330.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
86.11% 

Price Differential $152.69 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $785.00 $1,210.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
54.14% 

Price Differential $425.00 
Express 1500 cargo, Econoline 1500 Cargo 

Makes & Models Offered rates include full coverage 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: November 6,2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL 
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC. 

6100006697 MC 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach 
Dallas, 

Item Description TX 75247 San Antonia, 
210-630-6555 TX 78209 

X 
SEVEN (7) TO EIGHT (8) PASSENGER MINI-CAN, 
WINDOW TYPE: 
Acceptable Makes & Models: KIA Sedona, Chrysler 
Town & Country, Dodge Grand Caravan, Toyota Sienna 
or proven equal 

A Gasoline Powered 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $25.3, $512.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
1921.32% 

Price Differential $486.67 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $177.31 $312.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
75.96% 

Price Differential $134.69 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $785.0C $1,076.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
37.07% 

Price Differential $291.00 
Chrysler Town and Country, Dodge Grand 

Caravan, Toyota Sienna 
Makes & Models Offered rates include full coverage 

XI TWELVE (12) PASSENGER VAN, WINDOW-TYPE: 

Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford E350 or proven equal 
A Gasoline Powered 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $29.84 $94.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
215.01% 

Price Differential $64.16 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $208.88 $564.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
170.01% 

Price Differential $355.12 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $925.00 $1,958.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
111.68% 

Price Differential $1,033.00 
Ford Transit 12 passenger, Chevy E350 12 

passenger 
Makes & Models Offered rates include full coverage 

XII FIFTEEN (15) PASSENGER VAN, WINDOW-TYPE: 

Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford E350 or proven equal 
A Gasoline Powered 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate Each $29.84 $94.00 

Rental- Flat Daily Rate - Extended Price $149.20 $470.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
215.01% 

Price Differential $320.80 

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $208.88 $564.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
170.01% 

Price Differential $355.12 

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate Each $925.00 $1,958.00 
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate - Extended Price $2,775.00 $5,874.00 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 
111.68% 

Price Differential $3,099.00 
Ford Transit, Ford 350, Chevy E350 

Makes & Models Offered rates include full coverage 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 20, 2015 
For: AlC for HIV Tests and Supplies 

Sole Source 
Bio-Rad Laboratories, Inc. 

6100006606 KZ 6565 185th Avenue NE 
Estimated Redmond, 

Item Description Annual WA 98052 
Quantitv 800-666-8111 

1 Null Strips, 5 plats/pg 9 
Unit Price $55.65 
Manufacturer Stratec 
Part No. 0900-05 
Total Price $500.85 

2 Tips, Conductive, 300ul, 960/bx 5 
Unit Price $117.60 
Manufacturer Eppendon 
Part No. 25097 
Total Price $588.00 

3 Tips, Conductive, 11 OOul 960/bx 6 
Unit Price $189.00 
Manufacturer Eppendon 
Part No. 25098 
Total Price $1,134.00 

4 Microcide Cleaning Concentrate 10 
Unit Price $36.75 
Manufacturer Global Biotech-US 
Part No. 25099 
Total Price $367.50 

5 Tween 20, 100ml Bottle 1 
Unit Price $51.45 
Manufacturer Bio-Rad 
Part No. 25116 
Total Price $51.45 

6 HemoPoint H2 Cuvettes 4 
Unit Price $81.90 
Manufacturer Sarstead 
Part No. 25221 B 
Total Price $327.60 

7 Cap, Screw 2mL Neutral, 500/bg 4 
Unit Price $111.30 
Manufacturer Sarstead 
Part No. 25222B 
Total Price $445.20 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 20, 2015 
For: AlC for HIV Tests and Supplies 

Sole Source 
Bio-Rad Laboratories, Inc. 

6100006606 KZ 6565 185th Avenue NE 
Estimated Redmond, 

Item Description Annual WA 98052 
_Quantit'l 800-666-8111 

8 Stopping Solution Bulk Pack, 5/pg 2 
Unit Price $0.00 
Manufacturer Bio-Rad 
Part No. 25260 
Total Price $0.00 

9 Wash Solution Bulk Pack, 5/pg 428 
Unit Price $0.00 
Manufacturer Bio-Rad 
Part No. 25261 
Total Price $0.00 

10 HIV Ag/AB Combo Kit 14 
Unit Price $2,440.20 
Manufacturer Bio-Rad 
Part No. 26218 
Total Price $34,162.80 

11 Push Caps Vials, Polyethylene, 500/cs 2 
Unit Price $128.10 
Manufacturer Fisher Scientific 
Part No. 4025820 
Total Price $256.20 

12 Coda Reagent V-Vial, 500/cs 2 
Unit Price $183.75 
Manufacturer Fisher Scientific 
Part No. 4025900 
Total Price $367.50 

13 Tube, PP, 5ml, 75x13mm, 500/pack, Evolis 2 
Unit Price $75.60 
Manufacturer Fisher Scientific 
Part No. 48155525B 
Total Price $151.20 

14 Tips, Conductive, 300ul, 18 boxes/case 3 
Unit Price $2,096.85 
Manufacturer Stratec 
Part No. 89611 
Total Price $6,290.55 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 20, 2015 
For: AlC for HIV Tests and Supplies 

Sole Source 
Bio-Rad Laboratories, Inc. 

6100006606 KZ 6565 185th Avenue NE 
Estimated Redmond, 

Item Description Annual WA 98052 
.Quantit'l 800-666-8111 

15 Plate Carrier "A1", Evolis 1 
Unit Price $493.50 
Manufacturer Stratec 
Part No. 89679 
Total Price $493.50 

16 Reagent Rack, 2 x 12 BC Pos, Evolis 1 
Unit Price $3,412.50 
Manufacturer Stratec 
Part No. 89781 
Total Price $3,412.50 

17 Waste Bag, 10 bags/pack, Evolis 1 
Unit Price $73.54 
Manufacturer Stratec 
Part No. 89799 
Total Price $73.54 

18 Evolis Performance Eval Kit High Volume 4 
Unit Price $137.55 
Manufacturer Stratec 
Part No. 89897 
Total Price $550.20 

19 Wash Bottle 2L without cap, Evolis 1 
Unit Price $31.50 
Manufacturer Stratec 
Part No. 89935 
Total Price $31.50 

Amber Reagent Bottle, 125ml, 72/case, 
20 Evolis 1 

Unit Price $459.64 
Manufacturer Fisher Scientific 
Part No. 92002 
Total Price $459.64 

21 Multispot HIV-1/HIV-2 Rapid Test, 50 kits 20 
Unit Price $1,929.38 
Manufacturer Bio-Rad 
Part No. 25228 
Total Price $38,587.60 

Payment Terms Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $88,251.33 
Estimated Annual Award $88251.33 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 23,2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for West Publishing Corporation 
Research Licenses and Materials Sole Source 

West Publishing Corporation 
d/b/a West, a Thomson 
Reuters Business 
610 Opperman Drive 

6100006741 RG 

No. of 
Eagan, 

Item Description 
Months 

MN 55123 
651) 687-4406 

1 SAPO Clear Alerts and Law Enforcement Plus 

1 (a) Clear Alerts (up to 1,000) 2 
1 (b) Clear Law Enforcement Plus 

Subscription Period: 11/1/2015 -12/31/2015 
Monthly Price $5,617.00 
Annual Price $11,234.00 

1 (c) Clear Alerts (up to 1,000) 12 
1 (d) Clear Law Enforcement Plus 

Subscription Period: 1/1/2016 - 12/31/2016 
Monthly Price $5,617.00 
Annual Price $67,404.00 

1 (e) Clear Alerts (up to 1,000) 12 
1 (f) Clear Law Enforcement Plus 

Subscription Period: 1/1/2017 - 12131/2017 
Monthly Price $5,786.00 
Annual Price $69,432.00 

1 (g) Clear Alerts (up to 1,000) 12 
1 (h) Clear Law Enforcement Plus 

Subscription Period: 1/1/2018 -12/31/2018 
Monthly Price $5,959.00 
Annual Price $71,508.00 

1 (i) Clear Alerts (up to 1,000) 12 
1(j) Clear Law Enforcement Plus 

Subscription Period: 1/1/2019 - 12131/2019 
Monthly Price $6,138.00 
Annual Price $73,656.00 

1 (k) Clear Alerts (up to 1,000) 12 
1 (I) Clear Law Enforcement Plus 

Subscription Period: 1/1/2020 - 12131/2020 
Monthly Price $6,322.00 
Annual Price $75,864.00 

Total $369,098.00 
Total Award $369,098.00 


