City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 3, 2014 NAS
Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
Rick Bogle A-1 Fire & Safety Danny Ramirez McCoy's Texas Best
For: Purchase, Inspection & Maintenance of Fire Extinguishers dba ARB Fire Protection dba City Wide Fire Fire Protection, LLC
Protection
6100003227 AV 11202 Weslayan St. 203 E. Rhapsody 520 New Laredo Hwy 1025 US Hwy 181
Item Description Est. [Stamford, San Antonio, San Antonio, Portland,
Annual |TX 79553 TX 78216 TX 78211 TX 78374
Qty. |214-364-0704
Item I.  [Annual Inspection & Testing of Fire Extinguishers
A.|Annual Inspection (Alll types & sizes of fire extinguishers. To 1999
include CO2 conductivity test as required)
Cost per Inspection $4.00 $8.00 $8.00 $2.20
Total Cost $7,996.00 $15,992.00 $15,992.00 $4,397.80
B.[Hydrostatic Testing - All fire extinguishers (except CO2 880
extinguishers) Modified low presuure Hydrostatic test
Cost per Testina $14.00 $5.50 $6.50 $10.00
Total Cost $12,320.00 $4,840.00 $5,720.00 $8,800.00
C.|Hydrostatic Testing (all CO2 extinguishers) High pressure 40
Hydrostatic test
Cost per Unit $14.00 $5.50 $15.00 $10.00
Total Cost $560.00 $220.00 $600.00 $400.00
Sub Total $20,876.00 $21,052.00 $22,312.00 $13,597.80
Item Il. [Fire Extinquishers (New)
A.|2.5lb Capacity, UL Rated 1A-10B:C, Agent Type ABC/USCG 50
approved vehicle mounted
Cost per Unit $26.00 $30.00 $37.00 $35.95
Total Cost $1,300.00 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 $1,797.50
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Advantage Pyro Chem
Model No. 21007865 B250M 21007865 552920
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 13315
Manufacturer Badger Advantage
Model No. ADV250
B.|5lb Capacity, UL Rated 3A-40B:C, Agent Type ABC/USCG 215
approved vehicle mounted
Cost per Unit $35.00] $45.00 $51.50 $47.95
Total Cost $7,525.00] $9,675.00 $11,072.50 $10,309.25
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Advantage Pyro Chem
Model No. 21008936 B5MB 21008936 553342
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 25614
Manufacturer Badger
Model No. ADV550
C.[5Ib Capacity, UL Rated 3A-40B:C, Agent Type ABC, wall hanger 143
bracket
Cost per Unit $35.00] $32.00 $48.00 $45.95
Total Cost $5,005.00] $4,576.00 $6,864.00 $6,570.85
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Advantage Pyro Chem
Model No. 21007866 ADV550 21007866 553339
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 10914
D.|10lb Capacity. UL Rated 4A-80B:C. Aaent Tvpe ABC, wall hanaer 99
Cost per Unit $54.00] $56.00 $98.00 $74.95
Total Cost $5,346.00] $5,544.00 $9,702.00 $7,420.05
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Badger Badger
Model No. 21007867 B10M 22603B 10MB-8H
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 11340
Manufacturer Badger
Model No. ADV10
Cost per Unit
Total Cost
E.|20lb Capacity, UL Rated 10A-120B:C, Agent Type ABC, wall 5
hanger bracket
Cost per Unit $97.00] $89.00 $187.00 $125.95
Total Cost $485.00 $445.00 $935.00 $629.75
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Amerex Badger
Model No. 21007868 B20M AX411 20MB-6H
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 12120
Manufacturer Badger
Model No. ADV20
F.|5lb Capacity, UL Rated 5B:C, Agent Type ABC, wall hanger 2
bracket
Cost per Unit $128.00 $46.00 $165.50 $125.95
Total Cost $256.00 $92.00 $331.00 $251.90
Manufacturer Badger Badger Amerex Pyro Chem
Model No. 23348 B5P AX322 552083
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 13415




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 3, 2014 NAS
Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
Rick Bogle A-1 Fire & Safety Danny Ramirez McCoy's Texas Best
For: Purchase, Inspection & Maintenance of Fire Extinguishers dba ARB Fire Protection dba City Wide Fire Fire Protection, LLC
Protection
6100003227 AV 11202 Weslayan St. 203 E. Rhapsody 520 New Laredo Hwy 1025 US Hwy 181
Item Description Est. [Stamford, San Antonio, San Antonio, Portland,
Annual |TX 79553 TX 78216 TX 78211 TX 78374
Oty. |214-364-0704
G.|10lb Capacity, UL Rated 10B:C, Agent Type CO2, wall hanger 22
bracket
Cost per Unit $160.00 $156.00 $208.50 $190.95
Total Cost $3,520.00 $3,432.00 $4,587.00 $4,200.90
Manufacturer Badger Badger Amerex Pyro Chem
Model No. 21106 B1OvV AX330 552084
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 45600
H|15lb Capacity, UL Rated 10B:C, Agent Type CO2, wall hanger 2
bracket
Cost per Unit $195.00 $180.00 $268.50 $225.95
Total Cost $390.00 $360.00 $537.00 $451.90
Manufacturer Badger Badger Amerex Pyro Chem
Model No. 21103 B15V AX331 552085
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 46100
1.[20Ib Capacity, UL Rated 10B:C, Agent Type CO2, wall hanger 2
bracket
Cost per Unit $240.00 $235.00 $315.65 $265.95
Total Cost $480.00 $470.00 $631.30 $531.90
Manufacturer Badger Badger Amerex Pyro Chem
Model No. 21096 B20V AX332 552086
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 46600
J.[125lb Capacity, Wheeled Fire Extinguisher, UL Rated 240B:C, 3
Agent Type Purple K
Cost per Unit $2,000.00 $1,675.00 $1,888.00 $2,475.95
Total Cost $6,000.00 $5,025.00 $5,664.00 $7,427.85
Manufacturer Badger Badger Badger Badger
Model No. 20684 150PB 20684B 150PB
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 30310
K.|10lb Capacity, UL Rated 10-A:60-B:C, Agent Type ABC 3
Cost per Unit $54.00] No Bid $510.00 $350.95
Total Cost $162.00 $1,530.00 $1,052.85
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Ansul
Model No. 21007867 466527B-20lb A10H
L.|10lb Capacity, UL Rated 4-A:60-B:C, Agent Type ABC 60
Cost per Unit $54.00] No Bid $118.50 $59.95
Total Cost $3,240.00 $7,110.00 $3,597.00
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Advantage Minimax
Model No. 21007867 21007867B MX10A
M.|5lb Capacity, UL Rated 2-A:10-B:C, Agent Type ABC 21
Cost per Unit $35.00] $32.00 $83.00 $64.95
Total Cost $735.00 $672.00 $1,743.00 $1,363.95
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Amerex Amerex
Model No. 21007866 21009579 AX500 AX424
N.|10lb Capacity. UL Rated 10-A:60-B:C. Aaent Tvpe ABC 4
Cost per Unit $54.00] No Bid $510.00 $175.00
Total Cost $216.00 $2,040.00 $700.00
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Sentry
Model No. 21007867 466527B-20lb SY-1014
0.[10lb, UL Rated 4-A:60-B:C. Aaent Tvpe ABC 27
Cost per Unit $54.00] No Bid $139.00 $59.95
Total Cost $1,458.00] $3,753.00 $1,618.65
Manufacturer Advantage Amerex Minimax
Model No. 21007867 AX456 MX10A
P.|5lb Capacity, UL Rated 2A:10-B:C, Aaent Type ABC, wall hanaer 6
Cost per Unit $35.00] $32.00 $118.00 $64.95
Total Cost $210.00 $192.00 $708.00 $389.70
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Amerex Amerex
Model No. 21007866 21009579 AX424 AX424
0.[4lb Capacity, UL Rated 2A:10-B:C. Aaent Tvpe ABC 1
Cost per Unit $35.00] $35.00 $118.00 $79.95
Total Cost $35.00, $35.00 $118.00 $79.95
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Amerex Kidde
Model No. 21007866 ADV4-1 AX424 - 5lb 21008350




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 3, 2014 NAS
Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
Rick Bogle A-1 Fire & Safety Danny Ramirez McCoy's Texas Best
For: Purchase, Inspection & Maintenance of Fire Extinguishers dba ARB Fire Protection dba City Wide Fire Fire Protection, LLC
Protection
6100003227 AV 11202 Weslayan St. 203 E. Rhapsody 520 New Laredo Hwy 1025 US Hwy 181
Item Description Est. [Stamford, San Antonio, San Antonio, Portland,
Annual |TX 79553 TX 78216 TX 78211 TX 78374
Oty. |214-364-0704
R.|10lb Capacity, UL Rated 4A:80-B:C, Agent Type ABC 3
Cost per Unit $54.00 $75.00 $128.00 $73.95
Total Cost $162.00 $225.00 $384.00 $221.85
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Badger Badger
Model No. 21007867 10MB 22603B 22603B
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 11341
S.[5lb Capacity, UL Rated 2-A:40-B:C, Agent Type ABC 1
Cost per Unit $35.00] No Bid $103.00 $34.95
Total Cost $35.00] $103.00 $34.95
Manufacturer Advantage Amerex Minimax
Model No. 21007866 AX500 MX5A
T.|5lb Capacity, UL Rated 4:A-60-B:C, Agent Type ABC 3
Cost per Unit $35.00] No Bid $118.00 $55.95
Total Cost $105.00 $354.00 $167.85
Manufacturer Advantage Badger Advantage Buckeye
Model No. 21007866 21007867B-10lb 5HISA-40ABC
U.|2.5lb Capacity, Mini Guard Heat Actuated, Agent Type ABC 3
Cost per Unit $125.00 $170.00 $55.00 $79.95
Total Cost $375.00 $510.00 $165.00 $239.85
Manufacturer Flame Defender Buckeye Buckeye Buckeye
Model No. 518228 80250 13315 80250
V.[2.5lb Capacity, Automatic Liquefied Gas, Agent Type ABC 1
Cost per Unit $350.00 $170.00 $179.00 $120.95
Total Cost $350.00 $170.00 $179.00 $120.95
Manufacturer Fireboy| Buckeye Amerex Halon 1211 HalGuard
Model No. DDP25HFC227| 80250 DDPAX352TS HG250R
W.|4.4lb Capacity, Automatic Self Contained 4
Cost per Unit $125.00 $190.00 $215.00 $70.95
Total Cost $500.00 $760.00 $860.00 $283.80
Manufacturer Flame Defender| Buckeye Amerex Flame Defender
Model No. 518228 80501 DDPAX355T 740702
X.|2.5lb Capacitv, 1-A:10-B:C. Aaent Tvpe ABC 2 $26.00, $36.00 $37.00 $34.95
Cost per Unit $52.00] $72.00 $74.00 $69.90
Total Cost Advantage Badger Badger Advantage Amerex
Manufacturer 21007865 ADV250 21007865B AX417T
Model No.
Sub Total $37,732.00; $33,563.00 $60,586.80 $49,143.40
Item IIl.[Drv Chemical Aaent 30
A.|Purple-K Dry Chemical Aaent, 5 aallons each
Cost per 5 gallon container $87.00] $120.00 $275.50 $142.95
Total Cost $2,610.00] $3,600.00 $8,265.00 $4,288.50
Manufacturer Ansul PyroChem Brooks Universal
Model No. 9335 RC50PK 50PKPail 50PKPail
Manufacturer Badger
Model No. KC-50p
Manufacturer Buckeye
Model No. 61200
Sub Total $2,610.00] $3,600.00 $8,265.00 $4,288.50
Item IV.|Recharging of Fire Extinguishers
A.|2.5 Gallon Extinquisher, Type Water Pressure 3
Cost per Unit $0.00; $5.00 $5.50 $11.00
Total Cost $0.00; $15.00 $16.50 $33.00
B.|2.5lb Extinquisher, Type ABC 117
Cost per Unit $7.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.75
Total Cost $819.00 $585.00 $585.00 $672.75
C.|5lb Extinquisher, Type ABC 693
Cost per Unit $9.00, $5.00 $5.50 $7.75
Total Cost $6,237.00 $3,465.00 $3,811.50 $5,370.75
D.|4lb Extinquisher, Type ABC 5
Cost per Unit $9.00, $5.00 $5.50 $7.75
Total Cost $45.00] $25.00 $27.50 $38.75
E.|10Ib Extinquisher, Type ABC 629
Cost per Unit $12.00 $5.00 $7.50 $9.75
Total Cost $7,548.00 $3,145.00 $4,717.50 $6,132.75




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 3, 2014 NAS
Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
Rick Bogle A-1 Fire & Safety Danny Ramirez McCoy's Texas Best
For: Purchase, Inspection & Maintenance of Fire Extinguishers dba ARB Fire Protection dba City Wide Fire Fire Protection, LLC
Protection
6100003227 AV 11202 Weslayan St. 203 E. Rhapsody 520 New Laredo Hwy 1025 US Hwy 181
Item Description Est. [Stamford, San Antonio, San Antonio, Portland,
Annual |TX 79553 TX 78216 TX 78211 TX 78374
Oty. |214-364-0704
F.|20lb Extinquisher, Type ABC 38
Cost per Unit $20.00] $5.00 $12.50 $13.75
Total Cost $760.00 $190.00 $475.00 $522.50
G.[6lb Extinquisher, Type ABC 5
Cost per Unit $9.00, $5.00 $5.50 $8.50
Total Cost $45.00] $25.00 $27.50 $42.50
H.|2.5lb Extinquisher, Type BC 15
Cost per Unit $7.00 $5.00 $5.50 $5.75
Total Cost $105.00 $75.00 $82.50 $86.25
1.|10lb Extinquisher, Type BC 3
Cost per Unit $12.00 $5.00 $7.50 $9.75
Total Cost $36.00] $15.00 $22.50 $29.25
J.|5lb Extinquisher, Tvpe CO2 1
Cost per Unit $13.00] $5.00 $8.00 $15.75
Total Cost $13.00, $5.00 $8.00 $15.75
K.|10lb Extinquisher, Tvpe CO2 16
Cost per Unit $16.00] $5.00 $15.00 $25.75
Total Cost $256.00 $80.00 $240.00 $412.00
L.|5lb Extinauisher, Tvpe Halon 2
Cost per Unit $45.00] $5.00 $30.00 $9.75
Total Cost $90.00, $10.00 $60.00 $19.50
M.[10lb Extinauisher, Tvpe Halon 4
Cost per Unit $65.00] $5.00 $55.00 $13.75
Total Cost $260.00 $20.00 $220.00 $55.00
N.|20lb Extinquisher, Tvype Halon 1
Cost per Unit $105.00 $5.00 $110.00 $16.75
Total Cost $105.00 $5.00 $110.00 $16.75
0.]20Ib Extinguisher, Type CO2 3
Cost per Unit $27.00] $25.00 $30.00 $45.75
Total Cost $81.00, $75.00 $90.00 $137.25
P.|124lb Extinauisher, Tvpe CO2 2
Cost per Unit $125.00 $5.00 $186.00 $250.75
Total Cost $250.00 $10.00 $372.00 $501.50
Sub Total $16,650.00; $7,745.00 $10,865.50 $14,086.25
Item V.|CO2 Cartridae
A.|Fire Exinquisher 5Ib, Tvpe CO2 5
Cost per Unit $55.00] $5.00 $68.50 $49.95
Total Cost $275.00 $25.00 $342.50 $249.75
B.|Fire Exinquisher 10Ib, Type CO2 14
Cost per Unit $60.00] $5.00 $69.50 $49.95
Total Cost $840.00 $70.00 $973.00 $699.30
C.|Fire Exinquisher 15Ib, Tvype CO2 1
Cost per Unit $70.00] $5.00 $78.00 $57.95
Total Cost $70.00, $5.00 $78.00 $57.95
D.|Fire Exinauisher 20Ib, Tvpe CO2 1
Cost per Unit $75.00] $5.00 $78.00 $57.95
Total Cost $75.00 $5.00 $78.00 $57.95
Sub Total $1,260.00] $105.00 $1,471.50 $1,064.95
Item VI.|Fire Extinauisher Repair Parts
A.[Pressure Gauge 160
Cost per Unit $5.00; $6.50 $4.50 $3.95
Total Cost $800.00 $1,040.00 $720.00 $632.00
B.[Pull Pins 250
Cost per Unit $0.25] $0.40 $1.50 $0.95
Total Cost $62.50 $100.00 $375.00 $237.50
C.|Siphon Tube 110
Cost per Unit $5.00; $0.10 $9.76 $6.95
Total Cost $550.00 $11.00 $1,073.60 $764.50




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 3, 2014 NAS
Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
Rick Bogle A-1 Fire & Safety Danny Ramirez McCoy's Texas Best
For: Purchase, Inspection & Maintenance of Fire Extinguishers dba ARB Fire Protection dba City Wide Fire Fire Protection, LLC
Protection
6100003227 AV 11202 Weslayan St. 203 E. Rhapsody 520 New Laredo Hwy 1025 US Hwy 181
Item Description Est. [Stamford, San Antonio, San Antonio, Portland,
Annual |TX 79553 TX 78216 TX 78211 TX 78374
Qty. |214-364-0704
D.|Valve Sprinas 110
Cost per Unit $0.00; $0.10 $6.95 $3.95
Total Cost $0.00; $11.00 $764.50 $434.50
E.|Bottom Handle 85
Cost per Unit $5.00, $0.00 $7.00 $6.95
Total Cost $425.00 $0.00 $595.00 $590.75
F.|Top Handle 85
Cost per Unit $5.00, $0.00 $7.00 $6.95
Total Cost $425.00 $0.00 $595.00 $590.75
G.|Discharge Nozzle 85
Cost per Unit $3.00, $0.00 $7.00 $4.95
Total Cost $255.00 $0.00 $595.00 $420.75
H.|Valve Stem O-Rina 95
Cost per Unit $0.00; $0.00 $1.50 $1.95
Total Cost $0.00; $0.00 $142.50 $185.25
I.|Neck O-Rina 15
Cost per Unit $0.00; $5.00 $0.50 $1.95
Total Cost $0.00; $75.00 $7.50 $29.25
J.|Rivets 65
Cost per Unit $0.00; $0.00 $0.00 $0.95
Total Cost $0.00; $0.00 $0.00 $61.75
K.|Carrying Handle 60
Cost per Unit $12.00] $0.00 $7.00 $5.00
Total Cost $720.00 $0.00 $420.00 $300.00
L.|Valve Stem 65
Cost per Unit $5.00, $7.50 $8.00 $5.00
Total Cost $325.00 $487.50 $520.00 $325.00
M.|DOT Label 105
Cost per Unit $1.00 $0.40 $0.25 $2.00
Total Cost $105.00 $42.00 $26.25 $210.00
N.|Discharge Hoses: Dry Chemical and Halon, 5Ib-10lb 75
Cost per Unit $15.00, $1.50 $21.25 $13.95
Total Cost $1,125.00] $112.50 $1,593.75 $1,046.25
O.|Discharge Hoses: Dry Chemical and Halon, 20lb 12
Cost per Unit $20.00, $1.50 $39.45 $14.95
Total Cost $240.00 $18.00 $473.40 $179.40
P.|Fuse Links 5
Cost per Unit $8.00, $5.00 $0.00 $10.00
Total Cost $40.00, $25.00 $0.00 $50.00
Q.|50" Hose 4
Cost per Unit $110.00 $125.00 $179.90 $554.95
Total Cost $440.00 $500.00 $719.60 $2,219.80
R.|100' Hose 4
Cost per Unit $170.00 $215.00 $299.80 $1,050.95
Total Cost $680.00 $860.00 $1,199.20 $4,203.80
S.|Safety Disc for CO2 10
Cost per Unit $3.00, $15.00 $6.95 $5.00
Total Cost $30.00, $150.00 $69.50 $50.00
T.|Discharge Hoses: CO2, 5Ib-10lb 5
Cost per Unit $21.00, $25.00 $30.25 $67.95
Total Cost $105.00 $125.00 $151.25 $339.75
U.|Discharge Hoses: CO2, 20lb 2
Cost per Unit $21.00, $25.00 $31.75 $79.95
Total Cost $42.00 $50.00 $63.50 $159.90
Sub Total $6,369.50, $3,607.00 $10,104.55 $13,030.90
Sub Total $85,497.50) $69,672.00 $113,605.35 $95,211.80
Prompt Payment Discount 10% 0% 0% 0%
Sub-Total with Prompt Payment Discount $76,947.75 $69,672.00 $113,605.35 $95,211.80
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 47.64%
Price differential $36,657.60
Payment Terms 10% 10 days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $85,497.50 $69,672.00 $113,605.35 $95,211.80

Estimated Annual Award

$85,497.50




	Award

