City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 23, 2015 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Police Aggressive Driving Vehicles Cowboy Chrysler Dodge |Silsbee Ford Grapevine DCJ, LLC Caldwell Country Ford
Jeep Ram
6100005524 LD 1305 Highway 96 South 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 2601 William D Tate 800 E. Hwy 21 (PO Box
27)
Item Description Quantity |Silsbee, Silsbee, Grapevine Caldwell,
TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 76051 TX 77836
409-988-9377 409-988-9377
1 Police Package Sedan, Dodge Charger, 2
Rear Wheel Drive:
Price Each: $23,995.00 No Bid $24,567.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount: 2%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount: $24,075.66
Total: $47,990.00 $48,151.32
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2015 Dodge Charger PP 2015 Dodge Charger
Police LDDE48
Engine Offered: 5.7L, V8 5.7L Hemi V8
Warranty: 36 Mo/36,000 Bumper to 3yr/36,000 mile entire|
Bumper vehicle, 5yr/100,000 mile|
limited powertrain
Warranty Service Provider Name: Ancira Dodge Boerne Dodge|
Warranty Facility Address: 10807 IH 10, 30300 IH 10 West,
San Antonio, TX 78230 Boerne, TX 78006
Production Cut-off Date: May 31 June 2015
Last day order can be placed without missing 90 Mid/Late April 2015
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No Only if units are in stock
date:
Delivery 90 Days 60-80 days
2 Police Vehicle - Ford Mustang: 2
Price Each: No Bid $22,747.34 No Bid $27,320.00
Total: $45,494.68 $54,640.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2015 Ford Mustang 2015 Ford Mustang Fast
Back Ecoboost P8T
Engine Offered: 3.7L TI-VCT 2.3L Ecoboost 1.4 Turbo
Warranty: 36Mo0/36,000 bumper to| 3 yr/36,000
bumper
Warranty Service Provider Name: Red McCombs Ford Grande Ford
Warranty Facility Address: 8333 IH-10 West, IH 10 @ WW White Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78230 San Antonio, TX
Production Cut-off Date: May 31, 2015 May 30
Last day order can be placed without missing May 31 May 15
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
Delivery 90 Days 120 Days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 2% Net 10 Days Net 30
Total: $47,990.00 $45,494.68 $48,151.32 $54,640.00
Total Award: $47,990.00 $45,494.68
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