
LOC/fpr 
12/5/13 
Item No. 12A 

AN ORDINANCE 20 13 - 1 2 - 0 5 - 0 8 4 1 
ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM GRANDE TRUCK CENTER, 
CALDWELL COUNTRY FORD, SILSBEE FORD AND GUNN 
CHEVROLET TO PROVIDE VARIOUS CITY DEPARTMENTS WITH 
136 LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS FOR A COST OF $2,891,196.16, FROM THE 
EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND AND 
GENERAL FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide various City Departments with a total of 136 light 
duty trucks; and 

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Tom Benson Chevrolet for Item 18 failed to meet the City's 
specifications and/or requirements; and 

WHEREAS, the low bids were submitted by Grande Truck Center (Items 1-9, 14), Caldwell 
Country Ford (Item 10), Silsbee Ford (Items 11 - 13, 15) and Gunn Chevrolet Ltd. (Bid No.1, 
Items 17-18); NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Grande Truck Center (Items 1-9, 14), Caldwell Country 
Ford (Item 10), Silsbee Ford (Items 11-13, 15) and Gunn Chevrolet Ltd. (Bid No.1, Items 17-
18) to provide various City departments with 136 light duty trucks, for a total cost of 
$2,891,196.16, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required 
bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets 
and bids are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bid from Tom Benson Chevrolet for 
Item 18 did not meet the City's specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance is available as part of the Fiscal Year 2014 budget per 
the table below. 

Amount General Ledger Cost Center Fund 
$2,586,760.16 5501055 3503200001 72001000 

$19,159.00 5709090 5555050001 55001000 
$95,795.00 5709090 5555050002 55001000 

$134,113.00 5709090 6105010001 11001000 
$38,318.00 5709090 8002060059 11001000 
$17,051.00 5709090 2003040001 11001000 

Total Amount: 
$2,891,196.16 
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Item No. 12A 

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $2,286,442.00 is authorized to 
Grande Truck Center and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 5. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $28,326.00 IS authorized to 
Caldwell Country Ford and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 6. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $286,923.84 is authorized to 
Silsbee Ford and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 7. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $289,504.32 is authorized to 
Gunn Chevrolet Ltd. and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 8. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP 
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this Ordinance. 

SECTION 9. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 5th day of December, 2013. 

Y 0 R 
Julian Castro 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

Attorney 
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Voting Results Interface Page 7 of 72 

Agenda Item: 12A (in consent vote: 7,8,9,10,11, 12A, 12B, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 26, 27, 28, 
29,31,32,34,36,37,38,39,40,41,42, 43A, 43B, 43C, 43D ) 

Date: 12/05/2013 

Time: 10:02:38 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: Consideration of the following ordinances related to the purchase of light duty trucks: [Ben Gorzell, 
Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance] A) An Ordinance accepting the bids from 
Grande Truck Center, Caldwell Country Ford, Silsbee Ford and Gunn Chevrolet to provide various City 
departments with 136 light duty trucks for a cost of$2,891,196.16, from the Equipment Renewal and 
Replacement Fund and General Fund. 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Julian Castro Mayor x 

Diego Bernal District 1 x x 

Ivy R. Taylor District 2 x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Carlton Soules District 10 x 
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0.-"", AUgus116,2013 

light Duty Trucks 

Oescrlptlon 

112 Ton Truck, Regular Cat 
PriceEech 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Proa Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Prlc8Total 
Peroenh'gebetweenlowetltreapol18tvebidandlocalbKI 
Price differential 
Make & Model 

ProduclionCut-OffDale 
Lasl Day to Place Order 
FirmPlialngDBle 
Delivery 

112 Ton Truck. ExtendedCeb 
Price Each 
Prompt Payment DiscollOl 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
PeI'OOf\tage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 
Pricedifferenllal 
Make & Model 

Producllon Cut-Off Dale 
lll8t Day 10 Place Order 
Firm Pricing Date 

""'-Looal Preference Award 

112 Too TrueI<. Erlended Cab, 4x4 
Price Each 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt PftYment O".count 
Price Total 
Perc:entagebetween iowestreapol18ivebid and looalbid 
Price differential 
Make & Model 

Production Cul-Olf Oate 
LaslOtoyIoPlaceOrder 
Firm Pricing D"'e 
Delivery 

314TonTruck,ReguiarCat 
Price Each 
Prompt Payment Diaoount 
Price E"ch with Prompt Payment Disoount 
PriceTotat 
Parcentage between lowest reaponsive bid and local btd: 
Price differential 
Maka& Model 

ProducllonCut-OlfOate 

Laat Day to Place Order 
FirmPricll'lgDate 
Delivery 
Looal P..,iarence AWMd 

314 TonTruck,ReguiarCab,4X4 
PnceEach 
Prompt Payll18f1t Discount 
Price Each w~h Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Totei 
Percentage between lowest reapol18ive bid end tocal bid 
Price differential 
Make & Model 

ProductlonCut-OffOate 
Lael Oayto Place Order 
Firm PrIclng Date 
Delivery 

Grande Truck Center 

Quantity 1~7:;~1'lIO. 

210-661-4121 

'17,051
0
00

1 $17,05100 
$460,3770 

1.14% 
$5,18400 

2014FICFordF-I50RIC 

121311201 
121311201 

N 
60-00 Deys after11111201 

$460,377.01 

$1.'15·0~1 
$19,159.00 

$1,245,335.00 

""'" $13,260.00 
2014XICFordF-I50Su~ C., 

12131/201 
121311201 

N 
60-OOOu~afterI1111201 

$1,245,335.00 

$22.14700 
0% 

$22,,47.001 
$44,294.00 

2"% 
$1,15048 

2014XIEFonjFI50Super 
Clab4XoiI 

121311201 
12131/201 

N 
60-00 De:ys after 11111201 

$44,294.001 

$20,813.00 
0%1 

$20,813.001 
$83.252.00 

2.29% 
$1,860.00 

2014F2AFordF250~: 

121311201 
N 

60-90 Days aller Ofdel 
$83,252,001 

'23'3910~1 $23,391.00 
$23,391.00 

2"% 
$539.00 

2014F2BFordF250Ra, 
Cab4X 

121311201 
121311201 

N 
60-90 Da)l$aftarordei 

CaldweD Counl.y Ford 

800HWj21 E 

Caldwell. 
TX77836 

$11,215.00 
0% 

$17,215.00 
$464,805.001 

2014 F-I50 RegulerCa 
Fon 
NlA 
NlA 

45 Day" 
120 Days 

$19,743.001 
0%1 

$I,~~:~~~i 

2014 Ford F-I5C 

NIA 
NIA 

450uys 
120Ds)"l 

$22,731.001 
0% 

$22,731.00 
$45,462.00 

2014FordF_I50 

NIA 
45 Dey~ 

120Da),,!! 

$20.839.00 
0% 

$20,83900 
$83,35600 

2014 Ford F-250 

NIA 
450ay 

120 Day 

$23,581.001 
0% 

$23,581.00 
$23,581.00 

2014 Ford F-250 

NIA 
NIA 

45 Day 
1200a 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

$16,659.00 
0% 

$16,85900 
$455,193.ooi 

2013 Ford F-I50 Rag C"I 

Sapll,2013 
10-1-13' 
10-1-1: 

90 Day 

$21,65370 
0% 

$21.65310 
$5S4,649.901 

28.44'* 
$129,4569' 

Chevrolet Silverado RE 
C8b201 

Aplil-Mayof201 
NlA 

1200ay 

$18.95500 
0% 

$18,955.00 
$1,232,015.00 

$22,174.31 
0% 

$22,17431 
$1,441,33015 

1698% 
$209.255.1!' 

2013 Ford F_15O ErlCa~ Chevrolet SilvemdoDoubI 
Cab 201 

Sept 1,2013 

~~:~~I 
90 Day 

$21,842.00 
0% 

$21.84200 
$43.68400 

FordF-I50ErlCBb4X 

::~~~~I 
90 Dey 

$20,348.00 
0% 

$20,348.00 
$81,392.00 

2014 Ford F-2SO Reg C .. I 

5-30-141 
000., 

$22,85200 
0% 

$22,652.00 
$22,852.00 

2014 Ford F-2SO Reg Cal 
<X4 

5-30-14 

~~:I 
OOD 

April-Mayof201 
NIA 

Not Provide 
120 Day 

$25.405,91 
0% 

$25,405.91 
$50,811.82 

17.77~ 

$SO.8118 
Chevrolet Silverado 4X, 

April-May 01201 
NIA 

Not Provided 
Not Provided 

$21,982.901 
0% 

$21.982.90 
$87,93160 

$6,:3~~6~1 
Chevrolet Silverado R, 

C 

101412013 
N, 

120 Day 

$24,750.46 
0% 

$24.75048 
$24,750.46 

8.31~ 
$1,89846 

Chevrolel Silverado R 
Cab 4WD 2014 

i~~~6~~1 
N, 

NotProvid, 

$19,657.95, 
0% 

$19.65795 
$530,764.651 

16.60% 
$75,511.6 

Chev!oIetCC15703201 

April 30,2014 
April 30,2014 

Yes,higherprie. 
60-80 Day' 

$21,978.56 
0% 

$21,91856 
$1.428,606401 

1595%1 
$100.531.4' 

ChevroletCC15753201 

April 30,2014 
Apnl30,2014 

Yea,higherpric, 
60-80 Day 

$25,210.16' 
0% 

$25,210.16 
$50.420.32 

$1~:7!~~1 
ChevrolatCK15753201 

April 30. 2014 
April 30,2014 

Yea, hi9her prie' 
60-80 Dey 

$22,489.8 
0% 

~!:::.~I 
10.53% 

se,567.40 
ChevrolelCC20903201 

Apn130.2014 

April 30, 2014 
Yes. higher price 

60-80 Day 

$25,248.91 
0% 

$25,248.91 
$25,24891 

ChevroletCK20903201 

Apri!30,2014' 
Apri130,2014 

Ye~, hlgherpric 
60-80 Da 

PreparedbyPurchasIrIQ1'I1912013 

Bid #2 

Ancira Chrysler Jeep Dod Caldwell Countlj-Chiwrolet !Orepev,ne Dodge Chrysler IGriffith Ford Segl.lln. LLC lounn- chevrolet L TO 

108071Hl0Weal 

San Antonio, 
lX18230 

$22,042.75
1 

0% 
$22,042.75 

$595,IS4.2f 
30.75% 

$139,961.2'-

Not Publish 

11.86 
$146,168.7 

2014 Ram 

Caldwell. 
'n< n836 

$22,595.00 
0% 

$22.59500 
$610,065.00 

Chevrolet~lveradol50 

RegCabCC10103,201 
May 15,201 

May 201 
Y5 

120 Day 

$23,28500 
0% 

$23,26500 
$1.513.52500 

Chevrolet Sifverado 150 
Double Cab (Erl) CC15153 

2014 
May 15,201 

May 201 
Y5 

120 Day 

0% 
$24,14515 
$48.29150 

11.93 
$5,147.98 

$2'6.720.00 
0% 

$26,72000 
$53,440.00 

".,,45.7j 

2014 Rftm Chevrolet 1500 Silverad, 

NotProvid 
Mareh25,201 

Ooub/e Cab (Erl) CC10753 
2014 

May 15,201 
Mlly201 

Yool 
12008)' 

$24,337.001 
0% 

;:;:~~:~~! 

Chevrolel Silverado 2SOOH 
RegCabCCZ5903,201 

1.4111)'1,201 

M8y201 

YMI 
1200&y$ 

$27.,16.001 
0% 

$27,116.00 
$27,116.00 

Chevrolet Silverado 2500HI 

Reg Cab 4X4 CKlS903! 
2015 

Me:yl,201 
Me:yl,201 

Y~ 

1200 

Joo, 
2601 WiliiamD Tate 

Grapevine, 
'rX76051 

$21,089.00 
,% 

$20,661.22 
$558,014.9 

Dodge Ram 1500201 

6/112014 
413012014 

N 
60-75 Day 

$20,643.00 
2% 

$20,23014 
$1,314,959.10 

Dodge Ram 1500 201 

61112014 
413012014 

N 
60-75 Day 

$22,012.00 
2% 

$21.57176 
$43.143.52 

DodgeR8Il11500201 

Seguin, 
TX78155 

$16,987,621 
0% 

$16,987.62 
$458.665.74 

Ford FI50RIC 2013_201 

2013 Model a.23-1 
8_22_13 on 2013 1.4 

Yea-MYI 
145 day 

126021H35N 

San AntoJlio, 
'1)(78233 

$1.000~1 
0% 

$1,~~~:=::1 

Ford FISO S/C 2013-201 

2013 Modet 8-23-13/201 
8_22_13 on 2013 1.4' 

Yee-MYI 
145 day 

$22,091.91 
0% 

$22,091.91 
$44,183.82 

Ford FI50 SIC 4X4 ~~,~I 

No Bid 

No BId 

No Bid! 

6J1I201~ 2013Model8·23-131201~ 
413012014 8-22-13 on 2013 MY 

N YM-MY14 
60-75 Day 145 days 

$24,58000 
2% 

$24,08840 
$96,35360 

Dodge Ram 2500 201 

4130120141 
N, 

60-75 Day 

$26,419.00 
,% 

$25,890.621 
$25,89062 

Dodge Ram 2500 201 

6/1/2014 
413012014 

N, 

$20,603.101 
0% 

:::;!.~~I 

NIA 
NIA 

120 Day 

$23.22824 
0% 

$23,228.24 
$23.228.241 

Ford F250 RIC 4X420141 

$24.585.16 
0% 

$24,565.76 
$98,343.04 

2083% 
$16.951.041 

ChevroIatSllveradoR"1 
Cab201~ 

NlA{produc~onstarta Fe!: 
2014)1 

Not Provided 
NotProvidoc 
NotProvldad 

$26,882.071 

0%; 
$26,882.07 
$26,88207 

1164% 
$4,0300i 

Chevrolet RegCa' 
S~verado201 

NIA~ Production starts Feb 20,' 
N/A NotPtoVIdoo 
NiA NotProvidec 

120 Day NotProvid 

EXHIBIT I 



Opened· 

6100003308 

August 16.2013 

Light Duty Trucks 

LocaiPreler9l1(:eAward 

D.scriptlon 

3/4 Ton Truck,Extancied Co.tb 

Prompt Payment Discount 
Prioe EaGh with Prompt Payment Discount 
PrioeTotal 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 
Price dIfferential 
Make & Model 

Production Cut-Otf Oate 
Last Oayto Placa Order 
Finn Pricing Date 
Delivery 
Local Preference Award 

3f4 Ton Truck. ExtandodCab. 4X4 
Price Each 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 

Percentage between lowest relIponIIiWl bid and local bid 
Price differential 
Make & Model 

ProduciionCut-OffOate 
Laal Oay 10 Place Order 
Finn Pricing Date 
Oelr".,ry 
local PreferBnce Award 

314 Ton Truck. C.-Cab 
PriceEacI1 
Prompt Payment Discooot 
Price Each wlh Prompt Payment DIscount 
Pric .. Totel 
Percantage between Ioweat reaponsive bid end Io::al bid 
Pric .. differenllal 
Make & Model 

Production Cut-Off Date 
lastOayloPlaceOrder 
Finn Pricing Data 
Delivery 
local Prelefence Award 

3/4 Ton Truck. Crew Cab. 4X4 
PriceEech 
Prompt Peyment DIScount 
Pooe Each with Prompl Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Percentage ootween iowest r .... ponsIVe bid end local bid· 
Pricedil'fefential 
Make & Model 

ProductlonCut-OtfOate 
last Oay 10 Placa Order 
Finn Pricing Data 
Delivery 
local Preference Award 

3/4 Ton Cab& ChasSIS, Regular Cab. 56- ceb to axle chassis, 
SRW. Sevica Body with Pipe Rack 
PoceEach 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment DiS(:ount 
PriceTotel 
Percentage between lowest resporl8ive bid and local bid: 
Pricedifferen!ial 
Make & Mode! 

ProductionCut-OffOate 
last Oay 10 Place On:ler 
Make & Model of ServICe Body 
FlnnPriclngDate 
Delivery 

314 Ton Cab & Chassis. Regular Cab, 56" Cab 10 Axle Cm.S9 
SRW, Service Body with Te18\100p1c Root and ledderRacl 
PriceEftCh 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Bid #2 
Local l~. Non-Lot:al Non-Lot:al 

Grande TruckCenter Caldwell Country Ford lSll9bee Ford GunnCh9llroleiLTO. Tom Benson Chevrolet IAncira Chrysler Jeep Ood981CaldweU Count,y·Cr.evrolei !Grapevine DodgeiChrysteilGnffitll Ford Seguin, LLC IGunn Ch9llrol6t LTD. 

4562 IH 10 East 800Hwy21 E 126021H35N 

TX78219 TX77636 
Quantity ISanAntonto. ICaidwell, 

210-661-4121 254-773-8824 

1211 US Hwy 69 

S~sbaa. 

TX776S6 
409-880-9191 

San AntOOlO. 
TX78233 
210-599-5000 

m;391.oo 

522'8970~1 
$22.89700 
$22.89700 

275% 
$61240 

2014 XlA Ford F250 Sups 
C •• 

121311201 
121311201 

N 
60-90 Days aflerorde! 

$22,897.001 

$25.483.00 
0% 

$25.4830( 
$50.966.00 

225% 
$1.120801 

2014 XlB Ford F250 Sups 
Cab4X' 

121311201 
121311201 

N 

60-90 D~:;~~I 

$24.107.00' 
0% 

$24.107.00 

$241,070.001 
139% 

$3,310.00 
2014W2AFordF250C""" C., 

121311201 
121311201 

N 
60-90 Days afterOfdel 

$241,070.0' 

$26.65100 
0%1 

$26,651.00 
$26.65100 

119% 
$31448 

2014W2BFordC_Cab 
4x41 

121311201 
121311201 

N 

60-90 Da~:;5~~:1 

$29.6510~ 

$29,651.00 
$29.651.00 

468% 

2014:!A~~~!~= 
121311201 

121311201 
1213112013 

90-120 Days 8t1er orde 

$30,823.001 

$22.983.001 
0% 

522.983.00 
$22,983.00 

2014 Ford F-2SC 

NlA 
NlA 

45 Day 
1200ay 

$25,724.001 OJ, 
$25,724.00 
$51.44800 

2014 FordF-2SC 

NlA, 
NlA 

45 Day 
120 Oay 

$24.260.00 
0% 

524.260.00 
5242.600001 

$22.284.60' 
0% 

$22,284.60 
$22,284.60 

527,081.92 
0% 

$27.08192 
$27.08192 

$4~;9~3~ 
2014 Ford F-25O Ext CU~ChevroIoI3f4 Ton Silven!lc 

Double Cab 201 
5-30-14 Start of production notunt~ 
5-30-14 NlA 
5-30-14 Not Provide< 
90 Day NotProvid~-

$24.922.60 
0% 

$29,4124 
O%! 

$24,922.60 $29.41245: 
$49,845.20 $58,824.90 

$8~:7~2~ 
2014 Ford ExtCeb4X Cflevrolel314 Ton DoublE 

Cab2015 
5-30-14 Startofpnxiuctlonnotuntil 
5-30-\4 NfA 
5-30-14 
000., 

$23.77600 
0% 

$23,776.00 
$237.760.00 

$25,126.7 
0% 

:S~:~!~.~1 

2014FordF_2~2014FordF_25Ocrewcal 

NlA 5-30-14 
NlA 5-30_14 

450ay NotProvidec 
1200ay 90 Dey' 

5.68% 
$13.507.50 

Chevrolet 314 TonCreY 
Ceb 201~ 

~b.:::~~1 
N, 

120Dey 

~m~ 
$26.43200 $27,579.26 

0% 0% 0% 
526.971.00 $26.43200 527.579.26 
$26,971.00 $26.43200 $27,57926 

4.72% 
$1,24274 

2014FordF_2 2014 Ford F-250 Cre Chevrolet 314 TonC 
Cab 201 

NlA 5-30-14 101412013 
NlA 5-30-14 101412013 

,,"" 5-30-14 N 
1200ay 300., 1200ay 

$28,32600 $28,36000 $31.407.40 
0% 0% 0% 

$28,326.00 $28.36000 531.407.40 
$28,326.00 $28.36000 $31.407.40 

10.88 

2014 Ford F-2SC 2014 Ford F-25C Ch9llrolel 314 Ton RegCu 
2014 

NlA 10-4-2013 
Knaphelde 696J wi Pi RKll-56-80 Reading Cla""lc I 

NlA 5-30-14 10-4_2013 
45 Day 5-30-14 N 

100 DeY, 90 Days 120 Day 

$2840500 $27660.00 $2899640 

940Q San Pedro Ave. 

San AntonIo, 
TX78216 

$25.633.70' 
0% 

$25.633.70 
$256.337.00, 

Chevrolet CC20943 201 

April 30,2014 
April 30,2014 

NotProvideo: 
NotProv!de, 

$28.592761 
0%: 

$28,592.76, 
$28.59276 

8.57% 
$2.256.24 

ChevroletCK20943 201~ 

April 30, 2014 
April 30. 2014 

Yoo.high .... pnC< 
60-800ay 

$32,84
360

1 0% 
$32.64360 
$32,843.60 

15.95%1 

ChevroIeI.CC20903201 

Apnl 30, 2014, 
ReadingClassicU 

April 30. 2014 
Yes, higher priCE 

NotProvidec 

$30.44260 

P,aperad by PurchasIng 1111912013 

108071Hl0West 

San AntOOlo, 
TX78230 

No Bidl 

No Bid 

NoBld 

No Bid 

NoBldl 

Noeidl 

Caldwell, 
TX 77836 

No Bidl 

Joo, 
2601 WilhamD.Tate 

GrapevIne. 
TX76051 

525.595.00 
7% 

$25.083.10 
$250.831.00 

Dodge Ram 2500 201 

61112014 
413012014 

N 
60-75Da 

$26.67400 
' 7% 

$26,336.52 
$26.33652 

Dodge Ram 2500 201 

413012014 
N 

$34,096.00 
7% 

$33,416.04 
$33,41604 

Dodge Rem 2500 201 

61112014 
DTWsme 
413012014 

N 
90-100 Day 

$34,020.00 

Seguin. 
TX78155 

$22,731.341 
0% 

$22,731.34 
$22,731.34 

Ford F250 SfC20141 

NfA 
NIA, 
NfA 

120 Oay 

$25,324.06 
0% 

$25.324.06 
$50.648.12 

FordF250SfC4X420141 

NIA, 
NfA 
NfA 

120 OaY' 

$23.945.5 
0% 

$23.94555 
$239.45550 

2014 F250Crew SWB 
2014 
NlA 
NfA 

No" 
120 Dey 

$26,534.26 
0% 

$26.534.26 
$26,534.26 

Ford F250 Crew SWB 4X4 
2014 
NlA 
NfA 
NfA 

120 Days 

$30,06869 
0% 

$30.06869 
$30.088.69 

Ford F250 RJC 2014 

Wam .... 8· 
NfA 
NlA 

145Da 

$28.01295 

126021H35N 

San Antonio, 
TX76233 

No Bid 

NoBld' 

527,46315
1 0% 

527,463.15 
5274.631.50 

15.51% 
$36.871.50 

ChevrolBl 3/4 Crew Cal 
201' 

ProductionstartupFel 
NlA 
N, 

120Duy 

$29~7191 0% 
$29,542.19 
$29.542.19 

1217% 
$3.205.67 

Chevrolet 4X4 Crew Ca 
20 1 ~ 

PnxiuclionstartupFel 
NlA 
NfA 

Not Provided 

$34.03324 
0% 

$34.033.24 
$34.033.241 

20.15~ 

Chevroiet Reg Cab 201 

ProducbOllstart up Fel 
Readlr1QClassicl 

NlA 
NfA 

NctPI'OVIQe. 

$31,595.24 



Opened: August 16,2013 

Light Duty Trucks 

O.sc::rlptlon 

Prompt Payment Discount 
Prloo Each with Prompt Payment DillCount 
PrlooTotal 
Percentage belWeen lowest responsive bid and local bod 
PricedlfferentlBl 
Make & Model 

ProductionCut-OffDate 
Laat Day to PIac::aOrder 
Make & Model of Service Body 
FirmPricingD8te 
Delivery 
Non-Loclll Preference Award 

3/4 Ton Cab & Cha!!lS~, Regular Cab, 56" Cab to Axle, SRW 
with 8 Cages and 1 StOlBge Compartment Animal Control Umt 
B"", 
PnceEach 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Prloo Each w~h Prompt Payment Di!lCOUnt 
Price Total 
Make & Model 
ProductionCut-OffDate 
Laet 08yto Piece Order 
Meke & Model of Body 
Firm Pricing Date 
Oelivefy 
Non-Local Prefereooe Awerd 

Minimum OVWR 14,000 lbe .. Reguler Cab, Cab & Chassis 
with 2-3 CY dump body 
Price Each 
Prompt Peyment DISCount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment DIscount 
Price Total 
Percentege between ICI'M!SI responsive bid and local bid' 
Pricedlfferenllal 
Meke & Model 

Production Cut-Off Date 
last Day to PIac::e Order 
Maka & Model of SeMce Body 
Firm Pricing Data 
~ivery 

Non-local Preference Award 

Minimum 17,500 lbe GVWR, Regular Cab, 84" Cab to Axla 
Cab & Chassis, DIesel, Minimum 36ft. Aenel Vehicle with 
Service Body 
Price Each 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Percentage between lowest reaponsive bid and local bid' 
Price differential 
Make & Model 

ProductlonCut-OtfDate 
Last Day to Place Order 
Make & Model of Aerial8ucllet 
Flnl1 Pricing Date 
DeilveIY 
local Preference Award 

15 IMinimum 13,000 GCWR, Van, 15 passenger, Black & WMe 
EJderiorColoi 
Price Each 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 
Price differential 
Maka& Model 
Production Cut-Oft Date 
lest Day to Piece Order 
FirmPriclngData 
Delivery 

17 1~':~:: Vehicle. Mldeize. 4 door, 2WD, M8J(lmum 12Q" 

Prompt Peyment Discount 
Price Each wtth Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Make & Model 

ProduclionCut-OlI'Dete 

last Day to Place Order 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Bld#l Bid #2 
L~al Local Non-Local 

Grande Truc::kCenter GunriChevroletLTD Tom Benson Chevrolet IAnc::ira Chrysler Jeep Dod Caldwell Country ChavrOla! IGrapevine Dodge Chrysler GriffithFord Seguin, LLC IGunn Chevrolet LTD 
Joop 

9400 San Pedro Ave 10S071Hl0We<J1 PO BOIr 27 2601 WilhamD Tate ISS0W.IH10 

Caklweh Country Ford [siisbee Ford 

45621Hl0Eaat 12602IH35N 800Hwy21E !1211 US Hwy69 

QUlllltity ISanAntonio, 
TX78219 

0% 
$30,82300 
$61,646.00 

Caldwalt, 
1)(77836 
254-773-8824 

0%1 $28,405.00 
$56,610.00 

."~'-'-~ .,,,.,, Cab wi S9IVlceB 

12/3112Q13 NlA 
Knapheide696Jwi Telet 

12/3112013 NIA 
N 45 Day 

90-120 Daysafteron::le 1800ay 

NoBidl 

$33,65100 
0% 

$33,65100 
$33,651.00 

813% 

2014 F3G Ford F3fj)R 2014FordF-4 
Cab wi Dump Body 

1213112Q13 
NotProvid Rugby DU9-

1213112Q13 NfA 
N 45 Dey 

90-120 Daysafleron::le 210 Day 

$88,2~.00 $86,578.00 
0% 0% 

$88,2~.00 $86,57800 
$S8,2~00 $86,578.00 

1.86% 
$1,631.00 

2014F5GFord F5fj)R 2014FordF_55( 
CabwiAeria 

1213112Q1 "'. 1213112Q1 "'A 
No1PrQVid Veraa~ft SST-37-En 

N 4508y 
210-310 Days aflBf ord 280 Dar. 

209.00 

$27,12500 

O~ 

:;U~;': 

2014FordE_~~ 

Nf 
45 Day 

l100ay 

$23.97800 
0% 

$23,97800 
$215,802.00 

2014 Ford ElrpiorerFWC 

Silsbea, 
TX71656 

~
% 

$27,66000 
$55,32QOO 

San Anlonio, 
TX78233 
210-599-5000 

0% 
$28,996.40 
$57.992.80 

4.83%1 

"'''-''~ -"-~1 2014 
5-30-1 10-4-201 

RKIL-56-8 ReadingCiaeslC1 
5-30-1 10-4-2013 
5-30-1 N 
90 Day 120 Day 

$55,320.00 

$41.543'''1 
0% 

$41,543.58 
$124,630.74 

S&I1Antonio, 
TX78218 

0% 
$30.442.60 
$60,885.201 

10.06% 

ChevroJe\CC2090 

April 30,2014 
Reading ClassIc III 

April 30,2014 
Yes,higherpnCE 

60-80 Day" 

2014 Ford F-250 Reg Cel 
5-30-1~ 

Classic:: Custom Coachel 
5-30-1. 
5-30-1, 
3OD., 

$124,830.7 

$3O,9!j).1 

0%1 $30,95010 
$30,95010 

2014 F<.>r<:I F-35C 

5-30_1< w_, 
5-30_1. 
5-30-1, 
OlD., 

30 .1 

$25,34100 $27,662.75 
0% 0% 

$25,341.0 ~;:::;~ $76,02300 
9.16%1 

2014 Ford E-350 Va 2014 FordE-35C 
5-30-1 NfA 
5-30-1 NfA 
5-30-1 45Da~ 

OlD 12QDay' 

m"" '''_! ~" 0% 0% 0% 
$23,957.25 $23,6603 $24.372.11 

$215,615.2 $212,943.24 $219,348.99 
2014Fo<dE".,~2W Chw,oIon.,o_'" Chw •• ,CR1"26"" 

Apnl_May of2014 (Info NI Apri13O,2Q14 
at this time 

NotProvid Apnl30.2Q14 

Prepered by PurchastnQ 1111012013 

SIlI1Antonio, 
TX78230 

N()Bidl 

No Bidl 

No Bid 

Caldwell, 
TX 77838 

No Bid) $24,545.001 
0% 

$24,545.00 
$220,905.00 

ChevroleiTravernelSSpo< 
Utility FWD CR14526, 2014 

Mayl,201 

Mavl,201 

Grapevine, 
TX76051 

2% 
$33.339.60 
$66,679.20 

Dodge Ram 2500 201 

Warne, 
4130/20141 

N, 
90-100 Dey 

$44,56700 
2%1 

$43,675.66 
$43,675.66 

Dodge Ram 3500 201 

611/20141 

11' Rugby 2-3 Y~~~~ 

N, 
90-100DayE 

$24,45600 
2% 

$23,96888 
$215,70192 

Dodge Durango SSV 2014 
SPOSS 

611/20141 

Seguin, 
TX78155 

0% 
$28,01295 
$56,02590 

Ford F250 RIC 2014 

ReadingCIaSS~~ 

"'A 
145 Day' 

$34,053.44 
0% 

$34,053.44 
$34,053441 

2014F250 FordRICI 

RugbyLPI 
NfA 

1450ay 

No Bid 

$23,899.4 
0% 

$23.89945 
$215,095.051 

Ford Explorer Bese201 

San Antonio, 
TX78233 

0% 
$31,595.24 
$63,190.48 

14.23 

Chevrolel Reg Cab 201 

Proouctionstart up Fel 
RaadingClassiel 

",A 
NoIProv,,:le. 
Not ProVide. 

No Bid 

NoBldl 

Ne8idl 

No Bid 

No Bid 



0"",,00 August 16. 2013 

LightDutyTrucklil 

Grande Truck Cooler 

Description Quantity l~n7~~\~nIO 
210·661.4121 

FlrmPricing DBle 
DelIVery 
L0C8IPraferenceAwa,d 

Sport Utility Vehicle, Midsize. 4 door, 4WDfAWD, Maximum 
12Q"Wheelbase 

Prompt Payment Discount 
Price EacnWlth Prompt Payment DIscount 
Price TolBl 
PerclNllage between IOWMtresponslve bid end local bid: 
Price differential 
Make & Model 

last Dtly to Place Order 
Firm Pricing Date 
Oeliv9ry 
loca.PrefereneeAward 

Payment Tenns 

Line Items 1-9, 14, 18: Award based on Local Preference Progmm 
Deleted: Line Item 16 was deleted and WIll be bid at a later time 

$2.411.390.00 

NAS: Tom Benson Chevrolet-Item IS-Tom Bemoon did not bid .. 4WO a9 specified in theapacificatioos 

Caldwell COIJnlry Fotd 

800Hwy 21 E 

Caldwell, 
TX77836 
254·773-8824 

45 Day 
120 Day' 

$25,75800 
0% 

$26.75800 
$77,27400 

2014 Ford ExpiofarAW 

NIA 

NIA 
460ay 

120 Day 

Net 30 

_~961034.00 
;28,326.00 

Non-Lo<: .. r 

1211USHwy69 

Srtsbee, 
TX77656 
409-880-9191 

5·30·1 
9OD", 

$25.7222 
0% 

$25.7222 
$77.1667 

2014FordE~plofe.-4WC 

5-30.1 
9OD", 

277958364 
$286,923. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Loc.1 
Bid #2 
Local 

GunnChevroletlTO Tom Benson ChevroiflI IAncll'a Chrysler Jeep DodgejCaldweil Country Chevrolet IGrapelline Dodge Chrysler IGriffith Ford Seguin, LLC IGurm Chevrolet LTD. 

126011H35N 

San Antonio, 
TX78233 
210·599-5000 

NotPlUVld, 
120 Day 

5212,943.24 

$25,520.38 
0 

$25,620.3 
$76,5610 

124% 
$941.34 

ChevrolatTmverae201 

April·Mayof201 
(Info. N/A at this time 

NIA 
NoIPro~deo 

120 Dey 
76561.08 

$3.016120.28 
$289,50 .... 32 

San Antonio. 
TX78216 

Yes. htghef pric 
6O..(j00ay 

$24.372.11 
0% 

$24.372.11 
$73.116.33 

ChevrolatCR14526201 

ApI'1l 30. 2014 

April 30,2014 
Yes.hlgherpric 

60-80 Dey 

$2.796.123.56 

Prnpared by Purehsslng 1111912013 

San Antonio. 
TX78230 

$2.021.689,!j) 

Caldwell. 
TX 77836 

YM 
120 Day' 

$26.326.00 
0% 

$26,326.00 
$78.976.00 

ChevroieiTraverseLSS 
UtilityAWOCRI4526. 

Mayl.201 

Mayl.201 
Y 

120 Day 

$2,601,374.00 

J_p 
2601W,U,amD,Tete 

Gmpevlne. 
TX71!051 

N 
60·75 Day 

$26,721.00 
2% 

$25,20658 
$75,61974 

~odge Durango SSV 201 
AWD SPOSS 

61112014 

413012014 
N 

6()"75 Day 

2% 10 Days 

52,750,62186 

Seguin. 
TX78155 

120 Day' 

$25.682.69 
0% 

$26,68269 
$77,Q48071 

Fom Explomr Bas, 
AWD/4WD 2014 

NlA 

NlA 
NIA 

120 Day 

$2,601.552871 

San Antorno. 
TX78233 

$526.622521 


