City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened July 9, 2018

For:  Dog and Cat Food Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local
Midwest Veterinary Legend & White Animal [Hill's Pet Nutrition B & R Estes Corp
Supply Health Group dba Locke Hill Pet
6100010012 VF PO Box 856500 ;gi Schelter Rd, Ste 1,00 w. sth Avenue ‘11327 Golden Quail, Ste
Annual Minneapolis Lincolnshire Topeka, San Antonio,
Item Description Estimated |MN 55485 IL 60069 KS 66603 TX 78240
Quantities  |847-489-1002 800-643-9378 785-368-4902

1 Dog Food & Supplies

la |Adult Advanced Fitness Original Formula, #6735, 40 Ib bag 1,600 bags
Unit Price per Bag 64,000 Ibs $27.19 $33.58 $34.28 $38.99
Unit Price per Lb $0.85 $0.84 $0.86 $1.11
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $0.85 $0.84 $0.86 $1.11
Total Price $54,380.00 $53,728.00 $54,848.00 $71,296.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 32.70%
Brand Canine EN Hospital Pack Diamond Naturals SD SD

LW1342 Chicken

Product # 578.00039.5 LW1605 Beef 6735 11000
Lbs Per Bag 32 40 40 35
Extended Price $53,728.00

1b |Deleted
Adult Stew with Chicken & Vegetables, # 1430, 12 x 12.8 oz

1c |case 5 cases
Unit Price per Case 768 ounces $15.76 $18.11 $18.29 $30.00
Unit Price per Ounce $0.20 $0.12 $0.12 $0.20
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $0.20 $0.12 $0.12 $0.20
Total Price $151.30 $89.16 $91.45 $150.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 68.24%
Brand Pro Plan Savory Meals Purina SD SD
Product # 578.16215.5 LW0622 1430 1430
Case Count 8 12 12 12
Can Size 10.0 13.0 12.8 12.8
Extended Price $89.16
Adult Stew with Beef & Vegetables, # 1431, 12 x 12.8 oz

1d |case 215 cases
Unit Price per Case 33,024 ounces $15.76 $18.11 $18.29 $30.00
Unit Price per Ounce $0.20 $0.12 $0.12 $0.19
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $0.20 $0.12 $0.12 $0.19
Total Price $6,505.73 $3,833.75 $3,932.35 $6,350.77
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 65.65%
Brand Pro Plan Savory Meals Purina SD SD
Product # 578.16210.5 LWO0617 1431 1431
Case Count 8 12 12 12
Can Size 10.0 13.0 12.8 13.0
Extended Price $3,833.75

le |Puppy Loaf Chicken & Barley, # 7036, 12 x 13 0z case 1,300 cases
Unit Price per Case 202,800 ounces $14.87 $18.11 $18.29 $30.00
Unit Price per Ounce $0.10 $0.12 $0.12 $0.19
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $0.10
Total Price $19,331.00 $23,543.00 $23,777.00 $39,000.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 101.75%
Brand Pro Plan Focus Purina SD SD
Product # 578.17042.5 LW0278 7036 7036
Case Count 12 12 12 12
Can Size 13 13 13 13
Extended Price $19,331.00

1f [Healthy Growth Shelter Kennel Pack, # 2091, 40 Ib bag 750 bags
Unit Price per Bag 30,000 Ibs $27.19 No Bid $36.37 $49.99
Unit Price per Lb $0.85 $0.91 $1.67
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $0.85 $0.91
Total Price $25,490.63 $27,277.50 $49,990.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 96.11%
Brand Pack SD SD
Product # 578.00039.5 2091 9367
Lbs Per Bag 32 40 30
Extended Price $25,490.63
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened July 9, 2018

For:  Dog and Cat Food Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local
Midwest Veterinary Legend & White Animal [Hill's Pet Nutrition B & R Estes Corp
Supply Health Group dba Locke Hill Pet
6100010012 VF PO Box 856500 ;8451 Schelter Rd, Ste 1460 w. th Avenue ‘11327 Golden Quall, Ste
Annual Minneapolis Lincolnshire Topeka, San Antonio,
Item Description Estimated [MN 55485 IL 60069 KS 66603 TX 78240
Quantities |847-489-1002 800-643-9378 785-368-4902

2 |Cat Food & Supplies

2a |All Life Stages Kitten Food, # CD03024, 12 x 13 oz case 542 cases
Unit Price per Case 84,552 ounces $18.70 $31.11 No Bid No Bid
Unit Price per Ounce $0.26 $0.20
Total Price $21,960.03 $16,861.62
Brand Pro Plan Focus Canidae Pure LID
Product # 578.15068.5 LW1604
Case Count 24 12
Can Size 3 13
Extended Price $16,861.62

2b [Petag Clear Nursers, #99801, 12 per pack 10 packs
Unit Price per Package 120 each $8.28 No Bid No Bid $18.00
Unit Price per Each $0.69 $1.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $0.69
Total Price $82.80 $180.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 117.39%
Brand Esbilac Not Specified
Product # 105.0023.4 2027999801
Quantity per Package 12 12
Extended Price $82.80
Focus Classic Kitten Chicken & Liver Canned Food, #

2c (03100027634, 24 x 3 oz Case 2,500 cases NAS
Unit Price per Case 180,000 ounces $18.70 $21.19 $17.52 $23.00
Unit Price per Ounce $0.26 $0.29 $0.25 $0.32
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $0.26 $0.25
Total Price $46,750.00 $52,975.00 $45,310.34 $57,500.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 22.99%
Brand Pro Plan Focus ProPlan Focus SD Not Specified
Product # 578.15068.5 (Classic) LW0279 10807 (Minced) 38100027634
Case Count 24 24 24 24
Can Size 3 3 29 3
Extended Price $46,750.00

2d |Adult Optimal Care Original Formula, # 6801, 20 Ib bag 500 bags
Unit Price per Bag 10,000 Ibs $28.43 $26.25 $29.16 $36.99
Unit Price per Lb $1.78 $1.46 $1.46 $2.31
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1.46
Total Price $17,768.75 $14,583.33 $14,580.00 $23,118.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 58.56%
Brand Pro Plan Feline Adult Diamond Naturals SD SD

LW1400 Active Cat

Product # 578.15049.5 LW1672 Indoor Cat 6801 10405
Lbs per Bag 16 18 20 16
Extended Price $14,580.00

2e |Healthy Grown Shelter Kennel Pack, # 2092, 35 Ib bag 300 bags
Unit Price per Bag 10,500 Ibs $17.48 No Bid $50.20 $40.99
Unit Price per Lb $2.50 $1.43 $2.73
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 90.52%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1.43
Total Price $26,220.00 $15,060.00 $28,693.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 90.52%
Brand Pro Plan Focus SD SD
Product # 578.15059.5 2092 9392
Lbs per Bag 7 35 15
Extended Price $15,060.00
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $91,654.43 $74,512.52 $29,640.00
Estimated Annual Award $91,654.43 $74,512.52 $29,640.00

NAS: Did not meet product specifications
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