

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 7, 2020 For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts 6100012917			Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Quantity	Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. 2201 E. Division St. Arlington, TX 76011 817-831-9406	Traffic Parts Inc. 27895 Robinson Road Conroe, TX 77385 800-345-6329	Wildcat Traffic 5535 Harvey Wilson Houston, TX, 77020 512-608-8971	K&K Systems Inc. 687 Palmetto Road Tupelo, MS, 38801
		AJ				
1	Cabinet, School Zone Flasher Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No. Warranty (years)	50	\$397.00 \$19,850.00 Bison; 008-026618 One	No Bid	\$695.00 \$34,750.00 WE Manufacturing; WE-MFG Solar Flasher 5 years	No Bid
2	12" Amber LED Solar traffic signal lens, to comply with ITE specifications, TXDOT approved, warranted against defects for (5) years, and 16W LED maximum, Leotek TSL-12Y-LX-1L1-B1 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$66.00 \$3,300.00 Econolite; JXC300-DCY	\$68.00 \$3,400.00 Duralight; TP#2517; JXC-300-HFTDCY	\$46.00 \$2,300.00 Dialight; DI-433-3230-905XL	No Bid
3	DPC-2000 Controller, Precision Solar #864 100 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$323.00 \$16,150.00 Applied Information; Solar back panel with flasher *TXDOT approved	No Bid	\$160.00 \$8,000.00 Precision Solar; 864100	No Bid
4	Guss Tube w/ Vinyl insert, threaded on both sides, Pelco #AB2007-58 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$39.00 \$1,950.00 Pelco AB2007-58	No Bid	\$35.00 \$1,750.00 Pelco; AB-2007-58-PNC	No Bid
5	Post Top, Acorn type, Pelco #5401 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$14.00 \$700.00 Pelco PB-5401	\$16.33 \$816.50 Chapel Hill TP#5811	\$12.50 \$625.00 Component Prod; CPI-APC-1-ACORN	No Bid
6	Wiring Harness for DPC-2000 Controller Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	Included in Item 3 Applied Information; Included with item number 3	No Bid	\$7.00 \$350.00 Wildcat Traffic; Solar Harness	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 7, 2020 For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts 6100012917			Non-Local Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. 2201 E. Division St. Arlington, TX 76011 817-831-9406		Non-Local Traffic Parts Inc. 27895 Robinson Road Conroe, TX 77385 800-345-6329		Non-Local Wildcat Traffic 5535 Harvey Wilson Houston, TX, 77020 512-608-8971		Non-Local K&K Systems Inc. 687 Palmetto Road Tupelo, MS, 38801	
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Quantity	AJ							
7	Cabinet Mounting Bracket Mast Arm, Pelco #SE0126 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$15.00 \$750.00 Pelco SE-0126	No Bid	\$13.00 \$650.00 Pelco SE-0126-PNC	No Bid				
8	Astro Sign Brac, Stellar for Overhead Street Sign, AS-0128-24-29 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$111.00 \$5,550.00 Pelco AS-0128-24-29	No Bid	\$95.00 \$4,750.00 Pelco AS-0128-24-29-PNC	No Bid				
9	Notched Coupling, 1-1/2" X 2", Pelco #SE0346 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	200	\$7.00 \$1,400.00 Pelco SE-0346	\$7.83 \$1,566.00 Chapel Hill TP# 5140	\$6.50 \$1,300.00 Pelco SE-0346-PNC	No Bid				
10	One Way Signal Mounting Kit, Pelco #SE3003 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	60	\$10.00 \$600.00 Pelco SE-3003-PNC	\$8.50 \$510.00 Chapel Hill TP# 5083	\$8.25 \$495.00 Pelco SE-3003-P01	No Bid				
11	Aluminum Square Base w/ Plastic Door, Pelco #PB5335 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$135.00 \$20,250.00 Pelco PB-5335	\$140.00 \$21,000.00 Akron; TP#6800 TS-1000-P	\$112.00 \$16,800.00 Component Prod; CPI-BAS-1-PDP	No Bid				
12	Anchor Bolts, 4 per Set, Pelco #PB5306 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$33.00 \$4,950.00 Pelco PB-5306	\$32.00 \$4,800.00 Chapel Hill TP# 4220 sets of 4	\$24.00 \$3,600.00 Madden Bolt MAD-ANCHOR BOLT	No Bid				
13	Signal Mntg. Assy. Tri Stud for 8" or 12" only signal, Pelco #SE-0567 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$44.00 \$2,200.00 Pelco SE-0567	\$30.95 \$1,547.50 Chapel Hill TP#7328	\$38.00 \$1,900.00 Pelco SE-0567-PNC	No Bid				

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 7, 2020 For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts 6100012917			AJ			
			Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Quantity	Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. 2201 E. Division St. Arlington, TX 76011 817-831-9406	Traffic Parts Inc. 27895 Robinson Road Conroe, TX 77385 800-345-6329	Wildcat Traffic 5535 Harvey Wilson Houston, TX, 77020 512-608-8971	K&K Systems Inc. 687 Palmetto Road Tupelo, MS, 38801
14	4" Sign Clamp, Pelco#AB0287-04 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	100	\$13.00 \$1,300.00 Pelco AB-0502-04 (Approved equal)	\$8.45 \$845.00 Chapel Hill TP#1063	\$19.00 \$1,900.00 Pelco SH-0206-4-PNC	No Bid
15	Solar Panel mounting bracket for 4" pole, preset at 37 degrees with mounting hardware for 4" side of pole installation Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$90.00 \$13,500.00 Ameresco Solar 021-HPM 50U	\$90.00 \$13,500.00 Chapel Hill TP#475	\$67.00 \$10,050.00 AMERESCO: PowerUP-HPMH50-90	No Bid
16	Pole and Base Collar Assembly, for square base, Pelco #PB-5325 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$122.00 \$18,300.00 Pelco PB-5325	No Bid	\$55.00 \$8,250.00 Component Prod; CPI-RBC-1	No Bid
17	Cabinet Mounting Brackets, two (2) per set, Pelco #SP 5293 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$142.00 \$21,300.00 Pelco SP 5293	\$48.50 \$7,275.00 Chapel Hill; TP#6368	\$30.00 \$4,500.00 Pelco SP-5627-PNC	No Bid
18	Spun Aluminum Pole, 17', Pelco #PB-5100-17 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	120	\$334.00 \$40,080.00 Pelco PB-5100-17-PNC	No Bid	\$245.00 \$36,750.00 Component Prod CPI-AP-17-40	No Bid
19	Solar Panel mounting bracket for mast arm installation, preset at 37 degrees with mounting hardware for mast arm pole installation Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$75.00 \$11,250.00 Ameresco Solar 021-HPM-50U	\$134.53 \$20,179.50 Chapel Hill TP#468	\$67.00 \$10,050.00 Ameresco PowerUP-HPMH50-90	No Bid
20	Unbreakable Solar Panel with .090 gauge aluminum back plate. Service entries to junction box shall be weathertight. 80W-90W solar panel guaranteed power output 90% rated wattage for 10 years; 80% for 25 years Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$120.00 \$18,000.00 Ameresco Solar VLS90-Solar Module	\$187.50 \$28,125.00 VLS; TP#6655 VLS-90T (90w)	\$172.00 \$25,800.00 Ameresco PowerUP-BSP90-12	No Bid
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	
Estimated Annual Total			\$201,380.00	\$103,564.50	\$174,570.00	
Estimated Annual Award			\$37,850.00	\$2,392.50	\$110,220.00	