

| Opened: December 14, 2018 For: Purchase of Landscaping Equipment | | 6100010910 | | IM | Alt. Bid 1 / Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Alt. Bid 1 / Local | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Non-Local |
|---|--|------------|---|---|--|--|--|---|--|---|---|-----------|-----------|
| Item | Description | Qty | Vermeer Texas-Louisiana 16593 IH 35 N Selma, TX. 78154 210-337-7700 | Vermeer Texas-Louisiana 16593 IH 35 N Selma, TX. 78154 210-337-7700 | San Antonio Southwest Trailers 10302 IH 35 North San Antonio, TX. 78233 210-657-5828 | DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250 | DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250 | H&E Equipment Services, Inc. 5327 Tex con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 | Moridge Manufacturing, Inc. 107 S Old Hwy 81 Moundridge, KS 67107 | Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX. 78154 | Sageline, Inc. 1300 W. University Ave. Georgetown, TX. 78628 | | |
| 1 | Stump Cutter, Self-Propelled Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days | 1 | \$20,500.00 \$20,500.00 2019 SC292 Vermeer Kohler Command Pro EFI 26.5hp 1 yr / 1,000 hour Vermeer Texas- Louisiana 16593 IH35 N. Selma Tx 78154 Dec 2019 12/31/19 not specified 120 | \$21,700.00 \$21,700.00 2019 Vermeer SC362 Briggs & Stratton Vanquard 35hp 1 yr / 1,000 hour Vermeer Texas- Louisiana 16593 IH35 N. Selma Tx 78154 Dec 2019 12/31/19 No 90 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | |
| 2 | Wood Chipper Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provider Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days | 1 | No Bid | \$39,900.00 \$39,900.00 2019 Vermeer BC1000XL 74 HP Deutz D2.9L Tier 4 Final 1 yr,1,000 hr Vermeer Texas- Louisiana 16593 IH35 N Selma Tx 78154 Dec 2019 12/31/19 No 90 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | |
| 3 | DELETED | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 4 | Tandem Axle Landscape Utility Trailer Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provider Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days | 4 | No Bid | No Bid | \$7,105.00 \$28,420.00 2019, Southwest Gooseneck & B7083LDSU-16S0 N/A 1 Year Manufacturer Southwest Gooseneck 343 Gembler Rd, SA Tx 78219 02/28/19 02/28/19 Yes 120 | No Bid | No Bid | \$17,430.00 \$69,720.00 2019 Felling FT-10 E Drop Deck Tandem Axle Landscape Utility Trailer Limited Lifetime Warranty H&E Equipment Services, Inc. 5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, Tex 78220 10/31/2019 10/31/2019 No 70 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | |

| Opened: December 14, 2018 For: Purchase of Landscaping Equipment 6100010910 IM | | | Alt. Bid 1 / Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Alt. Bid 1 / Local | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Non-Local |
|--|--|-----|--|--|--|---|---|---|---|--|--|
| Item | Description | Qty | Vermeer Texas-Louisiana 16593 IH 35 N Selma, TX. 78154 210-337-7700 | Vermeer Texas-Louisiana 16593 IH 35 N Selma, TX. 78154 210-337-7700 | San Antonio Southwest Trailers 10302 IH 35 North San Antonio, TX. 78233 210-657-5828 | DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250 | DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250 | H&E Equipment Services, Inc. 5327 Tex con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 | Moridge Manufacturing, Inc. 107 S Old Hwy 81 Moundridge, KS 67107 | Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX. 78154 | Sageline, Inc. 1300 W. University Ave. Georgetown, TX. 78628 |
| 5 | 18' Dual Axle Utility Trailer Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provider Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days | 5 | No Bid | No Bid | \$8,995.00 \$44,975.00 2019, Southwest Gooseneck & B1077LSRG-18S0 N/A 1 Year Manufacturer Southwest Gooseneck 343 Gemblar Rd, SA Tx 78219 43524 43524 Yes 120 | No Bid | No Bid | \$19,708.00 \$98,540.00 2019 Felling FT-10 E Drop Deck 18' Dual Axle Utilitv Trailer Limited Lifetime Warranty H&E Equipment Services, Inc. 5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, Tex 78220 10/31/2019 10/31/2019 No 70 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| 6 | Deleted Payment Terms | 1 | Net 30 | Net 30 | 1% 10 Days | Net 30 | Net 30 | Net 30 | Net 30 | Net 30 | Net 30 |
| Total Award | | | \$20,500.00 | \$39,900.00 | \$73,395.00 | | | | | | |