

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 26, 2019 For: Video Imaging Vehicle Detection System 6100011536			Non-Local	Non-Local
AJ			Peek Traffic Corporation 5401 N Sam Houston Pkwy W Houston, TX 77086 281-453-0205	Control Technologies, Inc. 702 S Persimmon St. 1B Tomball, TX 77375 281-255-8844
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity		
1	Processor, One (1) Channel Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	34	90-180-05 Peek 90-180-05 \$1,250.00 \$42,500.00	7250-117 Flir/Traficon 10-4370 \$1,468.00 \$49,912.00
2	Processor, Two (2) Channel Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	166	90-180-06 Peek 90-180-06 \$2,050.00 \$340,300.00	7250-113 Flir/Traficon 10-4325 \$2,150.00 \$356,900.00
3	Camera with Hardware Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	203	NAS 82-1773 Peek 82-1773 \$850.00 \$172,550.00	2050-102MI RDP-CT-Traficon 2050-102 MI \$865.00 \$175,595.00
4	Remote Access Module Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	29	No Bid No Peek Equivalent	7250-210 Flir/Traficon 10-4545 \$1,950.00 \$56,550.00
5	Keypad, Field Set Up Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	6	No Bid Not Applicable	7250-501 Flir/Traficon 10-0023 \$175.00 \$1,050.00
6	Five (5) Coax Cable 1,000' feet Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	140	2W16-0068 Peek 2W16-0068 \$1,000.00 \$140,000.00	WIRE-VC-RG #18/6 ISOTEC Same \$750.00 \$105,000.00
7	Video Connector Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	1,000	2K71-0024 Peek 2K71-0024 \$3.00 \$3,000.00	CON-BNC-CP882 Emmerson CP882 \$4.50 \$4,500.00
8	Video Camera Cable Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	204	81-1605-01 Peek 81-1605-01 \$5.00 \$1,020.00	CON-BNC-CP892 Emmerson CP892 \$4.50 \$918.00

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 26, 2019 For: Video Imaging Vehicle Detection System 6100011536			Non-Local	Non-Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Peek Traffic Corporation 5401 N Sam Houston Pkwy W Houston, TX 77086 281-453-0205	Control Technologies, Inc. 702 S Persimmon St. 1B Tomball, TX 77375 281-255-8844
9	Video Camera Suppression Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	203	81-1073 Peek 81-1073 \$72.00 \$14,616.00	CX06MI-BNC Emmerson/EDCO CX06MI \$85.00 \$17,255.00
10	Deleted			
11	Deleted			
12	Deleted			
13	Video Monitor Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	21	2M20-0046 Peek 2M20-0046 \$250.00 \$5,250.00	No Bid
14	Deleted			
15	Suppression Panel Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price:	39	NAS 82-1661-05 Peek 82-1661-05 \$425.00 \$16,575.00	No Bid
16	Deleted			
17	IMSA 20-1, 14AWG, 9 conductor stranded cable on heavy duty all wood reels of 2,500 ft. minimum Supplier Part Number Manufacturer Manufacturer Part Number Unit Price: Extended Price: Delivery Payment Terms	20,000	2W1G-0001 Peek 2W1G-0001 \$0.85 \$17,000.00 120 calendar days Net 30	No Bid 30 calendar days Net 30
Estimated Annual Award			\$422,666.00	\$339,113.00

Items 11, 12 and 14: deleted due to duplication
 Items 10 and 16: deleted no longer a requirement