City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 12, 2014 Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Municipal Facilities Lighting Retrofit Project Facility Solutions Group Alvaro Rodriguez Jr CRI Electric, Inc. Heat Transfer Solutions HJD Capital Electric, Inc. Sylvania Lighting Services Corp.
6100004264 JE__ 13003 NE Loop 410, Suite 130 5830 Cliffmont 5504 Bandera Road, Suite 618 |102 W. Nakoma Dr. 5424 Hwy 90 W 100 Endicott Street
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Danvers,
Item Description Quantity | TX 78218 TX 78250 TX 78238 TX 78216 TX 78227 MA 01923
210-657-5025
-1 Install 40W Induction Retrofit Kit 7 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # UT-26040RK-UNV] UT-26040RK-UNV UT-26040RK-UNV UT-26040RK-UNV UT-26040RK-UNV
Unit Price $251.25| $532.60 $522.35 $318.98 $276.18
Total Price $1,758.75| $3,728.20 $3,656.45 $2,232.86 $1,933.26
-2 Install 80W Induction Retrofit Kit 337 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # UT-26080-RK-UNV-850-E| OV-26080-RK-UNV-850 OV-26080-RK-UNV-850 OV-26080-RK-UNV-850 OV-26080-RK-UNV-850
Unit Price $277.50| $565.59 $675.40 $347.85 $311.15
Total Price $93,517.50 $190,603.83 $227,609.80 $117,225.45 $104,857.55
1-3a Install 120W Induction Retrofit Kit (Pear shaped) 7 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # PE-26125RK-UNV-850 PE-26125RK-UNV-850 PE-26125RK-UNV-850 PE-26125RK-UNV-850 PE-26125RK-UNV-850
Unit Price $335.00| $574.19 $598.75 $559.75 $421.68
Total Price $2,345.00| $4,019.33 $4,191.25 $3,918.25 $2,951.76
1-3b Install 120W Induction Retrofit Kit (Rectangular) 40 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # NIRT-120-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-120-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-120-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-120-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-120-RK-UNV-850
Unit Price $285.00| $574.19 $735.23 $559.75 $421.68
Total Price $11,400.00] $22,967.60 $29,409.20 $22,390.00 $16,867.20
1-4 Install 200W Induction Retrofit Kit 65 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # NIRT-200-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-200-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-200-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-200-RK-UNV-850 NIRT-200-RK-UNV-850
Unit Price $340.00| $640.16 $698.00 $701.58 $425.07
Total Price $22,100.00| $41,610.40 $45,370.00 $45,602.70 $27,629.55
I-5 Install New 40W Induction Canopy Fixture 2 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 12040-UNV-850-BRZ| 12040-UNV-850-BRZ 12040-UNV-850-BRZ 12040-UNV-850-BRZ 12040-UNV-850-BRZ
Unit Price $335.00| $640.16 $621.40 $561.53 $366.93
Total Price $670.00| $1,280.32 $1,242.80 $1,123.06 $733.86
1-6 Install New 40W Induction Flood Fixture 2 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 65040-UNV-850-NPT-BRZ| 65040-UNV-850-NPT-BRZ 65040-UNV-850-NPT-BRZ 65040-UNV-850-NPT-BRZ 65040-UNV-850-NPT-BRZ
Unit Price $345.00| $645.89 $691.93 $572.53 $379.38
Total Price $690.00| $1,291.78 $1,383.86 $1,145.06 $758.76
-7 Install New 40W Induction Wall Pack Fixture 2 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 21040FLD-UNV-BRZ| 21040FLD-UNV-BRZ 21040FLD-UNV-BRZ 21040FLD-UNV-BRZ 21040FLD-UNV-BRZ
Unit Price $451.25| $645.89 $595.12 $618.91 $432.32
Total Price $902.50 $1,291.78 $1,190.24 $1,237.82 $864.64
-8 Install New 40W Induction Wall Pack Fixture, Full Cut-Off 4 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 21040FCT-UNV-BRZ| 21040FCT-UNV-BRZ 21040FCT-UNV-BRZ 21040FCT-UNV-BRZ 21040FCT-UNV-BRZ
Unit Price $358.75| $663.10 $202.12 $517.70 $382.08
Total Price $1,435.00| $2,652.40 $808.48 $2,070.80 $1,528.32
-9 Install New 80W Induction Shoebox Fixture 4 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 16080-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16080-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16080-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16080-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16080-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ
Unit Price $475.00| $803.64 $600.40 $990.00 $606.24
Total Price $1,900.00 $3,214.56 $2,401.60 $3,960.00 $2,424.96
1-10 Install New 80W Induction Wall Pack Fixture 26 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 21080FLD-UNV-BRZ 21080FLD-UNV-BRZ 21080FLD-UNV-BRZ 21080FLD-UNV-BRZ 21080FLD-UNV-BRZ
Unit Price $358.75| $663.10 $683.33 $517.70 $396.51
Total Price $9,327.50 $17,240.60 $17,766.58 $13,460.20 $10,309.26
I-11 Install New 80W Induction Wall Pack Fixture, Full Cut-Off 3 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 21080FCT-UNV-BRZ| 21080FCT-UNV-BRZ 21080FCT-UNV-BRZ 21080FCT-UNV-BRZ 21080FCT-UNV-BRZ
Unit Price $373.75] $681.75 $623.65 $534.21 $415.19
Total Price $1,121.25 $2,045.25 $1,870.95 $1,602.63 $1,245.57
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 12, 2014 Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Municipal Facilities Lighting Retrofit Project Facility Solutions Group Alvaro Rodriguez Jr CRI Electric, Inc. Heat Transfer Solutions HJD Capital Electric, Inc. Sylvania Lighting Services Corp.
6100004264 JE__ 13003 NE Loop 410, Suite 130 5830 Cliffmont 5504 Bandera Road, Suite 618 |102 W. Nakoma Dr. 5424 Hwy 90 W 100 Endicott Street
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Danvers,
Item Description Quantity | TX 78218 TX 78250 TX 78238 TX 78216 TX 78227 MA 01923
210-657-5025
I-12a Install New 120W Induction Shoebox Fixture (Side arm) 80 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 16120-UNV-SA12-BRZ 16120-UNV-SA12-BRZ 16120-UNV-SA12-BRZ 16120-UNV-SA12-BRZ 16120-UNV-SA12-BRZ
Unit Price $497.50 $830.89 $791.99 $1,014.75 $598.18
Total Price $39,800.00 $66,471.20 $63,359.20 $81,180.00 $47,854.40
I-12b Install New 120W Induction Shoebox Fixture (Spider mount) 4 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 16120-UNV-XXX-BRZ| 16120-UNV-XXX-BRZ 16120-UNV-XXX-BRZ 16120-UNV-XXX-BRZ 16120-UNV-XXX-BRZ
Unit Price $497.50 $830.89 $608.40 $1,014.75 $598.18
Total Price $1,990.00| $3,323.56 $2,433.60 $4,059.00 $2,392.72
1-13 Install New 120W Induction Wall Pack Fixture 9 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 21120FLD-UNV-BRZ| 21120FLD-UNV-BRZ 21120FLD-UNV-BRZ 21120FLD-UNV-BRZ 21120FLD-UNV-BRZ
Unit Price $387.50 $697.52 $621.03 $619.30 $432.32
Total Price $3,487.50 $6,277.68 $5,589.27 $5,573.70 $3,890.88
I-14 Install New 120W Induction Wall Pack Fixture, Full Cut-Off 7 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 21120-FCT-UNV-BRZ| 21120-FCT-UNV-BRZ 21120-FCT-UNV-BRZ 21120-FCT-UNV-BRZ 21120-FCT-UNV-BRZ
Unit Price $403.75| $717.60 $620.23 $594.13 $466.99
Total Price $2,826.25| $5,023.20 $4,341.61 $4,158.91 $3,268.93
I-15 Install New 120W Induction Cobra Head Fixture 3 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 282120-UNV-GRY 282120-UNV-GRY 282120-UNV-GRY 282120-UNV-GRY 282120-UNV-GRY
Unit Price $451.25| $774.96 $650.40 $1,147.00 $540.58
Total Price $1,353.75| $2,324.88 $1,951.20 $3,441.00 $1,621.74
I-16a  |Install New 200W Induction Flood Fixture (Slipfitter) 57 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 38200-UNV-850-SF-BRZ| 38200-UNV-850-SF-BRZ 38200-UNV-850-SF-BRZ 38200-UNV-850-SF-BRZ 38200-UNV-850-SF-BRZ
Unit Price $521.25| $859.57 $690.40 $1,009.17 $627.76
Total Price $29,711.25] $48,995.49 $39,352.80 $57,522.69 $35,782.32
I-16b Install New 200W Induction Flood Fixture (Yoke bracket) 21 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 38200-UNV-850-YK-BRZ| 38200-UNV-850-YK-BRZ 38200-UNV-850-YK-BRZ 38200-UNV-850-YK-BRZ 38200-UNV-850-YK-BRZ
Unit Price $521.25| $859.57 $785.50 $1,009.17 $627.76
Total Price $10,946.25| $18,050.97 $16,495.50 $21,192.57 $13,182.96
I-17a Install New 200W Induction Shoebox Fixture (Side arm) 20 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 16200-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16200-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16200-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16200-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 16200-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ
Unit Price $521.25| $859.57 $795.40 $831.78 $642.20
Total Price $10,425.00] $17,191.40 $15,908.00 $16,635.60 $12,844.00
I-17b Install New 200W Induction Shoebox Fixture (Side arm, round pole adapt.) 1 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 16200-UNV-850-SA12R-BRZ| 16200-UNV-850-SA12R-BRZ 16200-UNV-850-SA12R-BRZ 16200-UNV-850-SA12R-BRZ 16200-UNV-850-SA12R-BRZ
Unit Price $521.25| $859.57 $702.37 $831.78 $642.20
Total Price $521.25| $859.57 $702.37 $831.78 $642.20
I-18a Install New 500W Induction Flood Fixture (Slipfitter) 34 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 39500-UNV-850-SF-BRZ| 39500-UNV-850-SF-BRZ 39500-UNV-850-SF-BRZ 39500-UNV-850-SF-BRZ 39500-UNV-850-SF-BRZ
Unit Price $658.75| $1,025.92 $1,059.75 $1,009.17 $835.10
Total Price $22,397.50 $34,881.28 $36,031.50 $34,311.78 $28,393.40
1-18b Install New 500W Induction Flood Fixture (Yoke bracket) 26 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 39500-UNV-850-YK-BRZ| 39500-UNV-850-YK-BRZ 39500-UNV-850-YK-BRZ 39500-UNV-850-YK-BRZ 39500-UNV-850-YK-BRZ
Unit Price $658.75| $1,025.92 $1,051.75 $1,009.17 $835.10
Total Price $17,127.50] $26,673.92 $27,345.50 $26,238.42 $21,712.60
I-19a Install New 500W Induction Shoebox Fixture (Side arm) 14 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 38500-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 37500-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 37500-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 37500-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ 37500-UNV-850-SA12-BRZ
Unit Price $658.75| $1,025.92 $995.85 $1,100.64 $799.02
Total Price $9,222.50 $14,362.88 $13,941.90 $15,408.96 $11,186.28
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 12, 2014 Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Municipal Facilities Lighting Retrofit Project Facility Solutions Group Alvaro Rodriguez Jr CRI Electric, Inc. Heat Transfer Solutions HJD Capital Electric, Inc. Sylvania Lighting Services Corp.
6100004264 JE__ 13003 NE Loop 410, Suite 130 5830 Cliffmont 5504 Bandera Road, Suite 618 |102 W. Nakoma Dr. 5424 Hwy 90 W 100 Endicott Street
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Danvers,
Item Description Quantity | TX 78218 TX 78250 TX 78238 TX 78216 TX 78227 MA 01923
210-657-5025
1-19b Install New 500W Induction Shoebox Fixture (Spider mount) 1 No Bid
Manufacturer Neptune Neptun Neptun Neptun Neptun
Model & Part # 37500-UNV-850-XXX-BRZ| 37500-UNV-850-XXX-BRZ 37500-UNV-850-XXX-BRZ 37500-UNV-850-XXX-BRZ 37500-UNV-850-XXX-BRZ
Unit Price $658.75| $1,025.92 $495.89 $1,100.64 $799.02
Total Price $658.75| $1,025.92 $495.89 $1,100.64 $799.02
F-1 Lamp and ballast change - 1-F28T8 16 No Bid
Manufacturer GE Sylvania Sylvania Sylvania Sylvania
Model & Part # 72866 22179-FO28/841/XP/SS/IECO3| 22179-FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179-FO28/841/XP/SS/IECO3| 22179-FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3
F28T8/XL/SPX41/ECOGE132MA| 49861 - QHELX32T8/UNV ISL| 49861 - QHE1X32T8/UNV ISL| 49861 - QHE1X32T8/UNV ISL| 49861 - QHE1X32T8/UNV ISL
X-L/ULTRA UNV 72258 SC SC| SC| SC|
Unit Price $35.60| $165.76 $101.32 $204.00 $40.39
Total Price $569.60| $2,652.16 $1,621.12 $3,264.00 $646.24
F-2 Lamp and ballast change - 2-F28T8 13 No Bid
Manufacturer GE| Svlvania Sylvania Svlvania Svlvania
Model & Part # 72866 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3]
F28T8/XL/SPX41/ECOGE232MA| 49863 - QHE2X32T8/UNV ISL| 49863 - QHE2X32T8/UNV ISL| 49863 - QHE2X32T8/UNV ISL| 49863 - QHE2X32T8/UNV ISL|
X-L/ULTRA 72262 Sl SC| SC| SC|
Unit Price $42.20| $165.76 $101.35 $204.00 $42.56
Total Price $548.60| $2,154.88 $1,317.55 $2,652.00 $553.28
F-3 New 2X4 Fluorescent 4-lamp T8 troffer with (2) 3-L Electronic Ballasts 24 No Bid
Manufacturer Paragon Precision Paragon Precision Paragon Precision Paragon Precision Paragon
Model & Part # HBN-1X4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-IS-| HBN-1X4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-IS-| HBN-1X4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-IS-| HBN-1X4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-IS-[ HBN-1X4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-IS-
UE-CD-WG-SB| UE-EA-CD-WG-SB UE-CD-WG-SB UE-EA-CD-WG-SB UE-EA-CD-WG-SB
Unit Price $247.80] $785.00 $195.65 $1,001.00 $319.16
Total Price $5,947.20 $18,840.00 $4,695.60 $24,024.00 $7.659.84
F-4 New 4ft Vapor Tiaht Highbay Fixture wired w (2) 3-L Premium Ballasts 14 No Bid
Manufacturer Paragon| Precision Paragon Precision Paragon Precision Paragon Precision Paragon
Model & Part # HVT-2x4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-UE-| HVT-2x4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-UE-| HVT-2x4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-UE-| HVT-2x4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-UE-| HVT-2x4-4L-T8-UL2-3L/HP-UE-
EA| EA| EA| EA| EA|
Unit Price $160.40| $861.00 $195.65 $1,001.00 $363.61
Total Price $2,245.60| $12,054.00 $2,739.10 $14,014.00 $5,090.54
F-5 Relamp Fixture - 2-F28T8, Lamps Only 116 No Bid
Manufacturer GE Sylvania Sylvania Sylvania Sylvania
Model & Part # 72866 F28T8/XL/SPX41/ECO| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/IECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3]
Unit Price $11.20| $148.55 $221.55 $45.30 $18.24
Total Price $1,299.20| $17,231.80 $25,699.80 $5,254.80 $2,115.84
F-6 Retrofit 8 ft channel to (4) 4 ft T8 28W lamps, Premium Ballast 16 No Bid
Manufacturer GE & ALP| Svlvania Sylvania Sylvania Sylvania
Model & Part # GE 72866-F28T8/XL/SPX/ECO| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/IECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3| 22179 - FO28/841/XP/SS/ECO3]
GE432MAX-L/ULTRA 78625 49867 - QHE4X32T8/UNV ISL| 49867 - QHE4X32T8/UNV ISL| 49867 - QHE4X32T8/UNV ISL| 49867 - QHE4X32T8/UNV ISL|
ALP CASEX84LH SC EPA- SC EPA- SC EPA- SC EPA-
RBC1804T832WACCLSLST| RBC1804T832WACCLSLST RBC1804T832WACCLSLST| RBC1804T832WACCLSLST
Unit Price $77.95| $219.06 $171.60 $261.87 $78.04
Total Price $1,247.20 $3,504.96 $2,745.60 $4,189.92 $1,248.64
C-1 Install 13W CFL 16 No Bid
Manufacturer TCP| Halco Halco Halco Halco
Model & Part # 48913/41K| 45105 45105 45105 45105
Unit Price $12.20| $148.55 $145.85 $51.46 $23.46
Total Price $195.20| $2,376.80 $2,333.60 $823.36 $375.36
Cc-2 Install 26W CFL 27 No Bid
Manufacturer TCP TCP TCP TCP TCP
Model & Part # 48927/SS/41k| 48927/SS/41k 48927/SS/41k 48927/SS/41k 48927/SS/41k
Unit Price $15.20 $228.86 $106.80 $54.76 $24.73
Total Price $410.40| $6,179.22 $2,883.60 $1,478.52 $667.71
Cc-3 Remove ballast, hardwire medium base lamp socket, install 23W CFL 11 No Bid
Manufacturer Halco| Halco Halco Halco Halco
Model & Part # 45253-CFL23/41] 45253 45253 45253 45253
Unit Price $28.45 $228.86 $492.70 $60.96 $38.43
Total Price $312.95| $2,517.46 $5,419.70 $670.56 $422.73
L-1 Install 20W PAR38 LED Lamp 31 No Bid
Manufacturer Philips| Philips Philips Philips Philips
Model & Part # ALSP38-1200-X-X| ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9 ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9 ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9 ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9
Unit Price $66.75) $538.34 $128.85 $168.20 $49.11
Total Price $2,069.25| $16,688.54 $3,994.35 $5,214.20 $1,522.41
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 12, 2014 Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Municipal Facilities Lighting Retrofit Project Facility Solutions Group Alvaro Rodriguez Jr CRI Electric, Inc. Heat Transfer Solutions HJD Capital Electric, Inc. Sylvania Lighting Services Corp.
6100004264 JE__ 13003 NE Loop 410, Suite 130 5830 Cliffmont 5504 Bandera Road, Suite 618 |102 W. Nakoma Dr. 5424 Hwy 90 W 100 Endicott Street
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Danvers,
Item Description Quantity | TX 78218 TX 78250 TX 78238 TX 78216 TX 78227 MA 01923
210-657-5025
L-2 Bypass HID Ballast, Install 20W PAR38 LED Lamp 38 No Bid
Manufacturer Philips Philips Philips Philips Philips
Model & Part # ALSP38-1200-X-X| ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9 ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9 ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9 ALSP38-1200-X-X-R9
Unit Price $80.70| $538.34 $196.86 $168.20 $63.54
Total Price $3,066.60| $20,456.92 $7,480.68 $6,391.60 $2,414.52
M-1 Install Step-Down Transformer 146 No Bid
Unit Price $35.95| $402.91 $213.00 $315.00 $68.59
Total Price $5,248.70| $58,824.86 $31,098.00 $45,990.00 $10,014.14
M-2 Scaffolding at San Fernando Gym 1 No Bid
Unit Price $500.00| $3,000.00 $5,375.00 N/A $2,176.02
Total Price $500.00| $3,000.00 $5,375.00 N/A $2,176.02
M-3 Install Photocell on New Fixture 13 No Bid
Unit Price $29.00| $145.00 $118.75 $62.65 $60.88
Total Price $377.00] $1,885.00 $1,543.75 $814.45 $791.44
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total $321,672.50 $0.00 $705,774.60 $663,797.00 $602,405.29 $391,374.85
Total Award $321,672.50)
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