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ORDINANCE  9019-04-04 -0265

APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH BLUEBONNET FORD, DOGGETT
FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, LLC, GRANDE TRUCK CENTER,
AND SANTEX TRUCK CENTERS, LTD. TO PROVIDE 21 MEDIUM AND
HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS FOR CITY DEPARTMENTS FOR A TOTAL
COST OF $1,432,487.29. FUNDING FOR THIS PURCHASE IS
AVAILABLE IN THE FY 2019 EQUIPMENT RENEWAL &
REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET, GENERAL FUND BUDGET,
AIRPORT OPERATING & MAINTENANCE FUND BUDGET AND THE
HOTEL MOTEL TAX FUND BUDGET.

& * & & &

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with medium and heavy
duty trucks; and

WHEREAS, this purchase includes 19 replacement and two additional units to the City’s fleet
which will be used for various construction, maintenance, repair and vector control projects
throughout the City; and

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Bluebonnet Ford for items 7, 11 and 14 failed to meet the
City’s specifications and/or requirements; and

WHEREAS, the low bid(s) for item 1 was submitted by Doggett Freightliner of South Texas,
LLC for a total cost of $329,778.00, by Santex Truck Centers, LTD. for items 2 and 3 for a total
cost of $508,091.99, by Grande Truck Center for items 5 and 6, with the application of local
preference, and items 7, 8, 11, and 14 for a total cost of $456,203.00, and the low bids for items
9, 10 and 13 were submitted by Bluebonnet Ford for a total cost of $138,414.30; NOW
THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC (Item 1), Santex
Truck Centers, LTD. (Items 2 and 3), Grande Truck Center (Items 5-8, 11, and 14), and
Bluebonnet Ford (Items 9, 10 and 13) to provide the City with 21 medium and heavy duty trucks
for a total cost of $1,432,487.29 are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit
of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. Attached
hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I are the bid tabulation sheets. Copies
of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance
Department.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $1,432,487.29 is available as part
of the FY 2019 Budget approved by City Council, as follows:

Amount General Ledger | Cost Center Fund
$705,262.55 5709080 3503200001 72001000
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$558,100.00 5709080 3503300001 72001001
$69,191.74 5709080 2615020001 11001000
$53,018.00 5701085 3305030005 51001000
$46,915.00 5701060 4205010001 29006000
Total: $1,432,487.29

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount is authorized to Bluebonnet Ford,
Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC, Grande Truck Center, and Santex Truck Centers,
LTD. to provide City departments with medium and heavy duty trucks, and should be
encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 4. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted by Bluebonnet Ford for
items 7, 11 and 14 failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements for medium and
heavy duty trucks.

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, SAP Project
Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost Centers,
SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL Accounts as
necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 4™ day of April, 2019.

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

ticia M. Vace%ty Clerk Aew 8t egovia, City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 7 (in consent vote: 5,7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14A, 14B, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26,

27,29)
Date: 04/04/2019

Time: 10:02:13 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: Ordinance approving contracts with Bluebonnet Ford, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas LLC,

Grande Truck Center, and Santex Truck Centers LTD to provide City departments with 21 medium and
heavy duty trucks for a total cost of $1,432,487.29. Funding for this purchase is available in the FY
2019 Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund Budget, FY 2019 Airport Operating & Maintenance
Fund Budget, FY 2019 Community & Visitor Facilities Fund Budget, and FY 2019 General Fund
Budget. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Result: Passed
Voter Group P Net Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Art A. Hall District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldaia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X
X

Clayton H. Perry District 10

https://cosaweb1/voteinterface/default.aspx 4/4/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of |Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center [Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC

6100010987 LD (8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road |4562 IH-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N

IH 35
Item Description QTY |[Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
1 60K GVWR 5th Wheel Tractor Truck: 3

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

$109,926.00
$329,778.00
2020 Freightliner|
M2-112]
Detroit Diesel - DD 13|
505HP /1850 Ib. ft|
Torque.
Eaton Fuller _FRO
17210C Transmission
1750 Ib. ft. Torque|
Chassis - 1 year
Unlimited Miles -
Engine 2 yrs. / 250K|
complete and 5 yrs.
500K major]
components
Doggett Freightliner of]
South Texas LLC|
8700 IH-10 East,
Converse, TX 78219

120-210 Days|
12/31/2019]
10/01/2019]

No|

$112,000.00
$336,000.00

2020 Intemnational
HV613 SBA
International A26, 500
HP

Fuller FRO 17210C

See Attached
Warranty Documents

Santex Truck Centers

1380 Ackerman Road,
San Antonio,

TX 78219

200 Days

10/31/19

10/24/19

No

$117,563.00
$352,689.00

2020 Westem Star
4700 Tractor]|

Detroit DD13,12.8 L,
505 H.P.

Eaton Fuller FRO
17210C

12 months

Grande Truck Center|

4562 TH-10 East, San
Antonio, Texas 78219

180-240 Days
41712019
4/1/2019

No

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
5 Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of [Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road [4562 IH-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Item Description QTY [Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
2 52K GVW 12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck: 4
Price Each: $115,468.00| $112,250.00} $123,046.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $461,872.00 $449,000.00} $492,184.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2020 Freightliner] 2020 Intemnational 2020 Westemn Star,
M2-112 HV613 SBA 4700 Truck
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Detroit Diesel - DD13|| International A26, 475 DD13,12.8 L, 470
(Include SAE Net HP): 470HP / 1650 Ib. ft. of] HP) HP;
Torque|
Transmission Offered: Eaton Fuller _FRO| Fuller FRO 16210C| FRO 16210C
16210C Transmission Eaton Fuller|
1650 Ib. ft. Torque
Cab & Chassis Warranty: Chassis - 1 year See Attached| 12 months

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Hydraulic Dump: 12
Cubic Yard Dump Body Offered:

Hydraulic Dump: 12 Cubic Yard Dump Body
Warranty:

Hydraulic Dump: 12 Cubic Yard Dump Body
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Hydraulic Dump: 12 Cubic Yard Dump Body
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Unlimited Miles -]

Engine 2 yrs. / 250K
complete and 5 yrs.

500K major
component:

Doggett Freightliner oj Santex Truck Centers

South Texas LLC]
8700 IH-10 East,
Converse, TX 78219

2019 Davis Trailer and
Truck Equipment - 14
Dump Body to City of]
SA Specifications|

1 year - unlimited|
miles
Fox Truck World|

965 FM 1516, San|
Antonio, TX 78263|

120-210 Days|
12/31/2019
10/01/2019

Not Provided

Warranty Documents|

1380 Ackerman Road,
San Antonio,

TX 78219

2019 Davis 14', 12-15
‘Yard Dump Bodyj

See Attached|
Warranty Documents|
Peak Trailer Group|

1605 Ackerman Road,|
San Antonio,|

TX 78219

200 Days|j

10/31/19|

10/26/19|

No

Grande Truck Center]|

4562 TH-10 East, San
Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 Davis 12 Cubic
Yard Dump Truck

12 months|

Davis Truck & Trailer|
by Grizzly Hydraulics!
4562 TH-10 East, San
Antonio, Texas 78219

180-240 Days
3/31/2019,
3/31/2019

No

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of [Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road |4562 IH-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Iltem Description QTY |Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
3 Class 5, Single Cab, DRW, Extended Height 1
Service Body: .
Price Each: No Bid $59,091.99) $63,916.00 $63,389.38 No Bid
Total: $59,091.99| $63,916.00 $63,389.38
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2020 Intemnationall 2019 Ford F550 R/C 2019 Ford F550
CV515) 4X2 Regular Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered International 6.6,| Ford 6.7 L, 330 H.P.| Ford 6.7 Liter, 330 HP
(Include SAE Net HP): 350 HP)
Transmission Offered: Allison 1700 HS| Ford Torque Shift 6 6 Speed Automatic
Speed
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 year, 36,000 miles| 36 months or 36,000 3 year, 36,000 miles
miles| standard, 5 year,
60,000 miles|
powertrain

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Facility
Address:

Year, Make & Model of Service Body
Offered:

Service Body Warranty:

Service Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Service Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Santex Truck Centers|

1380 Ackerman Road,
San Antonio,
TX 78219

2019 Knapheide
KC169H2094]

6 years|

16201 S. IH 35,
Buda, TX

Knapheidej

260 Days|
10/31/19|
10/26/19|

No

Grande Truck Center|

4562 TH-10 East, San
Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 Knapheide
Model KC169H2094

12 months
UTEC

5860 Pfeil Road,
Schertz, TX 78154

150-180 Days

3/31/2019
3/31/2019

No

Bluebonnet Ford

1879 S. Business
IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 Knapheide
KTECPQ-UBKCR

6 Year Limited
Knapheide Equipment

16201 South Interstate
35 Buda, TX 78610

120 Days

7/2019
7/2019

No|

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of |Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road 14562 IH-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Item Description QTY [Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
4 Deleted:
5 1 Ton Regular Cab DRW, 12’ Stake Bed 1
wi/Lift Gate:
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $46,915.00 $46,070.89 $47,030.49
Total: $46,915.00 $46,070.89 $47,030.49
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 1.8%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $844.11
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F350 R/C 2019 Ford F350 2019 Ford F-350
4X2, Regular Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.7 L Diesel, 330}l Ford 6.7 Liter, 330 HP 2019 F-350
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P.
Transmission Offered: Ford Torque Shift 6| 6 Speed Automatic Auto
Speed|
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000( 3 year, 36,000 miles 36 months / 36,000
miles standard, 5 year, Bumper to Bumper,
60,000 miles 5yr./ 100,000
powertrain powertrain
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Bluebonnet Ford Red McCombs
Facility Name:
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 TH-10 East, San 1879 S. Business Local Dealer|

Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Stake Bed and Lift
Gate Offered:

Stake Bed and Lift Gate Warranty:

Stake Bed and Lift Gate Warranty Service
Provider Facility Name:

Stake Bed and Lift Gate Warranty Service
Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 Limestone non-|
skirted with TG+
G2922050TP41 Lift
gate

12 months

Truckfitters LLC

2625 Broadway, San
Antonio, TX 78215

150-180 Days|
5/31/2019

5/31/2019

No|

IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 Bedrock
Limestone 34FWDW,
Liftgate TG-G 292
2050 TP41

Bed Lifetime
Warranty, Liftgate 1
Year Limited
Truckfitters

959 Hwy 95 North,
Shiner, TX 77984

120 Days
7/2019

7/2019

No

Rail Gate, Knapheide

6yr.

Knapheide, Buda

Knapheide, Buda

5-31-19
5-31-19

No

No|

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of |Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road (4562 IH-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Item Description QTY |[Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
6 % Ton Regular Cab Long Bed Pickup1 Ton 3
Regular Cab DRW with Traffic Utility Storage
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $55,405.00) $54,076.74 No Bid
Total: $166,215.00 $162,230.22
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 2.4%)
and local bid:
Price Differential: $3,984.78|
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F350 Reg| 2019 Ford F350
Cab 4X2| Regular Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.7 L Diesel, 330| Ford 6.7 Liter, 330 HP
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P]
Transmission Offered: Ford Torque Shift 6| 6 Speed Automatic
Speed
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000 3 year, 36,000 miles|
miles standard, 5 year,

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address: )

Year, Make & Model of Front Bumper Pole
Puller and Traffic Utility Bed Offered:

Front Bumper Pole Puller and Traffic Utility
Bed Warranty Service Provider Facility
Name:

Front Bumper Pole Puller and Traffic Utility
Bed Warranty Service Provider Facility
Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Grande Truck Center

4562 TH-10 East, San|
Antonio, Texas 78219

2019, 12' Limestone|
Bed w/ PPF-203 Puller]

Truckfitters LLC
2625 Broadway, San
Antonio, TX 78215
180-210 Days|
5/31/2019|

5/31/2019|

No|

60,000 miles tr.
Bluebonnet Ford

1879 S. Business
IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 PPF-203Post
Puller, 2019 Bedrock
Limestone
TN144978434
B09742L
Truckfitters

959 Hwy 95 North,
Shiner, TX 77984
120 Days

7/2019

7/2019

No

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of |Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD (8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road (4562 IH-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Iltem Description QTY [Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
7 1 Ton Crew Cab, DRW, 2-3 Cubic Yard, 9’ 1
Dump Body NAS
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $53,018.00) $50,516.55) $55,116.20
Total: $53,018.00] $50,516.55) $55,116.20
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F350 Crew| 2019 Ford F350 2019 Ford F-350
Cab 4X2 Reqular Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 6.7 L Ford Diesel, 330 Ford 6.7 Liter, 330 HP 6.7L, V8 Diesel
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P,
Transmission Offered: Ford Torque Shift 6 6 Speed Automatic| Ford 6-Spd
Speed|
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000f 3 year, 36,000 miles| 36 mo. / 36,000
miles| standard, 5 year, Bumper to Bumper,
60,000 miles| 5yr. /100,000
powertrain powertrain
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Bluebonnet Ford Local Dealer
Facility Name:
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 TH-10 East, San 1879 S. Business| Local Dealer

Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Dump Body Offered:

Dump Body Warranty:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 Marander MD92
2/4 Yard Charcoal
12 Months
Truckfitters|

2625 Broadway, San
Antonio, TX 78215
180-210 Days
5/31/2019|
5/31/2019

No|

IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 Rugby -
DU93WU

5 Year Limited|
Truckfitters|

959 Hwy 95 North,)
Shiner, TX 77984
120 Days|

7/2019

7/2019

No|

2019 Knapheide
Dump Body

6 yr.
Knapheide, Buda

Knapheide, Buda
5-31-19
5-31-19
5-31-19

No

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of |Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road (4562 |H-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
ltem Description QTY [Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
8 1 Ton Regular Cab, DRW, 2-3 Cubic Yard, 1
9’ Dump Body:
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $42,047.00; $42,090.74 $44,426.83
Total: $42,047.00 $42,090.74 $44,426.83
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F350 R/C| 2019 Ford F350 2019 Ford
4X2 Regqular Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.2 L, Gas 385|| Ford 6.7 Liter, 330 HP 6.2L, V8 Gas
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P.
Transmission Offered: Ford Torque Shift 6| 6 Speed Automatic| 6-Spd Auto!
Speed-G
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000 3 year, 36,000 miles 36 mo. / 36,000
miles standard, 5 year, Bumper to Bumper,
60,000 miles 5 yr. /60,000
powertrain powertrain

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Dump Body Offered:

Dump Body Warranty:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off

date:

Grande Truck Center|

4562 TH-10 East, San
Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 Marander MD92
2/4 Yd. Charcoal

12 Months|
Truckfitters|

2625 Broadway, San|
Antonio, TX 78215
180-210 Days|
5/31/2019

5/31/2019

No

Bluebonnet Ford

1879 S. Business

IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 Rugby -
DU93WU

5 Year Limited
Truckfitters

959 Hwy 95 North,
Shiner, TX 77984
120 Days

7/2019

7/2019

No

Local Dealer|

Local Dealer

2019 Knapheide

Knapheide
6 yr.

Knapheide 6 yr. /|
Buda|

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of [Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center [Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road 4562 |H-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Item Description QTY |[Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
9 % Ton Regular Cab Utility Service Truck: 2
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $35,872.00} $34,595.87| $35,172.34
Total: $71,744.00] $69,191.74] $70,344.68
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 3.7%)
and local bid:
Price Differential: $2,552.26
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F250 R/C 2019 Ford F250 2019 Ford F-250
4X2 Reqular Cab)
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.2 L Gas, 385/ Ford 6.2 Liter, 385 HP| 6.2L, V8
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P,
Transmission Offered: Ford Torgq Shift 6 6 Speed Automatic 6-Spd
Speed-G
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000( 3 year, 36,000 miles 36 mo. / 36,000
miles| standard, 5 year, Bumper to Bumper|
60,000 miles;
powertrain
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Bluebonnet Ford| Local Dealer
Facility Name:
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 TH-10 East, San 1879 S. Business Local Dealer

Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Utility Body Offered:

Utility Body Warranty:

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 KTEC PQ-UBST|
Knapheide|

12 months|
UTEC|

5860 Pfeil Road,
Schertz, TX 78154

180-210 Days|
5/31/2019|
5/31/2019

No

IH 35

2019 Knapheide|
KTEC PQ-UB|
Standard|

6 Year Limited
Warranty|

Knapheide Equipment]

16201 South Interstate)
35 Buda, TX 78610

120 Days|
7/2019
7/2019

No|

2019 Knapheide 596
Body!

6 yr.

Knapheide, Buda
Budal

5-31-19

5-31-19

5-31-19

No

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of [Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD (8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road |4562 |H-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Iltem Description QTY [Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
10 % Ton Regular Cab Utility Bed Service 1
Truck with Pipe Rack:
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $37,147.00) $36,008.78 $37,183.04
Total: $37,147.00 $36,008.78 $37,183.04
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 3.2%]
and local bid:
Price Differential: $1,138.22
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F250 R/C| 2019 Ford F250|f 2019 Ford F-250 Reg
4X2, Note: 9950 Regular Cab Cab
GVWR Not 10,000
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 6.2 L Ford Gas, 385|| Ford 6.2 Liter, 385 HP 6.2L, V8
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P,
Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shift - G - 6 6 Speed Automatic| 6-Spd
Speed|
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000 3 year, 36,000 miles|(36 m / 36,000 Bumper]
miles standard, 5 year) to Bumper, 5yr. /
60,000 miles 60,000 Powertrain
powertrain
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center| Bluebonnet Ford| Local Dealer
Facility Name:
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 TH-10 East, San 1879 S. Business| Local Dealer

Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Utility Body and Pipe
Rack Offered:

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty:

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty Service
Provider Facility Name:

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty Service
Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off

date:

Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 Knapheide 596
Service Body w/ UTEC
Pipe Rack|

12 months|

UTEC]

5860 Pfeil Road,
Schertz, TX 78154

180-210 Days|
5/31/2019|
5/31/2019|

No|

IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 Stahli|
CST98VVS-48.5, ATE
Custom Rack

Body 5 Year Limited,
Rack 1 Year Limited
Axton Truck
Equipment]

4844 Whirlwind Dr.,
San Antonio, TX|
78217

120 Days|

7/2019

7/2019

No|

2019 Knapheide 596

Knapheide 6 yr.
6 yrs.

6 yrs.

5-31-19
5-31-19
5-31-19

No

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of [Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD (8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road (4562 |H-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Item Description QTY [Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
11 % Ton Crew Cab Utility Service Truck w/ 1
Tow Hitch: NAS
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $38,908.00) $34,633.07 $39,168.14
Total: $38,908.00) $34,633.07 $39,168.14
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F250 Crew| 2019 Ford F250| 2019 Ford Crew Cab
Cab 4X2] Reqular Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.2 L Gas, 385|| Ford 6.2 Liter, 385 HP 6.2L, V8
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P,
Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shift - G - 6 6 Speed Automatic 6-Spd
Speed|
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000]| 3 year, 36,000 miles| 36 m / 36,000 Bumper|
miles| standard, 5 year, to Bumper, 5 yr. /|

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Utility Body Offered:

Utility Body Warranty:

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Grande Truck Center

4562 TH-10 East, San
Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 Knapheide 596
S/B|

12 months
UTEC]|

5860 Pfeil Road,|
Schertz, TX 78154

180-210 Days|
5/31/2019|
5/31/2019|

No

60,000 miles
powertrain
Bluebonnet Ford

1879 S. Business

IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 Knapheide
KTEC PQ-UB
Standard

6 Year Limited
Knapheide Equipment

16201 South Interstate
35 Buda, TX 78610

120 Days
7/2019
7/2019

No

60,000 Powertrain
Local Dealer

Local Dealer

2019 Knapheide 596
6 yrs.

6 yrs.

Knapheide Buda

Not Provided

Not Provided

Not Provided

Not Provided

Prepared by Purchasing 2/28/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of |Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center [Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road |4562 |H-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
Item Description QTY [Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
12 DELETED:
13 % Ton Regular Cab, Flatbed, w/Vector 1
Control Attachments:
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $35,833.00 $33,213.78 No Bid
Total: $35,833.00] $33,213.78
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 7.9%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $2,619.22
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F250 R/C 2019 Ford F250
4X2 Reqular Cab)
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.2 L Gas, 385| Ford 6.2 Liter, 385 HP|
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P,
Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shift- G - 6 Speed Automatic|
Speed|
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000f 3 year, 36,000 miles|
miles] standard, 5 year,
60,000 miles|
powertrain

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of Flat Bed and Vector
Equipment Offered:

Flat Bed and Vector Equipment Warranty:

Flat Bed and Vector Equipment Warranty
Service Provider Facility Name:

Flat Bed and Vector Equipment Warranty
Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Grande Truck Center

4562 TH-10 East, San
Antonio, Texas 78219

2019 TKO 8'6" X 84"
Bed, Truckfitters|
Sprayer Bin/Chemicall
Holder, Truckfitters|
200 Gas Skid Sprayer,
w/ 160 CC Honda|
GX160 Engine|

12 months|

Truckfitters|

2625 Broadway, San
Antonio, TX 78215
210-240 Days|
5/31/2019|
5/31/2019|

No|

Bluebonnet Ford|

1879 S. Business|

IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130

2019 TKO|
TF7102845640BO77D)|
7,2019 NST-268170]
Sprayer Skid 200 Gal
Honda GX160 ENG

Bed 5 Year Limit]
Warranty/Skid 1 Year|
Limited|

Truckfitters|

959 Hwy 95 North,|
Shiner, TX 77984
120 Days|

7/2019

7/2019

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Doggett Freightliner of |Santex Truck Centers |Grande Truck Center |Bluebonnet Ford Silsbee Ford
South Texas LLC
6100010987 LD |8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Road |4562 IH-10 East 1879 S. Business 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N
IH 35
ltem Description QTY |Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, Silsbee,
TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78130 TX 77656
210-277-4373 210-661-8371 210-666-7112 830-626-5477
14 % Ton Regular Cab Dump Bed Insert 2
w/Crane: NAS
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $54,550.00 $53,851.76 No Bid
Total: $109,100.00 $107,703.52
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2019 Ford F250 R/C 2019 Ford F250
4Xx2 Reqular Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.7 L Diesel, 450| Ford 6.7 Liter Diesel,
(Include SAE Net HP): H.P, 330 HP
Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shift 6 6 Speed Automatic
Speed|
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 months or 36,000 3 year, 36,000 miles;
miles standard, 5 year,
60,000 miles
powertrain
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Bluebonnet Ford
Facility Name:
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 TH-10 East, San| 1879 S. Business
Facility Address: Antonio, Texas 78219 IH 35, New Braunfels,
TX 78130
Year, Make & Model of Dump Insert and Truck Craft Dump| 2019 Truck Craft
Cover and Fold-Away Bumper Crane Insert TC-101f Dump Magnum TC-
Offered: Magnum Alum-Line 101, 2019 Bumper
Truck Cap, westem|[Crane Western Mule A|
Mule A-1350 Bumper 1350 Bed Cover
Moiint C.ram|
Dump Insert and Cover and Fold-Away 12 months Not Provided
Bumper Crane Warranty:
Dump Insert and Cover and Fold-Away Axton Truck| Not Provided
Bumper Crane Warranty Service Provider Equipment|
Facility Name:
Dump Insert and Cover and Fold-Away 4844 Whirlwind Dr., Not Provided
Bumper Crane Warranty Service Provider San Antonio, TX|
Facility Address: 78217
Delivery: 180-210 Days 120 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 5/31/2019| 7/2019
Last day order can be placed without 5/31/2019| 7/2019
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No| No
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $791,650.00 $844,091.99 $1,509,716.00 $645,048.67 $293,269.38
Total Award: $329,778.00 $508,091.99 $456,203.00 $138,414.30

Iltems 4 and 12: Deleted and will be rebid at a later date.
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