
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 25, 2017 Non-Local                 

Alternate Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local

For: Annual Contract for Herbicides - Storm Water Division Helena Chemical Company Red River Specialties, 

LLC.

Helena Chemical 

Company

KBW Supply Winfield, LLC.

DS
225 Schilling Blvd.                                         

Suite 300

1324 N. Hearne Ave.                  

Ste. 120

225 Schilling Blvd.                

Suite 300
102 N. 13th Street 13411 Headwater           

Lane

Item
 Description


Estimated 

Quantities

Collierville,                                        

TN 38017                                                                

210-651-3552

Shreveport,                                        

LA 71107                                                          

318-425-5944

Collierville,                                       

TN 38017

Donna,

TX 78537                           

College Station,                                     

TX 77845                                                                     

979-551-0507

1 Herbicide, Broad Spectrum postemergence professional herbicide             

for non-crop: Roundup Pro Max or approved equal 2,140

Manufacturerer: Monsanto Monsanto Monsanto Monsanto Monsanto
Product No: 524-579 Roundup Pro Max 524-579 03285 10122497
Container Size: 1.67 gallon 1.67 gallon 1.67gallon 1.67 gallon 1.67 gallon
Price per container: $43.10 $43.34 $43.10 $75.28 $65.83
Extended Price: $92,234.00 $92,747.60 $92,234.00 $161,099.20 $140,876.20

2 Deleted 10

3 Herbicide, target pests: Barnyard Grass, Bluegrass, Crabgrass and 

Chickweeds species:  Pendulum Aquacap or approved equal 366

Manufacturer: BASF BASF BASF No Bid BASF

Product No: 241-416 Pendulum Aquacap 241-416 10001305

Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per container: $124.95 $147.93 $124.95 $133.20
Extended Price: $45,731.70 $54,142.38 $45,731.70 $48,751.20

 

4
Herbicide, target: control of undersirable vegetation, bareground weed 

control under certain paved surfaces:  Arsenal                                                 

or approved equal 297

Manufacturer: Nufarm BASF Nufarm No Bid Nufarm Polarlis

Product No: 228-534 Arsenal Herbicide 228-534 10119175

Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallons 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per container: $142.49 $145.00 $142.49  $171.73
Extended Price: $42,319.53 $43,065.00 $42,319.53 $51,003.81

5
Herbicide, bareground vegetation control in specified noncropland                

areas:  Sahara DG  or approved equal 1,339

Manufacturer: Alligare Alligare Alligare No Bid BASF

Product No: 81927-25 Mojave 70 EG 81927-25 Sahara DG

Container Size: 5 lb. package 5 lb. bag 5 lb. package 10 lb.
Price per container: $41.95 $47.50 $41.95 $122.00
Extended Price: $56,171.05 $63,602.50 $56,171.05 $163,358.00

6
Herbicide, target:  Crabgrass, foxtail, panicum signalgrass, mustard 

species:  Plateau or approved equal 117

Manufacturer: BASF BASF BASF No Bid BASF

Product No: 241-365 Plateau 241-365 65636415

Container Size: 2.5 gallon 1 gallon 2.5 gallon 1 gallon
Price per container: $287.50 $107.00 $287.50 $145.17
Extended Price: $33,637.50 $12,519.00 $33,637.50 $16,984.89

7
Herbicide, postemergent controls problems in centipedegrass, annual 

bluegrass:  Segment or approved equal 154

Manufacturer: BASF No Bid BASF No Bid BASF

Product No: 7969-398  7969-398 10121957

Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 1 gallon
Price per container: $450.00 $450.00 $203.71

$180.00*

$180.00
Extended Price: $27,720.00 $69,300.00 $31,371.34

Delivery days 5 days 3 - 5 days 7 days 10 days 5 days

 

Payment Term Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total: $297,813.78 $266,076.48 $339,393.78 $161,099.20 $452,345.44

Estimated Annual Award: $264,176.28 $12,519.00

Note: * Denotes price per gallon.

Deleted:   Item 2 will be rebid at a later date.  
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