

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: August 16, 2017 For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles				Local	Local	Alt 1 Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Alt 1 Non-Local
6100009216		IM		Mission Golf Cars 18865 Redland Road San Antonio, TX 78259 210-545-7868	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154 210-666-7112	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900W IH 10 Sequin, TX 78155	Golf Cars Etc. 5560 N. Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78247	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154
Item	Description	Qty								
1	Heavy Duty Cargo Transport Vehicle- 2 seater Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	1		\$9,390.00 \$9,390.00 2018 Titan HD 48V Cushman 48 Volt DC 2 Year Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259 Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st Yes 60	No bid	No Bid	\$17,030.85 \$17,030.85 2017 Toro Workman HDT Auto Toro 07390 Workman 28 HP 2 yrs or 1500 hours - see attached ***** (illegible) Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma Tx 78154 November 1, 2017 November 1, 2017 No 15-30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Electric Golf Cart- 4 Seater Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	1		\$8,580.00 \$8,580.00 2018 Cushman Shuttle 2+2 Cushman Shuttle 2+2 48V DC 2 Year Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259 Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st Yes 60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,781.80 \$8,781.80 2018 Club Car Villager 4 - Electric 4-Passenger 48 Volt Excel Electric - SAE H/P Rating=Peak 13 H.P. 4 year limited battery, 3 year power-train/frame, 2 year limited remaining Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer 06/01/2018 03/01/2018 NO 30 to 45	No Bid

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: August 16, 2017 For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles				Local	Local	Alt 1 Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Alt 1 Non-Local
6100009216		IM		Mission Golf Cars 18865 Redland Road San Antonio, TX 78259 210-545-7868	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154 210-666-7112	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900W IH 10 Sequin, TX 78155	Golf Cars Etc. 5560 N. Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78247	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154
Item	Description	Qty								
3	Turf & Ground Utility Vehicle with Power Dump Bed Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	5		\$13,380.00 \$66,900.00	\$9,759.00 \$48,795.00	\$12,503.00 \$62,515.00			\$11,172.65 \$55,863.25	
				2018 Cushman Hauler 4x4	2017 Volunteer 4x4	2017 Gravely 996200 JSV 3000	No Bid	No Bid	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 2-wheel drive - Gas	No Bid
				2018 Cushman Hauler 28 HP Subaru	Kohler 31 hp, 747cc kohler aegis v-twin	Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak			Kawasaki SH680 4-cycle SAE H.P. Rating 20.1	
				2 Year	1-year	1-year			2 years / 2000 hour engine/drive-train and 1 year remaining vehicle	
				Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250			Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer	
				Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st	10/01/2017 10/01/2017	10/01/2017 10/01/2017			06/01/2018 03/01/2018	
				Yes 60	yes 30	yes 30			NO 30 to 45	
4	DELETED									
5	4 Wheeled 4x2 Open Cab Light Utility Vehicle GASOLINE Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	2		NAS \$8,320.00 \$16,640.00	\$8,500.00 \$17,000.00	\$12,503.00 \$25,006.00			\$10,286.85 \$20,573.70	
				2018 Cushman 1200	2017 Volunteer 4x4	2017 Gravely 996200 JSV 3000	No Bid	No Bid	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 2-wheel drive - Gas	No Bid
				2018 Cushman 12 HP Kawasaki	Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler aegis v-twin	Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak			Kawasaki SH680 SAE Rating - 20.1	
				2 Year	1 Year	1-year			2 years / 2000 hour limited warranty	
				Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250			Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer	
				Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st	10/01/2017 10/01/2017	10/01/2017 10/01/2017			06/01/2018 03/01/2018	
				Yes 60	yes 30	yes 30			NO 30 to 45	
6	DELETED									

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: August 16, 2017 For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles				Local	Local	Alt 1 Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Alt 1 Non-Local
6100009216		IM		Mission Golf Cars 18865 Redland Road San Antonio, TX 78259 210-545-7868	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154 210-666-7112	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900W IH 10 Sequin, TX 78155	Golf Cars Etc. 5560 N. Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78247	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154
Item	Description	Qty								
7	4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with Cargo Bed Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	6		\$13,380.00 \$80,280.00	NAS \$9,954.00 \$59,724.00	\$13,202.91 \$79,217.46			NAS \$11,771.00 \$70,626.00	
				2018 Cushman Hauler 4x4 Subaru 28 HP 2 Year	2017 Volunteer 4x4 Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler aegis v-twin 1 Year	2017 Gravely 996200 JSV 3000 Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak 1-year	No Bid	No Bid	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 4x4 - Gas Kawasaki SH680 SAE Rating - 20.1 H.P. 2 years / 2000 hours limited warranty Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer	No Bid
				Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259 Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st Yes 60	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250 10/01/2017 10/01/2017 yes 30	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250 10/01/2017 10/01/2017 yes 30				06/01/2018 03/01/2018 NO 30 to 45
8	Off Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 w/ Power Tilt Large Cargo Bed & Hitch-2 Seater Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	8		\$11,539.00 \$92,312.01	NAS	\$14,453.06 \$115,624.48		\$14,672.00 \$117,376.00	NAS \$13,459.05 \$107,672.40	
				Cushman Hauler 4x4 Kubota Diesel 22 HP 2 Year	No Bid	2017 Gravely 996202 JSV-3000 Diesel Kohler Diesel 1003, 24HP 1-year	No Bid	2017 RTV 900 W Kubota D902 21.6 HP 12 Mos	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 4x4 - Diesel Kubota D-722 3-cylinder Diesel - SAE Rating - 20.0 H.P. 2 years / 2000 hours engine/drive-train and 1 year bumper to bumper warranty Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer	No Bid
				Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259 Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st Yes 60		DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250 10/01/2017 10/01/2017 yes 30		Ewald Kubota 1900 IH 10 W Sequin Tex 78155 12-31-17 12-31-17 Yes 30		06/01/2018 03/01/2018 NO 30 to 45

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: August 16, 2017 For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles				Local	Local	Alt 1 Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Alt 1 Non-Local
6100009216		IM		Mission Golf Cars 18865 Redland Road San Antonio, TX 78259 210-545-7868	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154 210-666-7112	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900W IH 10 Sequin, TX 78155	Golf Cars Etc. 5560 N. Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78247	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154
Item	Description	Qty								
9	Off Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 w/ Cargo Bed-4 Seater Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days Last Day to Place Order	1	NAS \$13,548.00 \$13,548.00							NAS \$16,695.65 \$16,695.65
			2018 Cushman Hauler Crew Kubota Diesel 22 HP 2 Year Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259 Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st Yes 60	No Bid	2017 Gravely 996203 JSV-3000 Diesel Kohler Diesel 1003, 24HP 1-year DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250 10/01/2017 10/01/2017 yes 30			2017 RTVX 1140 Kubota D1105 24.8 HP 12 Mos Ewald Kubota 1900 IH 10 W Sequin Tex 78155 12-31-17 12-31-17 Yes 30	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500SE 4x4 4-pass - Diesel Kubota D-722 3-cylinder diesel - SAE Rating - 20.0 H.P. 2 years / 2000 hours limited warranty Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer 06/01/2018 03/01/2018 NO 30 to 45	No Bid
10	DELETED									
11	4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with Cargo Bed and Removable Soft Cab Enclosure Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	3	NAS \$9,979.00 \$29,937.00	NAS \$10,269.00 \$30,807.00	\$14,232.86 \$42,698.58				NAS \$12,448.25 \$37,344.75	
			2018 Cushman Hauler 4x4 Subaru 28 HP 2 Year Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259 Dec 15th - Jan 8th Nov 1st Yes 60	2017 Volunteer 4x4 Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler aegis v-twin 1 Year DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250 10/01/2017 10/01/2017 yes 30	2017 Gravely 996200 JSV-3000 Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak 1-year DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250 10/01/2017 10/01/2017 yes 30	No Bid	No Bid	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 4x4 - Gas Kawasaki SH660 - SAE Rating - 20.1 H.P. 2 years / 2000 hours limited warranty Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer 06/01/2018 03/01/2018 NO 30 to 45	No Bid	
12	DELETED									

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: August 16, 2017 For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles				Local	Local	Alt 1 Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Alt 1 Non-Local
6100009216		IM		Mission Golf Cars 18865 Redland Road San Antonio, TX 78259 210-545-7868	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154 210-666-7112	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900W IH 10 Sequin, TX 78155	Golf Cars Etc. 5560 N. Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78247	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154
Item	Description	Qty								
13	Off Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 w/ NO POWER TILT Large Cargo Bed & Hitch- 2 Seater Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	1	NAS \$9,338.00 \$9,338.00			\$12,400.00 \$12,400.00			NAS \$11,355.30 \$11,355.30	
			2018 Cushman 4x4	No Bid	2017 Gravely 996200 JSV-3000 Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak 1-year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 4x4 - Gas Kawasaki SH660 - SAE Rating - 20.1 H.P. 2 years / 2000 hours limited warranty Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer	No Bid
			Subaru 28 HP		DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250					
			2 Year							
			Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259							
			Dec 15th - Jan 8th		10/01/2017				06/01/2018	
			Nov 1st		10/01/2017				03/01/2018	
			Yes		yes				NO	
			60		30				30 to 45	
14	Cart w/ Power Dump Bed 2 Seater- GASOLINE Price Each Price Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Year, Make & Model Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Warranty Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Production Cut-Off Date Last Day to Place Order Firm Pricing Date Delivery Days	4	NAS \$8,320.00 \$33,280.00	\$10,269.00 \$41,076.00 6.42%	\$13,162.96 \$52,651.84 36.41%	\$9,649.62 \$38,598.48	\$10,231.00 \$40,924.00	\$9,422.20 \$37,688.80	NAS \$7,940.47 \$31,761.88	
			2018 Cushman Hauler 4x4 Subaru 28 HP	2017 Volunteer 4x4 Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler aeqis v-twin 1 Year	2017 Gravely 996200 JSV-3000 Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak 1-year	2017 Toro Max 480cc Toro Max 07235	2017 RTV 400 Subaru 16 HP	2018 Club Car Carryall 500G 4x2 - EFI GAS Subaru EX-40 E.F.I. - SAE Rating - 14.0 H.P. 3 years / 3000 hour limited engine/drive-train and 2 year limited	2017 Toro GTX 429CC Toro GTX 07042	
			2 Year			2 yr or 1500 hours - see attached	12 Mos		2 yr or 1500 hours - see attached	
			Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250	9468 Selma Parkway, Selma Tx 78154	Ewald Kubota 1900 IH 10 W	Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer	9468 Selma Parkway, Selma Tx 78154	
			Dec 15th - Jan 8th	10/01/2017	10/01/2017	November 1, 2017	12-31-17	06/01/2018	November 1, 2017	
			Nov 1st	10/01/2017	10/01/2017	November 1, 2017	12-31-17	03/01/2018	November 1, 2017	
			Yes	yes	yes	No	Yes	NO	No	
			60	30	30	15-30	30	30 to 45	15-30	

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: August 16, 2017 For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles				Local	Local	Alt 1 Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Alt 1 Non-Local
6100009216		IM		Mission Golf Cars 18865 Redland Road □ San Antonio, TX 78259 210-545-7868	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 979-567-6116	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154 210-666-7112	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900W IH 10 Sequin, TX 78155	Golf Cars Etc. 5560 N. Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78247	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154
Item	Description	Qty								
15	DELETED									
16	4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with Cargo Bed & Winch	2								
	Price Each		\$15,180.00	\$10,174.00	\$14,257.86				\$12,864.80	
	Price Total		\$30,360.00	\$20,348.00	\$28,515.72				\$25,729.60	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid									
	Price Differential									
	Year, Make & Model Offered		2018 Cushman Hauler 4x4 Subaru 28 HP	2017 Volunteer 4x4 Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler aeqis v-twin 1 Year	2017 Gravely 996200 JSV-3000 Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak 1-year		No Bid	No Bid	2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 4x4 - Gas Kawasaki SH680 - SAE Rating - 20.1 H.P. 2 Years / 2000 hour limited warranty Golf Cars, Etc. - Authorized Club Car Dealer	No Bid
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)									
	Warranty		2 Year							
	Warranty Service Provide Name & Address		Mission Golf Cars and Industrial Vehicles 18865 Redland Road, San Antonio, Texas 78259	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, Tx 78250					
	Production Cut-Off Date		Dec 15th - Jan 8th	10/01/2017	10/01/2017				06/01/2018	
	Last Day to Place Order		Nov 1st	10/01/2017	10/01/2017				03/01/2018	
	Firm Pricing Date		Yes	yes	yes				NO	
	Delivery Days		60	30	30				30 to 45	
17	DELETED									
18	DELETED									
	Prompt Payment Discount		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
			\$17,970.00	\$65,795.00	\$278,456.24		\$38,598.48	\$16,537.00	\$0.00	\$0.00