

**City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation**

Opened: July 18, 2016		Annual Contract for Supply of 5 & 15 Gallon Shade, Ornamental and & Fruit and Nut Trees			
6100007515		RS	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Mosty Brothers Nursery 200 Mosty Center Point, TX 78010 830-634-2643	Bob Wells 17160 CR 4100 Lindale, TX 75771 903-882-3550	AgH2O Holdings, LLC 3817 Bent Brook Dr. Round Rock, TX 78664
	<b>Five (5) Gallon Trees</b>				<b>NAS</b>
1	Bur Oak	100			
	Price per Tree		\$14.00	No bid	\$35.00
	Total Price		\$1,400.00		\$3,500.00
2	Deleted				
3	Chinkapin Oak	50			
	Price per Tree		\$14.00	No bid	\$40.00
	Total Price		\$700.00		\$2,000.00
4	Crape Myrtle	100			
	Price per Tree		\$14.00	\$23.50	\$42.00
	Total Price		\$1,400.00	\$2,350.00	\$4,200.00
5	Desert-Willow	50			
	Price per Tree		No bid	\$19.50	\$42.00
	Total Price			\$975.00	\$2,100.00
6	Deleted				
7	Lacey Oak	50			
	Price per Tree		\$14.00	No bid	\$46.00
	Total Price		\$700.00		\$2,300.00
8	Deleted	250			
9	Mexican Buckeye	100			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$48.00
	Total Price				\$4,800.00
10	Mexican Olive	100			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$42.00
	Total Price				\$4,200.00
11	Mexican Plum	50			
	Price per Tree		\$14.00	\$22.50	\$45.00
	Total Price		\$700.00	\$1,125.00	\$2,250.00
12	Mexican Sycamore	100			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$45.00
	Total Price				\$4,500.00
13	Mexican White Oak	200			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$45.00
	Total Price				\$9,000.00
14	Texas Mountain Laurel	250			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$45.00
	Total Price				\$11,250.00
15	Texas Persimmon	50			
	Price per Tree		No bid	\$22.50	\$48.00
	Total Price			\$1,125.00	\$2,400.00
16	Deleted				
17	Texas or Mexican Redbud	150			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$46.00
	Total Price				\$6,900.00
18	<b>7- Gallon Trees</b>				
	Pecan (native)	100			
	Price per Tree		No bid	\$34.50	\$36.00
	Total Price			\$3,450.00	\$3,600.00
19	Pecan (Desirable)	150			
	Price per Tree		No bid	\$39.50	\$50.00
	Total Price			\$5,925.00	\$7,500.00
20	<b>15 Gallon Size Trees</b>				
	Bur Oak	100			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$86.00
	Total Price				\$8,600.00
21	Cedar Elm	300			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$79.00
	Total Price				\$23,700.00
22	Chinkapin Oak	100			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$85.00
	Total Price				\$8,500.00
23	Crape Myrtle	25			
	Price per Tree		\$55.00	No bid	\$85.00
	Total Price		\$1,375.00		\$2,125.00
24	Deleted				
25	Eve's Necklace	25			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$148.00
	Total Price				\$3,700.00
26	Honey Mesquite (thornless)	25			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$120.00
	Total Price				\$3,000.00
27	Lacey Oak	25			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$125.00
	Total Price				\$3,125.00
28	Live Oak	300			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$76.00
	Total Price				\$22,800.00
29	Mexican Buckeye	50			
	Price per Tree		No bid	No bid	\$95.00
	Total Price				\$4,750.00

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2016		Annual Contract for Supply of 5 & 15 Gallon Shade, Ornamental and & Fruit and Nut Trees			
For: 6100007515		RS	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Mosty Brothers Nursery 200 Mosty Center Point, TX 78010 830-634-2643	Bob Wells 17160 CR 4100 Lindale, TX 75771 903-882-3550	AgH2O Holdings, LLC 3817 Bent Brook Dr. Round Rock, TX 78664
30	Mexican Olive Price per Tree Total Price	50	No bid	No bid	\$110.00 \$5,500.00
31	Mexican Plum Price per Tree Total Price	25	No bid	No bid	\$85.00 \$2,125.00
32	Deleted				
33	Deleted	200			
34	Pecan (native) Price per Tree Total Price	150	No bid	\$129.50 \$19,425.00	\$165.00 \$24,750.00
35	Possumhaw Price per Tree Total Price	25	No bid	No bid	\$100.00 \$2,500.00
36	Retama (thornless) Price per Tree Total Price	75	No bid	No bid	\$100.00 \$7,500.00
37	Sierra Red Oak Price per Tree Total Price	50	No bid	No bid	\$90.00 \$4,500.00
38	Texas Mountain Laurel Price per Tree Total Price	200	No bid	No bid	\$87.00 \$17,400.00
39	Texas Persimmon Price per Tree Total Price	75	No bid	No bid	\$95.00 \$7,125.00
40	Texas Red Oak Price per Tree Total Price	100	No bid	No bid	\$85.00 \$8,500.00
41	Deleted				
<b>5 Gallon Size Fruit Trees</b>					
42	Apple Price per Tree Total Price	50	No bid	\$15.50 \$775.00	\$24.50 \$1,225.00
43	Apricot Price per Tree Total Price	25	No bid	\$15.50 \$387.50	\$24.50 \$612.50
44	Avocado Price per Tree Total Price	100	No bid	No bid	\$55.00 \$5,500.00
45	Fig Price per Tree Total Price	150	No bid	\$15.50 \$2,325.00	\$24.50 \$3,675.00
46	Deleted				
47	Lime Price per Tree Total Price	100	No bid	No bid	\$42.00 \$4,200.00
48	Lime Price per Tree Total Price	100	No bid	No bid	\$42.00 \$4,200.00
49	Nectarine Price per Tree Total Price	25	No bid	\$15.50 \$387.50	\$24.50 \$612.50
50	Olive Price per Tree Total Price	50	No bid	\$42.50 \$2,125.00	\$50.50 \$2,525.00
51	Orange Price per Tree Total Price	250	No bid	\$39.50 \$9,875.00	\$47.00 \$11,750.00
52	Peach Price per Tree Total Price	150	No bid	\$15.50 \$2,325.00	\$25.00 \$3,750.00
53	Pear Price per Tree Total Price	75	No bid	\$15.50 \$1,162.50	\$25.00 \$1,875.00
54	Persimmon Price per Tree Total Price	50	No bid	\$23.50 \$1,175.00	\$35.00 \$1,750.00
55	Plum Price per Tree Total Price	100	No bid	\$15.50 \$1,550.00	\$25.00 \$2,500.00
56	Pomegranate Price per Tree Total Price	50	No bid	\$24.50 \$1,225.00	\$33.00 \$1,650.00
Total			\$6,275.00	\$54,212.50	\$276,525.00
Prompt Payment discount			Net 30	5% 7 days	Net 30
Estimated Annual Total			\$6,275.00	\$54,212.50	\$276,525.00
<b>Estimated Annual Award</b>			<b>\$6,275.00</b>	<b>\$54,212.50</b>	

Deleted: Line items 2, 6, 8, 16, 24, 32, 33, 41 and 46 were re-bid and are recommended for award on IFB 6100007913.