

**City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation**

Opened: May 4, 2016			
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service			
6100007454		DG	
		<b>Local</b>	<b>Local</b>
		Sankey Equipment Co Inc 4331 Milling Rd San Antonio, TX 78219 210-227-4178	Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218 210-661-7700
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Estimated Annual Usage</b>	
1A	Ingersoll-Rand Power Tool Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	5%	50%
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	Ingersoll Rand Power Tools	Ingersoll- Rand
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	MSRP	Jobber
D	Price schedule number:	None on price sheet	RPT086
E	Date of price schedule:	2/1/16	3-2016
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	Special	List
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	Limited 90 days against defects in material & workmanship only	12 months
1B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
1C	Labor and Service - Ingersoll-Rand Power Tool Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	\$70.00	No bid
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	\$105.00	No bid
2A	Chicago-Pneumatic Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	5%	43%
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	Chicago Pneumatic	Chicago Pneumatic
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	MSRP	Jobber
D	Price schedule number:	None	RPT086
E	Date of price schedule:	2/1/16	3-2016
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	Special	List
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	Limited 90 days against defects in material & workmanship only	12 months
2B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
2C	Labor and Service - Chicago-Pneumatic Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	\$70.00	No bid
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	\$105.00	No bid
3A	Hein-Warner Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	5%	No bid
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	Hein Werner	No bid
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	MSRP	No bid
D	Price schedule number:	none on sheet	No bid
E	Date of price schedule:	2016	No bid
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	Special	No bid
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	Limited 90 days against defects in material & workmanship only	No bid
3B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
3C	Labor and Service - Hein-Warner Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	\$70.00	No bid
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	\$105.00	No bid
4A	Lincoln/Walker Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	5%	50%
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	Lincoln/Walker	Lincoln
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	MSRP	Jobber
D	Price schedule number:	none on price sheet	RPT086
E	Date of price schedule:	2016	3-2016
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	Special	List
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	Limited 90 days against defects in material & workmanship only	12 months
4B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
4C	Labor and Service - Lincoln/Walker Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	\$70.00	No bid
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	\$105.00	No bid

**City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation**

Opened: May 4, 2016			
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service			
6100007454		DG	
		<b>Local</b>	<b>Local</b>
		Sankey Equipment Co Inc 4331 Milling Rd San Antonio, TX 78219 210-227-4178	Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218 210-661-7700
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Estimated Annual Usage</b>	
5A	Champion Air Compressor Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	10%	No bid
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	Champion Pneumatic	No bid
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	MSRP	No bid
D	Price schedule number:	22-100	No bid
E	Date of price schedule:	1/1/2016	No bid
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	Special	No bid
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	Limited 90 days against defects in material & workmanship only	No bid
5B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
5C	Labor and Service - Champion Air Compressor Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	\$85.00	No bid
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	\$127.50	No bid
6A	Blackhawk Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	5%	No bid
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	Blackhawk	No bid
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	MSRP	No bid
D	Price schedule number:	None on Excel Sheet	No bid
E	Date of price schedule:	1/1/2016	No bid
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	Special	No bid
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	Limited 90 days against defects in material & workmanship only	No bid
6B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
6C	Labor and Service - Blackhawk Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	\$70.00	No bid
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	\$105.00	No bid
7A	Coats Tire Service Equipment Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	No bid this item	45%
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	No bid	Coats
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	No bid	Jobber
D	Price schedule number:	No bid	RPT086
E	Date of price schedule:	No bid	3-2016
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	No bid	List
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	No bid	12 months
7B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
7C	Labor and Service - Coats Tire Service Equipment Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	No bid this item	\$85.00
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	No bid	\$95.00
8A	Norco Equipment Parts		
A	Percent of discount offered	5%	No bid
B	Product identification (Manufacturer):	Norco	No bid
C	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):	MSRP	No bid
D	Price schedule number:	None	No bid
E	Date of price schedule:		
F	Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)	None- factory updates weekly Special	No bid
G	Warranty (minimum 90 day):	Limited 90 days against defects in material & workmanship only	No bid
8B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
8C	Labor and Service - Norco Equipment Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour	\$70.00	No bid
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour	\$105.00	No bid

**City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation**

Opened: May 4, 2016			
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service		<b>Local</b>	
6100007454		<b>Local</b>	
	DG	Sankey Equipment Co Inc 4331 Milling Rd San Antonio, TX 78219 210-227-4178	Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218 210-661-7700
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Estimated Annual Usage</b>	
9A	Ammco Brake Lathe Equipment Parts		
	A Percent of discount offered		No bid this item 27%
	B Product identification (Manufacturer):		No bid Ammco
	C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):		No bid Jobber
	D Price schedule number:		No bid RPT086
	E Date of price schedule:		No bid 3-2016
	F Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)		No bid List
	G Warranty (minimum 90 day):		No bid 12 months
9B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
9C	Labor and Service - Ammco Brake Lathe Equipment Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour		No bid on this item \$85.00
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour		No bid \$95.00
10A	Robinair Air Condition Equipment Parts		
	A Percent of discount offered		No bid 28%
	B Product identification (Manufacturer):		No bid Robin Air
	C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.):		No bid Jobber
	D Price schedule number:		No bid RPT086
	E Date of price schedule:		No bid 3-2016
	F Price schedule column on which discount is based: (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)		No bid List
	G Warranty (minimum 90 day):		No bid 12 months
10B	Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only		
10C	Labor and Service - Robinair Air Condition Equipment Parts		
	Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour		No bid this item \$95.00
	Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour		No bid \$125.00
	Payment Terms		Net 30 days 2% 10 days