

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 13, 2013			LOCAL	LOCAL	LOCAL	NAS
For: Annual Contract for Automotive Shop Supplies			Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218 210-661-7700	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217 210-496-0407	Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217 210-787-2438	Luna Automotive Inc. 1603 W. Commerce San Antonio, TX 78207
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities	SC			
1	Windshield Wiper Blades	300				
a	16" Windshield Wiper Blades					
	Price Each		\$1.85	No Bid	\$2.80	\$1.34
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%		2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.81		\$2.74	\$1.34
	Price Total		\$543.90		\$823.20	\$402.00
	Brand & Model No.		NAPA NB16		ANCO 31-16	GoodYear 20/20
	Delivery		1 Day		1 Day	Performance Blade 10 Days
b	18" Windshield Wiper Blades	900				
	Price Each		\$1.99	No Bid	\$2.80	\$1.34
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%		2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.95		\$2.74	\$1.34
	Price Total		\$1,755.18		\$2,469.60	\$1,206.00
	Brand & Model No.		NAPA NB18		ANCO 3H8	GoodYear 20/20
	Delivery		1 Day		1 Day	Performance Blade 10 Days
c	20" Windshield Wiper Blades	1,500				
	Price Each		\$1.99	No Bid	\$2.80	\$1.58
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%		2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.95		\$2.74	\$1.58
	Price Total		\$2,925.30		\$4,116.00	\$2,370.00
	Brand & Model No.		NAPA NB20		ANCO 31-20	GoodYear 20/20
	Delivery		1 Day		1 Day	Performance Blade 10 Days
d	22" Windshield Wiper Blades	3,000				
	Price Each		\$1.99	No Bid	\$2.80	\$1.58
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%		2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.95		\$2.74	\$1.58
	Price Total		\$5,850.60		\$8,232.00	\$4,740.00
	Brand & Model No.		NAPA NB22		ANCO 31-22	GoodYear 20/20
	Delivery		1 Day		1 Day	Performance Blade 10 Days
e	24" Windshield Wiper Blades	300				
	Price Each		\$2.39	No Bid	\$2.80	\$1.58
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%		2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$2.34		\$2.74	\$1.58
	Price Total		\$702.66		\$823.20	\$474.00
	Brand & Model No.		NAPA NB24		ANCO 31-24	GoodYear 20/20
	Delivery		1 Day		1 Day	Performance Blade 10 Days
2	Non-Chlorinated Parts Cleaner, 14 oz. spray can	6,000				
	Price Each		\$2.19	\$2.66	\$2.75	\$2.13
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	0%	2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$2.15	\$2.66	\$2.70	\$2.13
	Price Total		\$12,877.20	\$15,960.00	\$16,170.00	\$12,780.00
	Brand & Model No.		3M 08880	Zena-Flush 203427	3M 08880	Next Dimension N/C Brake & Parts Cleaner/Part # 734-20
	Delivery		1 Day	2 Days	1 Day	14 Days
3	Lubricant/Penetrant, 11 oz. spray can	500				
	Price Each		\$3.59	\$2.98	\$5.65	\$2.44
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	0%	2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$3.52	\$2.98	\$5.54	\$2.44
	Price Total		\$1,759.10	\$1,490.00	\$2,768.50	\$1,220.00
	Brand & Model No.		NAPA MAC 6300 12 Oz. Can	Pentrazen 203473	WD40 110078	Next Dimension Penetrating Lubricant Spray/Part # 393-16
	Delivery		1 Day	1-7 Days	1 Day	14 Days
4	Rearview mirror adhesive, Approximately .01 ounce per tube	150				
	Price Each		\$2.25	No Bid	\$1.85	\$1.75
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%		2%	0%
	Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$2.21		\$1.81	\$1.75
	Price Total		\$330.75		\$271.95	\$262.50
	Brand & Model No.		PERMATEX NAPA 765-1184		PERMATEX 81844	Loctite # 37438/Rearview Mirror Adhesive
	Delivery		1 Day		1 Day	7 Days

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 13, 2013 For: Annual Contract for Automotive Shop Supplies 6100003286			LOCAL	LOCAL	LOCAL	NAS
SC			Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218 210-661-7700	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217 210-496-0407	Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217 210-787-2438	Luna Automotive Inc. 1603 W. Commerce San Antonio, TX 78207
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities				
5	Black Ultra Silicone, 3.35 oz. tube Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	500	\$4.69 2% \$4.60 \$2,298.10 PERMATEX NAPA # 765-1589 1 Day	No bid	\$3.99 2% \$3.91 \$1,955.10 PERMATEX 598BR 1 Day	\$3.31 0% \$3.31 \$1,655.00 Loctite 37467-2.702 RTV598 Black Silicone Marker 7 Days
6	Thread seal tape, 1/2" x 260" Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	200	\$1.25 2% \$1.23 \$245.00 NAPA # 770-1755 1 Day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Deleted					
8	Battery cleaner, 11 oz. spray can Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	150	\$2.19 2% \$2.15 \$321.93 CRC # 095023 1 Day	\$2.61 0% \$2.61 \$391.50 Zena Volt 203480 (18 Oz. Cans) 2 Days	\$2.75 2% \$2.70 \$404.25 CRC 05023 1 Day	\$3.69 0% \$3.69 \$553.50 Plastikote # 279 Battery Cleaner 10 Days
9	Injector cleaning fluid, 16 oz. can Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	200	\$8.25 2% \$8.09 \$1,617.00 NAPA OTC # 700-2121 1 Day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Brake fluid, Five gallon container Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	50	\$69.55 2% \$68.16 \$3,407.95 NAPA BRAKE FLUID # 35-105 1 Day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Antifreeze/Coolant, 55 gallon container Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	10	\$439.00 2% \$430.22 \$4,302.20 NAPA 55 GAL 1 Day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Clear silicone, 3 oz. tube Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	100	\$3.59 2% \$3.52 \$351.82 NAPA PERMATEX # 765-1344 1 Day	No Bid	\$2.75 2% \$2.70 \$269.50 PERMATEX 66BR 1 Day	\$2.34 0% \$2.34 \$234.00 Loctite # 37463 RTV Clear Silicone 2.7 Oz. 7 Days
13	Battery Protector, 12 oz. spray can Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total	150	\$2.99 2% \$2.93 \$439.53	\$6.19 0% \$6.19 \$928.50	No Bid	\$3.69 0% \$3.69 \$553.50

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 13, 2013 For: Annual Contract for Automotive Shop Supplies 6100003286			LOCAL	LOCAL	LOCAL	NAS
SC			Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218 210-661-7700	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217 210-496-0407	Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217 210-787-2438	Luna Automotive Inc. 1603 W. Commerce San Antonio, TX 78207
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities				
14	Brand & Model No. Delivery All Purpose Marking & Coding Pens Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	400	CRC 095046 1 Day	Zenakote 203481 (14 Oz. Cans) 2 Days		Plastikote # 278 Battery Terminal Protector 10 Days
				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			\$2.79			
			2%			
			\$2.73			
			\$1,093.68			
			SUPER MET-AL (NAPA) # 710-1712 TO # 710-1718 1 Day			
15	Thread Locker, 1.69 oz. Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	100	\$17.39 2% \$17.04 \$1,704.22 NAPA PERMATEX # 765-1144 1 Day	No Bid	\$15.59 2% \$15.28 \$1,527.82 PERMATEX 27140 1 Day	\$4.19 0% \$4.19 \$419.00 Loctite # 37421 ThreadLocker 271 7 Days
				No Bid		No Bid
			\$22.99		\$22.63	
			2%		2%	
			\$22.53		\$22.18	
			\$11,265.10		\$11,088.70	
			3M # 08908 1 Day		3M 08908 1 Day	
16	Woodgrain and Stripe Adhesive Remover, 18 Fluid oz. Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	500	\$22.99 2% \$22.53 \$11,265.10 3M # 08908 1 Day	No Bid	\$22.63 2% \$22.18 \$11,088.70 3M 08908 1 Day	No Bid
				No Bid		No Bid
			\$22.99		\$22.63	
			2%		2%	
			\$22.53		\$22.18	
			\$11,265.10		\$11,088.70	
			3M # 08908 1 Day		3M 08908 1 Day	
17	Antifreeze/Coolant, One gallon container Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	2,000	\$8.19 2% \$8.03 \$16,052.40 NAPA # 1 GAL 1 Day	No Bid	\$9.99 2% \$9.79 \$19,580.40 PRONTO 076PR LONGLIFE ANTIFREEZE 1 Day	No Bid
				No Bid		No Bid
			\$8.19		\$9.99	
			2%		2%	
			\$8.03		\$9.79	
			\$16,052.40		\$19,580.40	
			NAPA # 1 GAL 1 Day		PRONTO 076PR LONGLIFE ANTIFREEZE 1 Day	
18	Anti-Seize Lubricant, 12 oz spray can Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	100	\$8.85 2% \$8.67 \$867.30 PERMATEX NAPA # 765-1150 1 Day	No Bid	\$8.55 2% \$8.38 \$837.90 PERMATEX 81464 1 Day	\$7.21 0% \$7.21 \$721.00 Loctite # 38658 Anti-Seize Lubricant Silver 7 Days
				No Bid		No Bid
			\$8.85		\$8.55	
			2%		2%	
			\$8.67		\$8.38	
			\$867.30		\$837.90	
			PERMATEX NAPA # 765-1150 1 Day		PERMATEX 81464 1 Day	
19	Spray Paint a Exterior Industrial Maintenance Paint, 16 oz. can, 12 oz. net weight, Color to be selected at time of order; available colors must include white, black, red and safety yellow Price Each Prompt Payment Discount Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total Brand & Model No. Delivery	500	\$3.49 2% \$3.42 \$1,710.10 KRYLON 51501-1813 1 Day	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.14 0% \$5.14 \$2,570.00 Plastikote Valspar Max Anti-Rust Spray 10 Days
				No Bid		No Bid
			\$3.49			\$5.14
			2%			0%
			\$3.42			\$5.14
			\$1,710.10			\$2,570.00
			KRYLON 51501-1813 1 Day			Plastikote Valspar Max Anti-Rust Spray 10 Days
				No Bid		
			\$3.49			\$3.53
			2%			0%
			\$3.42			\$3.53
			\$513.03			\$529.50
			KRYLON #S VARIES 1 Day			Plastikote Industrial Coatings Marking Paint 20 Oz./17 Net 10 Days

