
City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 29, 2013
For: X Series Supplies for the Fire Department NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL

ZOLL Medical Corporaton Bound Tree Medical, LLC
VF 269 Mill Road 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd.

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

Chelmsford, 
MA 01824-4105
800-348-9011

Dublin, 
OH 43016
800-533-0523

Item 1 SpO2 Accessories
1a Red 4' Reusabe Patient Cable 50 NAS

Price Each $221.25 $162.37
Manufacturer Zoll Physio-Control
Product No. 8000-0330 1196-00323
Total $11,062.50 $8,118.50

1b Red 10' Reusable Patient Cable 50
Price Each $258.75 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8000-0331
Total $12,937.50

1c Masimo Single Patient Ear Sensor, LNCS E1 50
Price Each $281.25 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8000-000456
Total $14,062.50

1d Masimo Single Patient Ear Sensor, M-LNCS E1 50
Price Each $281.25 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8000-000457
Total $14,062.50

1e Red MNC Patient Cable, 4 Foot 50
Price Each $296.25 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8000-000460
Total $14,812.50

1f Rainbow 4' Patient Calbe 50
Price Each $168.75 $206.27
Manufacturer Zoll Physio-Control
Product No. 8000-0341 11171-000037
Total $8,437.50 $10,313.50

1g Rainbow 12' Reusable Patient Cable 50
Price Each $221.25 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8000-0342
Total $11,062.50

1h Rainbow Adult Reusable Patient Sensor 50
Price Each $371.25 $659.41
Manufacturer Zoll Physio-Control
Product No. 8000-000371 11171-00049
Total $18,562.50 $32,970.50

1i Rainbow Pediatric Reusable Patient Sensor 50
Price Each $348.75 $835.03
Manufacturer Zoll Physio-Control
Product No. 8000-000372 11996-000338
Total $17,437.50 $41,751.50

1j M-LNCS DCI Reusable Sensor 50 NAS
Price Each $221.25 $165.68
Manufacturer Zoll Masimo America
Product No. 8000-000459 1863
Total $11,062.50 $8,284.00
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Item 2 Non-Invasive Blood Pressure Accessories
2a Dual Lumen NIBP 10 Foot Hose for Propaq MD 50

Price Each $48.75 $78.31
Manufacturer Zoll Zoll
Product No. 8300-0002-01 8300-0002-01
Total $2,437.50 $3,915.50

2b Infant/Neonate, 8 Foot Single Lumen NIBP Hose 240
Price Each $48.75 $78.31
Manufacturer Zoll Zoll
Product No. 8300-0796-01 8300-0796-01
Total $11,700.00 $18,794.40

2c Neonatal Cuff Kit, Sizes 1 - 5 240
Price Each $224.25 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8300-0797-01
Total $53,820.00

2d Disposal Cuff, Soft Infant, 2-Tube 18
Price Each $93.22 $4.81 / $96.20
Manufacturer Zoll Allyn Welch
Product No. SOFT-07-2MQ SOFT-07-2MQ
Total $1,677.96 $1,731.60

2e Disposal Cuff, Soft Chile, 2 -Tube 23
Price Each $93.22 $4.81 / $96.20
Manufacturer Zoll Allyn Welch
Product No. SOFT-09-2MQ SOFT-09-2MQ
Total $2,144.06 $2,212.60

2f Disposable Cuff, Soft Adult, 2-Tube 500
Price Each $126.46 $6.52 / $130.40
Manufacturer Zoll Zoll
Product No. SOFT-11-2MQ SOFT-11-2MQ
Total $63,230.00 $65,200.00

2g Disposable Cuff, Soft Lg Adult, 2-Tube 480
Price Each $126.46 $6.52 / $130.40
Manufacturer Zoll Zoll
Product No. SOFT-12-2MQ SOFT-12-2MQ
Total $60,700.80 $62,592.00

2h Disposable Cuff, Soft Thigh, 2-Tube 430
Price Each $168.00 $8.67 / $173.40
Manufacturer Zoll Zoll
Product No. SOFT-13-2MQ SOFT-13-2MQ
Total $72,240.00 $74,562.00

Item 3 Temperature Accessories
3a YSI Reusable Adult Skin Tmerpature Probe 280

Price Each $56.25 $89.29
Manufacturer Zoll Zoll
Product No. 8000-0670 8000-0670
Total $15,750.00 $25,001.20

3b YSI Reusable Adult Esophageal Rectal Temperature Probe 280
Price Each $41.25 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8000-0668
Total $11,550.00
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Item 4 EtCO2 Accessories
4a Filterline Set, Adult/Pediatric 1,800

Price Each $206.25 $6.81 / $170.25
Manufacturer Zoll Oridion Capnography
Product No. 8300-0520-01 10579
Total $371,250.00 $306,450.00

4b Smart CapnoLine Plus O2 Adult (O2 Tubing) 120
Price Each $266.25 $8.60 / $215.00
Manufacturer Zoll Oridion Capnography
Product No. 8300-0524-01 10210
Total $31,950.00 $25,800.00

Item 5 Training and Manual Accessories
Item 5a 12-Lead Simulator 25

Price Each $798.75 No Bid
Manufacturer Zoll
Product No. 8012-0206
Total $19,968.75

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total $851,919.07 Incomplete
Estimated Annual Award $448,719.07 $332,250.00
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