## City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:	December 23, 2016		Local
For:	Annual Contract for Differential Component & Rebuilt		Grande Truck Center
	Exchange Units Parts & Service		
6100008447		IM	4562 IH-10 East
		Estimated Annual	Can Antonia TV 70210
Item	Description	Usage	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7144
1 (A)	Rockwell/Meritor Differential Component Parts (For Models	Osage	210 000 7144
1 (A)	Listed Below)		
а	Percent of Discount Offered		Cost + 20%
b	Product Identification (Manufacturer)		Meritor
С	Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Dealer Cost
d	Price Schedule Number		Not specified
е	Date of Price Schedule		Not specified
	Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is based (i.e.		
f	distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)		Cost
9	Warranty		12 months
1 (B)	Manufacturer and Model Number		
1	New Factory Assembly (Estimated usage 1 per year)		(Inactive)
	RD23160563	1	No Bid
2			(Inactive)
	Rebuilt Exchange (Estimated usage 1 per year) RD23160563	1	No Bid
1 (C)	Specified Items – (For Meritor RR23160563)		
(5)			
1 (D)	Manufacturer and Model Number		(In a ative)
<u>'</u>	New Factory Assembly (Estimated usage 1 per year) RR23160563	1	(Inactive) No Bid
2	14420100000	•	\$2,104.21 + 20% = \$2,525.05
_	Rebuilt Exchange (Estimated usage 1 per year) RR23160563	1	Core Charge \$825.00
			3. 3. 3. 3.
1 (E)	Specified Items -(For Meritor RR23160563)		
2( A)	Eaton Differential Component Parts (For Models Listed		
	Below)		0
a	Percent of discount offered Products Identification (Manufacturer)		Cost + 20% Eaton
b C	Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Dealer Cost
d	Price Schedule Number		Not specified
e	Date of Price Schedule		Not Specified
f	Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is based. (i.e.		Cost
	distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)		
g	Warranty		12 months
O (D)	Manufacturar and Madal Numbers Navy Accordation		
2 (B)	Manufacturer and Model Number: New Assemblies		\$7069.07 L 20% - \$0.561.69
'	Eaton/Spicer DP463P (Estimated Annual Usage 1 each per		\$7968.07 + 20% = \$9,561.68 (New Number)
	year) Part Number 674953	1	(ETN/DP461P531CF)
2	, ,	-	\$5004.15 + 20% = \$6,004.98
	Eaton/Spicer RP463P (Estimated Annual Usage 1 each per		(New Number)
	year) Part Number 675512	1	(ETN/RP461531CF)
	Warranty		
0 (0)	Specified Items – (for Eaton/Spicer DP463P Gear Ratio		
2 (C)	5.29)		
	0.23)		
2 (C)	Specified Items – (for Eaton/Spicer RP463P Gear Ratio		
,	5.29)		
3 (A)	Eaton/Spicer Differential Component Parts (For Models		
_	Listed Below) Percent of discount offered		01000
a b	Products Identification (Manufacturer)		Cost + 20% Eaton/Spicer
C	Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Dealer Cost
d	Price Schedule Number		Not Specified
e	Date of Price Schedule		Not Specified
f	Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based: (i.e.		Cost
	distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)		
g	Warranty		12 Months
			II .

## City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:	December 23, 2016		Local
For:	Annual Contract for Differential Component & Rebuilt		Grande Truck Center
	Exchange Units Parts & Service		
6100008447		IM	4562 IH-10 East
		Estimated	
	<b>5</b>	Annual	San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Usage	210-666-7144
3 (B)	Manufacturer and Model Number: Eaton/Spicer Model W230S		
1	New Assembly (Estimated usage 1 per year)		(Inactive)
	Part Number: 057CA108-7X	1	No Bid
2	Rebuilt Exchange (Estimated usage 1 per year)		(Inactive)
	Part Number: 057CA108-7X	1	No Bid
3 (C)	Specified Items- (For Eaton W230S Gear Ratio 5.38)		
4 (A)	Navistar International Differential Components Parts (For Models Listed Below)		
а	Percent of discount offered		Cost + 20%
b	Products Identification (Manufacturer)		Navistar
C	Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Cost
d	Price Schedule Number		Not Specified
e	Date of Price Schedule		Not Specified
f	Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based: (i.e.		Not opcomed
	distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)		Cost
g	Warranty		12 Months
9	The state of the s		
4 (B)	Manufacturer and Model Number: Navistar International N400		
	New Assembly (Estimated usage 1 per year) 1665235C92	1	\$4,094.73 + 20% = \$4,913.68
	Rebuilt Exchange Estimated usage 1 per year) MN400F511	1	(Inactive) No Bid
4 (C)	Specified Items- (Navistar International N400)		
5 (D)	Differential Component Parts & Rebuilt Exchange Units		
A (D)	Regular Labor and Service Rate to Repair and Overhaul Per		
^	Hour		\$100.00
В	Expedited/Shop Labor and Service Rate for Removal Repair		ψ100.00
Ь	and Re-Installation of Units on Vehicles		\$100.00
	and the installation of critic on veriloids		Ψ100.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		2% 10 days
	Parts and Service Facilities Name:		Grande Truck Center
			4562 IH 10 East, San Antonio,
	Parts and Service Facilities Address:		Texas 78219