

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017 For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment 6100008940 LD			Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 1	Local Bid 2	Local Bid 3
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	Tuttle Motor Company 509 Ave H, Poteet, TX 78065 830-742-3515	Holt Texas, LTD. 5665 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111	C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment 13250 Lookout Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233 210-657-3511	The Akana Group Inc. 1701 W NW Highway, Ste. 100 Grapevine, TX 78051 571-229-6843	Sageline Inc. 1300 W. University Ave. Georgetown, TX 78628 512-930-4054	Ag-Pro Texas 3030 N. Austin Seguin, TX 78155 830-379-5477	Alamo Group (TX) Inc. 1502 E Walnut Street Seguin, TX 78155	DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250	DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250	DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250
1	4x4 Utility Tractor: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	14	\$62,480.00 \$874,720.00 Case Farmall 110A case IHFPPT Tier 4B/Final 110 Engine HP 90 PTO HP 2 Yr./2000 Hrs. Whichever comes First	NAS \$56,500.00 \$791,000.00 Massey Ferguson 5711 Agco Power 4 Cyl Max Engine HP 110	No Bid	\$64,236.35 \$899,308.90 John Deere 5115M Utility Tractor John Deere PowerTech Diesel Engine 2 Years/2000 Hours Factory Warranty	No Bid	\$63,250.00 \$885,500.00 John Deere 5115M John Deere Power Tech PWL 115 HP 2 Years or 2000 Hours	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Compact Tractor with 5 foot Shredder: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	4	No Bid	\$15,250.00 \$61,000.00 Massey Ferguson 1726E and Woods RC5 Shredder 24.0 Rated HP Shibaura 3 Cylinder Liquid Cooled Diesel MF 1726E-24 Month/2000 Hour Factory Warranty Woods RC5 - 1 Year factory Warranty on Cutter/3 Years Warranty on Gearbox Holt Cat	No Bid	\$27,272.70 \$109,090.80 John Deere 3033R Compact Utility Tractor (24PTO HP) Yanmar Diesel Engine 32.2 HP 2 Years/2000 Hours Factory Warranty	No Bid	\$22,875.00 \$91,500.00 John Deere 3033R/John Deere MX5 Yanmar - 3TNV88C - MJT 33 HP 3033R - 2 yrs. or 2000 Hrs. / MX5 - 1 Year - Gearbox 5 Years	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Deleted:											

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017			Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 1	Local Bid 2	Local Bid 3
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment			Tuttle Motor Company	Holt Texas, LTD.	C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment	The Akana Group Inc.	Sageline Inc.	Ag-Pro Texas	Alamo Group (TX) Inc.	DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company
6100008940 LD			509 Ave H,	5665 S.E. Loop 410	13250 Lookout Rd.	1701 W NW Highway, Ste. 100	1300 W. University Ave.	3030 N. Austin	1502 E Walnut Street	11002 Bandera Rd.	11002 Bandera Rd.	11002 Bandera Rd.
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	Poteet, TX 78065 830-742-3515	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111	San Antonio, TX 78233 210-657-3511	Grapevine, TX 78051 571-229-6843	Georgetown, TX 78628 512-930-4054	Seguin, TX 78155 830-379-5477	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio, TX 78250	San Antonio, TX 78250	San Antonio, TX 78250
4	Single Operator Grounds Sprayer: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$26,721.80 \$26,721.80 Smithco Spray Star 1754 Smithco 1754, 31 HP 2 Yr. C&M Golf & Grounds 13250 Lookout Rd., San Antonio, TX 78233 30 Days	NAS \$9,026.04 \$9,026.04 Frontier LS1125 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer - Attachment Only NA 2 Years/2000 Hours Factory Warranty Not Provided Not Provided 45 days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	15' Ft Batwing Mower Deck: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	20	\$15,495.00 \$309,900.00 Rhino 4155	NAS \$12,500.00 \$250,000.00 Woods BW180XHD	No Bid	\$19,865.89 \$397,317.80 John Deere CX15 Flex wing Rotary Cutter - 540 RPM - Stump Jumpers - Single Suction Blades	No Bid	NAS \$11,750.00 \$235,000.00 John Deere MX15	\$18,004.00 \$360,080.00 Alamo Industrial - Eagle 15" Flex Wing Rotary Mower	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			1 yr. machine, 2 yrs. Ltd Driveline, 6 yrs. gearbox, 2 yrs. seals Tuttle Motor Company 509 Ave H, Poteet, TX 78065 45 Days	1 Year Factory Warranty on Machine/ 6 Year on Gearbox Warranty Holt Cat 5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 60 Days		2 Years/2000 Hours Factory Warranty Not Provided Not Provided 45 days		1 Year / 5 Years Gearbox Ag-Pro 3030 N. Austin, Seguin, TX 78155 180 Days	Mower warranty - 1 Year Limited and Gearbox warranty - 5 Year Limited H & V Equipment Services Inc. 3307 S East loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 120 Days			

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017			Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 1	Local Bid 2	Local Bid 3
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment			Tuttle Motor Company	Holt Texas, LTD.	C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment	The Akana Group Inc.	Sageline Inc.	Ag-Pro Texas	Alamo Group (TX) Inc.	DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company
6100008940 LD			509 Ave H,	5665 S.E. Loop 410	13250 Lookout Rd.	1701 W NW Highway, Ste. 100	1300 W. University Ave.	3030 N. Austin	1502 E Walnut Street	11002 Bandera Rd.	11002 Bandera Rd.	11002 Bandera Rd.
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	Poteet, TX 78065 830-742-3515	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111	San Antonio, TX 78233 210-657-3511	Grapevine, TX 78051 571-229-6843	Georgetown, TX 78628 512-930-4054	Seguin, TX 78155 830-379-5477	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio, TX 78250	San Antonio, TX 78250	San Antonio, TX 78250
6	84" inch Mower Deck: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	2	No Bid	NAS \$5,700.00 \$11,400.00 Woods BB8400X	No Bid	\$9,959.16 \$19,918.32 2017 Bush Hog 327	No Bid	NAS \$7,150.00 \$14,300.00 Brown 684	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
				1 Year Factory Warranty on Machine/ 6 Year on Gearbox Warranty Holt Cat		2 Years/2000 Hours Factory Warranty		1 Year / 90 Days on Gearbox				
				5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 60 Days		Not Provided 45 days		Ag-Pro 3030 N. Austin, Seguin, TX 78155 180 Days				
7	52" Zero Turn Mowers- GASOLINE Engines: Price Each: Total: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,909.36 \$23,728.08	\$6,459.00 \$19,377.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,974.13 \$26,922.39 1% \$26,653.17	\$8,623.46 \$25,870.38 1% \$25,611.68	\$9,395.27 \$28,185.81 1% \$27,903.95
						John Deere Z915E Commercial ZTrak	Bad Boy Outlaw 54" B8054ZT740			Exmark LZS740AKC524A2	Gravely, Pro-Turn 252 992268	Gravely, Pro-Turn 452 992273
						Not Provided	747cc Kohler Confidant 25HP			Kohler Command ECV 740 EFI, 25HP	Kawasaki FX850V, 27 HP	Kawasaki FX850V 27 HP
						2 Years/2000 Hours Factory Warranty	Defects in material or workmanship 2 years			5 Year or 1250 Hours, First 2 years no hour limited	2 Years	3 Years
						Not Provided	Texas Tractor Country			DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company
						Not Provided	1175 FM 306, New Braunfels, TX 78130			11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250	11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250	11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250
						45 days	30 Days			45 Days	45 Days	45 Days

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017			Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 1	Local Bid 2	Local Bid 3
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment			Tuttle Motor Company	Holt Texas, LTD.	C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment	The Akana Group Inc.	Sagline Inc.	Ag-Pro Texas	Alamo Group (TX) Inc.	DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company	DeWinnie Equipment Company
6100008940 LD			509 Ave H,	5665 S.E. Loop 410	13250 Lookout Rd.	1701 W NW Highway, Ste. 100	1300 W. University Ave.	3030 N. Austin	1502 E Walnut Street	11002 Bandera Rd.	11002 Bandera Rd.	11002 Bandera Rd.
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	Poteet, TX 78065 830-742-3515	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111	San Antonio, TX 78233 210-657-3511	Grapevine, TX 78051 571-229-6843	Georgetown, TX 78628 512-930-4054	Seguin, TX 78155 830-379-5477	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio, TX 78250	San Antonio, TX 78250	San Antonio, TX 78250
8	60" Zero Turn Mowers (Diesel): Price Each: Total: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$19,500.25 \$234,003.00	\$11,899.00 \$142,788.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12,992.93 \$155,915.16 1% \$154,356.01 8% \$11,568.01 Exmark, LZS902DKU605A1 Kubota Diesel, D902 25HP 2 Years Not Provided Not Provided 45 days	\$12,992.93 \$155,915.16 1% \$154,356.01 8% \$11,568.01 Exmark, LZS902DKU605A1 Kubota Diesel, D902 25HP 2 Years Not Provided Not Provided 45 Days	\$12,992.93 \$155,915.16 1% \$154,356.01 8% \$11,568.01 Exmark, LZS902DKU605A1 Kubota Diesel, D902 25HP 2 Years Not Provided Not Provided 45 Days
9	60" Zero Turn Mowers (Gasoline): Price Each: Total: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,132.63 \$32,530.52	\$6,559.00 \$26,236.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,796.83 \$39,187.32 1% \$38,795.45 48% \$12,559.45 Exmark, LZS749AKC604A1 Kohler Command ECV 749 EFI, 26.5HP 5 Year or 1250 Hours, First 2 years no hour limited	\$8,804.97 \$35,219.88 1% \$34,867.68 33% \$8,631.68 Gravely, Pro-Turn 260 992269 Kawasaki FX850V, 27 HP 2 Years	\$10,094.45 \$40,377.80 1% \$39,974.02 52% \$13,738.02 Gravely Pro-Turn 460 992274 Kawasaki FX921V, 31 HP 3 Years

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017 For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment 6100008940 LD			Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 1	Local Bid 2	Local Bid 3
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	Tuttle Motor Company 509 Ave H, Poteet, TX 78065 830-742-3515	Holt Texas, LTD. 5665 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111	C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment 13250 Lookout Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233 210-657-3511	The Akana Group Inc. 1701 W NW Highway, Ste. 100 Grapevine, TX 78051 571-229-6843	Sageline Inc. 1300 W. University Ave. Georgetown, TX 78628 512-930-4054	Ag-Pro Texas 3030 N. Austin Seguin, TX 78155 830-379-5477	Alamo Group (TX) Inc. 1502 E Walnut Street Seguin, TX 78155	DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250	DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250	DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250
10	3 Wheeled Infield Tractor w/ Attachments: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Payment Terms:	3	No Bid	No Bid	\$17,422.30 \$52,266.90 Smithco Sand Star 1 PN# 45-001 Vanguard 16 HP/12kW OHV Gasoline 2 Years C&M Golf & Grounds 13250 Lookout Rd., San Antonio, TX 78233 30 Days Net 30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	1% - 10 Days	1% - 10 Days	1% - 10 Days

Item 3 was deleted and will be rebid at a later date.

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017			Local Bid 4	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local Bid 2	Non-Local Bid 3	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Alt 1	Non-Local Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment			DeWinnie Equipment Company	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	Moridge Manufacturing, Inc.	Professional Turf Products	Professional Turf Products	Sageline Inc.
6100008940 LD			11002 Bandera Rd.	1900 W IH10	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	105 S Old Hwy 81	9468 Selma Parkway	9468 Selma Parkway	1300 W. University Ave.
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	San Antonio, TX 78250	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	Moundridge, KS 67107	Selma, TX 78154	Selma, TX 78154	Georgetown, TX 78628
1	4x4 Utility Tractor: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	14	No Bid	\$66,537.00 \$931,518.00 Kubota M6-111SHC Kubota V3800 Tier 4 DEV 106.8 Net HP 24 Mos/2000 Hours Whichever Occurs First, Powertrain 36 Mos/3000 WOF Ewald Kubota 1900 W IH10, Seguin, TX 78155 60 Days	No Bid	No Bid	NAS \$60,764.71 \$850,705.94 Kioti PX1153 PCB Daedong DL03-LEA07 110 HP One Year 2000 Hrs. to include all required Under 4.2.3 H & V Equipment Services 3307 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 45 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Compact Tractor with 5 foot Shredder: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	4	No Bid	\$22,949.00 \$91,796.00 Kubota L2501 Kubota D1703 23.9 HP 24 Mos/1500 Hours Whichever Occurs First, PT 36 Mos/2000 WOF Ewald Kubota 1900 W IH10, Seguin, TX 78155 60 Days	\$17,483.53 \$69,934.12 Kioti CK 2610 HST ROPS Daedong 3A165LWM-V 24.5 HP 1 Year 2000 Hours to include all required Under 4.2.3 H & V Equipment Services 3307 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 45 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Deleted:										

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017 For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment 6100008940 LD			Local Bid 4	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local Bid 2	Non-Local Bid 3	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Alt 1	Non-Local Bid 2
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78250	Ewald Kubota 1900 W IH10 Seguin, TX 78155	H & V Equipment 3307 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio TX 78222	H & V Equipment 3307 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio TX 78222	H & V Equipment 3307 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio TX 78222	Mordige Manufacturing, Inc. 105 S Old Hwy 81 Moundridge, KS 67107	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154	Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway Selma, TX 78154	Sageline Inc. 1300 W. University Ave. Georgetown, TX 78628
4	Single Operator Grounds Sprayer: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$31,008.66 \$31,008.66 Toro MP 1750 (Toro 41188) Kohler, 27 HP 2 years or 1500 hours whichever occurs first Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154 15-30 Days	No Bid	No Bid
5	15' Ft Batwing Mower Deck: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	20	No Bid	\$16,299.00 \$325,980.00 Rhino 4150 1 Yr. Ewald Kubota 1900 W IH10, Seguin, TX 78155 45 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017			Local Bid 4	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local Bid 2	Non-Local Bid 3	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Alt 1	Non-Local Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment			DeWinnie Equipment Company	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	Mordige Manufacturing, Inc.	Professional Turf Products	Professional Turf Products	Sageline Inc.
6100008940 LD			11002 Bandera Rd.	1900 W IH10	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	105 S Old Hwy 81	9468 Selma Parkway	9468 Selma Parkway	1300 W. University Ave. Georgetown, TX 78628
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	San Antonio, TX 78250	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	Moundridge, KS 67107	Selma, TX 78154	Selma, TX 78154	San Antonio, TX 78250
6	84" inch Mower Deck: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	2	No Bid	NAS \$9,300.00 \$18,600.00 Rhino 484	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	52" Zero Turn Mowers- GASOLINE Engines: Price Each: Total: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	3	\$7,564.00 \$22,692.00 1% \$22,465.08 16% \$3,088.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,487.00 \$25,461.00	\$8,246.23 \$24,738.69	\$7,244.16 \$21,732.48	\$6,999.00 \$20,997.00
			Cub Pro Z 554L				Grasshopper 225/52	Toro 74906	Toro 74955	Bad Boy Outlaw Extreme 54" B8054FX850	852cc Kawasaki FX 27 HP
			Kohler Command ECV 749 EFI, 26.5HP				Kohler Command Pro Model CH742, 747cc, Horizontal Crankshaft, 25HP	Kohler 25 HP	25 HP Kohler Command Pro W/52" Turbo Force Deck	Not Provided	Defects in material or workmanship 2 years
			DeWinnie Equipment Company				DeWinnie Equipment	Professional Turf Products	Professional Turf Products	Texas Tractor Country	
			11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250				11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250	9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154	9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154	9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154	1175 FM 306, New Braunfels, TX 78130
			45 Days				30 Days	15-30 Days	Not Provided	Not Provided	30 Days

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017			Local Bid 4	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local Bid 2	Non-Local Bid 3	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Alt 1	Non-Local Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment			DeWinnie Equipment Company	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	Mordige Manufacturing, Inc.	Professional Turf Products	Professional Turf Products	Sageline Inc.
6100008940 LD			11002 Bandera Rd.	1900 W IH10	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	105 S Old Hwy 81	9468 Selma Parkway	9468 Selma Parkway	1300 W. University Ave.
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	San Antonio, TX 78250	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	Moundridge, KS 67107	Selma, TX 78154	Selma, TX 78154	Georgetown, TX 78628
8	60" Zero Turn Mowers (Diesel): Price Each: Total: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	12	\$12,992.93 \$155,915.16 1% \$154,356.01 8% \$11,568.01 Exmark, LZS902DKU605A1 Kubota Diesel, D902 25HP 2 Years DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 45 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11,997.00 \$143,964.00 Grasshopper 325D/61 Kubota D902, 898cc, Cast-Iron Block, 3-Cylinder, Horizontal Crankshaft, 25HP 5 Years or 1,250 hours, first 3 years no hour limitation DeWinnie Equipment 11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 30 Days	\$12,314.36 \$147,772.32 Toro 74267 Kubota 25 HP Engine 2 Years Product 4 Yrs. or 1,200 Hours whichever occurs first Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154 15-30 Days	No Bid	\$13,100.00 \$157,200.00 Bad Boy Diesel 61" BBA6135PK 1500cc Perkins LC Diesel 35 HP Defects in material or workmanship 2 years Texas Tractor Country 1175 FM 306, New Braunfels, TX 78130 30 Days
9	60" Zero Turn Mowers (Gasoline): Price Each: Total: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery:	4	\$8,244.00 \$32,976.00 1% \$32,646.24 24% \$6,410.24 Cub Pro Z 560L Kawasaki FX850V, 27 HP 3 Years DeWinnie Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 45 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,697.00 \$34,788.00 Grasshopper 329B/61 Vanguard Big Block Model 5424, 895cc, Aluminum Block, V-Twin, Horizontal Crankshaft, 29HP 5 Years or 1,250 hours, first 3 years no hour limitation DeWinnie Equipment 11002 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 30 Days	\$8,482.78 \$33,931.12 Toro 74915 Kohler 25 HP Engine 3 yrs., rest 5 yrs. or 1500 hours whichever occurs first Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154 15-30 Days	\$7,846.16 \$31,384.64 Toro 74958 25 HP Kohler Command Pro EFI W/ 60" Turbo Force Deck Not Provided Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154 Not Provided	\$7,299.00 \$29,196.00 Bad Boy Outlaw Extreme 61" B8061FX850 852cc Kawasaki FX 27 HP Defects in material or workmanship 2 years Texas Tractor Country 1175 FM 306, New Braunfels, TX 78130 30 Days

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 14, 2017			Local Bid 4	Non-Local	Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local Bid 2	Non-Local Bid 3	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local Alt 1	Non-Local Bid 2
For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tractor and Landscaping Equipment			DeWinnie Equipment Company	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	H & V Equipment	Mordige Manufacturing, Inc.	Professional Turf Products	Professional Turf Products	Sageline Inc.
6100008940 LD			11002 Bandera Rd.	1900 W IH10	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	3307 S.E. Loop 410	105 S Old Hwy 81	9468 Selma Parkway	9468 Selma Parkway	1300 W. University Ave.
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	San Antonio, TX 78250	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	San Antonio TX 78222	Moundridge, KS 67107	Selma, TX 78154	Selma, TX 78154	Georgetown, TX 78628
10	3 Wheeled Infield Tractor w/ Attachments: Price Each: Total: Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Payment Terms:	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22,928.58 \$68,785.74 Toro Sand Pro 3040 (08703) 16 HP 2 years or 1500 hours whichever occurs first Professional Turf Products 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, TX 78154 15-30 Days	No Bid	No Bid
			1% - 10 Days	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30

Item 3 was deleted and will be rebid at a later date.