
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017

For:
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System 

Parts Non-Local Non-Local

Campbell Scientific Inc. Keller America Inc.

6100009333 AJ 815 W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road

Item Description Quantity

Logan,                                       

UT  84321                                

435-227-9532

Newport News,                                       

VA  23606                                        

757-596-6680

1

9080-18 18' WOOD ARM ASSEMBLY– Brand: 

Linear/Osco 15

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

2

9080-25 REPLACEMENT 25 ft WOOD 

WISHBONE ARM ASSEMBLY– Brand: 

Linear/Osco 8

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

3

5830-03 GATE ARM LED BEACON– Brand: 

Chapel Hill Manufacturing 16

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

4

6951-01 2" DIAMETER GALVANIZED FLOAT 

TUBE– Brand: Omega 10

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

5

6600-01 ADDITIONAL SUBMERSIBLE CABLE 

– Brand: Druck, Inc. 30

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

6

6640-01 ADDITIONAL SUBMERSIBLE CABLE 

– Brand: Keller America 15

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

7

5512-00    WATTMETER; 20-1000 MHz, 50 

Ohm – Brand: Telwave 1

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)
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8

5512-01    CARRYING CASE FOR 

WATTMETER – Brand: Telwave 1

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

9

5515-00    VHF ANTENNA ANALYZER – 

Brand: MFJ Enterprises 1

Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

10

6640-15    PRESSURE TRANSDUCER 

INTERFACE – Brand: Keller America  5

Net Unit Price No Bid $612.50

Extended Price $3,062.50

Manufacturer Name Keller America Inc

Product No 0507.33507.081308.02
Warranty (# of years) 2 yrs

11

31330  Surge Protection Kit, Type N to BNC, 

100-512MHz, 18 inches – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 25

Net Unit Price $207.00 No Bid

Extended Price $5,175.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31330

Warranty (# of years)

12

MHBDC5800/ SPECIAL-MISC   VHF Omni 

Antenna Includes MBC mounting hardware – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 25

Net Unit Price $80.73 No Bid

Extended Price $2,018.25

Manufacturer Name PCTEL

Product No MHBDC8500

Warranty (# of years)

13

MYA1503KN/ SPECIAL-MISC   VHF 

Directional Antenna Includes mounting 

hardware – Brand: Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $108.86 No Bid

Extended Price $1,088.60

Manufacturer Name

Product No MYA1503KN

Warranty (# of years)

14

14221     900MHz 3dBd Omni Antenna w/Type 

N Female & Mounting Hardware – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $144.15 No Bid

Extended Price $1,441.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 14221

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017

For:
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System 

Parts Non-Local Non-Local

Campbell Scientific Inc. Keller America Inc.

6100009333 AJ 815 W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road

Item Description Quantity

Logan,                                       

UT  84321                                

435-227-9532

Newport News,                                       

VA  23606                                        

757-596-6680

15

14201    900MHz 9dBd Yagi Antenna w/Type N 

Female & Mounting Hardware – Brand: 

Campbell 10

Net Unit Price $213.90 No Bid

Extended Price $2,139.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 14201

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

16

31314   Surge Protection Kit, Type N to 

RPSMA, 700-2700MHz, 18 inches – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 15

Net Unit Price $199.95 No Bid

Extended Price $2,999.25

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31314

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

17

31182    27dBi GPS Antenna 3V Magnetic 

Mount w/SMA Connector, 16ft Cable – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $22.32 No Bid

Extended Price $223.20

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31182

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

18

CM235/17959  Magnetic Mounting Stand – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $44.64 No Bid

Extended Price $446.40

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 17959

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

19

32262    4G/3G Omni 2dBd Antenna w/Type N 

Female & CSI Mounting Hardware – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $83.70 No Bid

Extended Price $837.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32262

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

20

31317    Surge Protection Kit, Type N to SMA, 

700-2700MHz, 18 inches – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $199.95 No Bid

Extended Price $1,999.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31317

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

21

SPECIAL-MISC  12' LMR195 N to N – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $42.00 No Bid

Extended Price $420.00

Manufacturer Name

Product No
Warranty (# of years)
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22

SPECIAL-MISC   20' LMR195 N to N RFACE – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 25

Net Unit Price $53.50 No Bid

Extended Price $3,837.50

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

23

CCFC-R2/32494-1       CSC Outdoor 

Observation & Surveillance Field Camera (-40 

to +60C) -R2 w/RS-232 Comms – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 20

Net Unit Price $2,464.50 No Bid

Extended Price $49,290.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32494-1

Warranty (# of years) 2 yr

24

18549   CC Camera or PWD22 Mounting Kit – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 20

Net Unit Price $42.78 No Bid

Extended Price $855.60

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 18549

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

25

CCFCCBL1-L12-PT/ 32495-20    CCFC Power 

& I/O Cable 12ft per cable -PT w/Tinned Wires 

– Brand: Campbell Scientific 20

Net Unit Price $164.40 No Bid

Extended Price $3,288.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32495-20

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

26

CCFCCBL2-L12/ 32496-14     CCFC RJ45 

Environmental Ethernet Cable 12ft per cable – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 2

Net Unit Price $266.52 No Bid

Extended Price $533.04

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32496-14

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

27

28033    Ethernet ESP-100-POE In-line Surge 

Protection – Brand: Campbell Scientific 2

Net Unit Price $33.00 No Bid

Extended Price $66.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28033

Warranty (# of years) .49 yr

28

CR6-NA-ST-SW/ 28385-5    Measurement & 

Control Datalogger -NA No Additional Coms -

ST -40 to +70C

-SW Standard 3yr Warranty – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 

15

Net Unit Price $1,813.50 No Bid

Extended Price $27,202.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28385-5
Warranty (# of years) 3 yr
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29

CR6-RF407-ST-SW/ 28385-14     

Measurement & Control Datalogger -RF407 

w/900MHz Radio -ST -40 to +70C; -SW 

Standard 3yr Warranty – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 20

Net Unit Price $2,087.85 No Bid

Extended Price $41,757.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28385-14

Warranty (# of years) 3 yr

30

CR310-NA/ 31968-1    Datalogger (-40 to 

+70C) -NA No Additional Coms – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 6

Net Unit Price $875.00 No Bid

Extended Price $5,250.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31968-1

Warranty (# of years) 3 yr

31

CR310-RF407/ 31968-2  Datalogger (-40 to 

+70C) -RF407 w/900MHz Radio – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $1,004.40 No Bid

Extended Price $10,044.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31968-2

Warranty (# of years) 3 yr

32

18823    Universal Backplate for ENC14/16; 1 

inch-on- center hole grid – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 20

Net Unit Price $30.13 No Bid

Extended Price $602.60

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 18823

Warranty (# of years)

33

21106-20/ RF500M-AL    Radio Modem -ST -

25 to +50C -SW Standard 1yr Warranty -AL 

ALERT Dual Mode OS -J1 Jumper for 

RF31x/32x – Brand: Campbell Scientific 20

Net Unit Price $409.20 No Bid

Extended Price $8,184.00

Manufacturer Name 21106-20

Product No 21106-20

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

34

14291    Field Power Cable 12Vdc Plug to 

Pigtail, 2ft – Brand: Campbell Scientific 5

Net Unit Price $16.00 No Bid

Extended Price $80.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 14291

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

35

AL200/28817    ALERT2 Encoder, Modulator & 

Sensor Interface (-40 to +60C) – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $553.35 No Bid

Extended Price $5,533.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28817

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr
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36

SC12/16675    Robust CS I/O Cable, 2ft – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $14.88 No Bid

Extended Price $148.80

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 16675

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

37

18663    Null Modem Cable 9-Pin Male to Male, 

1ft – Brand: Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $14.88 No Bid

Extended Price $148.80

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 18663

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

38

RV50-NA/31886-1    RV50 Sierra Wireless 

Airlink 4G Industrial LTE Cellular Gateway – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific  10

Net Unit Price $571.95 No Bid

Extended Price $5,719.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31886-1

Warranty (# of years) 3 yr

39

32252    RV50 Mounting Kit – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific  10

Net Unit Price $23.25 No Bid

Extended Price $232.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32252

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

40

SPECIAL-COM      ALERT2 Repeater with RS-

232 output Dual radios Custom enclosure – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 2

Net Unit Price $8,131.43 No Bid

Extended Price $16,262.86

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

41

SPECIAL-COM      ALERT2 Field Decoder – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 2

Net Unit Price $2,850.00 No Bid

Extended Price $5,700.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

42

SP20-PT-SM/ 10893-1   20W Solar Panel, 15ft 

Cable -PT w/Tinned Wires -SM Std Mounting 

Kit – Brand: Campbell Scientific 15

Net Unit Price $278.07 No Bid

Extended Price $4,171.05

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 10893-1

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

43

SP50-L15-PT/ 31276-39    50W Solar Panel 

15ft cable per SP50 -PT w/Tinned Wires – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 20

Net Unit Price $598.65 No Bid

Extended Price $11,973.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31276-39

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr
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44

29796-US/ 29796-1    Power Supply 24Vdc 

1.67A Output, 100-240Vac 1A Input, 5ft Cable -

US US & Canada Plug – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific   5

Net Unit Price $30.00 No Bid

Extended Price $150.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 29796-1

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

45

SPECIAL-POWER     Crydom DRA1MPDC3B 

NC SPST SSR – Brand: Campbell Scientific 10

Net Unit Price $69.94 No Bid

Extended Price $699.40

Manufacturer Name Crydom

Product No DRA1MPDC3B

Warranty (# of years)

46

28870     Ritron DTX-145 VHF Radio 

Programmed for ???.???MHz (136-174MHz)– 

Brand: Campbell Scientific  40

Net Unit Price $355.50 No Bid

Extended Price $14,220.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28784

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

47

SPECIAL-COM    Ritron DTX-145 data cable 

for use with HSE controller RFACE – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 40

Net Unit Price $31.50 No Bid

Extended Price $1,260.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No

Special-COM, Ritron to 

HSE

Warranty (# of years)

48

29291    RF320-Series Ritron Radio to AL200 

Cable, 12 inches – Brand: Campbell Scientific  40

Net Unit Price $58.50 No Bid

Extended Price $2,340.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 29291

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

49

28823    Ritron mounting bracket – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 40

Net Unit Price $22.29 No Bid

Extended Price $891.60

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28823

Warranty (# of years)

50

32043     Maxon SD-125EL V2 VHF Radio 

(148-174MHz) Programmed for ???.???MHx – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 15

Net Unit Price $232.50 No Bid

Extended Price $3,487.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32043

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr
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51

31924    SUB MAXON SD-125E V2 RADIO 

DATA CABLE, 15 INCHES – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 15

Net Unit Price $59.85 No Bid

Extended Price $897.75

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31924

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

52

21104   FAB MAXON RADIO MOUNTING 

BRACKET FOR 1 INCH GRID MOUNTING – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific 15

Net Unit Price $24.91 No Bid

Extended Price $373.65

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 21104

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

53

SPECIAL-COM    Maxon SD-125EL V2 data 

cable for use with HSE controller – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific  15

Net Unit Price $32.55 No Bid

Extended Price $488.25

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No

Special-COM Maxon to 

HSE

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

54

CS451-33-SA-14-SN/28790-1107  Pressure 

Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel; -

33 w/33ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1% Accuracy; -

14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN w/Standard Nose 

Cone – Brand: Campbell Scientific 6

Net Unit Price $784.55 No Bid

Extended Price $4,707.30

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28790-1107

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

55

CS451-75-SA-14-SN/28790-663    Pressure 

Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel; -

75 w/75ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1% Accuracy; -

14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN w/Standard Nose 

Cone – Brand: Campbell Scientific  2

Net Unit Price $841.25 No Bid

Extended Price $1,682.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28790-663

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

56

CS451-100-SA-14-SN/28790-670     Pressure 

Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel; -

100 w/100ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1% 

Accuracy; -14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN 

w/Standard Nose Cone – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $875.00 No Bid

Extended Price $875.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28790-670

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017

For:
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System 

Parts Non-Local Non-Local

Campbell Scientific Inc. Keller America Inc.

6100009333 AJ 815 W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road

Item Description Quantity

Logan,                                       

UT  84321                                

435-227-9532

Newport News,                                       

VA  23606                                        

757-596-6680

57

CS451-200-SA-14-SN/28790-881    Pressure 

Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel; -

200 w/200ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1% 

Accuracy; -14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN 

w/Standard Nose Cone – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $1,010.00 No Bid

Extended Price $1,010.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 28790-881

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

58

CS475A-L100-PT/32873-3   Radar Water 

Level Sensor, 114.8ft Max Distance (-40 to 

+80C) 100ft cable per sensor; -PT w/Tinned 

Wires – Brand: Campbell Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $2,366.00 No Bid

Extended Price $2,366.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32873-3

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

59

CS475A-L200-PT/32873-18    Radar Water 

Level Sensor, 114.8ft Max Distance (-40 to 

+80C) 200ft cable per sensor; -PT w/Tinned 

Wires – Brand: Campbell Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $2,437.00 No Bid

Extended Price $2,437.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 32873-18

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

60

TE525WS-L20-PT/10868-86     Texas 

Electronics Rain Gage 0.01 inch (0.254mm) 

Tip w/8 inch Orifice 20ft cable per sensor; -PT 

w/Tinned Wires – Brand: Campbell Scientific  3

Net Unit Price $404.60 No Bid

Extended Price $1,213.80

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 10868-86

Warranty (# of years) 3 yr

61

CM270/20621    TE525, TE525MM, or 

TE525WS Rain Gage Mounting Kit – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific  4

Net Unit Price $110.00 No Bid

Extended Price $440.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 20621

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

62

SPECIAL-SENSOR   EML SBS500; P-780-

404; 0.01 inch resolution; 10 inch orifice; 20ft 

cable per sensor

Tinned wires – Brand: Campbell Scientific 

 
 5

Net Unit Price $900.00 No Bid

Extended Price $4,500.00

Manufacturer Name EML

Product No SBS500

Warranty (# of years)
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63

SPECIAL-SENSOR    Levelling base for EML 

SBS500 tipping bucket rain gauge – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific  6

Net Unit Price $145.00 No Bid

Extended Price $870.00

Manufacturer Name EML

Product No SBS500 Base

Warranty (# of years)

64

30408      Datalogger recalibration with 

documentation – Brand: Campbell Scientific  1

Net Unit Price $270.00 No Bid

Extended Price $270.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 30408

Warranty (# of years)

65

31971     CR300 Recalibration with 

documentation – Brand: Campbell Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $210.00 No Bid

Extended Price $210.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31971

Warranty (# of years)

66

25425     CS451 Recalibration with 

documentation – Brand: Campbell Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $100.00 No Bid

Extended Price $100.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 25425

Warranty (# of years)

67

27442     CS451 Recabling service – Brand: 

Campbell Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $87.99 No Bid

Extended Price $87.99

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 27442

Warranty (# of years)

68

LOGGERNETADM-D/31048-1    Admin 

Datalogger Support Software (Server and 

Clients); -D Download Only – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 1

Net Unit Price $1,175.00 No Bid

Extended Price $1,175.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31048-1

Warranty (# of years)

69

SPECIAL-SYS       Flasher Master; 2-Way 

ALERT2 communications – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 5

Net Unit Price $13,710.00 No Bid

Extended Price $68,550.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No Special-SYS FLSH MST

Warranty (# of years)

70

SPECIAL-SYS      Flasher Remote; 2-Way 

ALERT2 communications – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific  5

Net Unit Price $11,500.00 No Bid

Extended Price $57,500.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No Special-SYS FLSH REM
Warranty (# of years)
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71

SPECIAL-SYS     Flasher Master; 1-way 

ALERT2 communications; 2-way 900 MHz 

communications – Brand: Campbell Scientific 15

Net Unit Price $4,511.97 No Bid

Extended Price $67,679.55

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

72

SPECIAL-SYS     Flasher Remote; 2-way 900 

MHz communications – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 15

Net Unit Price $2,092.50 No Bid

Extended Price $31,387.50

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

73

31206/Special-Sensor     Al200 alert2 , 

Encoder , modulator – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific  5

Net Unit Price $2,525.00 No Bid

Extended Price $12,625.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 31206

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

74

SPECIAL-SENSOR     Key Board / Display for 

Cr1000, with CR6– Brand: Campbell Scientific  5

Net Unit Price $290.00 No Bid

Extended Price $1,450.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

75

13822-41     HS Rain Gage – Brand: Campbell 

Scientific 2

Net Unit Price $1,353.00 No Bid

Extended Price $2,706.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 13822-41

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

76

CM240/20620     Leveling base and mount – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific  2

Net Unit Price $128.00 No Bid

Extended Price $256.00

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 20620

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

77

CS700-L10-PW/8811-60     Rain Gage – 

Brand: Campbell Scientific   3

Net Unit Price $1,908.80 No Bid

Extended Price $5,726.40

Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci

Product No 8811-60

Warranty (# of years) 1 yr

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30

Delivery 60 days 60 days

Estimated Annual Total $514,301.14 $3,062.50

Estimated Annual Award $514,301.14 $3,062.50


