

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries		Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	
6100012951		JF	River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA)	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP	Gonzalez Auto Parts	IBS of Paseo Del Rio	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340 Spring Branch, TX 78070	World Tire Unlimited
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage	San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	San Antonio, TX 78216	Laredo, TX 78041	San Antonio, TX 78216	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78070	San Antonio, TX 78216
1	AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered: Brand Name of Batteries Offered:					Johnson Controls Continental		East Penn TRP	East Penn Manufacturing NAPA Batteries	
1	Group: U1-L Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 235 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 25 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	40	RC 25 SLIU1A \$25.95 \$1,038.00 \$6.00 \$240.00 \$1,278.00	25 8223 \$29.59 \$1,183.60 \$9.00 \$360.00 \$1,543.60	30 U1-230 \$51.39 \$2,055.60 \$5.88 \$235.20 \$2,290.80	25 U1-L \$38.00 \$1,520.00 \$6.00 \$240.00 \$1,760.00	250 SP-30 \$31.09 \$1,243.60 \$8.00 \$320.00 \$1,563.60	No Bid	25 8223 \$33.24 \$1,329.60 \$9.00 \$360.00 \$1,689.60	N/A 8221 \$30.91 \$1,236.40 \$10.00 \$400.00 \$1,636.40
2	Group: U1-R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 235 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 25 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	10	RC 25 SLIU1RA \$25.95 \$259.50 \$6.00 \$60.00 \$319.50	25 8224 \$29.59 \$295.90 \$9.00 \$90.00 \$385.90	27 U1R-230 \$51.39 \$513.90 \$5.88 \$35.30 \$572.70	25 U1-R \$39.00 \$390.00 \$6.00 \$60.00 \$450.00	250 SP-30R \$31.09 \$310.90 \$8.00 \$80.00 \$390.90	No Bid	25 8224 \$33.24 \$332.40 \$9.00 \$90.00 \$422.40	N/A 8221R \$30.43 \$304.30 \$10.00 \$100.00 \$404.30
3	Group: 4D Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 1000 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 320 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	15	RC 290 SLI4DA \$113.75 \$1,706.25 \$36.00 \$540.00 \$2,246.25	320 7266 \$135.46 \$2,031.90 \$54.00 \$810.00 \$2,841.90	335 4DS 146.77 \$2,201.55 \$35.30 \$529.50 \$2,731.05	290 4D 139 \$2,085.00 \$45.00 \$675.00 \$2,760.00	1000 4D-XHD \$113.14 \$1,697.10 \$60.00 \$900.00 \$2,597.10	320 BT4DP101 \$186.44 \$2,796.60 \$59.00 \$885.00 \$3,681.60	320 7266 \$144.28 \$2,164.20 \$54.00 \$810.00 \$2,974.20	290 7266 \$176.60 \$2,649.00 \$60.00 \$900.00 \$3,549.00
4	Group: 4DLT Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 810 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 250 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	RC 240 SLI4DLT \$102.00 \$2,040.00 \$36.00 \$720.00 \$2,760.00	250 7251 \$112.46 \$2,249.20 \$36.00 \$720.00 \$2,969.20	235 4DLTHD \$131.23 \$2,624.60 \$35.30 \$706.00 \$3,330.60	185 4DLT \$130.00 \$2,600.00 \$45.00 \$900.00 \$3,500.00	860 4DLT-VHD \$95.54 \$1,910.80 \$60.00 \$1,200.00 \$3,110.80	250 BT4DLTP81 \$151.25 \$3,025.00 \$39.00 \$780.00 \$3,805.00	250 7251 \$123.94 \$2,478.80 \$36.00 \$720.00 \$3,198.80	240 7251 \$149.92 \$2,998.40 \$40.00 \$800.00 \$3,798.40
5	Group: 8D Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 1300 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 435 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	40	RC 440 SLI8DA \$124.75 \$4,990.00 \$48.00 \$1,920.00 \$6,910.00	435 7669 \$158.86 \$6,354.40 \$72.00 \$2,880.00 \$9,234.40	420 8DS \$186.59 \$7,463.60 \$35.30 \$1,412.00 \$8,875.60	380 8D7 \$184.00 \$7,360.00 \$45.00 \$1,800.00 \$9,160.00	1400 8D-MHD \$139.82 \$5,592.80 \$60.00 \$2,400.00 \$7,992.80	435 BT8DP111 \$180.65 \$7,226.40 \$79.00 \$3,160.00 \$10,386.40	435 7271FT \$168.16 \$6,726.40 \$72.00 \$2,880.00 \$9,606.40	325 7269 \$197.90 \$7,916.00 \$80.00 \$3,200.00 \$11,116.00
6	Group: 24 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 525 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 90 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	50	RC 115 SLI24 \$53.50 \$2,675.00 \$12.00 \$600.00 \$3,275.00	115 7524 \$69.42 \$3,471.00 \$18.00 \$900.00 \$4,371.00	113 24S \$70.58 \$3,529.00 \$12.94 \$647.00 \$4,176.00	95 24P \$59.00 \$2,950.00 \$15.00 \$750.00 \$3,700.00	530 M-24 \$47.44 \$2,372.00 \$20.00 \$1,000.00 \$3,372.00	90 BT24P51 \$74.95 \$3,747.50 \$29.00 \$1,450.00 \$5,197.50	120 7524 \$72.75 \$3,637.50 \$18.00 \$900.00 \$4,537.50	115 7524 \$90.93 \$4,546.50 \$20.00 \$1,000.00 \$5,546.50
7	Group: 24 Deep Cycle Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 500 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 120 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	5	RC 130 SLI24MDC \$65.16 \$325.80 \$12.00 \$60.00 \$385.80	120 8240 \$74.75 \$348.75 \$18.00 \$90.00 \$438.75	125 M24DC \$80.31 \$401.55 \$12.94 \$64.70 \$466.25	120 TM24 \$74.00 \$370.00 \$15.00 \$75.00 \$445.00	550 M-24DC \$60.31 \$301.55 \$20.00 \$100.00 \$401.55	No Bid	120 8240 \$74.43 \$372.15 \$18.00 \$90.00 \$462.15	120 8240 \$89.28 \$446.40 \$20.00 \$100.00 \$546.40

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries		Local		Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local	
6100012951		JF		River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA)	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP	Gonzalez Auto Parts (NAPA)	IBS of Paseo Del Rio	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East	San Antonio, TX 78109	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340 Spring Branch, TX 78070	World Tire Unlimited 13080 VS HWY 281 North San Antonio, TX 78216					
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage	San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	San Antonio, TX 78216	Laredo, TX 78041	San Antonio, TX 78216	San Antonio, TX 78216	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78109
8	Group: 24F Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 525 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 80 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	5	RC 80 SLI24FM \$67.50 \$337.50 \$12.00 \$60.00 \$397.50	80 7524F \$75.24 \$376.20 \$18.00 \$90.00 \$466.20	113 24FS \$70.58 \$352.90 \$12.94 \$64.70 \$417.60	90 24FP \$59.00 \$295.00 \$15.00 \$75.00 \$370.00	530 M-24F \$48.48 \$242.40 \$20.00 \$100.00 \$342.40	No Bid	115 7524F \$79.39 \$396.95 \$18.00 \$90.00 \$486.95	115 7524F \$92.98 \$464.90 \$20.00 \$100.00 \$564.90							
9	Group: 26 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 525 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 80 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	RC 80 SLI26 \$45.50 \$910.00 \$12.00 \$240.00 \$1,150.00	80 7526 \$74.14 \$1,482.80 \$18.00 \$360.00 \$1,842.80	85 26S \$66.14 \$1,322.80 \$12.94 \$258.80 \$1,581.60	No Bid	525 MT-26 \$60.89 \$1,217.80 \$20.00 \$400.00 \$1,617.80	No Bid	80 7526 \$81.59 \$1,631.80 \$18.00 \$360.00 \$1,991.80	80 7526 \$99.48 \$1,989.60 \$20.00 \$400.00 \$2,389.60							
10	Group: 26R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 525 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 80 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	15	RC 80 SLI26R \$45.50 \$682.50 \$12.00 \$180.00 \$862.50	80 7526R \$71.23 \$1,068.45 \$18.00 \$270.00 \$1,338.45	85 26RS \$66.14 \$992.10 \$12.94 \$194.10 \$1,186.20	75 26R \$60.00 \$900.00 \$15.00 \$225.00 \$1,125.00	550 MT-26R \$60.94 \$914.10 \$20.00 \$300.00 \$1,214.10	No Bid	80 7526R \$76.67 \$1,150.05 \$18.00 \$270.00 \$1,420.05	80 7526R \$93.33 \$1,399.95 \$20.00 \$300.00 \$1,699.95							
11	Group: 27 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 600 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 120 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	50	RC 140 SLI27 \$61.95 \$3,097.50 \$12.00 \$600.00 \$3,697.50	120 7527 \$66.10 \$3,305.00 \$18.00 \$900.00 \$4,205.00	170 27SDC \$86.36 \$4,318.00 \$12.94 \$647.00 \$4,965.00	140 27CS \$73.00 \$3,650.00 \$15.00 \$750.00 \$4,400.00	700 M-27 \$65.00 \$3,250.00 \$20.00 \$1,000.00 \$4,250.00	120 BT27P71 \$103.96 \$5,198.00 \$29.00 \$1,450.00 \$6,648.00	120 7527 \$76.64 \$3,832.00 \$18.00 \$900.00 \$4,732.00	120 7527 \$95.80 \$4,790.00 \$20.00 \$1,000.00 \$5,790.00							
12	Group: 27 Deep Cycle Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 575 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 160 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	30	RC 175 SLI27MDC \$74.00 \$2,220.00 \$12.00 \$360.00 \$2,580.00	160 8270 \$71.24 \$2,137.20 \$18.00 \$540.00 \$2,677.20	160 M27OC \$92.67 \$2,780.10 \$12.94 \$388.20 \$3,168.30	155 TM27 \$82.00 \$2,460.00 \$15.00 \$450.00 \$2,910.00	675 M-27HDC \$62.20 \$1,866.00 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$2,466.00	No Bid	160 8270 \$76.32 \$2,289.60 \$18.00 \$540.00 \$2,829.60	150 8270 \$95.40 \$2,862.00 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$3,462.00							
13	Group: 31S Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 750 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 180 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	30	RC 175 SLI31SA \$62.50 \$1,875.00 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$2,475.00	180 7236 \$87.99 \$2,639.70 \$27.00 \$810.00 \$3,449.70	180 31C950T \$105.58 \$3,167.40 \$21.18 \$635.40 \$3,802.80	165 31S \$85.00 \$2,550.00 \$26.00 \$780.00 \$3,330.00	1000 M-31SHC \$63.32 \$1,899.60 \$30.00 \$900.00 \$2,799.60	180 BT31572 \$72.99 \$2,189.70 \$29.00 \$870.00 \$3,059.70	180 31-7236 \$69.99 \$2,099.70 \$27.00 \$810.00 \$2,909.70	175 7236 \$121.81 \$3,654.30 \$30.00 \$900.00 \$4,554.30							
14	Group: 34 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 660 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 115 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	RC 110 SLI34 \$60.35 \$1,207.00 \$12.00 \$240.00 \$1,447.00	115 7534 \$72.53 \$1,450.60 \$18.00 \$360.00 \$1,810.60	100 34S \$79.06 \$1,581.20 \$12.94 \$258.80 \$1,840.00	120 34CS \$65.00 \$1,300.00 \$15.00 \$300.00 \$1,600.00	685 M-34HC \$61.26 \$1,225.20 \$20.00 \$400.00 \$1,625.20	No Bid	115 7534 \$75.78 \$1,515.60 \$18.00 \$360.00 \$1,875.60	110 7534 \$94.68 \$1,893.60 \$20.00 \$400.00 \$2,293.60							

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries			Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
6100012951 JF			River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA)	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP	Gonzalez Auto Parts (NAPA)	IBS of Paseo Del Rio	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340	World Tire Unlimited
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage	San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	San Antonio, TX 78216	Laredo, TX 78041	San Antonio, TX 78216	San Antonio, TX 78109	Spring Branch, TX 78070	San Antonio, TX 78216
15	Group: 36R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 650 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 115 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	30	RC 120 SLI36R \$67.70 \$2,031.00 \$12.00 \$360.00 \$2,391.00	130 7536R \$67.95 \$2,038.50 \$18.00 \$540.00 \$2,578.50	130 36RPS \$101.96 \$3,058.80 \$12.94 \$388.20 \$3,447.00	130 36R \$79.00 \$2,370.00 \$15.00 \$450.00 \$2,820.00	650 MT-36R \$73.79 \$2,213.70 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$2,813.70	No Bid	120 7536R \$75.68 \$2,270.40 \$18.00 \$540.00 \$2,810.40	120 7536R \$94.60 \$2,838.00 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$3,438.00
16	Group: 40R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 590 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 105 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	30	RC 105 SLI40RT6M \$63.68 \$1,910.40 \$12.00 \$360.00 \$2,270.40	105 7540R \$65.97 \$1,979.10 \$18.00 \$540.00 \$2,519.10	120 40RPS \$100.49 \$3,014.70 \$12.94 \$388.20 \$3,402.90	120 40RCS \$73.00 \$2,190.00 \$15.00 \$450.00 \$2,640.00	590 MT-40R \$73.22 \$2,196.60 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$2,796.60	No Bid	105 7540R \$74.96 \$2,248.80 \$18.00 \$540.00 \$2,788.80	105 7540R \$93.76 \$2,812.80 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$3,412.80
17	Group: 48 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 700 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 135 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	70	RC 120 SLI48H6M \$74.75 \$5,232.50 \$12.00 \$840.00 \$6,072.50	135 7548 \$79.99 \$5,599.30 \$18.00 \$1,260.00 \$6,859.30	140 48S \$103.34 \$7,233.80 \$12.94 \$905.80 \$8,139.60	130 L3/H4/48CP \$76.00 \$5,320.00 \$15.00 \$1,050.00 \$6,370.00	730 MTP-48/H6-1 \$93.24 \$6,526.80 \$20.00 \$1,400.00 \$7,926.80	No Bid	135 7548 \$85.79 \$6,005.30 \$18.00 \$1,260.00 \$7,265.30	120 7548 \$109.73 \$7,681.10 \$20.00 \$1,400.00 \$9,081.10
18	Group: 49 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 800 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 135 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	70	RC 185 SLI49H8M \$84.25 \$5,897.50 \$12.00 \$840.00 \$6,737.50	185 7549 \$94.25 \$6,597.50 \$18.00 \$1,260.00 \$7,857.50	130 49S \$105.51 \$7,385.70 \$12.94 \$905.80 \$8,291.50	140 L5/H8/49CP \$85.00 \$5,950.00 \$15.00 \$1,050.00 \$7,000.00	850 M-49/H8 \$86.31 \$6,041.70 \$20.00 \$1,400.00 \$7,441.70	No Bid	185 7549 \$94.29 \$6,600.30 \$18.00 \$1,260.00 \$7,860.30	185 7549 \$109.46 \$7,662.20 \$20.00 \$1,400.00 \$9,062.20
19	Group: 51R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 400 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 70 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	RC 70 SLI51R \$43.76 \$875.20 \$12.00 \$240.00 \$1,115.20	70 7551R \$78.62 \$1,572.40 \$18.00 \$360.00 \$1,932.40	75 51RS \$68.08 \$1,361.60 \$12.94 \$258.80 \$1,620.40	70 51RCS \$57.00 \$1,140.00 \$15.00 \$300.00 \$1,440.00	425 M-51R \$54.93 \$1,098.60 \$20.00 \$400.00 \$1,498.60	No Bid	75 7551R \$78.86 \$1,577.20 \$18.00 \$360.00 \$1,937.20	75 7551R \$98.57 \$1,971.40 \$20.00 \$400.00 \$2,371.40
20	Group: 58 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 540 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 75 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	15	RC 85 SLI58 \$47.45 \$711.75 \$12.00 \$180.00 \$891.75	75 7558 \$69.95 \$1,049.25 \$18.00 \$270.00 \$1,319.25	80 58S \$70.78 \$1,061.70 \$12.94 \$194.10 \$1,255.80	80 58CS \$62.00 \$930.00 \$15.00 \$225.00 \$1,155.00	540 MT-58 \$62.87 \$943.05 \$20.00 \$300.00 \$1,243.05	No Bid	75 7558 \$79.65 \$1,194.75 \$18.00 \$270.00 \$1,464.75	75 7558 \$98.57 \$1,478.55 \$20.00 \$300.00 \$1,778.55
21	Group: 58R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 540 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 75 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	60	RC 85 SLI58R \$47.45 \$2,847.00 \$12.00 \$720.00 \$3,567.00	85 7558R \$78.62 \$4,717.20 \$18.00 \$1,080.00 \$5,797.20	80 58RS \$70.78 \$4,246.80 \$12.94 \$776.40 \$5,023.20	100 58RCS \$65.00 \$3,900.00 \$15.00 \$900.00 \$4,800.00	575 MT-58R \$64.72 \$3,883.20 \$20.00 \$1,200.00 \$5,083.20	No Bid	85 7558R \$80.65 \$4,839.00 \$18.00 \$1,080.00 \$5,919.00	85 7558R \$99.56 \$5,973.60 \$20.00 \$1,200.00 \$7,173.60

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries			Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
6100012951 JF			River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA)	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP	Gonzalez Auto Parts (NAPA)	IBS of Paseo Del Rio	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340 Spring Branch, TX 78070	World Tire Unlimited 13080 VS HWY 281 North San Antonio, TX 78216
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage	San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	San Antonio, TX 78216	Laredo, TX 78041	San Antonio, TX 78216	San Antonio, TX 78109	TX 78070	San Antonio, TX 78216
22	Group: 65 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 750 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 150 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	1100	RC 150 SLI65M \$63.44 \$69,784.00 \$12.00 \$13,200.00 \$82,984.00	150 7565 \$78.57 \$86,427.00 \$18.00 \$19,800.00 \$106,227.00	160 65GHR160 \$111.22 \$122,342.00 \$12.94 \$14,234.00 \$136,576.00	130 65P \$69.00 \$75,900.00 \$15.00 \$16,500.00 \$92,400.00	850 M-65HC \$71.64 \$78,804.00 \$20.00 \$22,000.00 \$100,804.00	150 BT65P81 \$97.63 \$107,393.00 \$20.00 \$22,000.00 \$129,393.00	150 7565 \$82.15 \$90,365.00 \$18.00 \$19,800.00 \$110,165.00	150 7565 \$108.93 \$119,823.00 \$20.00 \$22,000.00 \$141,823.00
23	Group: 75 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 525 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 90 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	200	RC 90 SLI75 \$47.60 \$9,520.00 \$12.00 \$2,400.00 \$11,920.00	No Bid	90 75S \$79.41 \$15,882.00 \$12.94 \$2,588.00 \$18,470.00	95 75CS \$70.00 \$14,000.00 \$15.00 \$3,000.00 \$17,000.00	550 M-75 \$58.31 \$11,662.00 \$20.00 \$4,000.00 \$15,662.00	No Bid	90 7575 \$69.75 \$13,950.00 \$18.00 \$3,600.00 \$17,550.00	90 7575 \$90.93 \$18,186.00 \$20.00 \$4,000.00 \$22,186.00
24	Group: 78 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 600 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 105 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	100	RC 115 SLI78 \$49.68 \$4,968.00 \$12.00 \$1,200.00 \$6,168.00	No Bid	110 78S \$81.94 \$8,194.00 \$12.94 \$1,294.00 \$9,488.00	120 78P \$68.00 \$6,800.00 \$15.00 \$1,500.00 \$8,300.00	680 M-78 \$58.71 \$5,871.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$7,871.00	105 BT78P61 \$86.33 \$8,633.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$10,633.00	110 7578 \$74.55 \$7,455.00 \$18.00 \$1,800.00 \$9,255.00	110 7578 \$96.93 \$9,693.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$11,693.00
25	Group: 78 Dual Terminal Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 770 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 120 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	100	RC 115 SLI34/78DT \$57.44 \$5,744.00 \$12.00 \$1,200.00 \$6,944.00	No Bid	115 78DTPS \$100.54 \$10,054.00 \$12.94 \$1,294.00 \$11,348.00	115 34/78CS \$78.00 \$7,800.00 \$15.00 \$1,500.00 \$9,300.00	780 M-78DT \$62.96 \$6,296.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$8,296.00	No Bid	120 843478 \$89.54 \$8,954.00 \$18.00 \$1,800.00 \$10,754.00	115 853478 \$110.67 \$11,067.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$13,067.00
26	Group: 90 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 600 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 100 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	100	RC 90 SLI90T5 \$63.75 \$6,375.00 \$12.00 \$1,200.00 \$7,575.00	No Bid	100 90S \$90.20 \$9,020.00 \$12.94 \$1,294.00 \$10,314.00	96 90/TS/CS \$72.00 \$7,200.00 \$15.00 \$1,500.00 \$8,700.00	600 MTP-90/T5 \$71.07 \$7,107.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$9,107.00	No Bid	100 7590 \$82.38 \$8,238.00 \$18.00 \$1,800.00 \$10,038.00	90 7590 \$102.97 \$10,297.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$12,297.00
27	Group: 94R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 700 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 135 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	60	RC 140 SLI94RH7M \$104.52 \$6,271.20 \$12.00 \$720.00 \$6,991.20	No Bid	145 94RS \$125.32 \$7,519.20 \$12.94 \$776.40 \$8,295.60	130 94RCS \$77.00 \$4,620.00 \$15.00 \$900.00 \$5,520.00	750 M-94R \$74.84 \$4,490.40 \$20.00 \$1,200.00 \$5,690.40	No Bid	140 7594R \$94.51 \$5,670.60 \$18.00 \$1,080.00 \$6,750.60	140 7594R \$121.28 \$7,276.80 \$20.00 \$1,200.00 \$8,476.80
28	Group: 96R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 500 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 90 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	30	RC 90 SLI96R \$67.11 \$2,013.30 \$12.00 \$360.00 \$2,373.30	No Bid	85 96RS \$81.94 \$2,458.20 \$12.94 \$388.20 \$2,846.40	95 96RCS \$71.00 \$2,130.00 \$15.00 \$450.00 \$2,580.00	500 M-96R \$66.55 \$1,996.50 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$2,596.50	No Bid	90 8496R \$81.83 \$2,454.90 \$18.00 \$540.00 \$2,994.90	90 8496R \$102.28 \$3,068.40 \$20.00 \$600.00 \$3,668.40

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries 6100012951			Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage	River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs 6891 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP 8423 Eastern San Antonio, TX 78216	Gonzalez Auto Parts (NAPA) 4220 San Bernando Ave. Laredo, TX 78041	IBS of Paseo Del Rio 902 Chulie Drive San Antonio, TX 78216	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East San Antonio, TX 78109	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340 Spring Branch, TX 78070	World Tire Unlimited 13080 VS HWY 281 North San Antonio, TX 78216	
29	Group: 534B20R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 275 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): N/A Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	100	RC 60 SLI51PAGM \$118.75 \$11,875.00 \$12.00 \$1,200.00 \$13,075.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$60.00 9851P \$134.82 \$13,482.00 \$18.00 \$1,800.00 \$15,282.00	60 9851R \$168.52 \$16,852.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$18,852.00
30	Group: 546B24R Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 325 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): N/A Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	100	RC 60 SLI51PAGM \$118.75 \$11,875.00 \$12.00 \$1,200.00 \$13,075.00	No Bid	70 1324R \$175.38 \$17,538.00 \$12.94 \$1,294.00 \$18,832.00	No Bid	410 MTX-546B2YR \$109.96 \$10,996.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$12,996.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$60.00 9851P \$134.82 \$13,482.00 \$18.00 \$1,800.00 \$15,282.00	60 9851R \$168.52 \$16,852.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$18,852.00
31	Group: XHD31C Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 950 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 185 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	12	RC 175 SLI31SA \$62.50 \$750.00 \$20.00 \$240.00 \$990.00	No Bid	195 31-900CT \$123.58 \$1,482.96 \$21.17 \$254.04 \$1,737.00	190 XHD31C \$80.00 \$960.00 \$26.00 \$312.00 \$1,272.00	1000 M-31SHC \$63.32 \$759.84 \$30.00 \$360.00 \$1,119.84	No Bid	185 7236 \$97.45 \$1,169.40 \$27.00 \$324.00 \$1,493.40	175 7536 \$121.81 \$1,461.72 \$20.00 \$240.00 \$1,701.72	
Overall Total Item Parts 1			\$172,044.90	\$138,374.95	\$255,157.76	\$169,640.00	\$174,930.24	\$140,208.80	\$219,913.40	\$282,145.92	
Overall Total Core Charges Item 1			\$32,880.00	\$34,290.00	\$33,334.14	\$37,167.00	\$51,760.00	\$32,595.00	\$48,834.00	\$54,140.00	
Prompt Payment Discount			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	2% 10 Days	2% 21 Days	
Total After Prompt Payment Discount			\$204,924.90	\$172,664.95	\$288,491.90	\$206,807.00	\$226,690.24	\$172,803.80	\$5,374.95	\$6,725.72	
Total Item 1			\$204,924.90	\$172,664.95	\$288,491.90	\$206,807.00	\$226,690.24	\$172,803.80	\$263,372.45	\$329,560.20	
II	FIRE DEPARTMENT TRUCK BATTERIES Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered: Brand Name of Batteries Offered:					Johnson Controls Continental			East Penn Manufacturing NAPA Batteries		
1	Group: 31p Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 950 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 190 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	100	RC 175 SLI31PA \$62.50 \$6,250.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$8,250.00	190 7237 \$87.99 \$8,799.00 \$27.00 \$2,700.00 \$11,499.00	195 31-901CT \$123.58 \$12,358.00 \$21.17 \$2,117.00 \$14,475.00	190 XHP31A \$79.95 \$7,995.00 \$26.00 \$2,600.00 \$10,595.00	950/1000 31P-MHD / M31PHC \$87.19 / \$63.32 \$8,749 / \$6,332 \$30.00 \$3,000.00 \$11,749.00	190 BT31P91 \$97.20 \$9,720.00 \$29.00 \$2,900.00 \$12,620.00	190 7237 \$97.45 \$9,745.00 \$27.00 \$2,700.00 \$12,445.00	175 7237 \$121.81 \$12,181.00 \$30.00 \$3,000.00 \$15,181.00	
2	Group: 31s Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 950 Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 190 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	1500	RC 175 SLI31SA \$62.50 \$93,750.00 \$20.00 \$30,000.00 \$123,750.00	190 7236 \$87.99 \$131,985.00 \$27.00 \$40,500.00 \$172,485.00	195 31-900CT \$123.58 \$185,370.00 \$21.17 \$31,755.00 \$217,125.00	190 XHD31C \$79.85 \$119,775.00 \$26.00 \$39,000.00 \$158,775.00	1000 M-31SHC \$63.32 \$94,980.00 \$30.00 \$45,000.00 \$139,980.00	190 BT31S91 \$79.99 \$119,985.00 \$29.00 \$43,500.00 \$163,485.00	190 7236 \$97.45 \$146,175.00 \$27.00 \$40,500.00 \$186,675.00	175 7236 \$121.81 \$182,715.00 \$30.00 \$45,000.00 \$227,715.00	
Overall Total Item Parts 2			\$100,000.00	\$140,784.00	\$197,728.00	\$127,770.00	\$103,729.00	\$129,705.00	\$155,920.00	\$194,896.00	
Overall Total Core Charges Item 2			\$32,000.00	\$43,200.00	\$33,872.00	\$41,600.00	\$48,000.00	\$46,400.00	\$43,200.00	\$48,000.00	
Prompt Payment Discount			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	2% 10 Days	2% 21 Days	
Total After Prompt Payment Discount			\$132,000.00	\$183,984.00	\$231,600.00	\$169,370.00	\$151,729.00	\$176,105.00	\$195,137.60	\$238,038.08	
Total Item 2			\$132,000.00	\$183,984.00	\$231,600.00	\$169,370.00	\$151,729.00	\$176,105.00	\$199,120.00	\$242,896.00	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries		Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	
6100012951 JF		River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs 6891 Bandera Rd. San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA) 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP 8423 Eastern San Antonio, TX 78216	Gonzalez Auto Parts (NAPA) 4220 San Bernardo Ave. Laredo, TX 78041	IBS of Paseo Del Rio 902 Chulie Drive San Antonio, TX 78216	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East San Antonio, TX 78109	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340 Spring Branch, TX 78070	World Tire Unlimited 13080 VS HWY 281 North San Antonio, TX 78216	
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage								
III	UTILITY BATTERIES Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered: Brand Name of Batteries Offered:									
1	Group: T105 Volts: 6 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 447 @ 25 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	150	RC 448 SLIGC115 \$80.63 \$12,000.00 \$30.00 \$4,500.00 \$16,500.00	448 8144 \$90.63 \$13,594.50 \$27.00 \$4,050.00 \$17,644.50	448 GC-110 \$127.66 \$19,149.00 \$31.77 \$4,765.50 \$23,914.50	225 T105 \$125.00 \$18,750.00 \$26.00 \$3,900.00 \$22,650.00	447 Min GC2-ECL-UTL \$89.77 \$13,465.50 \$30.00 \$4,500.00 \$17,965.50	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00	447 8144 \$91.90 \$13,785.00 \$27.00 \$4,050.00 \$17,835.00	488 8146 \$139.01 \$20,851.50 \$30.00 \$4,500.00 \$25,351.50
2	Group: T125 Volts: 6 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 488 @ 25 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	30	RC 488 SLIGC125 \$95.00 \$2,850.00 \$30.00 \$900.00 \$3,750.00	530 8146 \$90.63 \$2,718.90 \$27.00 \$810.00 \$3,528.90	488 EV-125 \$151.79 \$4,553.70 \$31.77 \$953.10 \$5,506.80	240 T125 \$154.00 \$4,620.00 \$26.00 \$780.00 \$5,400.00	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00	No Bid     \$810.00 \$0.00	530 8146 \$111.21 \$3,336.30 \$27.00 \$810.00 \$4,146.30	488 8146 \$139.01 \$4,170.30 \$30.00 \$900.00 \$5,070.30
3	Group: T145 Volts: 6 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 530 @ 25 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	60	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00	530 8146 \$90.63 \$5,437.80 \$27.00 \$1,620.00 \$7,057.80	530 EV-145 \$196.28 \$11,776.80 \$31.77 \$1,906.20 \$13,683.00	260 T145 \$177.00 \$10,620.00 \$26.00 \$1,560.00 \$12,180.00	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00	No Bid     \$1,620.00 \$0.00	530 8146 \$111.21 \$6,672.60 \$27.00 \$1,620.00 \$8,292.60	488 8146 \$139.01 \$8,340.60 \$30.00 \$1,800.00 \$10,140.60
4	Group: T875 Volts: 8 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 290 @ 25 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	RC 318 SLIGC8V \$103.00 \$2,060.00 \$30.00 \$600.00 \$2,660.00	318 8148 \$94.21 \$1,884.20 \$27.00 \$540.00 \$2,424.20	318 GL8-120 \$145.21 \$2,904.20 \$31.77 \$635.40 \$3,539.60	170 T875 \$136.00 \$2,720.00 \$26.00 \$520.00 \$3,240.00	295 Min GC8-HCL-UTL \$87.64 \$1,752.80 \$30.00 \$600.00 \$2,352.80	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00	300 8148 \$102.68 \$2,053.60 \$27.00 \$540.00 \$2,593.60	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00
5	Group: UB12120 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): No minutes, 12 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	N/A SLA12-12F2 \$34.90 \$698.00 \$2.50 \$50.00 \$748.00	12 AH ES12-12 \$33.66 \$673.20 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$673.20	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00	12 AMP CB12120-FI \$22.00 \$440.00 \$6.00 \$120.00 \$560.00	12-AH SLA-1105 \$39.72 \$794.40 \$5.00 \$100.00 \$894.40	No Bid     \$0.00 \$0.00	12 AMP/HR ES1212 \$37.74 \$754.80 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$754.80	85 ES1212 \$44.67 \$893.40 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$893.40

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries		Local		Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		
6100012951		JF		River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA)	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP	Gonzalez Auto Parts	IBS of Paseo Del Rio	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340	World Tire Unlimited							
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage	San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	San Antonio, TX 78216	Laredo, TX 78041	San Antonio, TX 78216	San Antonio, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78070	San Antonio, TX 78216								
6	Group: UB12180 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): No minutes, 12 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	N/A SLAA12-18NB \$53.90 \$1,078.00 \$6.00 \$120.00 \$1,198.00	12 AH ES17-12 \$49.96 \$999.20 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$999.20	No Bid	18 AMP CB12180 \$48.00 \$960.00 \$6.00 \$120.00 \$1,080.00	18-AH SLA-1116 \$41.51 \$830.20 \$5.00 \$100.00 \$930.20	No Bid	12 AMP/HR ES17-12 \$47.45 \$949.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$949.00	85 ES1712 \$58.06 \$1,161.20 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$1,161.20								
7	Group: UB1280 Volts: 20 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): No minutes, 8 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	20	N/A SLA12-8F \$19.90 \$398.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$398.00	8 AH ES7-12 \$49.96 \$999.20 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$999.20	No Bid	8 AMP CB1280-FI \$12.00 \$240.00 \$3.00 \$60.00 \$300.00	8-AH SLA-1075 \$30.06 \$601.20 \$5.00 \$100.00 \$701.20	No Bid	8 AMP/HR ES7-12 \$19.78 \$395.60 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$395.60	85 ES22NF \$22.22 \$444.40 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$444.40								
8	Group: UB12550 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): No minutes, 55 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	12	N/A SLAA12-55C/FR \$126.90 \$1,522.80 \$12.00 \$144.00 \$1,666.80	55 AH 8222 NF \$76.76 \$921.12 \$9.00 \$108.00 \$1,029.12	No Bid	55 AMP CB12550 \$72.00 \$864.00 \$15.00 \$180.00 \$1,044.00	55-AH SLA-1165 \$176.50 \$2,118.00 \$20.00 \$240.00 \$2,358.00	No Bid	55 AMP/HR ES22NF \$133.79 \$1,605.48 \$9.00 \$108.00 \$1,713.48	85 ES22FF \$165.98 \$1,991.76 \$9.00 \$108.00 \$2,099.76								
9	Group: UB12350 Volts: 12 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): No minutes, 35 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	22	N/A SLADC12-35J \$68.90 \$1,515.80 \$6.00 \$132.00 \$1,647.80	35 AH ES40-12 \$76.95 \$1,692.90 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$1,692.90	No Bid	35 AMP CB12350 \$52.00 \$1,144.00 \$6.00 \$132.00 \$1,276.00	35-AH DCM0035 \$82.12 \$1,806.64 \$8.00 \$176.00 \$1,982.64	No Bid	35 AMP/HR ESU135 \$72.69 \$1,599.18 \$9.00 \$198.00 \$1,797.18	\$45.00 ESU135 \$89.61 \$1,971.42 \$9.00 \$198.00 \$2,169.42								
10	Group: UB1250 Volts: 8 CCA (@ 0°F Min.): N/A Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): No minutes, 5 AMP per hr. Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) Supplier Code # Unit Price Extended Price Core Charge Price Total Extended Core Charge Price Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)	8	N/A SLA12-5F \$16.90 \$135.20 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$135.20	5 AH ES5-12 \$21.16 \$169.28 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$169.28	No Bid	5 AMP CB1250-FI \$8.00 \$64.00 \$3.00 \$24.00 \$88.00	5-AH SLA-1055 \$30.10 \$240.80 \$5.00 \$40.00 \$280.80	No Bid	5 AMP/HR ES512 \$24.08 \$192.64 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$192.64	\$45.00 ES512 \$27.60 \$220.80 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$220.80								
11	Deleted																	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries		Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	
6100012951		JF	River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus Bulbs	Genuine Parts Company (NAPA)	Arnold Oil Company Austin, LP	Gonzalez Auto Parts (NAPA)	IBS of Paseo Del Rio	Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center - San Antonio 8922 IH 10 East	South Texas Auto Parts Company dba M&M Auto & Truck Parts (NAPA) 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340 Spring Branch, TX 78070	World Tire Unlimited 13080 VS HWY 281 North San Antonio, TX 78216
Item	Description	Est. Annual Usage	San Antonio, TX 78238 (210) 647-0103	San Antonio, TX 78217 (210) 422-0906	San Antonio, TX 78216	Laredo, TX 78041	San Antonio, TX 78216	San Antonio, TX 78109	Spring Branch, TX 78070	San Antonio, TX 78216
12	Group: ES17-12 Nominal Voltage: 12V Nominal Capacity: 20 hour rate (0.9A to 10.50V) 18Ah 10 hour rate (1.71A to 10.50V) 17.1 Ah 5 Hour rate (3.06 to 10.20V) 15.3 Ah 1C (18A to 9.60V) 9.6 Ah 3C (54A to 9.60V) 6.3 Ah Internal Resistance (at 1KHz) Approx: 12Ω Maximum Discharge Current for 5 seconds: 270A Charge retention (shelf life) at 20° C (68° F) 1 month – 92% 3 months – 90% 6 months – 80% Terminal: F3 Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS)	8	No Bid	8 AH	No Bid	18 AMP	18-AH	No Bid	12V 20hr - 18 Ah 10hr - 17.1 Ah 5HR - 15.3 Ah 1C - 9.6 Ah 3C - 6.3 Ah 27NA	\$85.00
	Supplier Code #			ES17.12		CB12180	SLA-1116		ES17.12	ES1712
	Unit Price			\$49.96		\$48.00	\$62.10		\$47.45	\$58.06
	Extended Price			\$399.68		\$384.00	\$496.80		\$379.60	\$464.48
	Core Charge Price			\$0.00		\$6.00	\$5.00		\$0.00	\$0.00
	Total Extended Core Charge Price		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$48.00	\$40.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
	Total (Extended price + Extended Core Charge)		\$0.00	\$399.68	\$0.00	\$432.00	\$536.80	\$0.00	\$379.60	\$464.48
	Overall Total Item Parts 3		\$22,257.80	\$29,489.98	\$38,383.70	\$40,806.00	\$22,106.34	\$0.00	\$31,723.80	\$40,509.86
	Overall Total Core Charges Item 3		\$6,446.00	\$7,128.00	\$8,260.20	\$7,444.00	\$5,896.00	\$0.00	\$7,326.00	\$7,506.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	2% 10 Days	2% 21 Days
	Total After Prompt Payment Discount		\$28,703.80	\$36,617.98	\$46,643.90	\$48,250.00	\$28,002.34	\$0.00	\$38,268.80	\$47,055.54
	Total Item 3		\$28,703.80	\$36,617.98	\$46,643.90	\$48,250.00	\$28,002.34	\$0.00	\$39,049.80	\$48,015.86
			Incomplete	Incomplete	Incomplete	Incomplete	Incomplete	Incomplete	Incomplete	Incomplete
IV	DELIVERY & DISPOSAL SERVICE									
A.	Business hours from and to:		9:00 AM - 7:00 PM	7:30 AM - 6:00 PM	8:00AM - 5:00PM	8:00AM - 7:00PM	7:00 AM - 6:00 PM	7:00AM - 9:00PM	7:30 AM - 6:00 PM 9:00 AM - 5:00 PM Sunday	8:00AM - 5:00PM
	Days per week:		6	7	5	6	5	5	6	6
	Disposal Fee Per Battery		\$3.00	\$3.00	\$0.00	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$10.00
	Prompt payment discount:		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	2% 10 Days	2% 21 Days
	<b>Estimated Annual Award</b>		<b>\$336,924.90</b>	<b>\$36,617.98</b>						