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ORDINANCE 

APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT 
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
COST OF $2,946,000.00, FUNDED FROM THE RESPECTIVE 
DEPARTMENTS' FY 2019 ADOPTED BUDGETS: (A) MOSTLY 
BROTHERS NURSERY, INC., SITE ONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY 
HOLDING LLC, AND SORELLE FARMS LLC DBA BOB WELLS 
NURSERY FOR THE SUPPLY OF TREES; (B) POPPE AUTOMOTIVE 
WAREHOUSE, INC. FOR AUTOMOTIVE & HEAVY EQUIPMENT 
FILTERS; (C) SAN ANTONIO BELTING & PULLEY CO. INC. FOR 
HYDRAULIC, AIR, WATER, FUEL & INDUSTRIAL HOSE & 
FITTINGS; (D) VULCAN, INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS DBA VULCAN 
ALUMINUM FOR ALUMINUM SIGNS; AND (E) CASCO INDUSTRIES 
INC. FOR HELMETS AND REPAIR PARTS FOR THE SAN ANTONIO 
FIRE DEPARTMENT. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves the following contracts: (A) Mostly Brothers Nursery, 
Inc., Site One Landscape Supply Holding LLC, and Sorelle Farms LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery 
for the supply of trees; (B) Poppe Automotive Warehouse, Inc. for automotive and heavy 
equipment filters; (C) San Antonio Belting & Pulley Co. Inc. for hydraulic, air, water, fuel and 
industrial hose and fittings; (D) Vulcan, Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, dba Vulcan Aluminum for 
aluminum signs; and (E) Casco Industries Inc. for helmets and repair parts for the San Antonio 
Fire Department (SAFD); and 

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not 
required under section 252.022(a)(2), which provides for a procurement necessary to protect the 
public health or safety; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves six low bid contracts and a procurement on the basis of the 
public health or safety exemption; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The following bids and contracts to furnish the City with goods and services on an 
annual basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and 
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates 
and endorsements: (A) Mostly Brothers Nursery, Inc., Site One Landscape Supply Holding LLC, 
and Sorelle Farms LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery for the supply of trees; (B) Poppe Automotive 
Warehouse, Inc. for automotive and heavy equipment filters; (C) San Antonio Belting & Pulley 
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Co. Inc. for hydraulic, air, water, fuel and industrial hose and fittings; (D) Vulcan, Inc., dba 
Vulcan Signs, dba Vulcan Aluminum for aluminum signs; and (E) Casco Industries Inc. for 
helmets and repair parts for SAFD. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection 
in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is 
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the 
Fiscal Year 2019 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through 
their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances. 

SECTION 3. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, SAP Project 
Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost Centers, 
SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL Accounts as 
necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 15th day of August, 2019. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

2 



Agenda Item: 9 ( in consent vote: 5, 6, 7, 9, 10, 12A, 12B, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22A, 22B) 

Date: 08/ 15/2019 

Time: 12:00:00AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for 
an estimated annual cost of $2,946,000.00: (A) Mosty Brothers Nursery Inc., Site One 
Landscape Supply Holding LLC, and Sorelle Farms LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery for the supply 
of trees; (B) Poppe Automotive Warehouse for automotive & heavy equipment filters ; (C) San 
Antonio Belting & Pulley Co. Inc. for hydraulic, air, water, fuel , & industrial hose & fittings; (D) 
Vulcan, Inc. , dba Vulcan Signs, dba Vulcan Aluminum for aluminum signs; and (E) Casco 
Industries Inc. for helmets and repair parts for the San Antonio Fire Department. [Ben Gorzell , 
Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ron Nirenberg Mayor X 

Roberto C. Trevino District I X X 

Jada Andrews-Sullivan District 2 X 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 X 

Dr. Adriana Rocha Garcia District 4 X 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 X 

Melissa Cabello Havrda District 6 X 

Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X 

Manny Pelaez District 8 X 

John Courage District 9 X X 

Clayton H. Perry District I 0 X 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Annual Contract for Supply of Trees 

For: Non-local Non-Local Non-local Non-Local Non-Local 
Mosty Brothers Site One Landscape Sorell Farms LLC AgH20 Holdings , LLC South Texas Property 
Nursery Inc. Supply Holding LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery Services Inc. 

6100011094 DG 200 Mosty 1385 East 36th Street 17160 CR 4100 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 8338 Piney Wood Run 

Estimated Center Point, Cleveland, Lindale, Round Rock, San Antonio , 

Item Description Annual TX 78210 OH 44114 TX 77571 TX 78664 TX 78255 

Quantitv (830) 634-2643 (216) 706-9250 ext. 2 (903) 882-3550 

1 One (1) Gallon Trees , Anacacho Orchid Tree 200 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid 

Extended Price : $1 ,200.00 $7 ,000 .00 

2 Anaqua 100 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $600.00 $4,000.00 

3 Arizona Cypress 200 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid 

Extended Price: $1 ,200.00 $7,600.00 

4 Bur Oak 300 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,800.00 $9 ,000.00 

5 DELETED 

6 Cedar Elm 300 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $25 .00 No Bid 

Extended Price: $1 ,800.00 $7,500.00 

7 Chinkapin Oak 200 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid 

Extended Price: $1 ,200.00 $6,000.00 

8 Crape Myrtle 300 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid 

Extended Price: $1 ,800.00 $7,500.00 

9 Desert Willow 300 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 800.00 $9,000.00 

10 DELETED 

11 Eve's Necklace 200 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $1 ,200 .00 $6,000.00 

12 Lacey Oak 200 
Price per Tree $6 .00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $1 ,200.00 $9,000.00 

13 Live Oak 300 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $1 ,800 .00 $9,000.00 

14 Mexican Buckeye 400 
Price per Tree $6 .00 No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $2 ,400.00 $14,000.00 

15 DELETED 

16 Mexican Plum 200 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $1 ,200.00 $7,000.00 

17 DELETED 

18 Mexican Whie Oak 600 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,600.00 $22 ,800.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Annual Contract for Supply of Trees 

For. Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Mosty Brothers Site One Landscape Sorell Fam,s LLC AgH20 Holdings , LLC South Texas Property 

Nursery Inc. Supply Holding LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery Services Inc. 
6100011094 DG 200 Mosty 1385 East 36th Street 17160 CR 4100 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 8338 Piney Wood Run 

Estimated Center Point, Cleveland, Lindale, Round Rock , San Antonio , 

Item Description Annual TX 78210 OH 44114 TX 77571 TX 78664 TX 78255 

Quantitv (830) 634-2643 (216) 706-9250 ext. 2 (903) 882-3550 

19 Montezuma Cypress 200 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,200.00 $7 ,600.00 

20 Pecan (native or papershell) 400 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $2,400 .00 $20,000.00 

21 DELETED 

22 DELETED 

23 Roughleaf Dogwood 100 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $600.00 $3,500 .00 

24 DELETED 

25 DELETED 

26 DELETED 

27 DELETED 

28 DELETED 

29 Texas Red Oak 300 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,800.00 $10,500.00 

30 Texas Redbud 700 
Price per Tree $6.00 ND Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $4,200.00 $24,500.00 

31 Yaupon 100 
Price per Tree $6.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $600.00 $3,000.00 

Subtotal 1 Gallon Trees iJJ,600.00 No Bid No Bid $194 ,500.00 No Bid 

2 Five {5} Gallon Trees 
1 Anacacho Orchid Tree 25 

Price per Tree No Bid $19.50 No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $487 .50 $1 ,125.00 

2 Anaqua 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $22.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $550.00 $1 ,250.00 

3 Arizona Cypress 25 
Price per Tree $16.00 $16.75 No Bid $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $400.00 $418.75 $1 ,250 .00 

4 Bur Oak 100 
Price per Tree $16.00 $16.75 $24.50 $40.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,600.00 $1 ,675.00 $2 ,450.00 $4 ,000.00 

5 Cedar Elm 100 
Price per Tree No Bid $16.75 $24.50 $30.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $1 ,675.00 $2,450.00 $3 ,000.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Annual Contract for Supply of Trees 

For. Non-Local Non-Local Non-Loca l Non-Local Non-Local 
Mosty Brothers Site One Landscape Sorell Fam,s LLC AgH20 Holdings , LLC South Texas Property 

Nursery Inc. Supply Holding LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery Services Inc. 

6100011094 DG 200 Mosty 1385 East 36th Street 17160 CR 4100 3817 Bent Brook Or. 8338 Piney Wood Run 

Estimated Center Point, Cleveland, Lindale, Round Rock, San Antonio, 

Item Description Annual TX 78210 OH 44114 TX 77571 TX 78664 TX 78255 

Quantitv (830) 634-2643 (216) 706-9250 ext. 2 (903) 882-3550 

0 Chinkapin Oak 100 
Price per Tree >16.00 $19.50 $24.50 $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,600.00 $1 ,950.00 $2 ,450.00 $5,000.00 

7 Crape Myrtle 100 
Price per Tree $16.00 $19.50 No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $1 ,600.00 $1 ,950.00 $4,500.00 

8 Desert Willow 50 
Price per Tree No Bid $16.75 No Bid $55.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $837.50 $2 ,750.00 

9 Evergreen Sumac 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $17.50 No Bid $50 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $437.50 $1 ,250.00 

10 Eve's Necklace 100 
Price per Tree No Bid $19.50 No Bid $40 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,950.00 $4,000 .00 

11 DELETED 

12 DELETED 

13 Live Oak 100 
Price per Tree $16.00 $16.75 $24.50 $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,600.00 $1 ,675.00 $2 ,450.00 $4,500.00 

14 Mexican Buckeye 50 
Price per Tree $16 .00 $16.75 No Bid $45 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $800.00 $837.50 $2 ,250 .00 

15 DELETED 

16 DELETED 

17 Mexican Sycamore 100 
Price per Tree No Bid $19.50 No Bid $50 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,g5o.oo $5,000.00 

18 Mexican Whie Oak 150 
Price per Tree No Bid $19.50 No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $2 ,925.00 $6 ,750.00 

19 Montezuma Cypress 25 
Price per Tree $16 .00 No Bid No Bid $48.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $400.00 $1 ,200.00 

20 Possumhaw 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $22 .00 No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $550.00 $1 ,125.00 

21 Retama (thomless) 25 
Price per Tree No Bid S22 .00 No Bid $60.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $550.00 $1 ,500.00 

22 DELETED 

23 DELETED 

24 Texas Ash 25 
Price per Tree $16 .00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $400 .00 $1 ,125.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Annual Contract for Supply of Trees 

For. Non-Local Non.Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-local 
Mosty Brothers Site One Landscape Sorell Fanns LLC AgH20 Holdings , LLC South Texas Property 
Nursery Inc. Supply Holding LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery Services Inc. 

6100011094 0G 200 Mosty 1385 East 36th Street 17160 CR 4100 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 8338 Piney Wood Run 

Estimated Center Point, Cleveland, Lindale, Round Rock, San Antonia , 

Item Description Annual TX 78210 OH44114 TX 77571 TX 78664 TX 78255 

Quantity (830) 634-2643 (216) 706-9250 ext . 2 (903) 882-3550 

25 DELETED 

26 Texas Mountain Laurel 200 
Price per Tree No Bid $18.50 No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $3 ,700.00 $9 ,000.00 

27 Texas Persimmon 50 
Price per Tree No Bid $19.50 No Bid $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $975.00 $2,250.00 

28 DELETED 

29 Texas Redbud 200 
Price per Tree $16.00 $19.50 $24.50 $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,200.00 $3 ,900.00 $4,900.00 $9,000.00 

30 Yaupon 50 
Price per Tree $16.00 $16.75 $24.50 $45.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $800.00 $837 .50 $1 ,225.00 $2 ,250.00 

Subtotal 5 Gallon Trees >12,400.00 516,587,50 $15,925.00 $74,075.00 No Bid 

3 7 Gallon Trees 
1 Pecan (native) 100 

Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $39.50 $75.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,950.00 $7,500.00 

2 Pecan (Desirable ) 250 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $42 .50 $80.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $10 625.00 $20,000.00 

Subtotal 7 Gallon Trees No Bid No Bid $14.o,o.00 $27,500.00 No Bid 

4 15 Gallon Trees 

1 Bur Oak 50 
Price per Tree $60.00 $75.00 $74.50 $106.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3 000.00 $3,750.00 $3,725.00 $5,300.00 

2 Cedar Elm 100 
Price per Tree No Bid $78.00 $74.50 $85.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $7,800 .00 $7,450.00 $8,500.00 

3 Chinkapin Oak 50 
Price per Tree $60.00 $78.00 $74.50 $90.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,000.00 $3,900.00 $3,725.00 $4 ,500.00 

4 Crape Myrtle 25 
Price per Tree $50.00 $65.00 $74.50 $80 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,250.00 $1 ,625.00 $1 ,862 .50 $2,000.00 

5 Desert Willow 25 
Price per Tree $60.00 $78.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,500.00 $1 ,950.00 $2 ,500.00 

6 Evergreen Sumac 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $85.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $2 ,125.00 $2,500.00 

7 Eve's Necklace 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $78 .00 $74.50 $125.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,950.00 $1 ,862.50 $3,125.00 

8 DELETED 

9 DELETED 

10 DELETED 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Annual Contract fo r Supply of Trees 

For: Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Mosty Brothers Site One Landscape Sorell Fam,s LLC AgH20 Holdings, LLC South Texas Property 
Nursery Inc. Supply Holding LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery Services Inc. 

6100011094 0G 200 Mosty 1385 East 36th Street 17160 CR 4100 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 6338 Piney Wood Run 

Estimated Center Point, Cleveland, Lindale, Round Rock, San Antonio, 

Item Description Annual TX 78210 OH 44 114 TX 77571 TX 78664 TX 78255 

Quantitv (830) 634-2643 (216) 706-9250 ext. 2 (903) 882-3550 

11 Lacey Oak 25 
Price per Tree $60.00 No Bid No Bid $145.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,500.00 $3 ,625.00 

12 Live Oak 100 
Price per Tree $60.00 $75.00 $74.50 $80.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $6,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,450.00 $8 ,000.00 

13 Mexican Buckeye 50 
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid $95.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,750.00 $4,750.00 

14 Mexican Olive 50 
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid $110.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3 ,750.00 $5,500 .00 

15 Mexican Plum 50 
Price per Tree $60.00 $78.00 $74 .50 $98.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,000.00 $3 ,900.00 $3,725 .00 $4 ,900 .00 

16 Mexican Sycamore 75 
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 $74.50 $95.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $5 ,625.00 $5,587 .50 $7,125.00 

17 Mexican Whie Oak 100 
Price per Tree $60.00 $80.00 $74.50 $90.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $6 ,000.00 $8 ,000.00 $7 ,450.00 $9,000.00 

18 Montezuma Cypress 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,875.00 $2,500.00 

19 Pecan (native) 75 
Price per Tree $60.00 $75.00 S129.50 $175.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $4 500.00 $5,625.00 $9,712 .50 $13,125.00 

20 Pecan (Desirable) 50 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $149.50 $175.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $7,475.00 $8,750.00 

21 Possumhaw 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid $105.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,875.00 $2,625.00 

22 Retama (thomless) 50 
Price per Tree No Bid $78.00 No Bid $105.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,900.00 $5,250.00 

23 DELETED 

24 DELETED 

25 DELETED 

26 Texas Ash 25 
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid $105.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,875.00 $2 ,625 .00 

27 Texas Mountain Laurel 100 
Price per Tree No Bid $78.00 No Bid $105 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $7,800.00 $10,500 .00 

28 Texas Persimmon 50 
Price per Tree No Bid $80.00 f'lo Bid $105.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $4,000.00 $5,250.00 

29 Texas Red Oak 50 
Price per Tree $60 .00 No Bid No Bid $105.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,000 .00 $5,250.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Annual Contract for Supply of Trees 

For: Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Mosty Brothers Site One Landscape Sorell Farms LLC AgH20 Holdings , LLC South Texas Property 

Nursery Inc. Supply Holding LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery Services Inc. 
6100011094 DG 200 Mosly 1385 East 36th Street 17160 CR 4100 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 8338 Piney Wood Run 

Estimated Center Point, Cleveland, Lindale, Round Rock , San Antonio, 

Item Description Annual TX 78210 OH44114 TX 77571 TX 78664 TX 78255 

Quantity (830) 634-2643 (216) 706-9250 ext. 2 (903) 882-3550 

30 Texas Redbud 100 
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 $74.50 $100.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $7,500.00 $7,450.00 $10,000.00 

31 Yaupon 25 
Price per Tree $60.00 $68.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $1,500.00 $1 ,700.00 $2 ,500.00 

Subtotal 15 Gallon Trees >34,250.00 >30 950.00 >29 825.00 $139,700.00 No Bid 

5 30 Gallon Trees 
1 DELETED 

2 DELETED 

3 DELETED 

4 DELETED 

5 DELETED 

6 DELETED 

7 DELETED 

8 DELETED 

6 5 Gallon Fruit Trees 
1 Apple 100 

Price per Tree No Bid $19.75 $16.90 $50 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,975.00 $1 ,690.00 $5,000 .00 

2 Apricot 100 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $18.50 $55.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,850.00 $5,500.00 

3 Avocado 250 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $16.90 $65.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $4,225.00 $16,250.00 

4 Fig 250 
Price per Tree No Bid $16.50 $16.90 $65.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $4 ,125.00 $4,225.00 $16,250.00 

5 Lemon 350 
Price per Tree No Bid $26.50 $39.50 $48.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $9,275.00 $13,825.00 $16,800.00 

6 Lime-Mexican Key 200 
Price per Tree No Bid $26.50 $39.50 $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $5,300.00 $7 ,900.00 $10,000.00 

7 Lime-Persian 200 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $39.50 $55.00 No Bid 
Extended Price : $7,900.00 $11 ,000.00 

8 Nectarine 100 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $16.90 $60.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1 ,690 .00 $6,000.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Annual Contract for Supply of Trees 

For: Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Mosty Brothers Site One Landscape Sorell Fam,s LLC AgH20 Holdings , LLC South Texas Property 
Nursery Inc. Supply Holding LLC dba Bob Wells Nursery Services Inc. 

6100011094 DG 200 Mosty 1385 East 36th Street 17160 CR 4100 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 8338 Piney Wood Run 

Estimated Center Point , Cleveland, Lindale, Round Rock, San Antonio , 

Item Description Annual TX 78210 OH 44114 TX 77571 TX 78664 TX 78255 

Quantity (830) 634-2643 (216) 706-9250 ext . 2 (903) 882-3550 

9 Olive 100 
Price per Tree No Bid $22 .00 $42 .50 $60.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $2 ,200.00 $4 ,250.00 $6,000.00 

10 Orange 350 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $39.50 560.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $13 ,825.00 $21 ,000.00 

11 Peach 300 
Price per Tree No Bid $19.75 $16.90 $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $5,925.00 $5,070 .00 $15,000.00 

12 Pear 200 
Price per Tree No Bid $19.75 $16.90 $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3 ,950.00 $3 ,380.00 $10,000.00 

13 Persimmon 100 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $24 .50 $55.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $2,450.00 $5,500.00 

14 Plum 150 
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $16.90 $50.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $2,535.00 $7 ,500 .00 

15 Pomegranate 200 
Price per Tree No Bid $19.75 $26 .50 $55 .00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $3,950.00 $5,300.00 511 ,000.00 

Subtotal 5 Gallon Fruit Trees No Bid $24,850.00 $44,615.00 $162 ,800.00 No Bid 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $80,250.00 $72 ,387 .50 $89 015.00 $598,575 .00 No Bid 

Estimated Annual Award $80 250.00 $72,387.50 $89 ,015.00 

Item 5, 30 gallons trees 'Nill be re-bid at a later date . 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabualtion 

Opened: March 11 , 2019 Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 
For: Automotive & Heavy Equipment Filters Poppe Automotive Arnold Oil Company of Genuine Parts North Park Lincoln Oil Patch Petroleum South Texas Auto 

Austin . LP Company Inc Parts Company 
716 S. Frio Street 5909 Burleson Rd 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 1526 N.P.I.D. 20475 HWY 46W, 

6100011253 AJ Ste 340 
Estimated San Antonio, 

Annual TX 78207 Austin , San Antonio, San Antonio, Corpus Christi, Spring Branch, 
Item Description Quantity 210-225-3657 TX 78744 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78408 TX 78070 

AUTOMOTIVE AND LIGHT DUTY FUEL FILTERS 
1 

30% off Suggested 
a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% 60% 56% List price 59% 63% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix Filters Hastings Wix/Napa Filter Ford-Lincoln Baldwin Napa Wix 

Suggested List Price 
C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber Jobber Jobber-Blue -30% Dealer Jobber 

d Price Schedule Number 1201-10/18 US Price Sheet 1207-5A FPS-3642 Price List 18-189 
10-22-1 8, updated 2-19-

e Date of price Schedule 10/1/2018 19 10-1-2018 January 2019 4-2018 
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 

f Based (i.e. distributor, net , wholesale, etc) Jobber E, Jobber Blue Suggested List Price Jobber (Blue) 

Replacement of Free from defect in 2 years/unlimited Limited Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime defective part materials miles - see attached Limited Warranty 

2A AUTOMOTIVE AND LIGHT DUTY AIR FILTERS 
30% off Suggested 

a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% 60% 56% List price 59% 63% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix Filters Hastings Wix/Napa Filter Ford-Lincoln Baldwin Napa Wix 

C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber Jobber Jobber-Blue Suggested List Price Dealer Jobber 

d Price Schedule Number 1201-10/18 US Price Sheet 1207-5A FPS-3642 Price List 18,189 
10-22-18, updated 2-19-

e Date of price Schedule 10/1/2018 19 10-1-2018 January 2019 4-2018 
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 

f Based (i.e. distributor, net , wholesale, etc) Jobber E, Jobber Blue Suggested List Price Jobber Blue 

Replacement of Free from defect in 2 years/unlimited Limited Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime defective part materials miles - see attached Limited Warranty 

3A AUTOMOTIVE AND LIGHT DUTY OIL FILTERS 
30% off Suggested 

a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% 60% 56% List price 59% 63% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix Filters Hastings Wix/Napa Filter Ford-Lincoln Baldwin Napa Wix 

C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber. etc) Jobber Jobber Jobber-Blue Suggested List Price Dealer Jobber 

d Price Schedule Number 1201-10/18 US Price Sheet 1207-5A FPS-3642 Price List 18-1 89 
10-22-18, updated 2-19-

e Date of price Schedule 10/1 /2018 19 10-1-2018 January 2019 4-2018 
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 

f Based (i.e . distributor, net , wholesale, etc) Jobber E, Jobber Blue Suggested List Price Jobber (Blue) 

Replacement of Free from defect in 2 years/unlimited Limited Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime defective part materials miles - see attached Limited Warranty 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabualtion 

Opened: March 11 , 2019 Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 
For: Automotive & Heavy Equipment Filters Poppe Automotive Arnold Oil Company of Genuine Parts North Park Lincoln Oil Patch Petroleum South Texas Auto 

Austin , LP Company Inc Parts Company 
716 S. Frio Street 5909 Burleson Rd 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 1526 N.P.I.D. 20475 HWY 46W, 

6100011253 AJ Ste 340 
Estimated San Antonio , 

Annual TX 78207 Austin , San Antonio, San Antonio, Corpus Christi , Spring Branch, 
Item Description Quantity 210-225-3657 TX 78744 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78408 TX 78070 

AUTOMOTIVE AND LIGHT DUTY 
4A TRANSMISSION FILTERS 

60% Hastings/15% 30% off Suggested 
a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% I 20.00% Motorcraft No Bid List price 59% 30% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix/ FMP Hastings/Motorcraft Ford-Lincoln Baldwin Napa ATP 

US Price Sheet, Suggested List Price 
C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber / Jobber Jobber/Motorcraft dealer -30% Dealer Jobber 

1201-10/18 / US Price SheeUMarch 
d Price Schedule Number FIL0319 1, 2019 FPS-3642 Price List RPTO86 

10/1/2018- 10-22-18, rev 2-19-
e Date of price Schedule 03/01/2019 19/March 1, 2019 January 2019 2018 

Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 
f Based (i.e . distributor, net, wholesale, etc) Jobber / Jobber E, Jobber/Dealer Suggested List Price Jobber Blue 

Limited Lifetime I Replacement of 2 years/unlimited Limited Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime defective parts miles - see attached Limned Warranty 

SA HEAVY DUTY COOLANT FILTERS 
30% off Suggested 

a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% 60% 56% List price 59% 63% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix Hastings Wix/Napa Filter Ford-Lincoln Baldwin Napa Wix 

Suggested List Price 
C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber Jobber Jobber-Blue -30% Dealer Jobber 

d Price Schedule Number 1201-10/18 US Price Sheet 1207-5A FPS-3642 Price List 18-189 
10-22-18, revised 2-19-

e Date of price Schedule 10/1/2018 19 10-1-2018 January 2019 4-2018 
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 

f Based (i.e . distributor, net, wholesale , etc) Jobber E, Jobber Blue Suggested List Price Jobber (Blue) 

Replacement of Free from defect in 2 years/unlimited Limited Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime defective parts materials miles - see attached Limned Warranty 

SA HEAVY DUTY FUEL FILTERS 
30% off Suggested 

a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% 60% 56% List price 59% 63% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix Hastings Wix/Napa Filter Ford-Lincoln Baldwin Napa Wix 

Suggested List Price 
C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber Jobber Jobber-Blue -30% Dealer Jobber 

d Price Schedule Number 1201-10/18 US Price Sheet 1207-5A FPS-3642 Price List 18-189 
10-22-18, revised 2-19-

e Date of price Schedule 10/1/2018 
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 

19 10-1-2018 January 2019 4-2018 

f Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale , etc) Jobber E, Jobber Blue Suggested List Price Jobber (Blue) 

Replacement of Free from defect in 2 years/unlimited Limited Lifetime 
n Warrantv Limited Lifetime defective parts materials miles - see attached Limited Warrantv 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabualtion 

Opened: March 11 , 2019 Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 
For: Automotive & Heavy Equipment Filters Poppe Automotive Arnold Oil Company of Genuine Parts North Park Lincoln Oil Patch Petroleum South Texas Auto 

Austin , LP Company Inc Parts Company 
716 S. Frio Street 5909 Burleson Rd 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 1526 N.P.1.D. 20475 HWY 46W, 

6100011253 AJ Ste 340 
Estimated San Antonio, 

Annual TX 78207 Austin , San Antonio, San Antonio, Corpus Christi , Spring Branch, 
Item Description Quantity 210-225-3657 TX 78744 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78408 TX 78070 

7A HEAW DUTY AIR FILTERS 
a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% 60% 56% N/A 59% 63% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix Hastings Wix/Napa Filter N/A Baldwin Napa Wix 
C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber Jobber Jobber-Blue NIA Dealer Jobber 
d Price Schedule Number 1201-10/18 US Price Sheet 1207-5A N/A 18-189 

10-22-18, revised 2-1S-
e Date of price Schedule 10/1/2018 19 10-1-2018 N/A 4-2018 

Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 
f Based (i.e . distributor, net, wholesale , etc) Jobber E, Jobber Blue NIA Jobber (Blue) 

Free from defect in Limited Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime materials N/A Limited Warranty 

BA HEAW DUTY OIL FILTERS 
a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% 60% 56% NIA 59% 63% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Wix Filters Hastings Wix/Napa Filter N/A Baldwin Napa Wix 
C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber Jobber Jobber-Blue N/A Dealer Jobber 
d Price Schedule Number 1201-10/18 US Price Sheet 1207-5A NIA 18-189 

10-22-1 8, revised 2-1S-
e Date of price Schedule 10/1/2018 19 10-1-2018 N/A 4-2018 

Price Schedule Column on Wh ich Discount is 
f Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc) Jobber E, Jobber Blue N/A Jobber (Blue) 

Replacement of Free from defect in Limtted Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime defective parts materials N/A Limited Warranty 

9A HEAW DUTY OIL FILTER GASKET O-RINGS 
60% Hastings, 

a Percent of Discount Offered 61 .25% / 20.00% GM&Mopar=Net 56% NIA 59% 63% 
Hastings, GM & Mopar 

b Products lden@cation (Manufacturer) Wix/ FMP OE Wix/Napa Filter NIA Baldwin Napa Wix 
C Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Jobber / Jobber Hastings-Jobber Jobber-Blue N/A Dealer Jobber 

1201-10/1 8 / 
d Price Schedule Number FIL0319 US Price Sheet 1207-5A N/A 18-189 

10/1/2018 - 10-22-18, revised 02-19 
e Date of price Schedule 03/01 /2019 19 10-1-2018 NIA 4-2018 

Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 
f Based (i.e. distributor, net , wholesale, etc) Jobber/ Jobber Hastings E,Jobber Blue N/A Jobber (Blue) 

Limited Lifetime / replacement of Free from defect in Limtted Lifetime 
g Warranty Limited Lifetime defective parts materials N/A Limtted Warranty 

Delivery 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 
Business Hours 8 am-5 pm; 5 days 

8 am-6 pm; 5 days 8 am-5 pm; 5 days per 8 am-7 pm; 7 days 7 am-6 pm; 5 days per week; 8am - 7:30 am-7:00 pm; 5 
per week week per week per week noon on Saturday days per week 

Pavment Terms 2% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Davs 
Estimated Annual Award $240,000.00 

s 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 24, 2019 

For: Annual Contract for Hydraulic, Air, Water, Fuel, & Industrial Hose 
& Fittings Local 

San Antonio Belting & Pulley Co. Inc. 

6100011419 JF 211 West Cevallos 

Estimated San Antonio , 
Item Description Annual TX 78204 

Usaae 210-225-2671 

1 Hydraulic Hoses 

A. Parts Discount 

Percent of discount offered: 77.6% 

Product identification (manufacturer): Aeroquip 

Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List Price 

Price schedule number: A-Prov-PL001 -E13 

Date of price schedule 4-1-2019 

Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List 

net, wholesale, etc.): 
Warranty: 

1B. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

1C. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

10. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

1 E. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes on ly 

1 F. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

1 G. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

1 H. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

Air & Multi-Purpose Hose, Red (Minimum PSI Rating Not Less 

2 Than 300): 

A. Parts Discount 

Percent of discount offered: 70% 
Product identification (manufacturer): Thermoid 

Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List 

Price schedule number: 
Date of price schedule: July 2, 2012 
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List 
net, wholesale, etc.) 
Warranty : 

Item 2B: Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

3 Quick Couplers 

A. Parts Discount 

Percent of discount offered: 61 .2% 
Product identification (manufacturer): Dixon 
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List 
Price schedule number: Dixon 2019 List Price 
Date of price schedule: Jan 2 , 2019 
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, 
net, wholesale, etc.) List 

Warranty: 

3B. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only 

Payment Term Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $250,000.00 
I Estimated Annual Award $250,000.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 6/25/2019 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 

For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign• 

6100011425 OS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

Estimated Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Regulatory Prefabricated 
SiQns Sian Tvces 

1 R1-1 30"X30" 10,000 

Unit Price $24.10 $48.50 No Bid 

Total Price $241 ,000.00 $485,000.00 

2 R1-1 36"x36 1,000 

Unit Price $34.65 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $34,650.00 $69,600.00 

3 R 1-2 Yield 36" 500 

Unit Price $18.40 $39.00 No Bid 

Total Price $9,200.00 $19,500.00 

4 R1-3 All-Way 6"x18" 4,000 

Unit Price $3.72 $5.80 No Bid 

Total Price $14,880.00 $23,200.00 

5 R2-1 30 MPH 24"x30" 1,000 

Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid 

Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00 

6 R2-1 35 MPH 24"x30" 1,000 

Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid 

Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00 

7 R2-1 40 MPH 24"x30" 1,000 

Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid 

Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00 

8 R2-1 45 MPH 24"x30" 1,000 

Unit Price $20.10 $38.75 No Bid 

Total Price $20,100.00 $38,750.00 

9 R3-1 No Left tum 24"x24" 500 

Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid 

Total Price $8,245.00 $16,575.00 

10 R3-2 No right turn 24"x24" 500 

Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid 

Total Price $8,245.00 $16,575.00 

11 R3-1 No right turn 24x24" 250 

Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid 

Total Price $4,122.50 $8,287.50 

12 R3-4 No U tum 24x24" 250 

Unit Price $16.49 $33.15 No Bid 

Total Price $4,122.50 $8,287 .50 

13 R3-7R Right Lane must turn right 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No Bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

14 R3-7L Left Lane must turn left 30x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No Bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

15 R5-1 Do not enter 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No Bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

16 R3-1 No left turn 36X36" 500 

Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $18,270.00 $34,800.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 

Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign• 
6100011425 OS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

t:st1ma1ea Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Regulatory 
Signs 

17 R3-2 No right lurn 36X36" 500 

Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $18,270.00 $34,800.00 

18 R3-1 No Left turn 36X36" 250 

Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $9,135.00 $17,400.00 

19 R3-4 No U Turn 36X36" 250 

Unit Price $36.54 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $9,135.00 $17,400.00 

20 R3-7R Right lane must turn right 36X36" 300 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $10,854.00 $20,880.00 

21 R3-7L Left lane must tum left 36X36" 300 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No Bid 

Tolal Price $10,854.00 $20,880.00 

22 R5-1 Do not enter 36x36" 300 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $10,854.00 $20,880.00 

23 R3-17 Bike lane 30"x24" 500 

Unit Price $20.10 $46.40 No Bid 

Total Price $10,050.00 $23,200.00 

24 R4-7 Keep right symbol 24"x30" 500 

Unit Price $20.10 $46.40 No Bid 

Total Price $10,050.00 $23,200.00 

25 R5-1a Wrong Way 36"x24" 300 

Unit Price $24.12 $46.40 No Bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

26 R6-1 R One Way state type 36"x12" 1,000 

Unit Price $1206 $23.20 No Bid 

Tolal Price $12,060.00 $23,200.00 

27 R6-1L One way state type 36"x12" 1,000 

Unit Price $1206 $23.20 No Bid 

Total Price $12,060.00 $23,200.00 

28 R9-3 No Ped Crossing 24"x24" 300 

Unit Price $16.49 $30.95 No Bid 

Total Price $4,947.00 $9,285.00 

29 R10-12 Left tum on green (Ball) 30"x36" 500 

Unit Price $30.53 $58.00 No Bid 

Total Price $15,265.00 $29,000.00 

30 R10-4B UR Push button for crossing 5"x7 3/4" 1,000 

Unit Price $3.35 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $3,350.00 

31 R10-4B UR Push button for crossing 9x12" 1,000 

Unit Price $4.85 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $4,850.00 

32 W10-136"O 300 

Unit Price $35.72 $69.60 No Bid 

Total Price $10,716.00 $20,880.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs , dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 

Aluminum Equipment, LLG. U.S Standard Sign• 
6100011425 OS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11 400 W. Addison Ave 

Estlmatea Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

School 
Signs 

33 S1-1 FYG 36" 2,000 

Unit Price $47.64 $95.00 No Bid 

Total Price $95,280.00 $190,000.00 

34 S4-1 20 MPH FYG 24"x48" (GOSA to provide 1,000 

Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid 

Total Price $35,230.00 $75,200.00 

35 S4-1 25 MPH FYG 24"x48" (GOSA to provide 500 

Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid 

Total Price $17,615.00 $37,600.00 

36 S5-1 20 MPH FYG 24"x48" (GOSA to provide 1,000 

Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid 

Total Price $35,230.00 $75,200.00 

37 S5-1 25 MPH FYG 24"x48" (GOSA to provide 500 

Unit Price $35.23 $75.20 No Bid 

Total Price $17,615.00 $37,600.00 

38 S5-2A 10"x24" 1,000 

Unit Price $7.26 $20.80 No Bid 

Total Price $7,260.00 $20,800.00 

39 S6-1 OH FYG 36"x84" (GOSA to Provide 300 

Unit Price $117.45 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $35,235.00 

40 S7-1 G FYG 24"x36" No Arrows 500 

Unit Price $33.54 $62.40 No Bid 

Total Price $16,770.00 $31 ,200.00 

41 S7-1T 18"x24" 2,000 
Unit Price $12.18 $31 .20 No Bid 

Total Price $24,360.00 $62 ,400.00 

42 W16-7P FYG 12"x24" 1,000 
Unit Price $11 .74 $20.80 No Bid 

Total Price $11 ,740.00 $20,800.00 

43 W16-9P FYG 12"x24" 1,000 

Unit Price $11 .74 $20.80 No bid 

Total Price $11 ,740.00 $20,800.00 

Warning 
Signs 

44 W.1-1 R Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

45 W.1-1 L Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

46 W1-2R Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

47 W1-2L Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

48 W1-3R Arrow symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non.Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 

Foe Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign.J 

6100011 425 OS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

Est1mate<1 Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Warning 
Sions 

49 W1-3L Arrow Symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

50 W1-4R Arrow Symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

51 W1-4L Arrow Symbol 30"x30" 300 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $7,539.00 $14,550.00 

52 W1-1 R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

53 W1-1 L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

54 W1-2R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

55 W1 -2L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

56 W1 -3R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

57 W1 -3L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

58 W1-4R Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

59 W1-4L Arrow Symbol 36x36 200 

Unit Price $36.18 $69.60 No bid 

Total Price $7,236.00 $13,920.00 

60 W1-6 Single arrow 48"x24" 1,000 

Unit Price $32.16 $61 .75 No bid 

Total Price $32 ,160.00 $61 ,750.00 

61 W1-7 Double arrow 48"x24" 1,000 

Unit Price $32 .16 $61 .75 No bid 

Total Price $32,160.00 $61 ,750.00 

62 W1-8 Chevron arrow 18"x24" 1,500 

Unit Price $1206 $23.20 No bid 

Total Price $18,090.00 $34,800.00 

63 W2-1 Cross intersection 30"x30" 200 

Unit Price $25.13 $48.50 No bid 

Total Price $5,026.00 $9,700.00 

64 W3-1 Stop ahead symbol 30"x30" 750 

Unit Price $26.29 $61 .50 No bid 

Total Price $19,717.50 $46,125.00 
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Ctty of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 

Foe Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign• 

6100011425 OS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

Est1matea Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Warning 
Signs 

65 W3-3 Signal ahead symbol 30"x30" 750 

Unit Price $26.77 $61 .50 No bid 

Total Price $20,077.50 $46,125.00 

66 011-1 Bike route 24"x18" 1,000 

Unit Price $12 .18 $23.20 No bid 

Total Price $12 ,180.00 $23,200.00 

67 OM-3R Oelineator 12"x36" 400 

Unit Price $1206 $23.20 No bid 

Total Price $4,824.00 $9,280.00 

68 OM-3L Oelineator 12"x36" 400 

Unit Price $12.06 $23.20 No bid 

Total Price $4,824.00 $9,280.00 

69 W8-19 12x72" 100 

Unit Price $24.12 $46.40 No bid 

Total Price $2,412.00 $4,640.00 

No Parking 
Signs 

70 R7-18 12x18" 2,000 

Unit Price $7.04 $15.00 No Bid 

Total Price $14,080.00 $30,000.00 

71 R7-1L 2,000 

Unit Price $6.55 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $13,100.00 

72 R7-1R 2,000 

Unit Price $6.55 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $13,100.00 

73 R7-1DBL 2,000 

Unit Price $6.55 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $13,100.00 

74 R7-201aP 1,000 

Unit Price $2.78 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $2 ,780.00 

Pre-Sheeted 
Sign Blanks 

75 9"x12" 500 

Unit Price $3.35 $4.90 No Bid 

Total Price $1 ,675.00 $2,450.00 

76 12"x36" 800 

Unit Price $12.06 $19.50 No Bid 

Total Price $9,648.00 $15,600.00 

77 18'x24" 5,000 

Unit Price $12.06 $19.50 No Bid 

Total Price $60,300.00 $97,500.00 

78 24"x24" 500 

Unit Price $16.08 $26.00 No Bid 

Total Price $8,040.00 $13,000.00 

79 24"x30" 1,000 

Unit Price $20.10 $32 .50 No Bid 

Total Price $20,100.00 $32,500.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 

Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign• 
6100011425 OS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

1:st1matea Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Pre-Sheeted 
Sign Blanks 

80 30"x30 Yellow 3,000 

Unit Price $25.13 $40.75 No Bid 

Total Price $75,390.00 $122,250.00 

81 9'x24" 3,000 

Unit Price $6.69 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $20,070.00 

82 9"x30" 3,000 

Unit Price $8.06 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $24,180.00 

83 9"x36" 2,000 

Unit Price $9.62 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $19,240.00 

84 9"x42" 2,000 

Unit Price $11 .18 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $22,360.00 

85 9"x48" 2,000 

Unit Price $12.06 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $24,120.00 

86 9"x54" 1,000 

Unit Price $13.59 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $13,590.00 

87 18"x72" 500 

Unit Price $36.18 No Bid No Bid 

Total Price $18,090.00 

88 12"x18" 5,000 

Unit Price $6.55 $9.75 No Bid 

Total Price $32,750.00 $48,750.00 

89 12"x6" 1,000 

Unit Price $278 $3.25 No Bid 

Total Price $2 ,780.00 $3,250.00 

90 12"x30" 1,000 

Unit Price $10.01 $16.25 No Bid 

Total Price $10,010.00 $16,250.00 

91 12"x36" 1,000 

Unit Price $12.06 $19.50 No Bid 

Total Price $12 ,060.00 $19,500.00 

92 30"x30" 700 

Unit Price $25.13 $40.75 No Bid 

Total Price $17,591 .00 $28,525.00 

93 36"x36" 500 

Unit Price $36.18 $58.50 No Bid 

Total Price $18,090.00 $29,250.00 

94 18"x18" Yellow 500 

Unit Price $9.45 $14.90 No Bid 

Total Price $4,725.00 $7,450.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 

For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs, dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign• 

6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

Estimated Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Sign 
Blanks 

95 30" Octagonal (Stop) , .080'' thickness, Wt. 5.84# 200 

Unit Price $14.26 No Bid $15.44 

Total Price $2,852.00 $3,088.00 

96 36" Octagonal (Stop), .100" thickness, Wt. 10.52# 200 

Unit Price $25.35 No Bid $27.78 

Total Price $5,070.00 $5,556.00 

97 30" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 7.03# 500 

Unit Price $15.78 No Bid $16.33 

Total Price $7,890.00 $8,165.00 

98 36" Circle,. 100" thickness , Wt. 9.94# 100 

Unit Price $25.26 No Bid $31 .67 

Total Price $2,526.00 $3,167.00 

99 36" Pentagon,. 100" thickness, Wt. 9.50# 300 

Unit Price $24.07 No Bid $28.08 

Total Price $7,221 .00 $8,424.00 

100 18" x 18" Square A/Diamond, .080'' thickness, Wt. 2.53# 500 

Unit Price $5.76 No Bid $5.87 

Total Price $2,880.00 $2 ,935.00 

101 9" x 12" Horizontal Rectangle, .080" thickness, 500 

Unit Price $2.02 No Bid $2.68 

Total Price $1 ,010.00 $1 ,340.00 

102 9" x 24" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 2.64# 500 

Unit Price $6.11 No Bid $6.39 

Total Price $3,055.00 $3,195.00 

103 9" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.30# 500 

Unit Price $7.69 No Bid $7.98 

Total Price $3,845.00 $3,990.00 

104 9" x 36" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.96# 500 

Unit Price $9.21 No Bid $9.55 

Total Price $4,605.00 $4,775.00 

105 9" x 42" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 4.62# 500 

Unit Price $10.93 No Bid $11 .08 

Total Price $5,465.00 $5,540.00 

106 9" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle , . 125" th ickness, Wt. 5.28# 500 

Unit Price $12.05 No Bid $12.63 

Total Price $6,025.00 $6,315.00 

107 9" x 54" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" th ickness, Wt. 5.94# 500 

Unit Price $14.06 No Bid $14.19 

Total Price $7,030.00 $7,095.00 

108 12" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness 300 

Unit Price $9.76 No Bid $10.66 

Total Price $2,928.00 $3,198.00 

109 18" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 3.38# 500 

Unit Price $7.57 No Bid $7.84 

Total Price $3,785.00 $3,920.00 

110 18" x 60" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 13.19# 100 

Unit Price $30.41 No Bid $32.62 

Total Price $3,041 .00 $3,262.00 

111 18" x 72" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 15.83# 500 

Unit Price $36.45 No Bid $39.12 

Total Price $18,225.00 $19,560.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 

For Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs , dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 
Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign• 

6100011425 OS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

Est1matea Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Sign 
Blanks 

112 24" x 30 Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 5.63# 800 

Unit Price $12.64 No Bid $1308 

Total Price $10,112.00 $10,464.00 

113 6" x 18" Rectangle, .080'' thickness, Wt. .84# 1,000 

Unit Price $2 .00 No Bid $2.46 

Total Price $2,000.00 $2,460.00 

114 30" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 10.55# 1,000 

Unit Price $18.96 No Bid $19.61 

Total Price $18,960.00 $19,610.00 

115 5" x 7 3/4" Vertical Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. .24# 200 

Unit Price $0.86 No Bid $12.05 

Total Price $172.00 $2,410.00 

116 12" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6# 500 

Unit Price $7.76 No Bid $7.84 

Total Price $3,880.00 $3,920.00 

117 24" x 24" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 4.5# 500 

Unit Price $10.11 No Bid $10.46 

Total Price $5,055.00 $5,230.00 

118 24" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6.75# 500 

Unit Price $15.06 No Bid $15.68 

Total Price $7,530.00 $7,840.00 

119 36" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle ©, .080" thickness, Wt. 13.S# 500 

Unit Price $30.66 No Bid $31 .38 

Total Price $15,330.00 $15,690.00 

120 36" x 36" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, 500 
Wt.10.13# 
Unit Price $22.90 No Bid $23.54 

Total Price $11,450.00 $11 ,770.00 

121 12" x 18" Rectangle, .080" thickness. Wt. 1.69# 1,500 

Unit Price $3.78 No Bid $4.10 

Total Price $5,670.00 $6,150.00 

122 24" x 48" Horizontal RectangleNertical Rectangle©,. 100" 1,000 
thickness, Wt. 11 .26# 
Unit Price $25.47 No Bid $26.14 

Total Price $25,470.00 $26,140.00 

123 30" x 60" Horizontal Rectangle Vertical Rectangle © .100" 500 
thickness. Wt. 17.59# 
Unit Price $39.96 No Bid $40.86 

Total Price $19,980.00 $20,430.00 

124 36" Equilateral Triangle . 100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500 

Unit Price $13.47 No Bid $16.49 

Total Price $6,735.00 $8,245.00 

125 48" x 60" Vertical Rectangle, .100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500 

Unit Price $63.57 No Bid $65.38 

Total Price $31 ,785.00 $32,690.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 5/13/2019 Page B 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 19, 2019 
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan 
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs Signs , dba Vulcan Pathmark Traffic 

Aluminum Equipment, LLC. U.S Standard Sign• 
6100011425 DS PO Box 1850 4435 Hunter Road 11400 W. Addison Ave 

t:st1ma1ea Foley, San Marcos, Franklin Park, 
Annual AL 36536-1850 TX 78666 IL 60131 

Item Description Quantity 251-972-1308 

Sign 
Blanks 

126 12x18 1,500 

Unit Price $3.78 No Bid $4.10 

Total Price $5,670.00 $6,150.00 

127 12 x6 1,500 
Unit Price $1 .34 No Bid $1 .72 

Total Price $2,010.00 $2,580.00 

Delivery 30-45 days 45 days 45 days 

Payment Terms Net 30 days Net 30 days 2% 10 days 

Estimated Total: $1 ,913,415.00 $2,750,885.00 $275 304.00 
Estimated Total Award : $1 ,913,415.00 
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Opened: 

For: 

June 17, 2019 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Helmets and Repair Parts for The San Antonio Fire 
Department 

6100011450 

Item Description 

1A Helmet, Cairns & Brother, Matte Finish , Part Number 1044, 
No Substitute 

Name of Manufacturer 
Product No 

Total Price 

1B Helmet, Green, w/ Leather Front, Part Number 1010, No 
Substitute 
Name of Manufacturer 
Product No 

Total Price 

2A Repair/replacement parts for Cairns & Brother Model 
helmets 

Discount off price list 

Price list identification 

Effective date of price list 

Delivery 
Payment Terms 

Page 1 of 1 

HS Exemption 
Casco Industries Inc. 

1517 W . Carrier Pkwy Ste. 
SC 118 

Estimated Grand Prairie, TX 
Annual 75050 

Quantity 512-848-9971 

800 
$299.00 

MSA Cairns 
1044 

$239,200.00 

25 
$329.00 

MSA Cairns 
1010 

$8 ,225.00 

48% 

N/A 

17-Jun-19 

36 Days 

Net 30 


