

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2016						
For: Automotive Shop Supplies						
6100006852		DG				
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities	Local Poppe Automotive Warehouse 716 S. Frio Street San Antonio, TX 78207 (210) 225-3657	Local Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218	Non-Local O'Reilly Auto Enterprise LLC DBA O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Local Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217
1	Windshield Wiper Blades					
a	16" Windshield Wiper Blades	100				
	Price Each		\$1.75	\$2.15	\$3.49	\$2.80
	Price Total		\$175.00	\$215.00	\$349.00	\$280.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.72	\$2.11	\$3.42	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$171.50	\$210.70	\$342.02	\$280.00
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Rainy Day by Anco/ Part # RDB16	NAPA PROFORMER NP16	TRICO 31-160	ANCO 31-16
b	18" Windshield Wiper Blades	990				
	Price Each		\$1.75	\$2.19	\$3.49	\$2.80
	Price Total		\$1,732.50	\$2,168.10	\$3,455.10	\$2,772.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.72	\$2.15	\$3.42	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1,697.85	\$2,124.74	\$3,386.00	\$2,772.00
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Rainy Day by Anco/ Part # RDB18	NAPA PROFORMER NP18	TRICO 31-180	ANCO 31-18
c	20" Windshield Wiper Blades	1,200				
	Price Each		\$1.75	\$2.19	\$3.49	\$2.80
	Price Total		\$2,100.00	\$2,628.00	\$4,188.00	\$3,360.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.72	\$2.15	\$3.42	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$2,058.00	\$2,575.44	\$4,104.24	\$3,360.00
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Rainy Day by Anco/ Part # RDB20	NAPA PROFORMER NP20	TRICO 31-200	ANCO 31-20
d	22" Windshield Wiper Blades	2,710				
	Price Each		\$1.75	\$2.19	\$3.49	\$2.80
	Price Total		\$4,742.50	\$5,934.90	\$9,457.90	\$7,588.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.72	\$2.15	\$3.42	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$4,647.65	\$5,816.20	\$9,268.74	\$7,588.00
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Rainy Day by Anco/ Part # RDB22	NAPA PROFORMER NP22	TRICO 31-220	ANCO 31-22
e	24" Windshield Wiper Blades	690				
	Price Each		\$1.75	\$2.99	\$4.49	\$2.80
	Price Total		\$1,207.50	\$2,063.10	\$3,098.10	\$1,932.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.72	\$2.93	\$4.40	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1,183.35	\$2,021.84	\$3,036.14	\$1,932.00
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Rainy Day by Anco/ Part # RDB24	NAPA PROFORMER NP24	TRICO 31-240	ANCO 31-24
	Total Item 1		\$9,957.50	\$13,009.10	\$20,548.10	\$15,932.00
2	Non-Chlorinated Parts Cleaner, 14 oz. spray can	5,854				
	Price Each		\$1.99	\$2.69	\$4.47	\$2.90
	Price Total		\$11,649.46	\$15,747.26	\$26,167.38	\$16,976.60
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.95	\$2.64	\$4.38	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$11,416.47	\$15,432.31	\$25,644.03	\$16,976.60
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Johnsens/Part # 2413/14 oz	3M 08880	3M 8880	MMM 08880
3	Lubricant/Penetrant, 11 oz. spray can	164				
	Price Each		\$1.99	\$3.50	\$6.02	\$6.00
	Price Total		\$326.36	\$574.00	\$987.28	\$984.00
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.95	\$3.43	\$5.90	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$319.83	\$562.52	\$967.53	\$984.00
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Johnsens/Part # 4602/10 oz	NAPA MAC # 6300 12 Oz. Can	WD 10032	WD40 110078

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2016						
For: Automotive Shop Supplies						
6100006852		DG				
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities	Local Poppe Automotive Warehouse 716 S. Frio Street San Antonio, TX 78207 (210) 225-3657	Local Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218	Non-Local O'Reilly Auto Enterprise LLC DBA O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Local Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217
4	Rearview mirror adhesive, Approximately .01 ounce per tube Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	42	\$1.59 \$66.78 2% \$1.56 \$65.44	\$2.10 \$88.20 2% \$2.06 \$86.44	\$3.41 \$143.22 2% \$3.34 \$140.36	\$1.95 \$81.90 2% \$3.34 \$81.90
	Permatex/Part # 81844/.01 oz			PERMATEX 765-1184	PER 81844	PERMATEX 81844
5	Black Ultra Silicone, 3.35 oz. tube Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	143	\$3.79 \$541.97 2% \$3.71 \$531.13	\$3.99 \$570.57 2% \$3.91 \$559.16	\$6.74 \$963.82 2% \$6.61 \$944.54	\$4.25 \$607.75 2% \$6.61 \$607.75
	Permatex/Part # 82180/3.35 oz			PERMATEX NAPA 765-1589	PER 82180	PERMATEX 598BR
6	Thread seal tape, 1/2" x 260" Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	76	\$0.99 \$75.24 2% \$0.97 \$73.74	\$1.25 \$95.00 2% \$1.23 \$93.10	\$3.59 \$272.84 2% \$3.52 \$267.38	No Bid
	Performance Tool/Part # W974 1 1/2" x Z60"			NAPA 770-1755	MTM 25324	
7	Vinyl electrical tape, 3/4" x 60' x .007" Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	200	\$0.89 \$178.00 2% \$0.87 \$174.44	\$0.85 \$170.00 2% \$0.83 \$166.60	\$1.75 \$350.00 2% \$1.72 \$343.00	\$0.99 \$198.00 2% \$1.72 \$198.00
	3M/Part # 93604/3/4" x 60'			3M 93604	3M 93604	3m 93604
8	Battery cleaner, 11 oz. spray can Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	116	\$2.09 \$242.44 2% \$2.05 \$237.59	\$2.19 \$254.04 2% \$2.15 \$248.96	\$4.22 \$489.52 2% \$4.14 \$479.73	\$2.75 \$319.00 2% \$4.14 \$319.00
	CRC/Part # 05023 11 oz			CRC 095023	CRC 5023	CRC 05023
9	Injector cleaning fluid, 16 oz. can Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	4	\$8.12 \$32.48 2% \$7.96 \$31.83	\$8.25 \$33.00 2% \$8.09 \$32.34	No Bid	No Bid
	OTC/Part # OTC-7000/ 16 oz			NAPA OTC 700-2121		
10	Brake fluid, Five gallon container Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	17	\$59.95 \$1,019.15 2% \$58.75 \$998.77	\$74.95 \$1,274.15 2% \$73.45 \$1,248.67	\$69.99 \$1,189.83 2% \$68.59 \$1,166.03	No Bid
	Johnsens/Part # 2241/ 5gal			NAPA BRAKE FLUID 35-105	OIL 93004	
11	Antifreeze/Coolant, 55 gallon container Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	10	\$419.00 \$4,190.00 2% \$410.62 \$4,106.20	\$439.00 \$4,390.00 2% \$430.22 \$4,302.20	\$589.99 \$5,899.90 2% \$578.19 \$5,781.90	No Bid
	Parts Plus by Prestone/Part # 87979/55gal			NAPA 55 GAL	AFZ 55 GAL	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2016						
For: Automotive Shop Supplies						
6100006852		DG				
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities	Local Poppe Automotive Warehouse 716 S. Frio Street San Antonio, TX 78207 (210) 225-3657	Local Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218	Non-Local O'Reilly Auto Enterprise LLC DBA O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Local Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217
12	Clear silicone, 3 oz. tube Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Total Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	316	\$2.29 \$723.64 2% \$2.24 \$709.17	\$3.49 \$1,102.84 2% \$3.42 \$1,080.78	\$6.29 \$1,987.64 2% \$6.16 \$1,947.89	\$2.85 \$900.60
	Permatex/Part # 80050/3oz			NAPA PERMATEX 765-1344	VER 73009	PERMATEX 66BR
13	Battery Protector, 12 oz. spray can Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	198	\$2.89 \$572.22 2% \$2.83 \$560.78	\$3.29 \$651.42 2% \$3.22 \$638.39	\$3.14 \$621.72 2% \$3.08 \$609.29	No Bid
	CRC/Part # 05046/7.5oz net.wt. 12oz Can			CRC 095046	PER 80370	
14	All Purpose Marking & Coding Pens Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	180	\$2.69 \$484.20 2% \$2.64 \$474.52	\$3.26 \$586.80 2% \$3.19 \$575.06	No Bid	No Bid
	Dykem/Part # 84001-84007/			NAPA SUPER MET-AL # 710-1712 - # 710-1718		
15 a	Threadlocker High Temperature Threadlocker Red, 10 ml Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	91	\$6.19 \$563.29 2% \$6.07 \$552.02	\$6.99 \$636.09 2% \$6.85 \$623.37	\$11.69 \$1,063.79 2% \$11.46 \$1,042.51	\$7.00 \$637.00
	Permatex/Part # 27200/10ML			NAPA PERMATEX 765 - 2680	PER 27200	PERMATEX 27200
b	Surface Insensitive Threadlocker Blue, 0.20 oz Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	36	\$4.79 \$172.44 2% \$4.69 \$168.99	\$8.17 \$294.12 2% \$8.01 \$288.24	\$7.19 \$258.84 2% \$7.05 \$253.66	\$5.00 \$180.00
	Permatex/Part # 24027/20 oz			PERMATEX # 24027	PER 24027	PERMATEX 24027
c	Low Strength Threadlocker Purple, 6 ml Tube Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	36	\$4.29 \$154.44 2% \$4.20 \$151.35	\$4.69 \$168.84 2% \$4.60 \$165.46	\$6.29 \$226.44 2% \$6.16 \$221.91	\$5.00 \$180.00
	Permatex/Part # 24024/6 ML			NAPA PERMATEX 24024	PER 24024	PERMATEX 24024
d	High Strength Threadlocker Red, 36 ml Bottle Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	36	\$14.99 \$539.64 2% \$14.69 \$528.85	\$16.59 \$597.24 2% \$16.26 \$585.30	\$20.69 \$744.84 2% \$20.28 \$729.94	\$16.00 \$576.00
	Permatex/Part # 27140/36 ML			NAPA PERMATEX 765 - 1144	PER 27140	PERMATEX 27140
e	Medium Strength Threadlocker Blue, 36 ml Price Each Price Total Prompt Payment Discount Price each with Prompt Payment Discount Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	36	\$14.99 \$539.64 2% \$14.69 \$528.85	\$16.59 \$597.24 2% \$16.26 \$585.30	\$20.69 \$744.84 2% \$20.28 \$729.94	\$16.00 \$576.00
	Permatex/Part # 24240/36 ML			NAPA PERMATEX 765 - 1142	PER 24240	PERMATEX 24240
Total Item 15			\$1,969.45	\$2,293.53	\$3,038.75	\$2,149.00

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2016						
For: Automotive Shop Supplies						
6100006852		DG				
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities	Local Poppe Automotive Warehouse 716 S. Frio Street San Antonio, TX 78207 (210) 225-3657	Local Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218	Non-Local O'Reilly Auto Enterprise LLC DBA O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Local Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217
16	Woodgrain and Stripe Adhesive Remover, 18 Fluid oz. Price Each \$21.49 Price Total \$9,949.87 Prompt Payment Discount 2% Price each with Prompt Payment Discount \$21.06 Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount \$9,750.87 Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	463		\$26.49 \$12,264.87 2% \$25.96 \$12,019.57	\$29.85 \$13,820.55 2% \$29.25 \$13,544.14	\$24.75 \$11,459.25 2% \$29.25 \$11,459.25
17	Antifreeze/Coolant, One gallon container Price Each \$7.79 Price Total \$3,404.23 Prompt Payment Discount 2% Price each with Prompt Payment Discount \$7.63 Total \$3,336.15 Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	437	3M /Part # 08908/18 oz	3M 08908	3M 8908	3M 08908
18	Anti-Seize Lubricant, 12 oz spray can Price Each \$7.89 Price Total \$536.52 Prompt Payment Discount 2% Price each with Prompt Payment Discount \$7.73 Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount \$525.79 Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	68	Parts Plus by Prestone/Part # 87969	NAPA 1 EXT	AFZ PEAKLL	PRONTO 076PR
19 a	Exterior Industrial Maintenance Paint Exterior Industrial Maintenance Paint, 16 oz. can, 12 oz. net weight, Color to be selected at time of order; available colors must include white, black, red and safety yellow Price Each \$3.99 Price Total \$917.70 Prompt Payment Discount 2% Price each with Prompt Payment Discount \$3.91 Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount \$899.35 Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	230	Permatex/Part # 81464/12 oz	NAPA PERMATEX 765 - 1150	PER 80070	PERMATEX 81464
19 b	Acrylic Alkyd Enamel Paint, 16 oz. can, 12 oz. net weight, Color to be selected at time of order Price Each \$3.39 Price Total \$1,695.00 Prompt Payment Discount 2% Price each with Prompt Payment Discount \$3.32 Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount \$1,661.10 Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	500	Krylon/Part # 5809-5820/15 oz	KRYLON 51501-1813	No Bid	No Bid
19 c	Acrylic Latex Enamel Paint, 16 oz. can, 12 oz. net weight, Color to be selected at time of order Price Each \$3.39 Price Total \$1,559.40 Prompt Payment Discount 2% Price each with Prompt Payment Discount \$3.32 Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount \$1,528.21 Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	460	Krylon/Part # 51501-52504/12 oz	KRYLON VARIOUS #S	No Bid	No Bid
19 d	Rust Protective Enamel Paint, 20 oz. can, 15 oz. net weight, Color to be selected at time of order Price Each \$3.39 Price Total \$1,728.90 Prompt Payment Discount 2% Price each with Prompt Payment Discount \$3.32 Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount \$1,694.32 Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential Brand & Model No:	510	Krylon/Part # KO 7900-KO 7915/12 oz/12 oz	KRYLON VARIOUS #S	No Bid	No Bid
Total Item 19			\$5,901.00	\$6,399.00	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2016 For: Automotive Shop Supplies		Local		Local		Non-Local	Local
6100006852		DG		Poppe Automotive Warehouse 716 S. Frio Street San Antonio, TX 78207 (210) 225-3657	Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprise LLC DBA O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities					
20	Deleted						
21	Throttle Plate & Carb Cleaner, 8.5 Fluid oz.	88					
	Price Each		\$2.69	\$2.05	\$6.27	\$4.75	
	Price Total		\$236.72	\$180.40	\$551.76	\$418.00	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$2.64	\$2.01	\$6.14	\$4.71	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$231.99	\$176.79	\$540.72	\$418.00	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid						
	Price Differential						
	Brand & Model No:		Permatex/Part # 80279/12 oz	NAPA 8700 (13 Oz. Can)	3M 8866	3M 08866	
22	All Purpose Absorbent, 50 lbs. bags or sacks	1,240					
	Price Each		\$4.79	\$5.24	\$7.49	\$6.50	
	Price Total		\$5,939.60	\$6,497.60	\$9,287.60	\$8,060.00	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$4.69	\$5.14	\$7.34	\$6.39	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$5,820.81	\$6,367.65	\$9,101.85	\$8,060.00	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid						
	Price Differential						
	Brand & Model No:		Absorb-N-Dry/Part # 80620/50 lb	NAPA 8822 (24 QT bag/25 lb bag)	OD 40	WARREN 142925 OIL DRI	
23	Power Steering Fluid, 1 Quart plastic bottles	120					
	Price Each		\$2.39	\$2.48	\$3.39	\$2.55	
	Price Total		\$286.80	\$297.60	\$406.80	\$306.00	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$2.34	\$2.43	\$3.32	\$2.52	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$281.06	\$291.65	\$398.66	\$306.00	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid						
	Price Differential						
	Brand & Model No:		Johnsens/Part # 4610/32 oz	NAPA P/S FWID # 9832	ORC 72810	JOHNSON 4610	
24	Windshield Washer Fluid, 1 Gallon plastic bottles	2,557					
	Price Each		\$1.15	\$1.29	\$2.59	\$1.99	
	Price Total		\$2,940.55	\$3,298.53	\$6,622.63	\$5,088.43	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.13	\$1.26	\$2.54	\$1.97	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$2,881.74	\$3,232.56	\$6,490.18	\$5,088.43	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid						
	Price Differential						
	Brand & Model No:		Krystal Kleer/Part # KK22/1 qt	NAPA WASHER FLUID # PLUS32	W/P GAL-TX	BU66	
25	Super Glue, 2 gm Tube	2					
	Price Each		\$0.89	\$1.35	\$1.79	\$1.19	
	Price Total		\$1.78	\$2.70	\$3.58	\$2.38	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$0.87	\$1.32	\$1.75	\$1.17	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$1.74	\$2.65	\$3.51	\$2.38	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid						
	Price Differential						
	Brand & Model No:		Permatex/Part # 82140/2g	NAPA PERMATEX # 765-1181	PER 82190	PERMATEX 82190	
26	Fast Cure Epoxy - Ten 4 g Mixer Cups	6					
	Price Each		\$11.99	\$12.99	\$2.24	\$13.50	
	Price Total		\$71.94	\$77.94	\$13.44	\$81.00	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$11.75	\$12.73	\$2.20	\$13.29	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$70.50	\$76.38	\$13.17	\$81.00	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid		435.27%	479.91%		514.98%	
	Price Differential						
	Brand & Model No:		Permatex/Part # 21425/4g	NAPA PERMATEX # 765-1157	PER 21425	PERMATEX 21425	
27	Spray Trim Adhesive - 16.8 oz.	3					
	Price Each		\$11.99	\$10.99	\$12.65	\$12.50	
	Price Total		\$35.97	\$32.97	\$37.95	\$37.50	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$11.75	\$10.77	\$12.40	\$12.37	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$35.25	\$32.31	\$37.19	\$37.50	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid						
	Price Differential						
	Brand & Model No:		3M/Part # 08074/16.8oz	3M # 08074	3M 8074	3M 08074	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2016						
For: Automotive Shop Supplies		Local		Local	Non-Local	Local
6100006852		Poppe Automotive Warehouse 716 S. Frio Street San Antonio, TX 78207 (210) 225-3657		Genuine Parts Company 6374 Rittiman Road San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprise LLC DBA O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Full Service Auto Parts 4737 Broom St. San Antonio, TX 78217
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantities	DG			
28	Marvel Mystery Oil - Air Tool Oil 32 oz.	6				
	Price Each		\$4.99	\$3.75	\$7.49	No Bid
	Price Total		\$29.94	\$22.50	\$44.94	
	Prompt Payment Discount		2%	2%	2%	
	Price each with Prompt Payment Discount		\$4.89	\$3.68	\$7.34	
	Price Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$29.34	\$22.05	\$44.04	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid					
	Price Differential					
	Brand & Model No:		Marvel/Part # 00013/32oz	NAPA AIR TOOL OIL # 765-1400 (16 OZ)	MVL 085	
	Payment Terms		2% 10 Days	2% 10 Days	2% 10 Days	Net 30
	Estimated Annual Total		\$61,363.81	\$74,104.37	Incomplete	Incomplete
	Estimated Annual Award		\$61,363.81			

Item 20 deleted. This item will be rebid at a later date.