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ORDINANCE .20 2 0- Q 5 - 14 _ Q 3 2 2 
APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH EQUIPMENT DEPOT AND 
HOLTCAT TO PROVIDE THE PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT WITH 
TWO OFF-ROAD EQUIPMENT UNITS FOR A TOTAL COST OF 
$247,471.00. FUNDING IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2020 EQUIPMENT 
RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with replacement, off-road 
equipment units; and 

WHEREAS, the equipment includes one, wheeled asphalt paver for street paving projects and 
one, articulated wheeled loader to remove drainage channel debris; and 

WHEREAS, Equipment Depot submitted the low bid for item 2 for a cost of $75,926.00; and 

WHEREAS, HoltCat submitted the low bid for item 6 in the amount of $171,545.00; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Equipment Depot (Item 2) and HoltCat (Item 6) for a total 
cost of $247,471.00 are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required 
bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheet is 
attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. 

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $247,471.00 is available in Fund 
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2020 
budget approved by City Council. 

SECTION 3. Payment in the amount of $75,926.00 is authorized to Equipment Depot and should 
be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 4. Payment in the amount of $171,545 .00 is authorized to HoltCat and should be 
encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy 
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject to 
concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost 
Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 
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SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 14th day of May, 2020. 

Ron Nirenberg 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

~ 
~ Andrew Segovia, City Attorney 

2 



File Number: 20-2702 

Item: 8 

File Number: 20-2702 

City of San Antonio 

City Council 

May 14, 2020 

Enactment Number: 2020-05-14-0322 

Enactment Number: 
2020-05-14-0322 

Ordinance approving contracts with Equipment Depot and HoltCat to provide the Public 
Works Department with two off-road equipment units for a total cost of $247,471.00. 
Funding is available from the FY 2020 Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund Budget. 
[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Councilmember John Courage made a motion to approve. Councilmember Roberto C. 
Trevino seconded the motion. The motion passed by the following vote: 

Aye: 11 Nirenberg, Trevino, Andrews-Sullivan, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, 
Gonzales, Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage and Perry 

Office oft/re City Clerk Printed on 5/ 14120 
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Exhibit I 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened : January 31, 2020 Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local 
For: Off Road Equipment Equipment Depot HoltCat Anderson Machinery Associated Supply Bobcat of San Cooper Equipment H&E Equipment 

Company, Inc. Co., Inc. dba, ASCO Antonio Co. Services 
Equipment 

6100012410 LO 5250 N. Loop 1604 5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 2102 E. Slayton Rd. 11146 IH 35 North 17 4 7 4 Judson Road 5327 Tex-Con Rd . 
E. 

Item Description QTY San Antonio , San Antonio, San Antonio , Lubbock, San Antonio , San Antonio , San Antonio, 
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 79404-6800 TX 78233 TX 78247 TX 78220 
210-225-1221 210-213-3143 

1 DELETED : 

2 Articulated Wheeled Loader / 1.0 Cubic 1 
Yard Bucket: 
Price Each: $75,926.00 $84,239.00 No Bid $79,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total : $75,926.00 $84,239.00 $79,250.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2020 New Holland 2020 Caterpillar 2020 Case 321 F 

W80C - Identical to 906M 
Case 321F 

Specific Make & Model of Engine FPT F5HFL463A Cat C3.3B DIT, 74 FPT F5H FL463A 
Offered (Include SAE net HP): F004, 70 hp hp F001 , 70 

Warranty: 12 month/Unlimited 24 mos/2000 hours, 12m/Unlimited Hr 
Hours total machine Factory=) 

24m/2000 Hr 
Warranty Service Provider Facility Equipment Depot HoltCat, ASCO Equipment 
Name: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility 5250 N. Loop 1604 5665 SE Loop 410, 1920 SE Loop 410, 
Address: E., San Antonio , San Antonio , TX San Antonio 

TX 78247 78222 
Delivery: 120 Days 150 Days 200 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: NIA unknown 6-14-2020 

Last day order can be placed without NIA unknown 6-13-2020 
missinQ cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut- Yes no No 
off date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: January 31 , 2020 Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local 
For: Off Road Equipment Equipment Depot HoltCat Anderson Machinery Associated Supply Bobcat of San Cooper Equipment H&E Equipment 

Company, Inc. Co., Inc. dba, ASCO Antonio Co. Services 
Equipment 

6100012410 LD 5250 N. Loop 1604 5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 2102 E. Slayton Rd. 11146 IH 35 North 17 4 7 4 Judson Road 5327 Tex-Con Rd . 
E. 

Item Description QTY San Antonio , San Antonio , San Antonio , Lubbock, San Antonio , San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 79404-6800 TX 78233 TX 78247 TX 78220 
210-225-1221 210-213-3143 

3 DELETED: 

4 DELETED: 

5 DELETED: 

6 Wheeled Asphalt Paver: 1 
Price Each: No Bid $171 ,545.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $214,953.00 No Bid 
Total : $171 ,545.00 $214,953.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2020 Caterpillar 2020 Dynapac 

AP300F F1800W 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Cal C3.3B , 73.8 hp Deutz 2.9L Tier IV, 
Offered (Include SAE net HP): 73 h.P. 
Warranty: 12 mo/unlimited 12 months I 2000 

hours, total machine Hours 

Warranty Service Provider Facility HoltCat, Cooper Equipment 
Name: Co. 
Warranty Service Provider Facility 5665 SE Loop 410, 17474 Judson Rd. , 
Address: San Antonio , TX San Antonio , TX 

78222 78247 
Delivery: 150 Days 120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: unknown July 1, 2020 
Last day order can be placed without unknown June 15, 2020 
missinQ cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut- no Yes (Until October 
off date: 1, 2020) 

7 DELETED : 

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Total Award: $75 926 .00 $171 545.00 $0.00 $0 .00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
Deleted items 1, 3, 4, 5 and 7 will be bid at a later date. 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: January 31 , 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local 
For: Off Road Equipment H&V Equipment Harris County Nueces Power RDO Equipment Co. Romeo Equipment Waukesha-Pearce 

Services, Inc. Rentals dba Texas Equipment Company Industries, LLC 
State Rentals 

6100012410 LD 3307 S.E. Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 19275 N. IH 35 1042 SE Loop 410 3740 SE Loop 410 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio , Converse, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio , 
TX 78222 TX 78220 TX 78109 TX 78132 TX 78222 TX 78222 

1 DELETED: 

2 Articulated Wheeled Loader / 1.0 Cubic 1 
Yard Bucket: 
Price Each : No Bid No Bid No Bid $78,600.00 No Bid No Bid 
Total : $78,600.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2020 John Deere 

244L 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Yan mar 4TNV98CT 
Offered (Include SAE net HP): (71 HP) 

Warranty: 2 year or 2000 
hours 

Warranty Service Provider Facility RDO Equipment Co. 
Name: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility 19275 N. IH 35, 
Address: New Braunfels, 

TX 78132 
Delivery: 120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 9-30-2020 

Last day order can be placed without 4-30-2020 
missinQ cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut- No 
off date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: January 31 , 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local 
For: Off Road Equipment H&V Equipment Harris County Nueces Power RDO Equipment Co. Romeo Equipment Waukesha-Pearce 

Services, Inc. Rentals dba Texas Equipment Company Industries, LLC 
State Rentals 

6100012410 LO 3307 S.E. Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North 19275 N. IH 35 1042 SE Loop 410 3740 SE Loop 410 

Item Description QTY San Anionic, San Antonio , Converse, New Braunfels , San Antonio, San Anlonio , 
TX 78222 TX 78220 TX 78109 TX 78132 TX 78222 TX 78222 

3 DELETED: 

4 DELETED: 

5 DELETED: 

6 Wheeled Asphalt Paver: 1 
Price Each : No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total : 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine 
Offered (Include SAE nel HP): 
Warranty: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Name: 
Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address : 

Delivery: 
Production Cut-off Date: 
Last day order can be placed withoul 
missinq cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid ilems after cut-
off date: 

7 DELETED: 

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Total Award: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0 .00 $0.00 $0 .00 
Deleted items 1, 3, 4, 5 and 7 will be bid at a laler date. 
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