

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

| Opened: May 18, 2018 | | | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Non-Local |
|---|--|-----|--|---|---|---|--|---------------------------------------|--|------------------------------|---|
| For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment | | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment | Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment | Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC | Holt Texas, LTD | Grande Truck Center | Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. | H&V Equipment Services, Inc. | RDO Equipment Co. |
| 6100010201 LD | | | 17474 Judson Road | 4697 FM 1516 N. | 2102 E. Slayton Rd. | 8700 IH 10 East | 5665 Southeast Loop 410 | 4562 IH-10 East | 9415 NE Loop 410 | 3307 S.E. Loop 410 | 19275 N. IH 35 |
| Item | Description | QTY | San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151 | Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066 | Lubbock, TX 79404-6800 806-745-2000 | Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373 | San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111 | San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7112 | San Antonio, TX 78219 | San Antonio, TX 78222 | New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| 1 | 2 Ton Tandem Smooth Drum Vibratory Roller: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: | 1 | | | | No Bid | \$42,470.00 \$42,470.00 Caterpillar CB24B, 2018 Caterpillar C1.5, 36.2 hp T4f | No Bid | \$45,491.00 \$45,491.00 2018 Bomag BW120AD-5 DPF Kubota D1803 | No Bid | \$44,452.25 \$44,452.25 2018 Sakai SW354 Kubota D1703-M-DI-EF03, (25 hp) |
| | | | | \$33,832.48 \$33,832.48 2018 Dynapac CC1200V1 | \$39,473.00 \$39,473.00 2018 Hamm HD12VV | \$36,000.00 \$36,000.00 2018 Case DV26C | | | | | |
| | | | Kubota D1703-D1 (T4F), 25 HP | Kubota D1703 24.8 hp | Yanmar 3TNV88, 30.6 HP | | | | | | |
| | | | 1 year/2000 hours | 1 yr, 1000 hours | 12 Months/Unlimited Hours | | 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine | | Twelve (12) Months or 1000 hrs., whichever comes first | | 1 year full machine, then 2nd + 3rd year of powertrain up to 3000 hours. |
| | | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | Nueces Power Equipment | Associated Supply Co Inc. | | Holt Cat | | Anderson Machinery Company, San Antonio | | RDO Equipment Co. |
| | | | 17474 Judson Road, San Antonio, TX 78247 | 4697 FM 1516 North, Converse, TX 78109 | 4146 IH 10 East, San Antonio, Texas 78219 | | 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78222 | | 9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX | | 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| | | | 45-90 Days | 30-120 Days | 180 Days | | 175 Days | | 30-90 days | | 30-90 Days |
| | | | December 30, 2018 | 8/31/18 | 7-15-18 | | Unknown at this time | | 10-31-18 | | 8/30/2018 |
| | | | 12/30/18 | 8/30/18 | 7-15-18 | | Unknown at this time | | 10-24-18 | | 8/15/2018 |
| | | | No | No | No | | Unknown | | No | | No |

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

| | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---|---|------------|---------------------------------------|---|---|--|---------------------------------------|---------------------------------------|----------------------------------|------------------------------|-------------------------|
| Opened: May 18, 2018 | | | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Non-Local |
| For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment | | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment | Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment | Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC | Holt Texas, LTD | Grande Truck Center | Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. | H&V Equipment Services, Inc. | RDO Equipment Co. |
| 6100010201 LD | | | 17474 Judson Road | 4697 FM 1516 N. | 2102 E. Slayton Rd. | 8700 IH 10 East | 5665 Southeast Loop 410 | 4562 IH-10 East | 9415 NE Loop 410 | 3307 S.E. Loop 410 | 19275 N. IH 35 |
| Item | Description | QTY | San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151 | Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066 | Lubbock, TX 79404-6800 806-745-2000 | Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373 | San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111 | San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7112 | San Antonio, TX 78219 | San Antonio, TX 78222 | New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| 2 | Trailer Mounted Compressor: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: | 1 | No Bid | \$32,500.00 \$32,500.00 2018 Doosan P250 John Deere 4050ST, 74 HP 1 yr / 2000 Hours whichever occurs first Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North, Converse, TX 78109 30 Days 8/31/18 8/31/18 No | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

| Opened: May 18, 2018 | | | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Non-Local |
|---|---|-----|------------------------------------|---|---|--|---|------------------------------------|----------------------------------|--|--|
| For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment | | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment | Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment | Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC | Holt Texas, LTD | Grande Truck Center | Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. | H&V Equipment Services, Inc. | RDO Equipment Co. |
| 6100010201 LD | | | 17474 Judson Road | 4697 FM 1516 N. | 2102 E. Slayton Rd. | 8700 IH 10 East | 5665 Southeast Loop 410 | 4562 IH-10 East | 9415 NE Loop 410 | 3307 S.E. Loop 410 | 19275 N. IH 35 |
| Item | Description | QTY | San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151 | Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066 | Lubbock, TX 79404-6800 806-745-2000 | Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373 | San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111 | San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7112 | San Antonio, TX 78219 | San Antonio, TX 78222 | New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| 3 | 4 Wheel Drive Articulated Wheeled Loader: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: | 7 | No Bid | \$138,944.00 \$972,608.00 2018 Hyundai, HL940TM or 2019 Hyundai, HL940TM Cummins QSB 6.7, 156 HP | \$126,980.00 \$888,860.00 2018 Case 621G FPT F4HF2613W | No Bid | \$133,346.00 \$933,422.00 5.01% \$44,562.00 2018 Caterpillar 926M | No Bid | No Bid | NAS \$128,777.00 \$901,439.00 1.42% \$12,579.00 2018 Doosan DL220-5 Wheel Loader Doosan DL06, 6 Cylinder, 160 HP | \$130,774.99 \$915,424.93 2018 John Deere 544K II John Deere Power Tech PVS6068, (163 HP) |
| | | | | 3 yrs or 3,000 Hours whichever occurs first | 3yr/3,000 hr Factory Warranty | | 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine | | | 12 mo / 1500 Hours full machine, 36 mo / 5000 PT+Hyd H&V Equipment Services, Inc. 3307 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 | 1 year full machine warranty RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| | | | | Nueces Power Equipment Inc. 4697 FM 1516 North, Converse, TX 78109 | Associated Supply Co Inc. 4146 IH 10 East, San Antonio, Texas 78219 | | Holt Cat 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78222 175 Days | | | 90-130 Days (ARO) None 8/31/2018 | 90-120 Days 6/30/2018 6/15/2018 |
| | | | | 60-150 Days 8/30/18 8/30/18 | 180 Days 7-15-18 7-15-18 | | Unknown at this time Unknown at this time | | | Yes - an additional 60 days | No |

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

| | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---|---|------------|---------------------------------------|---|---|--|---------------------------------------|---------------------------------------|----------------------------------|------------------------------|-------------------------|
| Opened: May 18, 2018 | | | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Non-Local |
| For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment | | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment | Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment | Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC | Holt Texas, LTD | Grande Truck Center | Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. | H&V Equipment Services, Inc. | RDO Equipment Co. |
| 6100010201 LD | | | 17474 Judson Road | 4697 FM 1516 N. | 2102 E. Slayton Rd. | 8700 IH 10 East | 5665 Southeast Loop 410 | 4562 IH-10 East | 9415 NE Loop 410 | 3307 S.E. Loop 410 | 19275 N. IH 35 |
| Item | Description | QTY | San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151 | Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066 | Lubbock, TX 79404-6800 806-745-2000 | Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373 | San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111 | San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7112 | San Antonio, TX 78219 | San Antonio, TX 78222 | New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| 4 | Single Cab Asphalt Distributor: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Year, Make & Model of Asphalt Distributor Body Offered: Asphalt Distributor Body Warranty: Asphalt Distributor Body Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Asphalt Distributor Body Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: | 1 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$171,597.00 \$171,597.00 2020 Freightliner M2-106 Cummins B6.7, 260 HP/660 Tq 2 Years - Unlimited Miles Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC 8700 IH 10 East, Converse, TX 78109 2018 ED Etynyre Centennial Distributor 1 Year Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. 17474 Judson Road, San Antonio, TX 78247 210-330 Days 01/01/2019 09/31/2018 Yes | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

| Opened: May 18, 2018 | | | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Non-Local |
|---|--|-----|---|--|--|---|---|--|--|--|-------------------------------------|
| For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment | | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. 17474 Judson Road | Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 N. | Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. | Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC 8700 IH 10 East | Holt Texas, LTD 5665 Southeast Loop 410 | Grande Truck Center 4562 IH-10 East | Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 | H&V Equipment Services, Inc. 3307 S.E. Loop 410 | RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 |
| 6100010201 LD | | | San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151 | Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066 | Lubbock, TX 79404-6800 806-745-2000 | Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373 | San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111 | San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7112 | San Antonio, TX 78219 | San Antonio, TX 78222 | New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| Item | Description | QTY | | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | 35 Ton Paver Equipment Haul Trailer: | 1 | | | | | | | | | |
| | Price Each: | | \$64,465.22 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$62,862.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | Total: | | \$64,465.22 | | | | \$62,862.00 | | | | |
| | Year, Make & Model Offered: | | 2018 Etnyre Paver Special RTN35TD-PS | | | | 2019 XL 70 HDG Paver | | | | |
| | Warranty: | | 1 Year | | | | 12 months | | | | |
| | Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | | | | Holt Cat | | | | |
| | Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: | | 17474 Judson Road, San Antonio, TX 78247 | | | | 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78222 | | | | |
| | Delivery: | | 120-150 Days | | | | 210 Days | | | | |
| | Production Cut-off Date: | | November 16, 2018 | | | | Unknown at this time | | | | |
| | Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: | | 11/16/18 | | | | Unknown at this time | | | | |
| | Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: | | No | | | | Unknown | | | | |

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

| | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---|---|------------|--|---|---|--|---------------------------------------|---------------------------------------|----------------------------------|------------------------------|-------------------------|
| Opened: May 18, 2018 | | | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Non-Local |
| For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment | | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment | Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment | Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC | Holt Texas, LTD | Grande Truck Center | Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. | H&V Equipment Services, Inc. | RDO Equipment Co. |
| 6100010201 LD | | | 17474 Judson Road | 4697 FM 1516 N. | 2102 E. Slayton Rd. | 8700 IH 10 East | 5665 Southeast Loop 410 | 4562 IH-10 East | 9415 NE Loop 410 | 3307 S.E. Loop 410 | 19275 N. IH 35 |
| Item | Description | QTY | San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151 | Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066 | Lubbock, TX 79404-6800 806-745-2000 | Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373 | San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111 | San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7112 | San Antonio, TX 78219 | San Antonio, TX 78222 | New Braunfels, TX 78132 |
| 6 | 29 Cubic Yard Live Bottom Trailer with Hydraulic or Electric Tarp Cover: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: | 2 | \$74,244.51 \$148,489.02 2018 Falcon Live Bottom LBW-237 1 year Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. 17474 Judson Road, San Antonio, TX 78247 120-150 Days November 16, 2018 11/16/18 No | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

| Opened: May 18, 2018 | | Local | Non-Local | Non-Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Local | Non-Local | | |
|---|--|--------------------------------|---|---|--|------------------------------------|---------------------------------------|--|------------------------------|-----------------------|-------------------------|--------|
| For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment | | Cooper Equipment Company, Inc. | Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment | Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment | Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC | Holt Texas, LTD | Grande Truck Center | Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. | H&V Equipment Services, Inc. | RDO Equipment Co. | | |
| 6100010201 LD | | 17474 Judson Road | 4697 FM 1516 N. | 2102 E. Slayton Rd. | 8700 IH 10 East | 5665 Southeast Loop 410 | 4562 IH-10 East | 9415 NE Loop 410 | 3307 S.E. Loop 410 | 19275 N. IH 35 | | |
| Item | Description | QTY | San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151 | Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066 | Lubbock, TX 79404-6800 806-745-2000 | Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373 | San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-1111 | San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7112 | San Antonio, TX 78219 | San Antonio, TX 78222 | New Braunfels, TX 78132 | |
| 7 | One Ton Full Four Door 59" CA 4x4 9ft Flatbed Truck with Sides and Lift Gate: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Year, Make & Model of Flat Bed with Sides Body and Lift Gate Offered: Flat Bed with Sides Body and Lift Gate Warranty: Flat Bed with Sides Body and Lift Gate Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Flat Bed with Sides Body and Lift Gate Warranty Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Payment Terms: | 1 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$51,549.00 \$51,549.00 2019 Ford F350 Crew Cab SRW 6.7 L, V8 Diesel, Ford, 330 H.P. Ford 6 Speed Base 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Grande Truck Center 4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219 2018 UT989TP Platform, 2018 G2-87-1650 Tommy Gate 12 Months UTEC 5860 Pfeil Road, Schertz, TX 78154 150-180 Days 09/30/2018 09/30/2018 No | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | Total: | | \$246,786.72 | \$1,044,581.00 | \$924,860.00 | \$171,597.00 | \$1,038,754.00 | \$51,549.00 | \$45,491.00 | \$901,439.00 | \$959,877.18 | |
| | Total Award: | | \$182,321.50 | \$32,500.00 | \$888,860.00 | \$171,597.00 | \$62,862.00 | \$51,549.00 | | | | |