City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 6, 2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC.
6100006697 MC|8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach
Dallas,
Iltem Description TX 75247 San Antonio,
210-630-6555 TX 78209
| 1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive:
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford F150,
or proven equal
A Regular Cab
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 $60.00
. ) ) 153.06%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $36.29
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.97| $360.00
. . . 116.91%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $194.03
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $735.00 $1,210.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 64.63%
Price Differential $475.00
Makes & Models Offered Chevy Silverado, Dodge Ram, Ford F150;
rates include full coverage
B Extended Cab
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 $60.00
. . . 153.06%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $36.29
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.97| $360.00
. . . 116.91%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $194.03
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $735.00 $1,210.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 64.63%
Price Differential $475.00
Makes & Models Offered Chevy Silverado, Dodge Ram, Ford F150;
rates include full coverage
C Crew or Super Crew Cab
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $23.71 $60.00
. . . 153.06%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $36.29
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $165.97| $360.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 116.91%
Price Differential $194.03
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate Each $735.00 $1,210.00
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate - Extended Price $105,840.00 $174,240.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 64.63%
Price Differential $68,400.00

Makes & Models Offered

Chevy Silverado, Dodge Ram, Ford F150;

rates include full coverage
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
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6100006697

November 6, 2015
Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles
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NON-LOCAL
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Capps Van & Truck Rental
8555 John Carpenter Fwy
Dallas,

TX 75247

210-630-6555

EAN Holdings, LLC.
1505 Harry Wurzbach

San Antonio,
TX 78209
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1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford F150,
or proven equal

Reaular Cab

Rental- Flat Dailv Rate

Rental- Flat Weekly Rate

Rental- Flat Monthly Rate

Makes & Models Offered

Extended Cab

Rental- Flat Dailv Rate
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate
Makes & Models Offered

Crew or Super Crew Cab
Rental- Flat Dailv Rate

Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate
Makes & Models Offered

3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250,
or proven equal

Reaular Cab

Rental- Flat Daily Rate

Rental- Flat Weekly Rate

Rental- Flat Monthly Rate

Makes & Models Offered

Extended Cab

Rental- Flat Daily Rate
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Rental- Flat Monthlv Rate
Makes & Models Offered

Crew or Super Crew Cab
Rental- Flat Daily Rate

Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate
Makes & Models Offered

3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks. 4 Wheel Drive

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250,
or proven equal

Reaular Cab

Rental- Flat Daily Rate

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid

Price Differential

Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid

Price Differential

Rental- Flat Monthly Rate
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid

Price Differential
Makes & Models Offered

$23.71
$165.97|
$735.00

$23.71
$165.97|
$735.00

$23.71
$165.97|
$735.00

$26.94
$188.58
$835.00

$26.94
$188.58
$835.00]

$26.94
$188.58
$835.00

$26.94

$188.58

$835.00]

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$79.00
193.24%

$52.06

$439.00
132.79%

$250.42

$1,430.00
71.26%

$595.00
F250, Chevy 2500
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 6, 2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC.
6100006697 MC|8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach
Dallas,
Iltem Description TX 75247 San Antonio,
210-630-6555 TX 78209
B Extended Cab
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 $79.00
. ) ) 193.24%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $52.06
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 $439.00
. . . 132.79%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $250.42
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 $1,430.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 71.26%
Price Differential $595.00
Makes & Models Offered F250, Chevy 2500
C Crew or Super Crew Cab
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $26.94 $79.00
. . . 193.24%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $52.06
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $188.58 $439.00
" . . 132.79%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $250.42
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $835.00 $1.430.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 71.26%
Price Differential $595.00
Makes & Models Offered Ford F250. Chevv 2500
\Y Full Size Sport Utilitv Vehicles
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Tahoe, Ford
Expedition, or proven equal
A Reaqular 2 Wheel Drive
1 Rental- Flat Dailv Rate $35.00 $89.00
" . . 154.29%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $54.00
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $245.00 $534.00
" . . 117.96%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $289.00
3 Rental- Flat Monthlv Rate $1,085.00| $1.845.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 70.05%
Price Differential $760.00

Makes & Models Offered

Chevy Tahoe, GMC, Yukon, Nissan Armada,
Ford Expedition

rates include full coverage
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100006697

November 6, 2015
Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles

MC

NON-LOCAL

LOCAL

Item

Description

Capps Van & Truck Rental
8555 John Carpenter Fwy
Dallas,

TX 75247

210-630-6555

EAN Holdings, LLC.
1505 Harry Wurzbach

San Antonio,
TX 78209
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4 Wheel Drive

Rental- Flat Dailv Rate
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate
Makes & Models Offered

Small Size Sport Utility Vehicles

Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford Escape, Jeep Liberty,
or proven equal

2 Wheel Drive. Gasoline Powered

Rental- Flat Daily Rate

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid

Price Differential

Rental- Flat Weeklv Rate
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid

Price Differential

Rental- Flat Monthlv Rate
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid

Price Differential
Makes & Models Offered

4 Wheel Drive. Gasoline Powered
Rental- Flat Daily Rate

Rental- Flat Weekly Rate

Rental- Flat Monthlv Rate

Makes & Models Offered

Hvbrid Powered

Rental- Flat Dailv Rate
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Rental- Flat Monthlv Rate
Makes & Models Offered

Mid Size Sedan

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Malibu, Ford
Fusion, or proven equal

Gasoline Powered

Rental- Flat Dailv Rate

Rental- Flat Weekly Rate

Rental- Flat Monthly Rate

Hybrid Powered

Rental- Flat Daily Rate
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate
Makes & Models Offered

$38.23
$268.63
$1.185.00|

$23.71

$165.97

$735.00

$26.94
$188.58
$835.00

$26.94
$188.58
$835.00

$22.10
$154.70
$685.00]

$25.33
$177.31
$785.00]

No Bid

$56.00
136.19%

$32.29

$336.00
102.45%

$170.03

$1.232.00
67.62%

$497.00

Ford Escape, Kia Sportage, Jeep Compass,
Jeep Patriot, Hyundai Tucson

rates include full coverage

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 6, 2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC.
6100006697 MC|8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach
Dallas,
Iltem Description TX 75247 San Antonio,
210-630-6555 TX 78209
Vil Compact Size Sedan
Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Cruze, Ford
Focus, or proven equal
A Gasoline Powered
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $22.10 $37.00
. . . 67.42%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $14.90
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $154.70 $222.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 43.50%
Price Differential $67.30
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $685.00 $792.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 15.62%
Price Differential $107.00
Makes & Models Offered Chrysler 200, Dodge Avenger, Nissan Cube,
Volkswagen Jetta, Kia Soul
rates include full coverage
B Hybrid Powered No Bid
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $25.33
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $177.31
3 Rental- Flat Monthlv Rate $785.00
Makes & Models Offered
IX Cargo Van
Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford Econoline, GMC
Express, or proven equal
A Gasoline Powered
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $25.33 $55.00
" . . 117.13%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $29.67
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $177.31 $330.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 86.11%
Price Differential $152.69
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $785.00 $1,210.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 54.14%
Price Differential $425.00

Makes & Models Offered

Express 1500 cargo, Econoline 1500 Cargo

rates include full coverage
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 6, 2015 NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC.
6100006697 MC|8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach
Dallas,
Iltem Description TX 75247 San Antonio,
210-630-6555 TX 78209
% SEVEN (7) TO EIGHT (8) PASSENGER MINI-CAN,
WINDOW TYPE:
Acceptable Makes & Models: KIA Sedona, Chrysler
Town & Country, Dodge Grand Caravan, Toyota Sienna
or proven equal
A Gasoline Powered
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $25.33] $512.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 1921.32%
Price Differential $486.67
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $177.31 $312.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 75.96%
Price Differential $134.69
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $785.00] $1,076.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 37.07%
Price Differential $291.00
Chrysler Town and Country, Dodge Grand
Caravan, Toyota Sienna
Makes & Models Offered rates include full coverage
X1 TWELVE (12) PASSENGER VAN, WINDOW-TYPE:
Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford E350 or proven equal
A Gasoline Powered
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $29.84 $94.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 215.01%
Price Differential $64.16
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $208.88 $564.00
. . . 170.01%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $355.12
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $925.00 $1,958.00
. . . 111.68%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $1,033.00
Ford Transit 12 passenger, Chevy E350 12
passenger
Makes & Models Offered rates include full coverage
Xl FIFTEEN (15) PASSENGER VAN, WINDOW-TYPE:
Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford E350 or proven equal
A Gasoline Powered
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate Each $29.84 $94.00
Rental- Flat Daily Rate - Extended Price $149.20 $470.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 215.01%
Price Differential $320.80
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $208.88 $564.00
. . . 170.01%
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid
Price Differential $355.12
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate Each $925.00 $1,958.00
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate - Extended Price $2,775.00, $5,874.00
0,
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 111.68%
Price Differential $3,099.00
Ford Transit, Ford 350, Chevy E350
Makes & Models Offered rates include full coverage
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
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