

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts 6100012605		GDL		Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
				A1 Sports Center 1027 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S- 155 Dallas TX 75247	Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541
	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity												
1	<b>T-Shirt White</b> <b>100% Cotton Shirt</b> Brand Name	8,000	NAS	No Bid	Gildan, Hanes	Gildan	Fruit of the Loom (Port & Co PC54LS for 4x & 5x long sleeve)	Gildan Heavy Cotton T-Shirt (Short Sleeve Adult & Youth) *Long Sleeve is Port & Company Long Sleeve Core Cotton Tee (PC54LS)	Port & Company	Gildan	Port & Company	Gildan, Port & Company	Gildan	Port & Company
	Style #		No Bid	G500, G200, G500B, G200B, 5250, 54500, G540,6540B, G240, G240B, 5586, 5450		5000	3930R	5000 - Adult, 5000B Youth	PC54	G5000	PC61, PC61Y, PC61LS, G240B (Gildan)	SS 5000, 5000B LS 5400B, PC61LS	500 G240-Longsleeve	PC61/PC61LS
	<b>50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt</b> Brand Name	8,000		Jerzees, Gildan	Gildan, Hanes, Jerzees	Gildan	Jerzees (Port & Co PC55LS for 4x & 5x long sleeve)	No Bid	Port & Company	No Bid	Port & Company	Gildan, Port & Company	Gildan	Port & Company
	Style #		29B/29M G240/G240B	G800, G800B, 5170, 29M, 29B, 5370, G840, G840B, 29L, 29BL		8000	29MR	No Bid	PC55	No Bid	PC55, PC55LS, PC55Y, 29BL (Jerzees)	SS 8000, 8000B LS Port PC55LS, Jerzee 293LC	800 G840-Longsleeve	PC55/PC55LS
1.1	<b>Short Sleeve White T-Shirt:</b> Youth Xsmall - Xlarge	2,250												
	Price (per each)		\$1.80	\$2.00	\$2.50	\$3.37	\$1.80	\$2.49	\$1.59	\$2.19	\$2.45	\$2.35	\$2.63	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$4,050.00	\$4,500.00	\$5,625.00	\$7,582.50	\$4,050.00	\$5,602.50	\$3,577.50	\$4,927.50	\$5,512.50	\$5,287.50	\$5,917.50	
	Adult Small - Xlarge	2,250												
	Price (per each)		\$1.75	\$2.08	\$2.50	\$3.55	\$1.96	\$2.49	\$1.44	\$2.62	\$2.50	\$2.35	\$2.90	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$3,937.50	\$4,680.00	\$5,625.00	\$7,987.50	\$4,410.00	\$5,602.50	\$3,240.00	\$5,895.00	\$5,625.00	\$5,287.50	\$6,525.00	
	Adult 2X	1,200												
	Price (per each)		\$3.50	\$3.98	\$4.50	\$5.38	\$4.05	\$4.49	\$3.46	\$4.24	\$5.00	\$4.15	\$4.90	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$4,200.00	\$4,776.00	\$5,400.00	\$6,456.00	\$4,860.00	\$5,388.00	\$4,152.00	\$5,088.00	\$6,000.00	\$4,980.00	\$5,880.00	
	Adult 3X	150												
	Price (per each)		\$5.30	\$4.75	\$5.00	\$6.23	\$4.92	\$5.49	\$4.49	\$4.69	\$6.50	\$5.25	\$5.90	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$795.00	\$712.50	\$750.00	\$934.50	\$738.00	\$823.50	\$673.50	\$703.50	\$975.00	\$787.50	\$885.00	
	Adult 4X	75												
	Price (per each)		\$5.30	\$4.75	\$5.00	\$6.23	\$4.92	\$6.49	\$5.24	\$4.84	\$6.50	\$5.45	\$6.40	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$397.50	\$356.25	\$375.00	\$467.25	\$369.00	\$486.75	\$393.00	\$363.00	\$487.50	\$408.75	\$480.00	
	Adult 5X	75												
	Price (per each)		\$5.30	\$4.75	\$5.00	\$6.23	\$4.92	\$7.49	\$5.24	\$5.35	\$6.50	\$5.95	\$6.50	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$397.50	\$356.25	\$375.00	\$467.25	\$369.00	\$561.75	\$393.00	\$401.25	\$487.50	\$446.25	\$487.50	
1.2	<b>Long Sleeve White T-Shirt:</b> Youth Xsmall - Xlarge	750												
	Price (per each)		\$4.45	\$3.50	\$6.50	\$5.60	\$3.31	\$4.66	No Bid	\$4.48	\$4.10	\$4.95	\$5.91	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$3,337.50	\$2,625.00	\$4,875.00	\$4,200.00	\$2,482.50	\$3,495.00	\$3,360.00	\$3,075.00	\$3,712.50	\$3,712.50	\$4,432.50	
	Adult Small - Xlarge	750												
	Price (per each)		\$3.30	\$3.53	\$6.50	\$5.20	\$3.97	\$4.66	\$2.99	\$5.61	\$4.70	\$4.95	\$5.91	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$2,475.00	\$2,647.50	\$4,875.00	\$3,900.00	\$2,977.50	\$3,495.00	\$2,242.50	\$4,207.50	\$3,525.00	\$3,712.50	\$4,432.50	
	Adult 2X	400												
	Price (per each)		\$5.32	\$5.23	\$7.50	\$6.25	\$5.30	\$6.66	\$5.05	\$7.73	\$6.50	\$5.95	\$7.91	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$2,128.00	\$2,092.00	\$3,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$2,120.00	\$2,664.00	\$2,020.00	\$3,092.00	\$2,600.00	\$2,380.00	\$3,164.00	
	Adult 3X	50												
	Price (per each)		\$6.94	\$6.96	\$8.50	\$8.01	\$5.47	\$7.66	\$6.78	\$8.07	\$7.00	\$6.95	\$8.91	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$347.00	\$348.00	\$425.00	\$400.50	\$273.50	\$383.00	\$339.00	\$403.50	\$350.00	\$347.50	\$445.50	
	Adult 4X	25												
	Price (per each)		\$6.94	\$6.96	\$8.50	\$8.01	\$5.63	\$8.66	\$6.87	\$8.18	\$7.00	No Bid	\$9.41	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$173.50	\$174.00	\$212.50	\$200.25	\$140.75	\$216.50	\$171.75	\$204.50	\$175.00		\$235.25	
	Adult 5X	25												
	Price (per each)		\$6.94	\$6.96	\$8.50	\$8.01	No Bid	\$9.66	\$7.04	\$9.02 - G2400 Gildan	\$7.50	No Bid	\$9.51	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$173.50	\$174.00	\$212.50	\$200.25		\$241.50	\$176.00	\$225.50	\$187.50		\$237.75	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts 6100012605		GDL		Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
Description		Estimated Annual Quantity	San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S-155 Dallas TX 75247	Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541	
1.3	Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.50	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$2.65 72-143 \$2.20 144-287 \$1.90 288-503 \$1.80 504+ \$1.65 1008+ \$1.55 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$1.00	
	2 Color Imprint		\$0.90	\$0.91	\$1.00	\$0.30	\$0.49	\$0.50	\$1.10	\$0.60	\$0.80	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.05 72-143 \$2.50 144-287 \$2.30 288-503 \$3.10 504+ \$1.90 1008+ \$1.75 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	3 Color Imprint		\$1.10	\$1.08	\$1.20	\$0.46	\$0.56	\$0.50	\$1.15	\$0.69	\$0.95	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.45 72-143 \$3.00 144-287 \$2.60 288-503 \$3.10 504+ \$2.10 1008+ \$1.95 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	4 Color Imprint		\$1.30	\$1.26	\$1.40	\$0.52	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$1.25	\$0.80	\$1.10	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.70 72-143 \$3.40 144-287 \$3.00 288-503 \$2.85 504+ \$2.40 1008+ \$2.20 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	2nd Location Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$1.00 1 or 2 color	\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$0.50	\$1.00	\$0.65	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$1.00 each 72-143 \$.80 each 144-287 \$.80 each 288-503 \$.80 each 504+ \$.70 each 1008+ \$.70 each 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$1.00	
	Art Change per Hour		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$46.00	\$0.00	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$15.00	Waived	\$25.00	
	Set Up Fee		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$20.00 per screen	\$16.20 Per Color, Per Location	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00 per color	\$15.00	\$15.00 per color	\$10.00	
	Subtotal:		\$22,426.70	\$23,466.19	\$31,755.10	\$35,364.35	\$22,793.54	\$28,963.00	\$17,383.25	\$28,894.80	\$29,034.15	\$27,350.00	\$33,160.37	
	Prompt Payment Discount:		0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	1%	0%	0%	0%	
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$22,426.70	\$23,466.19	\$31,755.10	\$35,364.35	\$22,793.54	\$28,963.00	\$17,383.25	\$28,605.85	\$29,034.15	\$27,350.00	\$33,160.37	
	<b>Item 1 Total:</b>		\$22,426.70	<b>\$23,466.19</b>	\$31,755.10	\$35,364.35	\$22,793.54	\$28,963.00	\$17,383.25	\$28,605.85	\$29,034.15	\$27,350.00	\$33,160.37	
2	T-Shirt, Colored (Light and Dark) 100% Cotton Shirt	18,000	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	
	Brand Name		No Bid	Gildan, Hanes	Gildan	Fruit of the Loom (Port & Co PC54LS for 4x & 5x long sleeve)	Gildan Heavy Cotton T-Shirt (Short Sleeve Adult & Youth) *Long Sleeve is Port & Company Long Sleeve Core Cotton Tee (PC54LS)	Port & Company	Gildan	Port & Company	Gildan, Port & Company	Same as Item 1	Port & Company	
	Style #		No Bid	G500, G200, G500B, G200B, 5250, 54500, G540,6540B, G240, G240B, 5586, 5450	5000	3930R	5000 - Adult, 5000B Youth	PC54	5000	PC61, PC61Y, PC61LS, G240B (Gildan)	SS 5000, 5000B LS 5400B, PC61LS		PC61/PC61LS	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020				Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	
For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts				A1 Sports Center	Bankson Group LTD dba	Advertising Matters, LLC	All-Star Custom Apparel and	American Solutions for	Express Press	Heart N Soul Graphic Designs	Heaven Sent Promotions and	Promotional Designs	Rivercity Screen Printing &	ROSCO Imprints and	
6100012605		GDL		1027 Bandera Road	Alamo Tees & Advertising	12814 Cogburn	3412 S Grove Street	395 Summit Point Drive, Suite	9901 IH 10 West	1860 E St Louis St	13529 Chandelle Drive	5611 San Pedro Ave	8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S-	1709 South IH-35	120 S Avenue B
				San Antonio	San Antonio	Fort Worth	Henrietta	San Antonio	Springfield	Newalla	San Antonio	Dallas	San Marcos	Freeport	
				TX 78245	TX 78249	TX 76110	NY 14467	TX 78230	MO 65802	OK 74857	TX 78212	TX 75247	TX 78666	TX 77541	
				(210) 664-0566	(210) 699-3800										
				San Antonio	San Antonio	Fort Worth	Henrietta	San Antonio	Springfield	Newalla	San Antonio	Dallas	San Marcos	Freeport	
				TX 78245	TX 78249	TX 76110	NY 14467	TX 78230	MO 65802	OK 74857	TX 78212	TX 75247	TX 78666	TX 77541	
				(210) 664-0566	(210) 699-3800										
				San Antonio	San Antonio	Fort Worth	Henrietta	San Antonio	Springfield	Newalla	San Antonio	Dallas	San Marcos	Freeport	
				TX 78245	TX 78249	TX 76110	NY 14467	TX 78230	MO 65802	OK 74857	TX 78212	TX 75247	TX 78666	TX 77541	
				(210) 664-0566	(210) 699-3800										
2.1	50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt	18,000													
	Brand Name			Jerzees, Gildan	Gildan, Hanes, Jerzees	Gildan	Jerzees (Port & Co PC55LS for 4x & 5x long sleeve)	No Bid	Port & Company	No Bid	Port & Company	Gildan, Jerzee, Port & Company	Port & Company	Port & Company	Port & Company
	Style #			29B/29M, G240, G240B	G800, G800B, 5170, 29M, 29B, 5370, G840, G840B, 29L, 29BL	8000	29MR	No Bid	PC55	No Bid	PC55, PC55Y, PC55LS, 29BL (Jerzees)	SS 8000, 8000B LS Port PC55LS, Jerzee 29B4	PC55/PC55LS	PC55/PC55LS	
	Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colors:														
	Youth Xsmall - Xlarge	6,000													
	Price (per each)			\$2.15	\$2.25	\$2.75	\$3.75	\$2.14	\$3.70	\$1.87	\$3.31	\$2.80	\$3.50		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$12,900.00	\$13,500.00	\$16,500.00	\$22,500.00	\$12,840.00	\$22,200.00	\$11,220.00	\$19,860.00	\$16,800.00	\$21,000.00		
	Adult Small - Xlarge	6,000													
	Price (per each)			\$2.07	\$2.33	\$2.75	\$4.12	\$2.51	\$3.70	\$1.77	\$3.90	\$2.85	\$4.35		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$12,420.00	\$13,980.00	\$16,500.00	\$24,720.00	\$15,060.00	\$22,200.00	\$10,620.00	\$23,400.00	\$17,100.00	\$26,100.00		
	Adult 2X	750													
	Price (per each)			\$3.98	\$4.08	\$4.75	\$6.12	\$4.42	\$5.70	\$3.76	\$5.85	\$5.35	\$6.35		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$2,985.00	\$3,060.00	\$3,562.50	\$4,590.00	\$3,315.00	\$4,275.00	\$2,820.00	\$4,387.50	\$4,012.50	\$4,762.50		
	Adult 3X	375													
	Price (per each)			\$5.99	\$5.40	\$5.25	\$7.72	\$5.57	\$6.70	\$4.57	\$6.41	\$6.85	\$7.35		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$2,246.25	\$2,025.00	\$1,968.75	\$2,895.00	\$2,088.75	\$2,512.50	\$1,713.75	\$2,403.75	\$2,568.75	\$2,756.25		
	Adult 4X	200													
	Price (per each)			\$5.99	\$5.40	\$5.25	\$7.72	\$5.57	\$7.70	\$4.57	\$6.56	\$6.85	\$7.85		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$1,198.00	\$1,080.00	\$1,050.00	\$1,544.00	\$1,114.00	\$1,540.00	\$914.00	\$1,312.00	\$1,370.00	\$1,570.00		
	Adult 5X	200													
	Price (per each)			\$5.99	\$5.40	\$5.25	\$7.72	\$5.57	\$8.70	\$4.57	\$7.36	\$6.85	\$7.95		
Extended Price (per each)			\$1,198.00	\$1,080.00	\$1,050.00	\$1,544.00	\$1,114.00	\$1,740.00	\$914.00	\$1,472.00	\$1,370.00	\$1,590.00			
2.2	Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colors:														
	Youth Xsmall - Xlarge	2,000													
	Price (per each)			\$5.29	\$5.85	\$6.75	\$6.39	\$4.30	\$6.03	\$4.18	\$5.83	\$4.75	\$7.65		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$10,580.00	\$11,700.00	\$13,500.00	\$12,780.00	\$8,600.00	\$12,060.00	\$8,360.00	\$11,660.00	\$9,500.00	\$15,300.00		
	Adult Small - Xlarge	2,000													
	Price (per each)			\$4.37	\$4.50	\$6.75	\$6.98	\$5.26	\$6.03	\$2.95	\$7.08	\$5.50	\$7.65		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$8,740.00	\$9,000.00	\$13,500.00	\$13,960.00	\$10,520.00	\$12,060.00	\$5,900.00	\$14,160.00	\$11,000.00	\$15,300.00		
	Adult 2X	250													
	Price (per each)			\$6.68	\$5.95	\$7.75	\$7.75	\$6.67	\$8.03	\$5.36	\$9.02	\$7.25	\$9.65		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$1,670.00	\$1,487.50	\$1,937.50	\$1,937.50	\$1,667.50	\$2,007.50	\$1,340.00	\$2,255.00	\$1,812.50	\$2,412.50		
	Adult 3X	125													
	Price (per each)			\$8.33	\$7.56	\$8.75	\$9.25	\$6.81	\$9.03	\$5.82	\$9.41	\$7.75	\$10.65		
	Extended Price (per each)			\$1,041.25	\$945.00	\$1,093.75	\$1,156.25	\$851.25	\$1,128.75	\$727.50	\$1,176.25	\$968.75	\$1,331.25		
	Adult 4X	50													
	Price (per each)			\$8.33	\$7.56	\$8.75	\$9.25	\$7.11	\$10.03	\$8.53	\$9.53	\$7.75	\$11.15		
Extended Price (per each)			\$416.50	\$378.00	\$437.50	\$462.50	\$355.50	\$501.50	\$426.50	\$476.50	\$387.50	\$557.50			
Adult 5X	50														
Price (per each)			\$8.33	\$7.56	\$8.75	\$9.25	No Bid	\$11.03	\$8.53	\$10.37	\$8.25	\$11.25			
Extended Price (per each)			\$416.50	\$378.00	\$437.50	\$462.50	No Bid	\$551.50	\$426.50	\$518.50	\$412.50	\$562.50			
2.3	Color Imprint														
	1 Color Imprint			\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.50	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65	\$1.29		
	2 Color Imprint			\$0.90	\$0.91	\$1.00	\$0.30	\$0.49	\$0.50	\$1.10	\$0.60	\$0.80	\$0.32		
	3 Color Imprint			\$1.10	\$1.08	\$1.20	\$0.46	\$0.56	\$0.50	\$1.15	\$0.69	\$0.95	\$0.32		
	4 Color Imprint			\$1.30	\$1.26	\$1.40	\$0.52	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$1.25	\$0.80	\$1.10	\$0.32		
	2nd Location Color Imprint			\$0.70	\$0.72	\$1.00 1 or 2 color	\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$0.50	\$1.00	\$0.65	\$1.29		
	Art Change per Hour			\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$46.00	\$0.00	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$25.00		
	Set Up Fee			\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$20.00 per screen	\$16.20 Per Color, Per Location	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00 per color	\$15.00	\$10.00		
	Subtotal:			\$55,826.20	\$58,638.19	\$71,542.60	\$88,620.10	\$57,548.91	\$82,779.75	\$45,387.25	\$83,105.05	\$67,336.65	\$93,281.04		
	Prompt Payment Discount:			0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	1%	0%	0%		
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:			\$55,826.20	\$58,638.19	\$71,542.60	\$88,620.10	\$57,548.91	\$82,779.75	\$45,387.25	\$82,274.00	\$67,336.65	\$93,281.04			
Item 2 Total:			\$55,826.20	\$58,638.19	\$71,542.60	\$88,620.10	\$57,548.91	\$82,779.75	\$45,387.25	\$82,274.00	\$67,336.65	\$93,281.04			
3	T-Shirt (Tall), White	600		NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS
	100% Cotton Shirt			No Bid	Gildan, Port & Company	PC61T Port & Company	Port and Company	Port & Company Tall Core Cotton Tee	Port & Company	Gildan 2000T Anvil 5628	Port & Company	Port & Company	Port & Company Longsleeve	Port & Company	
Style #			No Bid	G200T, PC61T, PC61LST	PC61T	PC54T (PC61LST for long sleeve)	PC54T	PC61T	2000T, 5628	PC61T, PC61LST	PC54T, PC54LST, PC61LST	PC61T, PC61LST	PC61T, PC61LST	PC61T/PC61LST Only available in Adult Large 4 XLT	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts 6100012605		GDL											
Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
		A1 Sports Center 1027 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S- 155 Dallas TX 75247	Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541	
<b>50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt</b> Brand Name Style #	600	Port & Company, Gildan PC61T, PC55T, GT200, PC55LST	Gildan, Port & Company G200T, PC61T, PC55LST	Port & Company PC55T	Port and Company PC55T	No Bid No Bid	Port & Company PC55T	No Bid No Bid	Port & Company PC55T	Port & Company PC55T, PC55LST	Port & Company Longsleeve PC55T, PC55LST	Port & Company PC55T, PC55LST Only available in Adult Large 4 XLT	
<b>3.1 Short Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall), White:</b> Youth Xsmall - Xlarge Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	75	No Bid	\$3.50 \$262.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.84 \$288.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Adult Small - Xlarge Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	75	\$2.94 L & XL \$220.50	\$5.50 \$412.50	\$7.00 \$525.00	\$4.49 for L & XL Only \$336.75	\$2.81 LT & XLT \$210.75	\$3.84 \$288.00	\$4.14 \$310.50	\$4.06 \$304.50	\$3.75 \$281.25	\$4.95 Large & X-Large \$371.25	\$4.28 \$321.00	
Adult 2X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	75	\$4.98 \$373.50	\$5.50 \$412.50	\$9.50 \$712.50	\$6.62 \$496.50	\$4.70 \$352.50	\$5.84 \$438.00	\$4.79 \$359.25	\$6.78 \$508.50	\$6.00 \$450.00	\$6.95 \$521.25	\$6.78 \$508.50	
Adult 3X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	75	\$5.24 \$393.00	\$5.50 \$412.50	\$9.75 \$731.25	\$6.88 \$516.00	\$4.91 \$368.25	\$6.84 \$513.00	\$5.41 \$405.75	\$7.07 \$530.25	\$6.50 \$487.50	\$7.25 \$543.75	\$7.28 \$546.00	
Adult 4X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	75	\$5.49 \$411.75	\$5.50 \$412.50	\$10.00 \$750.00	\$7.16 \$537.00	\$5.22 \$391.50	\$7.84 \$588.00	\$6.00 \$450.00	\$7.33 \$549.75	\$6.75 \$506.25	\$7.95 \$596.25	\$7.78 \$583.50	
Adult 5X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	75	No Bid	\$5.50 \$412.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.84 \$663.00	\$6.00 \$450.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
<b>3.2 Long Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall), White:</b> Youth Xsmall - Xlarge Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	25	No Bid	\$4.50 \$112.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.02 \$150.50	\$4.18 \$104.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Adult Small - Xlarge Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	25	\$4.07 L & XL \$101.75	\$5.50 \$137.50	\$9.00 \$225.00	\$7.18 for L & XL Only \$179.50	No Bid	\$6.02 \$150.50	\$5.56 \$139.00	\$6.25 \$156.25	\$5.00 \$125.00	\$6.95 \$173.75	\$6.28 \$157.00	
Adult 2X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	25	\$5.34 \$133.50	\$5.50 \$137.50	\$11.00 \$275.00	\$9.53 \$238.25	No Bid	\$8.02 \$200.50	\$5.56 \$139.00	\$9.12 \$228.00	\$7.25 \$181.25	\$8.95 \$223.75	\$8.78 \$219.50	
Adult 3X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	25	\$5.49 \$137.25	\$5.50 \$137.50	\$12.00 \$300.00	\$9.95 \$248.75	No Bid	\$9.02 \$225.50	No Bid	\$9.64 \$241.00	\$7.50 \$187.50	\$9.95 \$248.75	\$9.28 \$232.00	
Adult 4X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	25	\$5.79 \$144.75	\$5.50 \$137.50	\$13.00 \$325.00	\$11.11 \$277.75	No Bid	\$10.02 \$250.50	No Bid	\$11.06 \$276.50	\$8.50 \$212.50	\$10.95 \$273.75	\$9.78 \$244.50	
Adult 5X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	25	No Bid	\$5.50 \$137.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.02 \$275.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
<b>3.3 Color Imprint</b> 1 Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.50	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$2.65 72-143 \$2.20 144-287 \$1.90 288-503 \$1.80 504+ \$1.65 1008+ \$1.55 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$1.00	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020		Local		Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local			
For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts		A1 Sports Center		Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising		Advertising Matters, LLC		All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc		American Solutions for Business		Express Press		Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography		Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC		Promotional Designs		Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery		ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery	
6100012605		1027 Bandera Road		12814 Cogburn		3412 S Grove Street		395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1		9901 IH 10 West		1860 E St Louis St		13529 Chandelle Drive		5611 San Pedro Ave		8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S-155		1709 South IH-35		120 S Avenue B	
		San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566		San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800		Fort Worth TX 76110		Henrietta NY 14467		San Antonio TX 78230		Springfield MO 65802		Newalla OK 74857		San Antonio TX 78212		Dallas TX 75247		San Marcos TX 78666		Freeport TX 77541	
Description		Estimated Annual Quantity																					
	2 Color Imprint		\$0.90		\$0.91		\$1.00		\$0.30		\$0.49		\$0.50		\$1.10		\$0.60		\$0.80		1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.05 72-143 \$2.50 144-287 \$2.30 288-503 \$3.10 504+ \$1.90 1008+ \$1.75 2500+ Call for Pricing		\$0.29
	3 Color Imprint		\$1.10		\$1.08		\$1.20		\$0.46		\$0.56		\$0.50		\$1.15		\$0.69		\$0.95		1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.45 72-143 \$3.00 144-287 \$2.60 288-503 \$2.45 504+ \$2.10 1008+ \$1.95 2500+ Call for Pricing		\$0.29
	4 Color Imprint		\$1.30		\$1.26		\$1.40		\$0.52		\$0.65		\$0.50		\$1.25		\$0.80		\$1.10		1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.70 72-143 \$3.40 144-287 \$3.00 288-503 \$2.85 504+ \$2.40 1008+ \$2.20 2500+ Call for Pricing		\$0.29
	2nd Location Color Imprint		\$0.70		\$0.72		\$1.00 1 or 2 color		\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve		\$0.38		\$0.75		\$0.50		\$1.00		\$0.65		1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$1.00 each 72-143 \$.80 each 144-287 \$.80 each 288-503 \$.80 each 504+ \$.70 each 1008+ \$.70 each 2500+ Call for Pricing		\$1.00
	Art Change per Hour		\$5.00		\$10.00		No charge		\$46.00		\$0.00		No charge		\$0.00		\$10.00		\$15.00		Waived		\$25.00
	Set Up Fee		\$5.00		\$10.00		No charge		\$20.00 per screen		\$16.20 Per Color, Per Location		No charge		\$0.00		\$10.00 per color		\$15.00		Per color		\$10.00
	Subtotal:		\$1,930.70		\$3,149.69		\$3,848.85		\$2,898.85		\$1,346.29		\$4,034.00		\$2,363.00		\$2,818.30		\$2,465.40		\$2,952.50		\$2,849.87
	Prompt Payment Discount:		0%		0%		0%		0%		0%		0%		0%		1%		0%		0%		0%
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$1,930.70		\$3,149.69		\$3,848.85		\$2,898.85		\$1,346.29		\$4,034.00		\$2,363.00		\$2,790.12		\$2,465.40		\$2,952.50		\$2,849.87
	Item 3 Total:		\$1,930.70		\$3,149.69		\$3,848.85		\$2,898.85		\$1,346.29		\$4,034.00		\$2,363.00		Incomplete Bid		\$2,465.40		\$2,952.50		\$2,849.87
4	<b>T-Shirt (Tall), Colored (Light and Dark) 100% Cotton Shirt</b>	1,000	NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS		NAS
	Brand Name		No Bid		Gildan, Port & Company		Port and Company		Port and Company		Port & Company Tall Core Cotton Tee		Port & Company		Gildan, Anvil		Port & Company		Port & Company		Same as Item 3		Port & Company
	Style #		No Bid		G200T, PC61T, PC61LST		PC61T		PC54T (PC61LST for long sleeve)		PC54T		PC61T		2000T, 5628		PC61T		PC54T, PC54LST				PC61T/PC61LST Only available in Adult Large 4 XLT
	<b>50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt</b>	1,000			Gildan, Port & Company		Port & Company		Port and Company		No Bid		Port & Company		No Bid		Port & Company		Port & Company				Port & Company PC55T/PC55LST Only available in Adult Large 4 XLT
	Brand Name				Port & Company, Gildan		Port & Company		Port and Company		No Bid		Port & Company		No Bid		Port & Company		Port & Company				
	Style #				PC61T, PC55T, GT200, PC55LST		PC55T		PC55T		No Bid		PC55T		No Bid		PC55T		PC55T, PC55LST				
4.1	<b>Short Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall), Colored (Light and Dark)</b>	75																					
	Youth Xsmall - Xlarge																						
	Price (per each)		No Bid		\$4.70		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$5.48		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Extended Price (per each)				\$352.50							\$411.00											
	Adult Small - Xlarge	125																					
	Price (per each)		\$3.89 L & XL		\$6.75		\$7.25		\$5.43 L & XL Only		\$3.87 LT & XLT		\$5.48		\$5.69		\$5.75		\$4.75 Large & X-Large				\$5.25
	Extended Price (per each)		\$486.25		\$843.75		\$906.25		\$678.75		\$483.75		\$685.00		\$711.25		\$718.75		\$593.75				\$656.25

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020		Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts											
For: 6100012605		GDL											
Description		Estimated Annual Quantity	Local A1 Sports Center 1027 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Local Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Non-Local Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	Non-Local All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	Non-Local American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Non-Local Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Non-Local Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Local Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Non-Local Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S-155 Dallas TX 75247	Non-Local Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	Non-Local ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541
4.2	Adult 2X	150											
	Price (per each)		\$6.08	\$6.75	\$9.75	\$7.76	\$5.85	\$7.48	\$6.15	\$8.73	\$7.25	\$7.75	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$912.00	\$1,012.50	\$1,462.50	\$1,164.00	\$877.50	\$1,122.00	\$922.50	\$1,309.50	\$1,087.50	\$1,162.50	
	Adult 3X	150											
	Price (per each)		\$6.36	\$6.75	\$10.00	\$8.08	\$6.07	\$8.48	\$6.85	\$9.06	\$7.50	\$8.25	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$954.00	\$1,012.50	\$1,500.00	\$1,212.00	\$910.50	\$1,272.00	\$1,027.50	\$1,359.00	\$1,125.00	\$1,237.50	
	Adult 4X	150											
	Price (per each)		\$6.69	\$6.75	\$10.25	\$8.40	\$6.91	\$9.48	No Bid	\$9.42	\$8.50	\$8.75	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$1,003.50	\$1,012.50	\$1,537.50	\$1,260.00	\$1,036.50	\$1,422.00	No Bid	\$1,413.00	\$1,275.00	\$1,312.50	
	Adult 5X	125											
Price (per each)		No Bid	\$6.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
Extended Price (per each)			\$843.75				\$1,310.00						
4.3	Long Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall), Colored (Light and Dark)	25											
	Youth Xsmall - Xlarge	25											
	Price (per each)		No Bid	\$5.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Extended Price (per each)			\$145.00				\$187.50					
	Adult Small - Xlarge	25											
	Price (per each)		\$5.25 L & XL	\$7.00	\$9.25	\$8.53 L & XL Only	No Bid	\$7.50	\$5.56	\$7.71	\$7.00 Large & X-Large	\$7.25	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$131.25	\$175.00	\$231.25	\$213.25		\$187.50	\$139.00	\$192.75	\$175.00	\$181.25	
	Adult 2X	50											
	Price (per each)		\$6.59	\$7.00	\$11.25	\$10.91	No Bid	\$9.50	\$5.56	\$10.55	\$8.30	\$9.75	
	Extended Price (per each)		\$329.50	\$350.00	\$562.50	\$545.50		\$475.00	\$278.00	\$527.50	\$415.00	\$487.50	
Adult 3X	50												
Price (per each)		\$6.74	\$7.00	\$12.25	\$11.70	No Bid	\$10.50	No Bid	\$11.48	\$8.50	\$10.25		
Extended Price (per each)		\$337.00	\$350.00	\$612.50	\$585.00		\$525.00		\$574.00	\$425.00	\$512.50		
Adult 4X	50												
Price (per each)		\$7.08	\$7.00	\$13.25	\$12.80	No Bid	\$11.50	No Bid	\$12.80	\$8.50	\$10.75		
Extended Price (per each)		\$354.00	\$350.00	\$662.50	\$640.00		\$575.00		\$640.00	\$425.00	\$537.50		
Adult 5X	25												
Price (per each)		No Bid	\$7.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
Extended Price (per each)			\$175.00				\$312.50						
5	Color Imprint												
	1 Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.50	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65	\$1.29	
	2 Color Imprint		\$0.90	\$0.91	\$1.00	\$0.30	\$0.49	\$0.50	\$1.10	\$0.60	\$0.80	\$0.32	
	3 Color Imprint		\$1.10	\$1.08	\$1.20	\$0.46	\$0.56	\$0.50	\$1.15	\$0.69	\$0.95	\$0.32	
	4 Color Imprint		\$1.30	\$1.26	\$1.40	\$0.52	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$1.25	\$0.80	\$1.10	\$0.32	
	2nd Location Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$1.00 1 or 2 color	\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve	\$0.38	\$0.75	No Bid	\$1.00	\$0.65	\$1.29	
	Art Change per Hour		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$46.00	\$0.00	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$25.00	
	Set Up Fee		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$20.00 per screen	\$16.20 Per Color, Per Location	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00 per color	\$15.00	\$15.00 Per color	
	Subtotal:		\$4,522.20	\$6,647.19	\$7,480.10	\$6,366.85	\$3,331.16	\$8,487.50	\$3,082.75	\$6,758.05	\$5,555.40	\$0.00	\$6,126.04
	Prompt Payment Discount:		0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	1%	0%	0%	0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$4,522.20	\$6,647.19	\$7,480.10	\$6,366.85	\$3,331.16	\$8,487.50	\$3,082.75	\$6,690.47	\$5,555.40	\$0.00	\$6,126.04	
Item 4 Total:		\$4,522.20	\$6,647.19	\$7,480.10	\$6,366.85	\$3,331.16	\$8,487.50	\$3,082.75	\$6,690.47	\$5,555.40	\$0.00	\$6,126.04	
5.1	T-Shirt, Wicking, White	4,000			NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	
	100% Polyester Wicking Knit		Augusta	Augusta, Team 365	Gildan	Port and Company	Sport Tek Men's PosiCharge Competitor Tee	Augusta	A4	Sport Tek	Badger	Team 365	
Brand Name													
Style #		790, 791	790, 791, TT11, TT11Y	G420	PC380	ST350	790	N3142	ST350 + YST350, 790 (Augusta - 5x)	C2-51000, C2-520000	TT11	ST350 (4XL Largest Size)	
Price (per each)		\$3.20	\$3.50	\$5.25	\$4.39	\$3.76	\$4.62	\$3.70	\$4.36	\$4.25	\$3.50	\$4.54	
Extended Price (per each)		\$4,800.00	\$5,250.00	\$7,875.00	\$6,585.00	\$5,640.00	\$6,930.00	\$5,550.00	\$6,540.00	\$6,375.00	\$5,250.00	\$6,810.00	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts 6100012605		GDL		Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
Description		Estimated Annual Quantity	A1 Sports Center 1027 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S- 155 Dallas TX 75247	Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541	
	Adult Small - Xlarge Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	1,500	\$3.20 \$4,800.00	\$3.50 \$5,250.00	\$5.50 \$8,250.00	\$4.66 \$6,990.00	\$4.30 \$6,450.00	\$4.62 \$6,930.00	\$3.70 \$5,550.00	\$4.98 \$7,470.00	\$4.25 \$6,375.00	\$3.50 \$5,250.00	\$5.19 \$7,785.00	
	Adult 2X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	800	\$3.20 \$2,560.00	\$4.95 \$3,960.00	\$6.50 \$5,200.00	\$5.73 \$4,584.00	\$5.37 \$4,296.00	\$6.62 \$5,296.00	\$4.70 \$3,760.00	\$6.23 \$4,984.00	\$6.75 \$5,400.00	\$4.50 \$3,600.00	\$6.59 \$5,272.00	
	Adult 3X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	100	\$5.46 \$546.00	\$5.95 \$595.00	\$7.50 \$750.00	\$6.48 \$648.00	\$7.52 \$752.00	\$7.62 \$762.00	\$5.20 \$520.00	\$8.73 \$873.00	\$6.75 \$675.00	\$5.50 \$550.00	\$8.59 \$859.00	
	Adult 4X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	50	\$6.64 \$332.00	\$6.95 \$347.50	No Bid	\$7.01 \$350.50	\$8.60 \$430.00	\$8.62 \$431.00	\$5.70 \$285.00	\$9.98 \$499.00	\$6.75 \$337.50	\$6.50 \$325.00	\$10.00 \$500.00	
	Adult 5X Price (per each) Extended Price (per each)	50	\$7.86 \$393.00	\$8.95 \$447.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.62 \$481.00	No Bid	\$12.25 \$612.50	\$12.00 \$600.00	No Bid	No Bid	
5.2	<b>Color Imprint</b> 1 Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.75	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$2.65 72-143 \$2.20 144-287 \$1.90 288-503 \$1.80 504+ \$1.65 1008+ \$1.55 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$1.00	
	2 Color Imprint		\$0.90	\$0.91	\$1.25	\$0.30	\$0.49	\$0.50	\$1.10	\$0.60	\$0.80	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.05 72-143 \$2.50 144-287 \$2.30 288-503 \$3.10 504+ \$1.90 1008+ \$1.75 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	3 Color Imprint		\$1.10	\$1.08	\$1.45	\$0.46	\$0.56	\$0.50	\$1.15	\$0.69	\$0.95	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.45 72-143 \$3.00 144-287 \$2.60 288-503 \$2.45 504+ \$2.10 1008+ \$1.95 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	4 Color Imprint		\$1.30	\$1.26	\$1.65	\$0.52	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$1.25	\$0.80	\$1.10	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.70 72-143 \$3.40 144-287 \$3.00 288-503 \$2.85 504+ \$2.40 1008+ \$2.20 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	2nd Location Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$1.25	\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$0.50	\$1.00	\$0.65	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$1.00 each 72-143 \$.80 each 144-287 \$.80 each 288-503 \$.80 each 504+ \$.70 each 1008+ \$.70 each 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$1.00	
	Art Change per Hour Set Up Fee		\$5.00 \$5.00	\$10.00 \$10.00	No charge No charge	\$46.00 \$20.00 per screen	\$0.00 \$16.20 Per Color, Per Location	No charge No charge	\$0.00 \$0.00	\$10.00 \$10.00 per color	\$15.00 \$15.00	Waived \$15.00 per color	\$25.00 \$10.00	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020		Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts											
For: 6100012605		GDL											
Description		Estimated Annual Quantity	Local A1 Sports Center 1027 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Local Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Non-Local Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	Non-Local All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	Non-Local American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Non-Local Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Non-Local Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Local Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Non-Local Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S-155 Dallas TX 75247	Non-Local Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	Non-Local ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541
	Subtotal:		\$13,445.70	\$15,874.69	\$22,081.35	\$19,225.85	\$17,586.66	\$20,833.00	\$15,670.00	\$21,002.05	\$19,796.65	\$14,975.00	\$21,263.87
	Prompt Payment Discount:		0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	1%	0%	0%	0%
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$13,445.70	\$15,874.69	\$22,081.35	\$19,225.85	\$17,586.66	\$20,833.00	\$15,670.00	\$20,792.03	\$19,796.65	\$14,975.00	\$21,263.87
	<b>Item 5 Total:</b>		<b>\$13,445.70</b>	<b>\$15,874.69</b>	<b>\$22,081.35</b>	<b>\$19,225.85</b>	<b>\$17,586.66</b>	<b>\$20,833.00</b>	<b>\$15,670.00</b>	<b>\$20,792.03</b>	<b>\$19,796.65</b>	<b>\$14,975.00</b>	<b>\$21,263.87</b>
6	<b>T-Shirt, Colored Wicking (Light and Dark) 100% Polyester Wicking Knit</b>	9,000			NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS
	Brand Name		Augusta	Augusta, Team 365	Gildan	Port and Company	Sport Tek Men's PosiCharge Competitor Tee	Augusta	A4	Sport Tek	Badger	Same as Item 5	Sport Tek
	Style #		790, 791	790, 791, TT11, TT11Y	G420	PC380	ST350	790	N3142	ST350 + YST350, 790 (Augusta - 5x)	C2-510000, C2-52000		ST350 (4XL Largest Size)
6.1	<b>Short Sleeve T-Shirt Colored Wicking (Light and Dark)</b>	4,000											
	Youth Xsmall - Xlarge												
	Price (per each)		\$3.20	\$3.50	\$5.35	\$4.39	\$3.76	\$4.62	\$3.70	\$4.36	\$4.25		\$4.54
	Extended Price (per each)		\$12,800.00	\$14,000.00	\$21,400.00	\$17,560.00	\$15,040.00	\$18,480.00	\$14,800.00	\$17,440.00	\$17,000.00		\$18,160.00
	Adult Small - Xlarge	4,000											
	Price (per each)		\$3.20	\$3.50	\$5.60	\$4.66	\$4.30	\$4.62	\$3.70	\$4.98	\$4.25		\$5.19
	Extended Price (per each)		\$12,800.00	\$14,000.00	\$22,400.00	\$18,640.00	\$17,200.00	\$18,480.00	\$14,800.00	\$19,920.00	\$17,000.00		\$20,760.00
	Adult 2X	500											
	Price (per each)		\$3.20	\$4.95	\$6.60	\$5.73	\$5.37	\$6.62	\$4.70	\$6.23	\$4.25		\$6.59
	Extended Price (per each)		\$1,600.00	\$2,475.00	\$3,300.00	\$2,865.00	\$2,685.00	\$3,310.00	\$2,350.00	\$3,115.00	\$2,125.00		\$3,295.00
	Adult 3X	250											
	Price (per each)		\$5.46	\$5.95	\$7.60	\$6.48	\$7.52	\$7.62	\$5.20	\$8.73	\$6.75		\$8.59
	Extended Price (per each)		\$1,365.00	\$1,487.50	\$1,900.00	\$1,620.00	\$1,880.00	\$1,905.00	\$1,300.00	\$2,182.50	\$1,687.50		\$2,147.50
	Adult 4X	125											
	Price (per each)		\$6.64	\$6.95	No Bid	\$7.01	\$8.60	\$8.62	\$5.70	\$9.98	\$6.75		\$10.00
	Extended Price (per each)		\$830.00	\$868.75		\$876.25	\$1,075.00	\$1,077.50	\$712.50	\$1,247.50	\$843.75		\$1,250.00
	Adult 5X	125											
	Price (per each)		\$7.86	\$8.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.62	No Bid	\$12.25	\$12.00		No Bid
	Extended Price (per each)		\$982.50	\$1,118.75				\$1,202.50		\$1,531.25	\$1,500.00		
6.2	<b>Color Imprint</b>												
	1 Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.75	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65		\$1.29
	2 Color Imprint		\$0.90	\$0.91	\$1.25	\$0.30	\$0.49	\$0.50	\$1.10	\$0.60	\$0.80		\$0.32
	3 Color Imprint		\$1.10	\$1.08	\$1.45	\$0.46	\$0.56	\$0.50	\$1.15	\$0.69	\$0.95		\$0.32
	4 Color Imprint		\$1.30	\$1.26	\$1.65	\$0.52	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$1.25	\$0.80	\$1.10		\$0.32
	2nd Location Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$1.25	\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$0.50	\$1.00	\$0.65		\$1.29
	Art Change per Hour		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$46.00	\$0.00	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$15.00	Waived	\$25.00
	Set Up Fee		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$20.00 per screen	\$16.20 Per Color, Per Location	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00 per color	\$15.00	\$15.00 per color	\$10.00
	Subtotal:		\$30,392.20	\$33,974.69	\$49,006.35	\$41,629.60	\$37,898.66	\$44,458.00	\$33,967.50	\$45,459.80	\$40,190.40	\$0.00	\$45,651.04
	Prompt Payment Discount:		0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	1%	0%	0%	0%
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$30,392.20	\$33,974.69	\$49,006.35	\$41,629.60	\$37,898.66	\$44,458.00	\$33,967.50	\$45,005.20	\$40,190.40	\$0.00	\$45,651.04
	<b>Item 6 Total:</b>		<b>\$30,392.20</b>	<b>\$33,974.69</b>	<b>\$49,006.35</b>	<b>\$41,629.60</b>	<b>\$37,898.66</b>	<b>\$44,458.00</b>	<b>\$33,967.50</b>	<b>\$45,005.20</b>	<b>\$40,190.40</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$45,651.04</b>
7	<b>T-Shirt, (Tall) Wicking, White 100% Polyester Wicking Knit</b>	300			NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS	NAS
	Brand Name		Sport Tek	Sport-Tek	Sport Tek	Sport Tek	Sport Tek Men's Tall PosiCharge Competitor Tee	Sport-Tek	Jerzees Dri Power	Sport-Tek	Sport-Tek	Sport-Tek	Sport-Tek
	Style #		TST350	TST350	TST350	TST350	TST350	TST350	29MT	TST350	TST350	TST350	TST350 (only available in adult sizes large-4XL)
7.1	<b>Short Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall) Wicking, White</b>	50											
	Youth Xsmall - Xlarge												
	Price (per each)		No Bid	\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price (per each)			\$275.00				\$296.50					
	Adult Small - Xlarge	50											
	Price (per each)		\$5.05	\$5.50	\$7.75	\$6.67	\$5.37 LT & XLT	\$5.93	\$4.47	\$6.23	\$6.50 Large & X-Large	\$5.99	\$6.49
	Extended Price (per each)		\$252.50	\$275.00	\$387.50	\$333.50	\$268.50	\$296.50	\$223.50	\$311.50	\$325.00	\$299.50	\$324.50
	Adult 2X	50											
	Price (per each)		\$6.05	\$6.65	\$8.75	\$7.72	\$6.45	\$7.93	\$4.47	\$7.48	\$7.75	\$6.99	\$7.99
	Extended Price (per each)		\$302.50	\$332.50	\$437.50	\$386.00	\$322.50	\$396.50	\$223.50	\$374.00	\$387.50	\$349.50	\$399.50
	Adult 3X	50											
	Price (per each)		\$8.05	\$8.85	\$10.75	\$9.82	\$8.60	\$8.93	\$5.02	\$9.98	\$10.50	\$8.99	\$9.99
	Extended Price (per each)		\$402.50	\$442.50	\$537.50	\$491.00	\$430.00	\$446.50	\$251.00	\$499.00	\$525.00	\$449.50	\$499.50
	Adult 4X	50											
	Price (per each)		\$9.06	\$9.85	\$11.75	\$10.87	\$9.67	\$9.93	No Bid	\$11.23	\$11.75	\$9.99	\$10.99
	Extended Price (per each)		\$453.00	\$492.50	\$587.50	\$543.50	\$483.50	\$496.50		\$561.50	\$587.50	\$499.50	\$549.50
	Adult 5X	50											
	Price (per each)		No Bid	\$9.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price (per each)			\$492.50				\$546.50					



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020 For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts 6100012605		GDL		Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
Description		Estimated Annual Quantity	A1 Sports Center 1027 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S- 155 Dallas TX 75247	Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541	
7.2	Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.50	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$2.65 72-143 \$2.20 144-287 \$1.90 288-503 \$1.80 504+ \$1.65 1008+ \$1.55 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$1.00	
	2 Color Imprint		\$0.90	\$0.91	\$1.00	\$0.30	\$0.49	\$0.50	\$1.10	\$0.60	\$0.80	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.05 72-143 \$2.50 144-287 \$2.30 288-503 \$3.10 504+ \$1.90 1008+ \$1.75 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	3 Color Imprint		\$1.10	\$1.08	\$1.20	\$0.46	\$0.56	\$0.50	\$1.15	\$0.69	\$0.95	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.45 72-143 \$3.00 144-287 \$2.60 288-503 \$2.45 504+ \$2.10 1008+ \$1.95 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	4 Color Imprint		\$1.30	\$1.26	\$1.40	\$0.52	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$1.25	\$0.80	\$1.10	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$3.70 72-143 \$3.40 144-287 \$3.00 288-503 \$2.85 504+ \$2.40 1008+ \$2.20 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$0.29	
	2nd Location Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$1.00 1 or 2 color	\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$0.50	\$1.00	\$0.65	1-11 Call for Pricing 12-35 Call for Pricing 36-71 \$1.00 each 72-143 \$.80 each 144-287 \$.80 each 288-503 \$.80 each 504+ \$.70 each 1008+ \$.70 each 2500+ Call for Pricing	\$1.00	
	Art Change per Hour		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$46.00	\$0.00	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$15.00	Waived	\$25.00	
	Set Up Fee		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$20.00 per screen	\$16.20 Per Color, Per Location	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00 per color	\$15.00	\$15.00 per color	\$10.00	
	Subtotal:		\$1,425.20	\$2,334.69	\$1,955.10	\$1,822.35	\$1,523.16	\$2,482.00	\$703.00	\$1,769.55	\$1,859.15	\$1,598.00	\$1,810.87	
	Prompt Payment Discount:		0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	1%	0%	0%	0%	
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$1,425.20	\$2,334.69	\$1,955.10	\$1,822.35	\$1,523.16	\$2,482.00	\$703.00	\$1,751.85	\$1,859.15	\$1,598.00	\$1,810.87	
	Item 7 Total:		Incomplete Bid	\$2,334.69	\$1,955.10	\$1,822.35	\$1,523.16	\$2,482.00	\$703.00	Incomplete Bid	\$1,859.15	\$1,598.00	\$1,810.87	
8	T-Shirt (Tall) Wicking Colored (Light and Dark) 100% Polyester Wicking Knit Brand Name Style #	500	Sport Tek TST350	Sport-Tek TST350	NAS Sport Tek TST350	NAS Sport Tek TST350	NAS Sport Tek Men's Tall PosiCharge Competitor Tee TST350	NAS Sport-Tek TST350	NAS Jerzees 29MT	NAS Sport Tek TST350	NAS Sport-Tek TST350	NAS Same as Item 7	NAS Sport Tek TST350 (only available in adult sizes large-4XL)	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020		Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts										
For: 6100012605		GDL										
Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
		A1 Sports Center 1027 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78245 (210) 664-0566	Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees & Advertising 12814 Cogburn San Antonio TX 78249 (210) 699-3800	Advertising Matters, LLC 3412 S Grove Street Fort Worth TX 76110	All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc 395 Summit Point Drive, Suite 1 Henrietta NY 14467	American Solutions for Business 9901 IH 10 West San Antonio TX 78230	Express Press 1860 E St Louis St Springfield MO 65802	Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography 13529 Chandelle Drive Newalla OK 74857	Heaven Sent Promotions and Apparel, LLC 5611 San Pedro Ave San Antonio TX 78212	Promotional Designs 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S- 155 Dallas TX 75247	Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery 1709 South IH-35 San Marcos TX 78666	ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery 120 S Avenue B Freeport TX 77541
<b>8.1</b>	<b>Short Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall) Wicking Colored (Light and Dark)</b>											
	Youth Xsmall - Xlarge	50	No Bid	\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price (per each)											
	Extended Price (per each)			\$275.00				\$296.50				
	Adult Small - Xlarge	75	\$5.05	\$5.50	\$8.00	\$6.67	\$5.37 LT & XLT	\$5.93	\$5.25	\$6.23	\$6.50 Large & X-Large	\$6.49
	Price (per each)		\$378.75	\$412.50	\$600.00	\$500.25	\$402.75	\$444.75	\$393.75	\$467.25	\$487.50	\$486.75
	Extended Price (per each)											
	Adult 2X	100	\$6.05	\$6.65	\$9.00	\$7.72	\$6.45	\$7.93	\$5.25	\$7.48	\$7.75	\$7.99
	Price (per each)		\$605.00	\$665.00	\$900.00	\$772.00	\$645.00	\$793.00	\$525.00	\$748.00	\$775.00	\$799.00
	Extended Price (per each)											
	Adult 3X	100	\$8.05	\$8.85	\$11.00	\$9.82	\$8.60	\$8.93	\$6.02	\$9.98	\$10.50	\$9.99
	Price (per each)		\$805.00	\$885.00	\$1,100.00	\$982.00	\$860.00	\$893.00	\$602.00	\$998.00	\$1,050.00	\$999.00
	Extended Price (per each)											
	Adult 4X	100	\$9.06	\$9.85	\$12.00	\$10.87	\$9.76	\$9.93	No Bid	\$11.23	\$11.75	\$10.99
	Price (per each)		\$906.00	\$985.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,087.00	\$976.00	\$993.00		\$1,123.00	\$1,175.00	\$1,099.00
	Extended Price (per each)											
	Adult 5X	75	No Bid	\$9.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price (per each)			\$738.75				\$819.75				
	Extended Price (per each)											
<b>8.2</b>	<b>Color Imprint</b>											
	1 Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$0.50	\$0.24	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$1.00	\$0.46	\$0.65	\$1.29
	2 Color Imprint		\$0.90	\$0.91	\$1.00	\$0.30	\$0.49	\$0.50	\$1.10	\$0.60	\$0.80	\$0.32
	3 Color Imprint		\$1.10	\$1.08	\$1.20	\$0.46	\$0.56	\$0.50	\$1.15	\$0.69	\$0.95	\$0.32
	4 Color Imprint		\$1.30	\$1.26	\$1.40	\$0.52	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$1.25	\$0.80	\$1.10	\$0.32
	2nd Location Color Imprint		\$0.70	\$0.72	\$1.00	\$0.24 standard \$0.83 Sleeve	\$0.38	\$0.75	\$0.50	\$1.00	\$0.65	\$1.29
	Art Change per Hour		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$46.00	\$0.00	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$25.00
	Set Up Fee		\$5.00	\$10.00	No charge	\$20.00 per screen	\$16.20 Per Color, Per Location	No charge	\$0.00	\$10.00 per color	\$15.00	\$10.00
	Subtotal:		\$2,709.45	\$3,985.94	\$3,805.10	\$3,409.60	\$2,902.41	\$4,243.00	\$1,525.75	\$3,359.80	\$3,521.65	\$3,422.29
	Prompt Payment Discount:		0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	0%	1%	0%	0%
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$2,709.45	\$3,985.94	\$3,805.10	\$3,409.60	\$2,902.41	\$4,243.00	\$1,525.75	\$3,326.20	\$3,521.65	\$3,422.29
	<b>Item 8 Total:</b>		Incomplete Bid	<b>\$3,985.94</b>	\$3,805.10	\$3,409.60	\$2,902.41	\$4,243.00	\$1,525.75	Incomplete Bid	\$3,521.65	\$3,422.29
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	1%, 10 Days	Net 30	Net 30
	Estimated Annual Total		\$132,678.35	\$148,071.27	\$191,474.55	\$199,337.55	\$144,930.79	\$196,280.25	\$120,082.50	\$191,235.73	\$169,759.45	\$46,875.50
	<b>Estimated Annual Award</b>		<b>\$43,837.90</b>	<b>\$98,221.89</b>								