

ORDINANCE 2021-03-04-0128

APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST OF \$444,000.00, INCLUDED IN THE RESPECTIVE DEPARTMENT'S FY 2021 ADOPTED BUDGET: (A) PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC., TRAFFIC PARTS, INC., AND WILDCAT TRAFFIC FOR SOLAR SCHOOL ZONE WARNING SIGNALS AND PARTS; (B) EAN HOLDINGS, LLC, DBA ENTERPISE RENT-A-CAR, FOR RENTAL VEHICLES; AND (C) CDS PROPERTIES, INC., DBA SOUTHWEST PUBLIC SAFETY, FOR WINDOW TINTING AND TINT REMOVAL SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TYPES OF AUTOMOBILES AND LIGHT-DUTY TRUCKS.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves low bid contracts with: (A) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc., Traffic Parts, Inc., and Wildcat Traffic for solar school zone warning signals and parts; (B) EAN Holdings, LLC, dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car, for rental vehicles; and (C) CDS Properties Inc., dba Southwest Public Safety, for window tinting and tint removal services for various types of automobiles and light-duty trucks; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget approved by City Council; **NOW THEREFORE:**

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements: (A) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc., Traffic Parts, Inc., and Wildcat Traffic for solar school zone warning signals and parts; (B) EAN Holdings, LLC, dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car, for rental vehicles; and (C) CDS Properties Inc., dba Southwest Public Safety, for window tinting and tint removal services for various types of automobiles and light-duty trucks. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as **Exhibit I**. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2021 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances.

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

LC
03/04/21
Item No. 8

8510-40-20-1505

PASSED and APPROVED this 4th day of March, 2021.



M A Y O R
Ron Nirenberg

ATTEST:



Tina J. Flores, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:



Andrew Segovia, City Attorney



City of San Antonio

City Council

March 04, 2021

Item: 8

Enactment Number:

File Number: 21-1366

2021-03-04-0128

Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an estimated annual cost of \$444,000.00, included in the respective department's FY 2021 Adopted Budget:

(A) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc., Traffic Parts, Inc., and Wildcat Traffic for solar school zone warning signals and parts;

(B) EAN Holdings, LLC, dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car, for rental vehicles; and

(C) CDS Properties Inc., dba Southwest Public Safety, for window tinting and tint removal services for various types of automobiles and light-duty trucks.

[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Councilmember John Courage made a motion to approve. Councilmember Manny Pelaez seconded the motion. The motion passed by the following vote:

Aye: 11 Nirenberg, Treviño, Andrews-Sullivan, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Gonzales, Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage and Perry

LC
03/04/21
Item No. 8

Exhibit I

Opened: August 7, 2020 For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts 6100012917			Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Quantity	Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. 2201 E. Division St. Arlington, TX 76011 817-831-9406	Traffic Parts Inc. 27895 Robinson Road Conroe, TX 77385 800-345-6329	Wildcat Traffic 5535 Harvey Wilson Houston, TX, 77020 512-608-8971	K&K Systems Inc. 687 Palmetto Road Tupelo, MS, 38801
		AJ				
1	Cabinet, School Zone Flasher Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No. Warranty (years)	50	\$397.00 \$19,850.00 Bison; 008-026618 One	No Bid	\$695.00 \$34,750.00 WE Manufacturing; WE-MFG Solar Flasher 5 years	No Bid
2	12" Amber LED Solar traffic signal lens, to comply with ITE specifications, TXDOT approved, warranted against defects for (5) years, and 16W LED maximum, Leotek TSL-12Y-LX-1L1-B1 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$66.00 \$3,300.00 Econolite; JXC300-DCY	\$68.00 \$3,400.00 Duralight; TP#2517; JXC-300-HFTDCY	\$46.00 \$2,300.00 Dialight; DI-433-3230-905XL	No Bid
3	DPC-2000 Controller, Precision Solar #864 100 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$323.00 \$16,150.00 Applied Information; Solar back panel with flasher *TXDOT approved	No Bid	\$160.00 \$8,000.00 Precision Solar; 864100	No Bid
4	Guss Tube w/ Vinyl insert, threaded on both sides, Pelco #AB2007-58 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$39.00 \$1,950.00 Pelco AB2007-58	No Bid	\$35.00 \$1,750.00 Pelco; AB-2007-58-PNC	No Bid
5	Post Top, Acorn type, Pelco #5401 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$14.00 \$700.00 Pelco PB-5401	\$16.33 \$816.50 Chapel Hill TP#5811	\$12.50 \$625.00 Component Prod; CPI-APC-1-ACORN	No Bid
6	Wiring Harness for DPC-2000 Controller Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	Included in Item 3 Applied Information; Included with item number 3	No Bid	\$7.00 \$350.00 Wildcat Traffic; Solar Harness	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 7, 2020 For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts 6100012917			AJ			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Quantity	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
			Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. 2201 E. Division St. Arlington, TX 76011 817-831-9406	Traffic Parts Inc. 27895 Robinson Road Conroe, TX 77385 800-345-6329	Wildcat Traffic 5535 Harvey Wilson Houston, TX, 77020 512-608-8971	K&K Systems Inc. 687 Palmetto Road Tupelo, MS, 38801
7	Cabinet Mounting Bracket Mast Arm, Pelco #SE0126 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$15.00 \$750.00 Pelco SE-0126	No Bid	\$13.00 \$650.00 Pelco SE-0126-PNC	No Bid
8	Astro Sign Brac, Stellar for Overhead Street Sign, AS-0128-24-29 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$111.00 \$5,550.00 Pelco AS-0128-24-29	No Bid	\$95.00 \$4,750.00 Pelco AS-0128-24-29-PNC	No Bid
9	Notched Coupling, 1-1/2" X 2", Pelco #SE0346 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	200	\$7.00 \$1,400.00 Pelco SE-0346	\$7.83 \$1,566.00 Chapel Hill TP# 5140	\$6.50 \$1,300.00 Pelco SE-0346-PNC	No Bid
10	One Way Signal Mounting Kit, Pelco #SE3003 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	60	\$10.00 \$600.00 Pelco SE-3003-PNC	\$8.50 \$510.00 Chapel Hill TP# 5083	\$8.25 \$495.00 Pelco SE-3003-P01	No Bid
11	Aluminum Square Base w/ Plastic Door, Pelco #PB5335 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$135.00 \$20,250.00 Pelco PB-5335	\$140.00 \$21,000.00 Akron; TP#6800 TS-1000-P	\$112.00 \$16,800.00 Component Prod; CPI-BAS-1-PDP	No Bid
12	Anchor Bolts, 4 per Set, Pelco #PB5306 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$33.00 \$4,950.00 Pelco PB-5306	\$32.00 \$4,800.00 Chapel Hill TP# 4220 sets of 4	\$24.00 \$3,600.00 Madden Bolt MAD-ANCHOR BOLT	No Bid
13	Signal Mntg. Assy. Tri Stud for 8" or 12" only signal, Pelco #SE-0567 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	50	\$44.00 \$2,200.00 Pelco SE-0567	\$30.95 \$1,547.50 Chapel Hill TP#7328	\$38.00 \$1,900.00 Pelco SE-0567-PNC	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 7, 2020 For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts 6100012917			Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
AJ			Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. 2201 E. Division St. Arlington, TX 76011 817-831-9406	Traffic Parts Inc. 27895 Robinson Road Conroe, TX 77385 800-345-6329	Wildcat Traffic 5535 Harvey Wilson Houston, TX, 77020 512-608-8971	K&K Systems Inc. 687 Palmetto Road Tupelo, MS, 38801
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Quantity				
14	4" Sign Clamp, Pelco#AB0287-04 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	100	\$13.00 \$1,300.00 Pelco AB-0502-04 (Approved equal)	\$8.45 \$845.00 Chapel Hill TP#1063	\$19.00 \$1,900.00 Pelco SH-0206-4-PNC	No Bid
15	Solar Panel mounting bracket for 4" pole, preset at 37 degrees with mounting hardware for 4" side of pole installation Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$90.00 \$13,500.00 Ameresco Solar 021-HPM 50U	\$90.00 \$13,500.00 Chapel Hill TP#475	\$67.00 \$10,050.00 AMERESCO; PowerUP-HPMH50-90	No Bid
16	Pole and Base Collar Assembly, for square base, Pelco #PB-5325 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$122.00 \$18,300.00 Pelco PB-5325	No Bid	\$55.00 \$8,250.00 Component Prod; CPI-RBC-1	No Bid
17	Cabinet Mounting Brackets, two (2) per set, Pelco #SP 5293 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$142.00 \$21,300.00 Pelco SP 5293	\$48.50 \$7,275.00 Chapel Hill; TP#6368	\$30.00 \$4,500.00 Pelco SP-5627-PNC	No Bid
18	Spun Aluminum Pole, 17', Pelco #PB-5100-17 or approved equal Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	120	\$334.00 \$40,080.00 Pelco PB-5100-17-PNC	No Bid	\$245.00 \$36,750.00 Component Prod CPI-AP-17-40	No Bid
19	Solar Panel mounting bracket for mast arm installation, preset at 37 degrees with mounting hardware for mast arm pole installation Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$75.00 \$11,250.00 Ameresco Solar 021-HPM-50U	\$134.53 \$20,179.50 Chapel Hill TP#468	\$67.00 \$10,050.00 Ameresco PowerUP-HPMH50-90	No Bid
20	Unbreakable Solar Panel with .090 gauge aluminum back plate. Service entries to junction box shall be weathertight. 80W-90W solar panel guaranteed power output 90% rated wattage for 10 years; 80% for 25 years Net Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer & Product No.	150	\$120.00 \$18,000.00 Ameresco Solar VLS90-Solar Module	\$187.50 \$28,125.00 VLS; TP#6655 VLS-90T (90w)	\$172.00 \$25,800.00 Ameresco PowerUP-BSP90-12	No Bid
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	
Estimated Annual Total			\$201,380.00	\$103,564.50	\$174,570.00	
Estimated Annual Award			\$37,850.00	\$2,392.50	\$110,220.00	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles		EAN Holdings, LLC dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car 1505 Harry Wurzbach San Antonio, TX 78209 210-889-3604		Capps Van & Truck Rental 8555 John Carpenter Fwy Dallas, TX 75247
6100013074		HH		
Category	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity		
I	1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive: Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford F150, or proven equal			
A	Regular Cab			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$36.75	No Bid
	Extended Price		\$36.75	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$202.13	
	Extended Price		\$202.13	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	47	\$735.00	
	Extended Price		\$34,545.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
B	Extended Cab			No Bid
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$36.75	
	Extended Price		\$36.75	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$202.13	
	Extended Price		\$202.13	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$735.00	
	Extended Price		\$3,675.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
C	Crew or Super Crew Cab			No Bid
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$36.75	
	Extended Price		\$36.75	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$202.13	
	Extended Price		\$202.13	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate Each	5	\$735.00	
	Extended Price		\$3,675.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
	TOTAL CATEGORY I		\$42,611.64	
II	1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford F150, or proven equal			No Bid
A	Regular Cab			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$36.75	
	Extended Price		\$36.75	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$202.13	
	Extended Price		\$202.13	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	6	\$735.00	
	Extended Price		\$4,410.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
B	Extended Cab			No Bid
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$36.75	
	Extended Price		\$36.75	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$202.13	
	Extended Price		\$202.13	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	60	\$735.00	
	Extended Price		\$44,100.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
C	Crew or Super Crew Cab			N/A
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$36.75	N/A
	Extended Price		\$36.75	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$202.13	N/A
	Extended Price		\$202.13	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	79	\$735.00	\$825.00
	Extended Price		\$58,065.00	\$65,175.00
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	Not listed
	TOTAL CATEGORY II		\$107,291.64	
III	3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250, or proven equal			No Bid
A	Regular Cab			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$51.25	
	Extended Price		\$51.25	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$281.88	
	Extended Price		\$281.88	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$1,025.00	
	Extended Price		\$5,125.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020				LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles				EAN Holdings, LLC dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car 1505 Harry Wurzbach San Antonio, TX 78209 210-889-3604	Capps Van & Truck Rental 8555 John Carpenter Fwy Dallas, TX 75247
6100013074		HH	Estimated Annual Quantity		
Category	Description				
B	Extended Cab				No Bid
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$51.25		
	Extended Price		\$51.25		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$281.88		
	Extended Price		\$281.88		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$1,025.00		
	Extended Price		\$5,125.00		
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		
C	Crew or Super Crew Cab				No Bid
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$51.25		
	Extended Price		\$51.25		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$281.88		
	Extended Price		\$281.88		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$1,025.00		
	Extended Price		\$5,125.00		
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		
	TOTAL CATEGORY III		\$16,374.39		
IV	3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250, or proven equal				
A	Regular Cab				
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$51.25		N/A
	Extended Price		\$51.25		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$281.88		N/A
	Extended Price		\$281.88		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$1,025.00		\$849.95
	Extended Price		\$5,125.00		\$4,249.75
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		
B	Extended Cab				No Bid
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$51.25		
	Extended Price		\$51.25		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$281.88		
	Extended Price		\$281.88		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$1,025.00		
	Extended Price		\$5,125.00		
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		
C	Crew or Super Crew Cab				
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$51.25		N/A
	Extended Price		\$51.25		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$281.88		N/A
	Extended Price		\$281.88		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$1,025.00		\$849.95
	Extended Price		\$5,125.00		\$4,249.75
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		Not Listed
	TOTAL CATEGORY IV		\$16,374.39		
V	Full Size Sport Utility Vehicles Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Tahoe, Ford Expedition, or proven equal				
A	Regular 2 Wheel Drive				
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	6	\$55.00		No Bid
	Extended Price		\$330.00		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$302.50		
	Extended Price		\$302.50		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	1	\$1,100.00		
	Extended Price		\$1,100.00		
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		
B	4 Wheel Drive				No Bid
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$60.00		
	Extended Price		\$60.00		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$330.00		
	Extended Price		\$330.00		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$1,200.00		
	Extended Price		\$6,000.00		
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		
	TOTAL CATEGORY V		\$8,122.50		
VI	Small Size Sport Utility Vehicles Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford Escape, Jeep Liberty, or proven equal				
A	2 Wheel Drive, Gasoline Powered				
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$37.50		No Bid
	Extended Price		\$37.50		
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$206.25		
	Extended Price		\$206.25		
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$750.00		
	Extended Price		\$3,750.00		
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed		

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles		EAN Holdings, LLC dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car		Capps Van & Truck Rental
6100013074		HH	1505 Harry Wurzbach San Antonio, TX 78209 210-889-3604	8555 John Carpenter Fwy Dallas, TX 75247
Category	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity		
B	4 Wheel Drive, Gasoline Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$42.50	No Bid
	Extended Price		\$42.50	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$233.75	
	Extended Price		\$233.75	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$850.00	
	Extended Price		\$4,250.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
C	Hybrid Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$47.50	No Bid
	Extended Price		\$47.50	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$261.25	
	Extended Price		\$261.25	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$950.00	
	Extended Price		\$4,750.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
	TOTAL CATEGORY VI		\$13,578.75	
VII	Mid Size Sedan			
	Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Malibu, Ford Fusion, or proven equal			
A	Gasoline Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$34.25	No Bid
	Extended Price		\$34.25	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$188.38	
	Extended Price		\$188.38	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	6	\$685.00	
	Extended Price		\$4,110.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
B	Hybrid Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$44.25	No Bid
	Extended Price		\$44.25	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$243.38	
	Extended Price		\$243.38	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$885.00	
	Extended Price		\$4,425.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
	TOTAL CATEGORY VII		\$9,045.26	
VIII	Compact Size Sedan			
	Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Cruze, Ford Focus, or proven equal			
A	Gasoline Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$34.25	No Bid
	Extended Price		\$34.25	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$188.38	
	Extended Price		\$188.38	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$685.00	
	Extended Price		\$3,425.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
B	Hybrid Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$44.25	No Bid
	Extended Price		\$44.25	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$243.38	
	Extended Price		\$243.38	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$885.00	
	Extended Price		\$4,425.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
	TOTAL CATEGORY VIII		\$8,360.26	
IX	Eight (8) Passenger Mini-Van ,Window Type			No Bid
	Acceptable Makes & Models: Kia Sedona, Chrysler Town & Country, Dodge Grand Caravan, or proven equal			
A	Gasoline Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$40.00	
	Extended Price		\$40.00	
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$220.00	
	Extended Price		\$220.00	
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	8	\$800.00	
	Extended Price		\$6,400.00	
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	
	TOTAL CATEGORY IX		\$6,660.00	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles		EAN Holdings, LLC dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car		Capps Van & Truck Rental
6100013074		HH	1505 Harry Wurzbach San Antonio, TX 78209 210-889-3604	8555 John Carpenter Fwy Dallas, TX 75247
Category	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity		
X	Twelve (12) Passenger Van:			
	Acceptable Makes & Models:			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	4	\$46.25	\$109.95
	Extended Price		\$185.00	\$439.80
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$254.38	\$549.75
	Extended Price		\$254.38	\$549.75
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	1	\$925.00	\$1,199.95
	Extended Price		\$925.00	\$1,199.95
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	Not Listed
	TOTAL CATEGORY X		\$1,364.38	\$2,189.50
XI	Fifteen Passenger Van			
	Acceptable Models:			
A	Gasoline Powered			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	52	\$46.25	\$119.95
	Extended Price		\$2,405.00	\$6,237.40
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$254.38	\$599.75
	Extended Price		\$254.38	\$599.75
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	1	\$925.00	\$1,299.95
	Extended Price		\$925.00	\$1,299.95
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	Not Listed
	TOTAL CATEGORY XI		\$3,584.38	\$8,137.10
XII	Cargo Van			
	Acceptable Makes & Models:Ford Econoline, GMC Express, or proven equal			
1	Rental- Flat Daily Rate	1	\$40.00	\$79.95
	Extended Price		\$40.00	\$79.95
2	Rental- Flat Weekly Rate	1	\$220.00	\$399.75
	Extended Price		\$220.00	\$399.75
3	Rental- Flat Monthly Rate	5	\$800.00	\$949.95
	Extended Price		\$4,000.00	\$4,749.75
	Makes & Models Offered		Not Listed	Not Listed
	TOTAL CATEGORY XII		\$4,260.00	\$5,229.45
XIII	City of San Antonio Airport Usage Fees			
	City of San Antonio Customer Facility Charges (CFC)		\$5.50 or current applicable rate	\$5.50 or current applicable rate
	Facility Maintenance Fee (FMF)		\$1.33 or current applicable rate	\$1.33 or current applicable rate
	Prompt Payment Discount		Net 30	Net 30
	Estimated Annual Total		\$238,000.00	Incomplete
	Estimated Annual Award		\$238,000.00	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 21, 2021		Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Auto & Light-Duty Truck Window Tint		CDS Properties Inc., dba Southwest Public Safety		Modern Edge LLC, dba Automotive Discount Specialist (ADS)		SunSafe, LLC	
6100013212		CD		9905 Perrin Bite! Rd.		11703 Huebner Rd. Ste 106-401	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Usage	San Antonio, Texas, 78217 210-590-9363	San Antonio, Texas, 78249	San Antonio, Texas, 78239	San Antonio, Texas, 78239	
1	Window Tint						
1A	Two- Door Cars						
a	5%	10	\$200.00	\$224.40	\$250.00		
b	20%	20	\$200.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
c	35%	1	\$200.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	5	\$75.00	\$140.00	\$75.00		
	1A SUBTOTAL		\$6,575.00	\$7,446.40	\$8,125.00		
1B	Four-Door Cars						
a	5%	5	\$200.00	\$224.40	\$250.00		
b	20%	5	\$200.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
c	35%	50	\$200.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	6	\$80.00	\$150.00	\$75.00		
	1B SUBTOTAL		\$12,480.00	\$13,814.00	\$15,450.00		
1C	Standard Car Pick-Up Trucks						
a	5%	20	\$150.00	\$160.40	\$250.00		
b	20%	20	\$150.00	\$150.40	\$250.00		
c	35%	23	\$150.00	\$150.40	\$250.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	5	\$50.00	\$120.00	\$75.00		
	1C SUBTOTAL		\$9,700.00	\$10,275.20	\$16,125.00		
1D	Extended Cab Pick-Up Trucks						
a	5%	20	\$175.00	\$224.40	\$250.00		
b	20%	20	\$175.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
c	35%	1	\$175.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	5	\$50.00	\$150.00	\$75.00		
	1D SUBTOTAL		\$7,425.00	\$9,740.40	\$10,625.00		
1E	Crew Cab Pick-Up Trucks						
a	5%	20	\$175.00	\$244.40	\$250.00		
b	20%	20	\$175.00	\$224.40	\$250.00		
c	35%	9	\$175.00	\$224.10	\$250.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	1	\$75.00	\$160.00	\$75.00		
	1E SUBTOTAL		\$8,650.00	\$11,552.90	\$12,325.00		
1F	Two-Door SUV						
a	5%	5	\$200.00	\$224.40	\$250.00		
b	20%	5	\$200.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
c	35%	2	\$200.00	\$214.40	\$250.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	1	\$80.00	\$140.00	\$75.00		
	1F SUBTOTAL		\$2,480.00	\$2,762.80	\$3,075.00		
1G	Four-Door SUV/Passenger Vans						
a	5%	6	\$250.00	\$290.70	\$250.00		
b	20%	20	\$250.00	\$272.00	\$250.00		
c	35%	1	\$250.00	\$272.00	\$250.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	1	\$100.00	\$190.00	\$75.00		
	1G SUBTOTAL		\$6,850.00	\$7,646.20	\$6,825.00		
1H	Single Window Only (Regardless of vehicle)						
a	5%	1	\$50.00	\$80.40	\$50.00		
b	20%	1	\$50.00	\$75.00	\$50.00		
c	35%	1	\$50.00	\$75.00	\$50.00		
d	Removal Price Per Vehicle	9	\$25.00	\$140.00	\$25.00		
	1H SUBTOTAL		\$375.00	\$1,490.40	\$375.00		
	Subtotal		\$54,535.00	\$64,728.30	\$72,925.00		
	Payment Terms		1% 30 Days	Net 30	5% 15 Days		
	Prompt Payment Discount		\$545.35	\$0.00	\$3,646.25		
	Estimated Total with Prompt Payment Discount		\$53,989.65	\$64,728.30	\$69,278.75		
	Estimated Annual Total		\$54,535.00	\$64,728.30	\$72,925.00		
	Estimated Annual Award		\$54,535.00				