Opened:

August 13, 2014

City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for HVAC Disposable Air Filters Advanced Filtration All Materials Construction Dustless Air Filter JF Filtration Inc. Filtration Products Pure Air Filter Co. Inc.
Products
3101 Longhorn Blvd. #116 |1532 Lorelei Lane 11515 N. Weidner Rd. 4707 NW Industrial 1218 North Hackberry 4743 Whirlwind Dr.
6100004680 SM Austin, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Est. Annual [TX 78758 TX 78130 TX 78233 TX 78238 TX 78202 TX 78217
Item Description Quantity |512-834-2237 830-515-6623 210-653-5300 210-946-1688

1
DELETED

2 PLEATED TYPE AIR CONDITIONING
FILTERS, CARBON IMPREGNATED
16" x 20" x 2" 125
Price Each $6.75 $16.57 $6.16 $6.70 No Bid $5.41
Price Total $843.75 $2,071.25 $770.00 $837.50 $676.25
16" x 25" x 2" 125
Price Each $8.70 $19.49 $7.41 $6.95 No Bid $6.58
Price Total $1,087.50 $2,436.25 $926.25 $868.75 $822.50
17 7/8"x 17 7/8" x 2" 125
Price Each $13.25 $21.95 $5.10 $10.75 No Bid $9.20
Price Total $1,656.25 $2,743.75 $637.50 $1,343.75 $1,150.00
24" x 24" x 2" 250
Price Each $10.59 $24.78 $6.22 $10.99 No Bid $9.09
Price Total $2,647.50 $6,195.00| $1,555.00| $2,747.50 $2,272.50
Total Item 2 $6,235.00 $13,446.25 $3,888.75 $5,797.50 No Bid $4,921.25
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $6,110.30 $13,042.86 $3,888.75 $5,797.50 $4,921.25
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 0.00%)
Price Differential $0.00
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model OdorBan/Quality Airguard Koch OdorKleen 250 Flanders/Pre Pleat AC Kleen Air/Kleen Carbon

3 SYNTHETIC MEDIA DUAL PLY ROLL
FILTERS, Avg. Eff. 15-20%
22"x90"x 1" 5
Price Each $12.10 $11.85 $23.25 $66.00 No Bid $33.86
Price Total $60.50 $59.25 $116.25 $330.00 $169.30
32"x90"x 1" 5
Price Each $17.60 $17.25 $34.53 $96.00 No Bid $49.24
Price Total $88.00 $86.25 $172.65 $480.00 $246.20
36" x 90" x 1" 5
Price Each $19.80 $19.41 $37.67 $108.00 No Bid $55.40
Price Total $99.00 $97.05 $188.35 $540.00 $277.00
48"x 90" x 1" 5
Price Each $26.40 $25.86 $50.22 $144.00 No Bid $73.88
Price Total $132.00 $129.30 $251.10 $720.00 $369.40
60" x 90" x 1" 5
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Price Each $33.00 $32.35 $62.78 $180.00 No Bid $92.34
Price Total $165.00 $161.75 $313.90 $900.00 $461.70
72" x 90" x 1" 5
Price Each $39.60 $38.81 $75.33 $216.00 No Bid $110.80
Price Total $198.00 $194.05 $376.65 $1,080.00 $554.00
Total Item 3 $742.50 $727.65 $1,418.90 $4,050.00 No Bid $2,077.60
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $727.65 $705.82 $1,418.90 $4,050.00 $2,077.60
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 101.03%
Price Differential $713.08
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model 0100 Media/FGI Airguard Green Leaf AFT/GAT Media Polyester Fibers/HP-100BT

4
DELETED

5 CAMSORB RIGA-CARB CARBON
FILTERS, or approved equal NAS NAS
12" x 24" x 12" 50
Price Each $277.56 $363.27 $98.00 $199.00 No Bid $308.67
Price Total $13,878.00 $18,163.50 $4,900.00 $9,950.00 $15,433.50
24" x 24" x 12" 50
Price Each $390.92 $420.04 $150.00 $285.00 No Bid $435.09
Price Total $19,546.00 $21,002.00 $7,500.00 $14,250.00 $21,754.50
Total ltem 5 $33,424.00 $39,165.50 $12,400.00 $24,200.00 No Bid $37,188.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $32,755.52 $37,990.54 $12,400.00 $24,200.00 $37,188.00
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid N/A 13.53%
Price Differential $4,432.48
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model CamSorb/Camfil Farr| Airguard *Koch DuraKleen *Flanders/Surge Flow Airguard/Vari-Klean

6 TRI-DEK 3 PLY LINK FILTERS, 15/40, or
approved equal
16" x 40" 25
Price Each $5.90 $8.15 $7.55 $7.44 No Bid $7.13
Price Total $147.50 $203.75 $188.75 $186.00 $178.25
16" x 64" 50
Price Each $11.78 $25.10 $11.32 $11.75 No Bid $14.04
Price Total $589.00 $1,255.00| $566.00 $587.50 $702.00
20" x 45" 50
Price Each $10.40 $12.16 $8.80 $9.50 No Bid $10.44
Price Total $520.00 $608.00 $440.00 $475.00 $522.00
20" x 60" 25
Price Each $11.45 $13.74 $11.59 $12.39 No Bid $12.47
Price Total $286.25 $343.50 $289.75 $309.75 $311.75
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20" x 86" 25
Price Each $16.73 $32.75 $17.64 $18.59 No Bid $21.00
Price Total $418.25 $818.75 $441.00 $464.75 $525.00
20" x 90" 25
Price Each $20.82 $24.32 $17.64 $18.59 No Bid $21.00
Price Total $520.50 $608.00 $441.00 $464.75 $525.00
25" x 45" 25
Price Each $13.23 $25.10 $9.89 $10.50 No Bid $12.47
Price Total $330.75 $627.50 $247.25 $262.50 $311.75
25" x 112" 50
Price Each $29.67 $33.49 $25.05 $27.50 No Bid $29.04
Price Total $1,483.50 $1,674.50 $1,252.50 $1,375.00 $1,452.00
25" x 140" 300
Price Each $36.43 $39.15 $30.98 $29.50 No Bid $35.51
Price Total $10,929.00 $11,745.00 $9,294.00 $8,850.00 $10,653.00
Total Item 6 $15,224.75 $17,884.00 $13,160.25 $12,975.25 No Bid $15,180.75
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $14,920.26 $17,347.48 $13,160.25 $12,975.25 $15,180.75
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 1.43%
Price Differential $185.00
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model 3 Ply Link/FGI ATI Koch Maxi-Grid Columbus/Surge Stop G3/Ultimate Panel 3ply
Local Preference Award $13,160.25

7
DELETED

8
DELETED

9 KOCH MULTI-PLEAT XL8-HC, MERV 8,
Avg. Eff. 30-35%, or approved equal
20" x 25" x 2" 24
Price Each $3.08 $4.06 $4.31 $5.24 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $73.92 $97.44 $103.44 $125.76
16" x 25" x 2" 24
Price Each $2.78 $3.36 $3.64 $4.44 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $66.72 $80.64 $87.36 $106.56
Total Item 9 $140.64 $178.08 $190.80 $232.32 No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $137.83 $172.74 $190.80 $232.32
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 38.43%
Price Differential $52.97
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model NovaPleat/FGI Airguard Koch Multi-Pleat Green Glassfloss/Huxun
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10 KOCH MULTI-PLEAT GREEN 13, Avg.
Eff. 80-85%, or approved equal
24" x 24" x 4" 140
Price Each $17.64 $24.35 $20.20 $16.37 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $2,469.60 $3,409.00 $2,828.00 $2,291.80
Total Item 10 $2,469.60 $3,409.00 $2,828.00 $2,291.80 No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $2,420.21 $3,306.73 $2,828.00 $2,291.80
Percentage between lowest responsible bid 23.40%
Price Differential $536.20
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model DP13/Airguard Airguard| Koch Multi-Pleat Green 13 Flanders/Merv 13 Pleat
Payment Terms 2% 10 Days 3% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Days Net 30
Delivery 3 days 10 days 5 days 5 days 14 days 21 days
Estimated Annual Total $32,893.35 $705.82 $17,049.00 $2,291.80 $0.00 $0.00
Estimated Annual Award $32,893.35 $705.82 $17,049.00 $2,291.80 $0.00 $0.00

* Item 5: The first and second lowest bidders did not meet the required specifications. Item awarded to third lowest bidder, which met the specifications.

Iltems 1, 4, 7, and 8 were deleted (no longer required) and will not be re-bid at a later date.

Page 4 of 4




