
LOC 
9/4/14 
Item No. 8 

AN ORDINANCE 20 14 - 0 q - 0 4 -0 642 

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING 
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL COST OF $4,810,000.00: (A) CONTROL TECHNOLOGIES, 
INC. AND WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC. FOR VIDEO IMAGING 
VEHICLE DETECTION SYSTEM, (B) HElL OF TEXAS AND RELIANCE 
TRUCK & EQUIPMENT, LTD. FOR REFUSE TRUCKS BODY PARTS & 
SERVICE, (C) TEXAS STAR SUPPL Y FOR ASPHALT EMULSION 
SEALCOAT MATERIAL, (D) TEXAS IRRIGATION SUPPL Y AND 
LONGHORN, INC. FOR SPRINKLER AND IRRIGATION REPAIR 
PARTS, (E) PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. FOR TRAFFIC 
SIGNAL CONTROL EQUIPMENT, (F) STANDARD & POOR'S 
CAPITAL IQ FOR NETADV ANT AGE SUBSCRIPTION FOR SAN 
ANTONIO PUBLIC LIBRARY, (G) FUTTERMAN AND ASSOCIATES, 
INC. D/B/A CIVICTECHNOLOGIES FOR BUSINESSDECISION 
LICENSE SUBSCRIPTION AND (H) PELCO STRUCTURAL, LLC. FOR 
TRAFFIC SIGNAL STEEL POLES. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Control 
Technologies, Inc. and Wildcat Electric Supply, Inc. for video imaging vehicle detection system, 
(B) Heil of Texas and Reliance Truck & Equipment, Ltd. for refuse trucks body parts & service, 
(C) Texas Star Supply for asphalt emulsion sealcoat material, (D) Texas Irrigation Supply and 
Longhorn, Inc. for sprinkler and irrigation repair parts, (E) Reserved, (F) Standard & Poor's 
Capital IQ for NetAdvantage subscription for San Antonio Public Library, (G) Futtennan and 
Associates, Inc. d/b/a CIVICTechnologies for BusinessDecision license subscription and (H) 
Pelco Structural, LLC. for traffic signal steel poles; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves 6 low bid contracts, 1 contract procured utilizing 
cooperative purchasing, and 2 sole source contracts; and 

WHEREAS, the contract for item E, for traffic signal control equipment, will not be awarded, 
and will be rebid at a later time; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Control 
Technologies, Inc. and Wildcat Electric Supply, Inc. for video imaging vehicle detection system, 



LOC 
9/4114 
Item No.8 

(B) Heil of Texas and Reliance Truck & Equipment, Ltd. for refuse trucks body parts & service, 
(C) Texas Star Supply for asphalt emulsion sealcoat material, (D) Texas Irrigation Supply and 
Longhorn, Inc. for sprinkler and irrigation repair parts, (E) Reserved, (F) Standard & Poor's 
Capital IQ for NetAdvantage subscription for San Antonio Public Library, (G) Futtennan and 
Associates, Inc. d/b/a CIVICTechnologies for BusinessDecision license subscription and (H) 
Pelco Structural, LLC. for traffic signal steel poles on an annual contract basis as shown on the 
attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of 
all required bonds, perfonnance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid 
tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. 
Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the 
Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will 
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2014 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal 
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals. 

SECTION 3. No contract will be awarded for traffic signal control equipment at this time. The 
contract will be rebid at a later date. 

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affinnative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 4th day of September, 2014. 

Ivy R. Taylor 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

ty Attorney 

2 



Voting Results Interface Page 6 of42 

Agenda Item: 8 ( in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9,11,12,13,14,15, 16A, 16B, 18, 19,20,21,22,23,24,25,26, 
27, 28A, 28B, 28C) 

Date: 09/04/2014 

Time: 09:32:40 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services 
for an estimated annual cost of$4,810,000.00: (A) Control Technologies, Inc. and Wildcat 
Electric Supply, Inc. for video imaging vehicle detection system, (B) Heil of Texas and Reliance 
Truck & Equipment, Ltd. for refuse trucks body parts & service, (C) Texas Star Supply for 
asphalt emulsion sea1coat material, (D) Texas Irrigation Supply and Longhorn, Inc. for sprinkler 
and irrigation repair parts, (E) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. for traffic signal control 
equipment, (F) Standard & Poor's Capital IQ for NetAdvantage subscription for San Antonio 
Public Library, (G) Futtennan and Associates, Inc. d/b/a CIVICTechnologies for 
BusinessDecision license subscription and (H) Pe1co Structural, LLC. for traffic signal steel 
poles. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ivy R. Taylor Mayor x 

Diego Bernal District 1 x 

Keith Toney District 2 x x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Mari Aguirre-Rodriguez District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x 

http:// cosawebN oteInterfacelDefault.aspx 9/5/2014 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Exhibit I 

Opened: June 18, 2014 Non-Local Non-Local 

For: Annual Contract for Video Imaging Vehicle Detection System Control Technologies, Inc Wildcat Electric Supply, Inc 

6100004370 AJ 702 South Persimmon SI. 1 B 5535 Harvey Wilson 

Estimated Tomball, Houston, 

Item Description Annual TX 77375 TX 77020 

Quantitv 281-255-8844 713-430-6556 

1 Processor, One (1) Channel 34 NAS 
Supplier Part Number 7250-117 90-180-05 
Manufacturer FlirlTraficon Peek 
Manufacturer Part Number 10-4370 90-180-O5 
Unit Price: $1,450.00 $1,400.00 
Extended Price: $49,300.00 $47,600.00 

2 Processor, Two (2) Channel 166 
Supplier Part Number 7250-113 90-180-06 
Manufacturer FlirlTraficon Peek 
Manufacturer Part Number 10-4320 90-180-06 
Unit Price: $2,150.00 $2,290.00 
Extended Price: $356,900.00 $380,140.00 

3 Camera with Hardware 203 
Supplier Part Number 2050-102MI 82-1773 
Manufacturer Control Technologies Peek 
Manufacturer Part Number 2050-102 MI 82-1773 
Unit Price: $900.00 $999.00 
Extended Price: $182,700.00 $202,797.00 

4 Remote Access Module 29 
Supplier Part Number 7250-210 
Manufacturer FlirlTraficon 
Manufacturer Part Number 10-4545 
Unit Price: $2,000.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $58,000.00 

5 Keypad, Field Set Up 6 
Supplier Part Number 7250-50T 
Manufacturer FlirlTraficon 
Manufacturer Part Number 10-0023 
Unit Price: $170.00 No Bid 
Extended Price: $1,020.00 

6 Five (5) Coax Cable 1,000' feet 140 
Supplier Part Number WIRE-VC-RG 18/6 991-63SFE 
Manufacturer ISOTEC Advanced Digital Cable 
Manufacturer Part Number Cable VC RG 18/6 991-63SFE 
Unit Price: $700.00 $770.00 
Extended Price: $98,000.00 $107,800.00 

7 Video Connector 1,000 
Supplier Part Number CON-BNC-CP882 2K71-0024 
Manufacturer Ampernohol or equal Peek 
Manufacturer Part Number BNC-CP882 2K71-0024 
Unit Price: $2.00 $4.00 
Extended Price: $2,000.00 $4,000.00 

8 Video Camera Cable 204 
Supplier Part Number CON-BNC-PE9908 81-1 080-006 

Manufacturer Control Technologies Peek 
Manufacturer Part Number CON-BNC-PE9908 81-1081-006 
Unit Price: $5.00 $110.00 
Extended Price: $1,020.00 $22,440.00 

9 Video Camera Suppression 203 
Supplier Part Number SUR-VI-CCTV-SP-NI 81-1073 

Manufacturer EDCO or Equal Peek 

Manufacturer Part Number CX06MI-BNC 81-1073 

Unit Price: $70.00 $90.00 
Extended Price: $14,210.00 $18,270.00 

10 Deleted 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 18, 2014 
Non·Local 

For: Annual Contract for Video Imaging Vehicle Detection System Control Technologies, Inc 
6100004370 

Item Description 

11 Deleted 

12 Vehicle Video Camera Assembly 
Supplier Part Number 
Manufacturer 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Unit Price: 
Extended Price: 

13 Video Monitor 

Supplier Part Number 
Manufacturer 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Unit Price: 
Extended Price: 

14 Connector Kit 
Supplier Part Number 
Manufacturer 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Unit Price: 
Extended Price: 

15 Suppression Panel 

Supplier Part Number 
Manufacturer 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Unit Price: 
Extended Price: 

16 Deleted 

Delivery 

Payment Terms 

Estimated Annual Total 
Estimated Annual Award 

Item 10 and 16: deleted will be rebid at a later date 
Item 11: deleted due to duplication 

AJ 702 South Persimmon St. 1 B 

Estimated Tomball, 

Annual TX 77375 

Quantitv 281-255-8844 

179 
2050-102MI 

Control Technologies, Inc 
2050-102MI 

$900.00 
$161,100.00 

21 

No Bid 

130 

No Bid 

39 
2285-104C 

Control Technologies 
2285-104C 

$215.00 
$8,385.00 

30 calendar days 

2% 10 days 

$932,635.00 
$932635.00 

Non·Local 

Wildcat Electric Supply, Inc 
5535 Harvey Wilson 
Houston, 
TX 77020 
713-430-6556 

82-1773 
Peek 

82-1773 
$999.00 

$178,821.00 

2M20-0046 
Peek 

2M20-0046 
$230.00 

$4,830.00 

2K71-0024 
Peek 

2K71-0024 
$4.00 

$520.00 

82-1661-05 
Peek 

82-1661-05 
$550.00 

$21,450.00 

60 calendar days 

Net 30 

$5,350.00 
$5,350.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 27, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Refuse Trucks Body Parts & Service 
Local Local 

Texan Waste Equipment Inc. Reliance Truck & 
d/b/a Heil Of Texas Equipment, Ltd. 

6100004511 LD 503 Pop Gunn 7200 South W. W. White Rd. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Item Description Qty TX 78219 TX 78222 
210-224-5800 21 0-648-3337 

1A Heil Refuse Body Parts Discount 

Percent of discount offered 13% off List No Bid 

Product identification (Manufacturer) Heil 
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Fleet 

Price schedule number Heil2014 

Date of price schedule 2014 

Price schedule column on which discount is based List 
(Le., distributor, net, wholesale) 

1B Specified Items for Evaluation Only 

1C Labor and Service 
Labor and Service Rate: $85.00 

Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate: $127.50 

Business hours: 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. 5 days pe 
week 

Parts and Service Facilities Name: Heil of Texas 

Parts and Service Facilities Address: 503 Pop Gunn, 
San Antonio, Texas 78219 

2A Pak-Mor Refuse Body Parts 

Percent of discount offered No Bid 0% 

Product identification (Manufacturer) Pak-Mo 

Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Deale 

Price schedule number N/A 

Date of price schedule N/A 

Price schedule column on which discount is based Net 
(Le., distributor, net, wholesale) 

2B Specified Items for Evaluation Only 

2C Labor and Service 
Labor and Service Rate: $60.00 

Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate: $90.00 

Business hours: 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 5 days 
per week 

Parts and Service Facilities Name: Reliance Truck & 
Equipment, LTD. 

Parts and Service Facilities Address: 7200 S. W. W. White Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 78222 

3 Deleted 

4A New Way King Cobra Refuse Body Parts 
Percent of discount offered No Bid Cost + 20% 

Product identification (Manufacturer) New Way 

Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Deale 

Price schedule number N/A 

Date of price schedule N/A 

Price schedule column on which discount is based Net 

(Le., distributor, net, wholesale) 

4B Specified Items for Evaluation Only 

4C Labor and Service 
Labor and Service Rate: $60.00 

Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate: $90.00 

Business hours: 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 5 days 
per week 

Parts and Service Facilities Name: Reliance Truck & 
Equipment, LTD. 

Parts and Service Facilities Address: 7200 S. W. W. White Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 78222 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 

Prepared by Purchasing 7/29/2014 Page 1 



Opened: 

For: 

6100004540 

Item 

1 

2 

3 

July 2,2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Local 
Annual Contract for Asphalt Emulsion Sealcoat 
Material Texas Star Supply 

OS 11910 Radium St. 
San Antonio, 

Estimated TX 78216 
Description Quantities 210-819-4751 

Year 1 - Pitch Black 3 94,770 
Asphalt Emulsion Seal Coat Material 
Price Per Gallon $2.3C 
Price Total $217,971.0C 

Year 2 - Pitch Black 3 94,770 
Asphalt Emulsion Seal Coat Material 
Price Per Gallon $2.30 
Price Total $217,971.00 

Year 3 - Pitch Black 3 94,770 
Asphalt Emulsion Seal Coat Material 
Price Per Gallon $2.30 
Price Total $217,971.00 

Delivery Days 1 da~ 

Payment Terms Net 30 days 

Estimated Annual Total $218,000.00 
. EstImated Annua I Award 5218,000.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/4/2013 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 7, 2014 Local Non-Local 
For: Annual Contract for Sprinkler and Irrigation Repair Texas Irrigation Supply Longhorn Inc. 

Parts 
6100004434 RS 15480 Capitol Port 403 W. Nakoma 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78249 210- TX 78216 

Item Description 323-8906 210-340-3516 

1A WHOLE COMPONENTS FOR HUNTER SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS 

a Percent of Discount Offered 60.00% 56.90% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) HUNTER HUNTER 
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) List Price List Price 
d Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 1/1/2014 

18 REPAIR PARTS FOR HUNTER SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS 

a Percent of Discount Offered 60.00% 45.00% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) HUNTER HUNTER 
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) List Price List Price 
d Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 1/1/2014 

2A WHOLE COMPONENTS FOR RAINBIRD SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS 

a Percent of Discount Offered 55.00% 52.00% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) RAINBIRD RAINBIRD 
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) List Price List Price 
d Date of price Schedule 2/3/2014 2/3/2014 

28 REPAIR PARTS FOR RAINBIRD SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS 

a Percent of Discount Offered 50.00% 32.00% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) RAINBIRD RAINBIRD 
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) List Price List Price 
d Date of price Schedule 2/3/2014 2/3/2014 

3A WHOLE COMPONENTS FOR WEATHERMATIC 
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS 

a Percent of Discount Offered 49.00% 51.40% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) WEATHERMATIC WEATHERMATIC 
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) List Price List Price 
d Date of price Schedule 11/1/2013 11/1/2013 

38 REPAIR PARTS FOR WEATHERMATIC SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS 

a Percent of Discount Offered 46.00% 33.00% 
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) WEATHERMATIC WEATHERMATIC 
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) List Price List Price 
d Date of price Schedule 11/1/2013 11/1/2013 

Delivery 1 day 2 days 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 

Page 1 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Opened April 29, 2014 

For: 
Annual Contract for NetAdvantage Subscription 
for San Antonio Public Library 

6100004300 CC 
Annual 

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities 

1 Annual Subscription to NetAdvantage Database 
1a Initial Year (09/11/2014 - 09/10/2015) 1 

Total Cost - 5% Discount 
1b Renewal Year # 1 (09/11/2015 - 09/10/2016) 1 

Total Cost - 10% Discount 
1c Renewal Year # 2 (09/11/2016 - 09/10/2017) 1 

Total Cost - 10% Discount 
1d Renewal Year # 3 (09/11/2017 - 09/10/2018) 1 

Total Cost - 10% Discount 
1e Renewal Year # 4 (09/11/2017 - 09/10/2019) 1 

Total Cost - 10% Discount 

Payment Terms 

Estimated Total 
Estimated Total Award 

Sole Source 

Standard & Poor's 
CaptiallQ 

7400 S. Alton Court 

Centennial, 
CO 80112 
303-721-4403 

$24,390.30 

$23,106.60 

$23,106.60 

$23,106.60 

$23,106.60 

Net 30 

$116,816.70 
$116,816.70 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 6,2014 

For: 
Annual Contract for BusinessDecision 
Subscription for San Antonio Public Library 

6100004535 VF 
Annual 

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities 

1 BusinessDecision License Subscription 
1a Initial Year (12/1/2014 - 09/30/2015) 10 

Total Cost 
1b Renewal Year # 1 (10/1/2015 - 09/30/2016) 12 

Total Cost 
1c Renewal Year # 2 (10/1/2016 - 09/30/2017) 12 

Total Cost 
1d Renewal Year # 3 (10/1/2017 - 09/30/2018) 12 

Total Cost 
1e Renewal Year # 4 (10/1/2017 - 09/30/2019) 12 

Total Cost 

Terms 

Estimated Total 
Estimated Award 

Sole Source 

Futterman and Associates Inc. 
d/b/a CIVICTechnologies 

17700 Karen Drive 
Encino, 
CA 91316 
818-881-2400 

$1,250.00 
$12,500.00 

$1,250.00 
$15,000.00 

$1,250.00 
$15,000.00 

$1,250.00 
$15,000.00 

$1,250.00 
$15,000.00 

Net 30 

$72,500.00 
$72,500.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened June 20, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Traffic Signal Steel Poles 

TXMAS 

Pelco Structural, LLC. 

6100004553 OS 1501 Industrial Blvd. 
Claremore, 

Estimated OK 74017 

Item Description Quantity 918-283-4004 

1 Type A Strain Pole, 26' 2 
Price Each $2,623.00 
Price Total $5,246.00 

2 Type B Strain Pole, 30' 2 
Price Each $2,915.00 
Price Total $5,830.00 

3 Type 0 Strain Pole, 34' 2 
Price Each $3,761.00 
Price Total $7,522.00 

4 19' Steel Pole w/20' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $2,658.00 
Price Total $2,658.00 

5 19' Steel Pole w/24' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $2,762.00 
Price Total $2,762.00 

6 19' Steel Pole w/28' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $2,916.00 
Price Total $2,916.00 

7 19' Steel Pole w/32' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $3,412.00 
Price Total $6,824.00 

8 19' Steel Pole w/36' Mast Arm 4 
Price Each $3,910.00 
Price Total $15,640.00 

9 19' Steel Pole w/40' Mast Arm 4 
Price Each $4,411.00 
Price Total $17,644.00 

10 19' Steel Pole w/44' Mast Arm 4 
Price Each $4,715.00 
Price Total $18,860.00 

11 19' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $4,267.00 
Price Total $4,267.00 

12 19' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $5,260.00 
Price Total $5,260.00 

13 19' Steel Pole w/24' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $4,405.00 
Price Total $4,405.00 

14 19' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $4,438.00 
Price Total $4,438.00 

15 19' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 28' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $5,561.00 

Price Total $5,561.00 

16 19' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 32' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $5,928.00 
Price Total $5,928.00 

17 19' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 32' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $6,585.00 
Price Total $6,585.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened June 20, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Traffic Signal Steel Poles 

TXMAS 

Pelco Structural, LLC. 

6100004553 DS 1501 Industrial Blvd. 
Claremore, 

Estimated OK 74017 

Item Description Quantity 918-283-4004 

18 19' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 36' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $6,852.00 
Price Total $6,852.00 

30' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 
19 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,174.00 
Price Total $5,174.00 

30' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 
20 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,935.00 
Price Total $5,935.00 

30' Steel Pole w/24' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 
21 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,380.00 
Price Total $5,380.00 

30' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 
22 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,346.00 
Price Total $5,346.00 

30' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 28' Clamp-on Arm 
23 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $6,141.00 
Price Total $6,141.00 

30' Steel Pole w136' Fixed Arm & 32' Clamp-on Arm 
24 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $6,936.00 
Price Total $6,936.00 

30' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 32' Clamp-on Arm 
25 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $7,419.00 
Price Total $7,419.00 

30' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 36' Clamp-on Arm 
26 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $7,428.00 
Price Total $7,428.00 

27 30' Steel Pole w/20' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 1 
Price Each $3,450.00 
Price Total $3,450.0C 

28 30' Steel Pole w/24' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 1 
Price Each $3,631.00 
Price Total $3,631.00 

29 30' Steel Pole w/28' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 1 
Price Each $3,822.00 
Price Total $3,822.00 

30 30' Steel Pole w/32' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 2 
Price Each $4,227.00 
Price Total $8,454.00 

31 30' Steel Pole w/36' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 1 
Price Each $4,756.00 
Price Total $4,756.00 

32 30' Steel Pole w/40' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 1 
Price Each $4,979.00 
Price Total $4,979.00 

2 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened June 20,2014 

For: Annual Contract for Traffic Signal Steel Poles 

TXMAS 

Pelco Structural, LLC. 

6100004553 DS 1501 Industrial Blvd. 
Claremore, 

Estimated OK 74017 

Item Description Quantity 918-283-4004 

33 30' Steel Pole w/44' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 1 
Price Each $5,650.00 
Price Total $5,650.00 

34 Pedestrian Pushbutton Post, per attached Exhibit A 2 
Price Each $450.00 
Price Total $900.00 

35 24' Steel Pole w/20' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $3,283.00 
Price Total $3,283.00 

36 24' Steel Pole w/24' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $3,451.00 
Price Total $3,451.00 

37 24' Steel Pole w/28' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $3,628.00 
Price Total $3,628.00 

38 24' Steel Pole w/32' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $4,211.00 
Price Total $8,422.00 

39 24' Steel Pole w/36' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $4,801.00 
Price Total $9,602.00 

40 24' Steel Pole w/40' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $5,368.00 
Price Total $10,736.00 

41 24' Steel Pole w/44' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $5,711.00 
Price Total $11,422.00 

42 24' Steel Pole w/48' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $6,265.00 
Price Total $6,265.00 

43 24' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $5,287.00 
Price Total $5,287.00 

44 24' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $6,325.00 
Price Total $6,325.00 

45 24' Steel Pole w/24' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $5,456.00 
Price Total $5,456.00 

46 24' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $5,458.00 
Price Total $5,458.00 

47 24' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 28' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $6,626.00 
Price Total $6,626.00 

48 24' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 32' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $7,606.00 
Price Total $7,606.00 

49 24' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 36' Clamp-on Arm 1 
Price Each $7,737.00 

Price Total $7,737.00 

30' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 
50 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,174.00 
Price Total $5,174.00 

3 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened June 20, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Traffic Signal Steel Poles 

TXMAS 

Pelco Structural, LLC. 

6100004553 DS 1501 Industrial Blvd. 
Claremore, 

Estimated OK 74017 

Item Description Quantity 918-283-4004 

30' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 20' Clamp-on Arm 
51 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,935.00 
Price Total $5,935.00 

30' Steel Pole w/24' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 
52 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,380.00 
Price Total $5,380.00 

30' Steel Pole w/28' Fixed Arm & 24' Clamp-on Arm 
53 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $5,396.00 
Price Total $5,396.00 

30' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 28' Clamp-on Arm 
54 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $6,141.00 
Price Total $6,141.00 

30' Steel Pole w/36' Fixed Arm & 32' Clamp-on Arm 
55 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $6,936.00 
Price Total $6,936.00 

30' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 32' Clamp-on Arm 
56 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $7,463.00 
Price Total $7,463.00 

30' Steel Pole w/40' Fixed Arm & 36' Clamp-on Arm 
57 & 8' Luminary Arm 1 

Price Each $7,428.00 
Price Total $7,428.00 

58 30' Steel Pole w/48' Mast Arm & 8' Luminary Arm 1 
Price Each $6,199.00 
Price Total $6,199.00 

59 24' Steel Pole w/50' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $12,423.00 
Price Total $12,423.00 

60 24' Steel Pole w/55' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $12,739.00 
Price Total $12,739.00 

61 24' Steel Pole w/60' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $13,036.00 
Price Total $13,036.00 

62 24' Steel Pole w/65' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $13,313.00 
Price Total $13,313.00 

63 7' Clamp-on ILSN Arm 10 
Price Each $422.00 

Price Total $4,220.00 

64 9' Clamp-on ILSN Arm 10 
Price Each $438.00 
Price Total $4,380.00 

65 Anchor Bolt Assembly, 17" bolt circle 10 
Price Each $298.00 

Price Total $2,980.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened June 20, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Traffic Signal Steel Poles 

TXMAS 

Pel co Structural, LLC. 

6100004553 DS 1501 Industrial Blvd. 
Claremore, 

Estimated OK 74017 

Item Description Quantity 918-283-4004 

66 Anchor Bolt Assembly, 19" bolt circle 10 
Price Each $492.00 
Price Total $4,920.00 

67 Anchor Bolt Assembly, 21" bolt circle 5 
Price Each $622.00 
Price Total $3,110.00 

68 Anchor Bolt Assembly, 23" bolt circle 5 
Price Each $1,280.00 
Price Total $6,400.00 

69 Freight charge for orders of only one pole 4 
Price Each $2,043.00 
Price Total $8,172.00 

70 Freight charge for orders of only two poles 4 
Price Each $1,929.00 
Price Total $7,716.00 

71 Freight charge for orders of only three poles 4 
Price Each $1,828.00 
Price Total $7,312.00 

72 19' Steel Pole w/24' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $2,393.00 
Price Total $4,786.00 

73 24' Steel Pole w/24' Mast Arm 3 
Price Each $2,610.00 
Price Total $7,830.00 

74 24' Steel Pole w/28' Mast Arm 7 
Price Each $2,790.00 
Price Total $19,530.00 

75 24' Steel Pole w/32' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $3,385.00 
Price Total $6,770.00 

76 24' Steel Pole w/36' Mast Arm 4 
Price Each $3,778.00 
Price Total $15,112.00 

77 24' Steel Pole w/40' Mast Arm 2 
Price Each $4,357.00 
Price Total $8,714.00 

78 24' Steel Pole w/44' Mast Arm 12 
Price Each $4,706.00 
Price Total $56,472.00 

79 24' Steel Pole w/48' Mast Arm 8 
Price Each $5,273.00 
Price Total $42,184.00 

80 24' Steel Pole w/55' Mast Arm 1 
Price Each $10,769.00 
Price Total $10,769.00 

Delivery after reciept of order 60 days 

Payment Terms Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $218,000.00 
Estimated Annual Award $218,000.00 
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