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ORDINANCE 2019-09-12-0702

APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH ASSOCIATED SUPPLY COMPANY,
INC. DBA ASCO EQUIPMENT, HOLTCAT, AND NUECES FARM
CENTER, INC. DBA NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT TO PROVIDE THE
TRANSPORTATION AND CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS AND SOLID
WASTE MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENTS WITH THE REPLACEMENT
OF SIX OFF ROAD CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT UNITS FOR A
TOTAL COST OF $811,798.00. FUNDING FOR THIS PURCHASE IN
THE AMOUNT OF $801,857.00 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2019
EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET, AND
$9,941.00 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2019 STORM WATER
OPERATING FUND BUDGET.

& & & & &

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to the City of San Antonio to provide off road construction
equipment for the Transportation and Capital Improvements and Solid Waste Management
departments; and

WHEREAS, Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment submitted the low bids for
items 1 and 2 for a total cost of $407,887.00, Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba ASCO
Equipment submitted the low bids for items 3 and 4 for a total cost of $86,500.00, and HoltCat
submitted the low bid for item 5 for a cost of $317,411.00; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba ASCO Equipment,
HoltCat, and Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment to provide off road
construction equipment for a total cost of $811,798.00 is hereby accepted, subject to and
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates
and endorsements. Attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I is the
bid tabulation sheet. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the
Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in an amount of $811,798.00 is available as part of the
Fiscal Year 2019 budget, as follows:

Amount General Cost Center / Fund
Ledger Internal Order
$482,298.00 | 5709080 3503300001 72001001
$329,500.00 | 5709080 3503200001 72001000
TOTAL $811,798.00

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount is authorized to Associated Supply
Company, Inc. dba ASCO Equipment, HoltCat, and Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power
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Equipment to provide the Transportation and Capital Improvements and Solid Waste
Management departments with the replacement of six off road construction equipment units.

SECTION 4. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject
to concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund
Numbers, SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund
Centers, SAP Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers,
and SAP GL Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 5. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 12" day of September, 2019.

M—A-Y OXK
Ron Nirenberg

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Dore () Hton /41“’74"\

é 9" Leticia M. Vacek?t City Clerk drew $€govia City Attorney




Agenda Item: 11 (in consent vote: 5,6, 7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19A, 19B, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24,
25, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39,40 )
Date: 09/12/2019
Time: 10:04:32 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: Ordinance approving contracts with Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba ASCO Equipment,
HoltCat, and Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment to provide Transportation
and Capital Improvements and Solid Waste Management departments with the replacement of six
off road construction equipment units for a total cost of $811,798.00. Funding for this purchase in
the amount of $801,857.00 is available from the FY 2019 Equipment Renewal and Replacement
Fund Budget, and $9,941.00 is available from the FY 2019 Storm Water Operating Fund Budget.
[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]
Result: Passed
Not : :
Voter Group Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Jada Andrews-Sullivan District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Adriana Rocha Garcia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Melissa Cabello Havrda District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X X
Clayton H. Perry District 10 X
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Exhibit I



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery [H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. |Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD (4697 FM 1516 North [2102 E. Slayton Rd. |5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. |H 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY [Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
1 Articulated Wheeled Loader / 2.5 Cubic 2
Yard Bucket:
Price Each: $121,500.00 $135,500.00 $132,231.00 No Bid No Bid $129,589.88 $168,718.00
Total: $243,000.00] $271,000.00 $264,462.00 $259,179.76 $337,436.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 8.83% 38.86%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $21,462.00 $94,436.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: Hyundai HL940 TM| 2018 Case 621G 2019 Caterpillar 2019 John Deere 2019 Komatsu
Wheel Loader 926M 524L WA270-8
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Hyundai HL940TM FPT F4HFE613W,| Cat C7.1 ACERT 141 John Deere Power| Komatsu SAA6D107E
(Include SAE net HP): 162 HP net hp Tech PVS 6068 (152 3 (149 Net
hp) Hp)
Warranty: 3 yr./3,000 Hrf 3yr. /3000 hours| 12 months/unlimited 1 Year Unlimited 1 Year/Unlimited
hours, total machine Hours Hours

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power Associated Supply Holt Cat RDO Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce

Equipment| Company Industries

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4697 FM 1516 N, 1920 SE Loop 410,| 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 19275 N. |H 35, New| 3740 SE Loop 410,

Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, Texas| San Antonio, Texas Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio,

78220 78222 TX 78222

Delivery: 150 Days 180 Days 135 Days 30-90 Days 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date: Oct 31, 2019 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/31/2019 9/30/2019

Last day order can be placed without 10/30/19 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/1/2019 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No No No

date:
Prepared by Purchasing 8/27/2019 10of5




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. |Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD |4697 FM 1516 North [2102 E. Slayton Rd. |5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY (Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
2 Articulated Wheeled Loader / min. 4 Cubic 1
Yard Bucket:
Price Each: $164,887.00 $206,250.00 $213,277.00 No Bid No Bid $217,488.90 $243,698.00
Total: $164,887.00) $206,250.00 $213,277.00 $217,488.90 $243,698.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 29.35% 47.80%
Price Differential: $48,390.00 $78,811.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2019 Hyundai HL960| 2019 Case 821G 2019 Caterpillar] 2019 John Deere 2019 Komatsu
Wheel Loader 950GC WA380-8
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins QSB 6.7, FPT F4AHFE613S,| Cat C7.1 ACERT, 225 John Deere Power| Komatsu SAA6D170E
(Include SAE net HP): 225 HP| 211 hp net hp Tech PSS 6090 (232| 3 (191 Net Hp)
hp)
Warranty: 3 yr./3,000 Hr| 3yr. /3000 hours| 12 months/unlimited 1 Year Unlimited 1 Year/Unlimited
hours, total machine Hours Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power| Associated Supply Holt Cat RDO Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce
Equipment| Company Industries
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4697 FM 1516 N, 1920 SE Loop 410, 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 19275 N. IH 35, New| 3740 SE Loop 410,
Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, Texas| San Antonio, Texas Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio,
78220 78222 TX 78222
Delivery: 150 Days 180 Days 135 Days 30-90 Days 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/31/19 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/31/2019 9/30/2019
Last day order can be placed without 10/30/19 8-30-2019 Unknown 10/1/2019 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No| No No No No

date:

Prepared by Purchasing 8/27/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. |Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD |4697 FM 1516 North 2102 E. Slayton Rd. |5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY |[Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
3 Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader 1
w/Attachments:
Price Each: No Bid $38,250.00 $47,800.00 $41,949.00 $46,119.00 $38,837.14 No Bid
Total: $38,250.00 $47,800.00 $41,949.00 $46,119.00 $38,837.14
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 24.97% 9.67% 20.57%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $9,550.00 $3,699.00 $7,869.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018 Case SR175 2019 Caterpillar| 2019 GEHL R165 w/ 2019 Gehl R190 2219 John Deere
226D3| 66" Dirt Bucket & 66" 316GR
Brush Grapple
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered ISM N844LTA-DI-F50,[| Cat C2.2 CRDI, 65.8 Yanmar 4TNV98C- Yanmar 4TNV98C-| Yanmar 4TNV86CHT
(Include SAE net HP): 64 hp net hp|NMS2 Tier 4, 68.4 Net NMS T4f, 68 Net (61HP)
HP

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

24 Month/2,000 hr|
Factory Warranty

Associated Supply
Company

1920 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, Texas
78220

180 Days
8-30-2019
8-30-2019

No|

12 months/2,000
hours, total machine

Holt Cat

5665 S. E. Loop 410,
San Antonio, Texas
78222

90 Days

Unknown

Unknown

No

Two (2) Years, 2,000
hrs. (whichever comes
first)

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX
78219

60-90 Days

10-31-19

9-30-19

No

12 Months

H&E Equipment
Services, Inc.
5327 Tex-Con Rd,
San Antonio, TX
78220

30 Days
12/1/2019
12/1/2019

Yes

2 Year or 2,000 hours

RDO Equipment Co.

19275 N. IH 35, New
Braunfels, TX 78132

30-90 Days
10/31/2019
10/1/2019

No

Prepared by Purchasing 8/27/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, [Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery |H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. |Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD (4697 FM 1516 North |2102 E. Slayton Rd. 5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. IH 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY |Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
4 Enclosed Tracked (Low Ground Pressure) 1
Skid Loader w/Attachments:
Price Each: No Bid| $48,250.00 No Bid $61,937.00 $65,693.00 $51,705.65 $64,499.00
Total: $48,250.00 $61,937.00 $65,693.00 $51,705.65 $64,499.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 28.37% 36.15% 25.19%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $13,687.00 $17,443.00 $16,249.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2019 Case TR310| 2019 GEHL RT255 w/ 2019 Gehl RT255 2019 John Deere 2019 Takeuchi
70" Dirt Bucket w/ 326G TL10V2
Cutting Edge, & 24"
Planetary Auger
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered FPT F5HFL463A' Deutz TD 3.6 L4 Deutz TD 3.6 L4| Yanmar 4TNV98CT Kobota V3307CR-
(Include SAE net HP): F001, 68 hp Tier 4, 70.7 Net HP 70.7 HP' (970HP)| TE4B (74.3 Net Hp)
Warranty: 24 Month/2,000 hr| Two (2) Years, 2,000 12 Months| 2 Year or 2,000 hours 2Yr/2,000 Hours
Factory Warranty| hrs (whichever comes
first)
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Associated Supply Anderson Machinery H&E Equipment| RDO Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce
Company Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1920 SE Loop 410, 9415 NE Loop 410, 5327 Tex-Con Rd,| 19275 N. IH 35, New| 3740 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX| Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio,
78220 78219 78220 TX 78222
Delivery: 180 Days 60-90 Days 30 Days 30-90 Days 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 8-30-2019 10-31-19 12/1/2019 10/31/2019 9/30/2019
Last day order can be placed without 8-30-2019 9-30-19 12/1/2019 10/1/2019 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No Yes No No
date:
Prepared by Purchasing 8/27/2019 40f5




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2019
Non Local Non Local Local Local Local Non Local Local
For: Off Road Construction Equipment Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply HoltCat Anderson Machinery [H&E Equipment RDO Equipment Co. |Waukesha-Pearce
Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, Company, Inc. Services, Inc. Industries
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100011671 LD (4697 FM 1516 North (2102 E. Slayton Rd. |5665 SE Loop 410 9415 NE Loop 410 5327 Tex-Con Rd 19275 N. |H 35 3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY |[Converse, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-648-8852
5 Wheeled Material Handler: 1
Price Each: $395,000.00 No Bid $317,411.00) No Bid No Bid No Bid $431,520.00
Total: $395,000.00 $317,411.00) $431,520.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018-2019 Liebuerr 2019 Caterpillar| 2019 Sennebogen
LU30 MH3022 821
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Liebuerr D934 Cat C7.1, 169 net hp Cummins OSB4.5-
(Include SAE net HP): C130 (140 Hp)-Meets
or exceeds all other
specifications
Warranty: 1yr/ 1,000 Hr 12 months/unlimited| 1Yr/2,000 Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power ' " Holt Cat| Waukesha-Pearce
Equipment Industries
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4697 FM 1516 N, 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 3740 SE Loop 410,
Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, Texas San Antonio,
78222 TX 78222
Delivery: 150 Days 175 Days 180 Days™*
Production Cut-off Date: 10/31/19 Unknown 9/30/2019
Last day order can be placed without 10/30/19 Unknown 9/30/2019
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No| No
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30| Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $802,887.00 $563,750.00 $842,950.00 $103,886.00 $111,812.00 $567,211.45 $1,077,153.00
Total Award: $407,887.00 $86,500.00 $317,411.00
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