
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 22, 2015

For: Type 170E Controller Cabinet Assemblies & Equipment
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local

Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. Brown Traffic Products, Inc. McCain Inc. Peek Traffic Corporation Texas Highway Products Trafficware Group, Inc.

6100005858 DS 2201 E. Division St. 109 W. 55th Street 2365 Oak Ridge Way 5401 N. Sam Houston Pkwy W. 1309 Clark 522 Gillingham

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Arlington,

TX 76011                                                 

817-831-9406

Davenport,

IA 52806                                                

Vista,

CA 92081                                                   

Houston,                                                

TX 77086                                                 

Round Rock,

TX 78681

Sugarland,                                 

TX 77478

1 Type 332 Cabinet 40     

Brand and Model: Safetran 332  Eagle 332SA McCain 332 M30154 Peek 332 Henke Enterprises 332 Trafficware P.332-CF-ALUM

Price per Item $6,344.00 $5,000.00 $5,250.00 $4,999.00 $8,750.00 $6,695.00

Extended Price $253,760.00 $200,000.00 $210,000.00 $199,960.00 $350,000.00 $267,800.00

2 Type 336 Cabinet 40

Brand and Model: Safetran 336  Eagle 336SA McCain 336 M26178 Peek 336 Henke Enterprises 336 Trafficware P.336-CF-ALUM-01

Price per Item $5,187.00 $4,500.00 $4,402.00 $4,099.00 $8,400.00 $6,342.00

Extended Price $207,480.00 $180,000.00 $176,080.00 $163,960.00 $336,000.00 $253,680.00

    

3 Load Switches 100

Brand and Model: PDC Model 200 PDC SSS-88 G01 Model 200 Peek EDI-200 PDC S55-88

Price per Item $17.00 $22.00 $16.50 $25.00 $18.00 $20.00

Extended Price $1,700.00 $2,200.00 $1,650.00 $2,500.00 $1,800.00 $2,000.00

4 EDCO Surge Protector #PC 642C-020D,

or approved equal 50

Brand and Model: EDCO PC 642C-020D EDCO PC642C-020D EDCO 642C-020D EDCO PC 642C-020D Hesco HE1750

Price per Item $35.00 $24.00 $32.00 No Bid $45.00 $102.50

Extended Price $1,750.00 $1,200.00 $1,600.00 $2,250.00 $5,125.00

5 Controller Cabinet Fan, Axial, Safetran 

0721810210, or approved equal 100

Brand and Model: Safetran 072180210

 Globe Motors A47-B15A-15T3-

000 Fan 115VAL 100CFU Henke Enterprises Trafficware P.332-1101

Price per Item $9.00 $10.00 $8.50 No Bid $16.50 $19.00

Extended Price $900.00 $1,000.00 $850.00 $1,650.00 $1,900.00

6 Flasher Unit, GDI 204, or approved equal 50

Brand and Model: PDC Model 204  PDC SSF-88 GDI 204 EDI-204 PDC SSF-88

Price per Item $17.00 $22.00 $16.50 No Bid $18.00 $20.00

Extended Price $850.00 $1,100.00 $825.00 $900.00 $1,000.00

7 DC Isolators GDI 242, or approved equal 50

Brand and Model:  PDC Model 242 PDC Model 242 GDI DIM242 EDI-242 PDC Model 242

Price per Item $26.00 $25.00 $24.50 No Bid $33.00 $30.00

Extended Price $1,300.00 $1,250.00 $1,225.00 $1,650.00 $1,500.00

8 Base for EDCO Isolator #PC BIB/WKEY, or 

approved equal 100

Brand and Model: EDCO #PC BIB/WKEY EDCO PC BIB/WKEY EDCO B1B EDCO BlB/wkey HESCO HE 1750-BASE

Price per Item $20.00 $9.00 $11.50 No Bid $12.00 $26.00

Extended Price $2,000.00 $900.00 $1,150.00 $1,200.00 $2,600.00

9 EDCO #CX05-BNCYL, or approved equal 50

Brand and Model: EDCO CX-06-MI EDCO CX06-MI

EDCO CX06-M1 replaced CX05-

BNCYL

Price per Item $64.00 $43.00 No Bid No Bid $57.00 No Bid

Exteneded Price $3,200.00 $2,150.00 $2,850.00

10 EDCO #CX06-M, or approved equal 50

Brand and Model: EDCO CX06-M EDCO CX06-M EDCO CX06-M EDCO CX06-M

Price per Item $55.00 $30.00 $42.50 No Bid $54.00 No Bid

Extended Price $2,750.00 $1,500.00 $2,125.00 $2,700.00
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TX 78681

Sugarland,                                 

TX 77478

11
P Base Adapter, to 332 Cabinet Foundation, 

AQC11186P004, or approved equal 10

Brand and Model: Safetran 083859Q332-00 Eagle AQC11186P004 McCain M60288H

Henke Enterprises 8" Adapter 

Base Trafficware 12" P to 332

Price per Item $235.00 $215.00 $208.00 No Bid $950.00 $380.00

Extended Price $2,350.00 $2,150.00 $2,080.00 $9,500.00 $3,800.00

12 AC Isolators, Model 252 or Approved equal 100

Brand and Model: PDC Model 252 PDC ACI 88-252 PDC AC1-88 PDC-AC1-88-252 PDC Model 252

Price per Item $31.00 $30.00 $26.50 No Bid $33.00 $35.00

Extended Price $3,100.00 $3,000.00 $2,650.00 $3,300.00 $3,500.00

13 Econolite 2070-4 VME 10 AMP Power Supply 

P/N 35190G1 or approved equal 30

Brand and Model: Econolite 35190G1 Siemens 2070-4 McCain 2070-4A

Intelight INT-YCT-4APS-2070-4A 

Module Trafficware 2070-4A

Price per Item $322.00 $275.00 $450.00 No Bid $397.00 $320.00

Extended Price $9,660.00 $8,250.00 $13,500.00 $11,910.00 $9,600.00

14 Class-Item 550-81, Type 2070-1C CPU 

Module Board (Fully compliant with ATC 

Standard version 5.2b, w/ 64 MB of RAM and 

64 MB of flash memory) 1,000

Brand and Model:

Econolite Exception 32MB 

Flash Memory Siemens 2070-1C McCain 2070-ATC Peek

Intelight INT-YCT-1CTX-CP4 

2070-1C CPU Module Trafficware 50232-2100 (ic)

Price per Item $480.00 $630.00 $700.00 $875.00 $535.00 $822.00

Extended Price $480,000.00 $630,000.00 $700,000.00 $875,000.00 $535,000.00 $822,000.00

15

1st year only - Pelco Products (No Exceptions) 

Proprietary City of San Antonio Lock 3,900

Brand and Model:

Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX-

BRS Pelco SM-1026-SK-BRS-SA Pelco SM-1026

Pelco SM-1026-OK-SPXXXX-

BRS Pelco SM-1026-OK

Price per Item $35.25 $35.00 $34.50 No Bid $38.17 $47.00

Extended Price $137,475.00 $136,500.00 $134,550.00 $148,863.00 $183,300.00

15a After 1st year only, Pelco Products (No 

exceptions) Proprietary City of San Antonio 

Lock 25

Brand and Model:

Pelco SM-1026-0K-SPXXXX-

BRS Pelco SM-1026-SK-BRS-SA Pelco SM-1026

Pelco SM-1026-OK-SPXXXX-

BRS Pelco SM-1026-OK

Price per Item $36.00 $50.00 $36.00 No Bid $40.40 $48.50

Extended Price $900.00 $1,250.00 $900.00 $1,010.00 $1,212.50

16 1st year only additional keys for Pelco 

Products (No Exceptions) Proprietary City of 

San Antonio Lock 100

Brand and Model:

Pelco SM-1026-0K-SPXXXX-

BRS Pelco SM-0198-2-CRM-SA Pelco SM-0198 Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX-BRS Pelco SM-0198-2

Price per Item $4.75 $20.00 $4.80 No Bid $5.25 $6.45

Extended Price $475.00 $2,000.00 $480.00 $525.00 $645.00

16a After 1st year only, Additional Keys for Pelco 

Products (No Exceptions) Proprietary City of 

San Antonio Lock 25

Brand and Model:

Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX-

BRS Pelco SM-0198-CRM-SA Pelco SM-0198 Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX-BRS Pelco SM-0198-2

Price per Item $5.00 $20.00 $5.00 No Bid $5.50 $6.80

Extended Price $125.00 $500.00 $125.00 $137.50 $170.00

Delivery 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days

Payment terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total $1,109,775.00 $1,174,950.00 $1,249,790.00 $1,241,420.00 $1,411,245.50 $1,559,832.50
Estimated Annual Award $1,109,775.00
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