
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

1 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-411 Series 10

Product Type: Vinyl Acrylic Latex, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $144.71 $71.25

Total $1,447.10 $712.50

Color: Brigade Green

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-417 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 50.7636%

Price differential $734.60

Non-Local Preference Award $712.50

2 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-411 Series 10

Product Type: Vinyl – Acrylic Resin, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $195.97 $71.25

Total $1,959.70 $712.50

Color: Purple Brooch

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-417 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 63.6424%

Price differential $124.72

Non-Local Preference Award $712.50

3 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-411 Series 10

Product Type: Latex Enamel, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $117.89 $71.25

Total $1,178.90 $712.50

Sheen: Eggshell

Color: Reed Green

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-417 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 39.5623%

Price differential $46.64

Non-Local Preference Award $712.50

4 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-411 Series 10

Product Type: Vinyl Acrylic Latex, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $168.09 $71.25

Total $1,680.90 $712.50

Sheen: Eggshell

Color: Deep Purple

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-417 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 57.6120%

Price differential $96.84

Non-Local Preference Award $712.50

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

5 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-411 Series 10

Product Type: Vinyl Acrylic Latex, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $167.25 $71.25

Total $1,672.50 $712.50

Sheen: Satin

Color: Red Maple

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-417 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 57.3991%

Price differential $96.00

Non-Local Preference Award $712.50

6 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-3511 Series 10

Product Type: Acrylic Latex, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $245.76 $77.00

Total $2,457.60 $770.00

Sheen: Satin

Color: Brick Dust

Manufacturer Pittsburgh Wondertone PPG

Model Number 6-3517 6-3511 Serious

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 68.6686%

Price differential $168.76

Non-Local Preference Award $770.00

7 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-411 Series 15

Product Type: Acrylic Latex, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $176.45 $71.25

Total $2,646.75 $1,068.75

Sheen: Semi Gloss

Color: Tower view Blue

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-417 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 59.6203%

Price differential $105.20

Non-Local Preference Award $1,068.75

8 PPG PITT-TECH 90-474 SERIES 10

Product Type: Acrylic, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $250.38 $110.00

Total $2,503.80 $1,100.00

Sheen: Satin

Color: Negative Image

Manufacturer PPG PiH-Tech PPG

Model Number 90-477 90-474 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 56.0668%

Price differential $140.38

Non-Local Preference Award $1,100.00

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

9 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-4XX SERIES 10

Product Type: Acrylic Latex, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $138.80 $71.25

Total $1,388.00 $712.50

Sheen: Eggshell

Color: Wild Peregrine

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-417 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 48.6671%

Price differential $67.55

Non-Local Preference Award $712.50

10 PPG SPEEDHIDE 20

Product Type: Acrylic Latex, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $122.71 $71.25

Total $2,454.20 $1,425.00

Sheen: Eggshell

Color: Tan Tone

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-411 6-411 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 41.9363%

Price differential $51.46

Non-Local Preference Award $1,425.00

11 PPG SPEEDHIDE 6-500 SERIES 20

Product Type: Semi Gloss, Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $122.51 $81.94

Total $2,450.20 $1,638.80

Color: Antique White

Manufacturer PPG Speedhide PPG

Model Number 6-500 6-500 Series

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 33.1157%

Price differential $40.57

Non-Local Preference Award $1,638.80

12 DEVFLEX 5

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $157.25 $110.73

Total $786.25 $553.65

Color:  White Tint Base

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0100 Devlex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 29.5835%

Price differential $46.52

Non-Local Preference Award $553.65

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

13 KILSTAIN  

Product Type: Water based Exterior Primer 

Sealer 2

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $157.89 $76.25

Total $315.78 $152.50

Color: White

Manufacturer Pittsburgh Paints PPG

Model Number DRP51801 Seal Grip 17-921

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 51.7069%

Price differential $81.64

Non-Local Preference Award $152.50

14 DEVFLEX 5

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss 

Intermediate Base

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $157.25 $110.73

Total $786.25 $553.65

Color:  White 

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0100 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 29.5835%

Price differential $46.52

Non-Local Preference Award $553.65

15 DEVFLEX 4

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $225.70 $110.73

Total $902.80 $442.92

Color:  Black

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4216-9990 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 50.9393%

Price differential $114.97

Non-Local Preference Award $442.92

16 DEVFLEX 2

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $159.98 $110.73

Total $319.96 $221.46

Color:  Off White

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0100 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 30.7851%

Price differential $49.25

Non-Local Preference Award $221.46

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

17 DEVFLEX 5

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Flat

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $117.44 $110.73

Total $587.20 $553.65

Color:  Off White

Manufacturer Pittsburgh Paints PPG

Model Number DRN3649 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 5.7136%

Price differential $6.71

Non-Local Preference Award $553.65

18 DEVFLEX 5

Product Type: Water based Acrylic (Accent 

Base) Gloss

Price Per Each 1 Gal Can $44.04 $23.15

Total $220.20 $115.75

Color:  Roadrunner Orange

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0500 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 47.4342%

Price differential $20.89

Non-Local Preference Award $115.75

19 DEVFLEX 2

Product Type: Water based Acrylic (Deep Base) 

Gloss

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $177.72 $110.73

Total $355.44 $221.46

Color:  Stadium Blue

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0400 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 37.6941%

Price differential $66.99

Non-Local Preference Award $221.46

20 DEVFLEX 4

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $165.11 $110.73

Total $660.44 $442.92

Color: White tint base – P1

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0100 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 32.9356%

Price differential $54.38

Non-Local Preference Award $442.92

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

21 DEVFLEX 4

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss 

Intermediate Base

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $167.41 $110.73

Total $669.64 $442.92

Color:  P2

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0300 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 33.8570%

Price differential $56.68

Non-Local Preference Award $442.92

22 DEVFLEX 1

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss 

Intermediate Base

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $170.58 $110.73

Total $170.58 $110.73

Color:  P4

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0300 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 35.0862%

Price differential $59.85

Non-Local Preference Award $110.73

23 DEVFLEX 2

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss White 

Tint Base

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $161.67 $110.73

Total $323.34 $221.46

Color:  629

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0100 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 31.5086%

Price differential $50.94

Non-Local Preference Award $221.46

24 DEVFLEX 1

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Satin

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $160.60 $110.73

Total $160.60 $110.73

Color:  Coyote (568)

Manufacturer Pittsburgh Paints PPG

Model Number DRN3549 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 31.0523%

Price differential $49.87

Non-Local Preference Award $110.73

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

25 DEVFLEX 4

Product Type: Water based Acrylic Gloss

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $164.89 $110.73

Total $659.56 $442.92

Color:  Coyote (568)

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex PPG

Model Number 4208-0100 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 32.8461%

Price differential $54.16

Non-Local Preference Award $442.92

26 Sherwin Williams 0038 3

Product Type: Library Gloss – P5A

Price Per Each 1 Gal Can $39.12 NO BID

Total $117.36

Color:  Pewter

Manufacturer Devoe Devflex

Model Number 4208-0100

Local award $119.36

27 Sherwin Williams 0038 3

Product Type: Library Flat – P5B

Price Per Each 1 Gal Can $36.83 NO BID

Total $110.49

Color:  Pewter

Manufacturer Pittsburgh Paints

Model Number DRN3653

Local award $110.49

28 Sherwin Williams 6544 3

Product Type: Library Flat – P6

Price Per Each 1 Gal Can $36.83 NO BID

Total $110.49

Color:  Mezmerize

Manufacturer Pittsburgh Paints

Model Number DRN3653

Local award $110.49

29 Devflex 2

Product Type: Breakthrough Floss Ultra Deep 

Base

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $286.65 $110.73

Total $573.30 $221.46

Color:  Machinery Gray

Manufacturer PPG Paint PPG

Model Number V70-620 Devflex 4216

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 

local bid: 61.3710%

Price differential $175.92

Non-Local Preference Award $221.46

30 Devoe Paint Wonder Tones 15

Product Type: Acrylic Latex Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $191.33 NO BID

Total $2,869.95

Color: Wrought Iron

Sheen: Satin

Manufacturer PPG Wondertone

Model Number DR3557

Local award $2,869.95

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

 LJ Local Non-Local

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  

Paint & Stain Specialist

712 West Laurel

San Antonio,

Tx 78212

210-223-8861

PPG Architectural Finishes

11911 Blanco Road

San Antonio,

TX 78216

210-269-0814 

31 Devoe Paint  wonder –pro 15

Product Type: Acrylic Latex Interior

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $113.38 NO BID

Total $1,700.70

Color: Brazos

Sheen: Eggshell

Manufacturer Pittsburgh Wonder Pro

Model Number DR21849

Local award $113.38

32 Devoe Wonder –pro 15

Product Type: Acrylic enamel

Price Per Each 5 Gal Can $128.16 NO BID

Total $1,922.40

Color: Soshi White

Sheen: Semi-gloss

Manufacturer Pittsburgh WonderPro

Model Number DR23649  

Local award $1,922.40

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total $36,162.38 $15,085.73

Estimated Total Award $6,831.39 $15,085.73

Opened: October 21, 2015

For:   Annual Contract for CSEF Paint Supply

6100006456


