LC
9/17/15

Item No. 11

ANORDINANCE ~ 2015-09-17-0785

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM GRANDE TRUCK CENTER, DOGGETT
FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, LLC, RUSH TRUCK CENTER,
SANTEX TRUCK CENTER, LTD AND COOPER EQUIPMENT CO. TO
PROVIDE REPLACEMENTS FOR 25 MEDIUM AND HEAVY DUTY
TRUCKS AND 18 HEAVY DUTY TRAILERS FOR A TOTAL COST OF
$3,500,932.00, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND
REPLACEMENT FUND AND SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT FUND.

* * * * *®

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with medium and heavy
duty trucks and trailers; and

WHEREAS, Grande Truck Center was the low responsive bidder for items 1 and 9-10 for a total
cost of $1,027,588.00; and

WHEREAS, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC was the low responsive bidder for items
2-5 for a total cost of $961,931.00; and

WHEREAS, Rush Truck Center was the low responsive bidder for items 6 and 8 for a total cost
of $723,551.00; and

WHEREAS, Santex Truck Center, LTD was the low responsive bidder for item 7 for a cost of
$716,912.00; and

WHEREAS, Cooper Equipment Co. was the low responsive bidder for item 11 for a cost of
$70,950.00; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low responsive bids described above, submitted by Grande Truck Center,
Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LL.C, Rush Truck Center, Santex Truck Center, LTD, and
Cooper Equipment Co. to provide the City with medium and heavy duty trucks and trailers for a
total cost of $3,500,932.00 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all
required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid
tabulation sheet is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies
of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance
Department.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance is available as part of the Fiscal Year 2015 budget per
the table below.



LC

9/17/15
Item No. 11
Amount General Ledger | Cost Center Fund
$3,364,244.00 5501055 3503200001 | 72001000
$136,688.00 5501050 5501010001 | 51001000
Total Amt $3,500,932.00

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $1,027,588.00 is authorized to
Grande Truck Center and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $961,931.00 is authorized to
Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 5. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $723,551.00 is authorized to Rush
Truck Center and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 6. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $716,912.00 is authorized to
Santex Truck Center, LTD and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 7. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $70,950.00 is authorized to
Cooper Equipment Co. and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 8. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this Ordinance.

SECTION 9. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.
PASSED AND APPROVED this 17" day of September, 2015.

Ivy R. Taylor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:
ity ) b G o
L vy . AW ew () UMV ¢
e¥cia M. Vagek, City/(jlerk Martha G. Sepeda, Acting City Attorney



Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item: 11 (in consent vote: 6,7,8,9,10, 11,12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 20, 22A, 22B, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27,
28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 35, 36, 37, 38, 40, 41, 42, 43 )
Date: 09/17/2015
Time: 10:02:11 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Grande Truck Center, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas,
LLC, Rush Truck Center, Santex Truck Center, and Cooper Equipment Co. to provide replacements
for 25 medium and heavy duty trucks and 18 heavy duty trailers for a total cost of $3,500,932.00,
funded from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund and Solid Waste Management Fund.
[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance]
Result: Passed
Voter Group PrI::etn ¢ Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X
http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LLC LTD
6100006381 LD {4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description Quantity |TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78218 TX 78219

210-666-7112

210-277-4373

210-380-6772

210-661-8371

22K-28K, 15" Platform Dump Truck

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered:
Dump Body Warranty:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Dump Body Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

$85,748.00
$85,748.00

2016 Ford F750 Crew|
Cab)

Ford 6.7 L 270 H.P. 675
ib. fi. Torque)

Ford Torque Shift HD 6
Speed with PTO
Provision|

24 Months Uniimited
Miles

Grande Truck Center]

4562 IH 10 East, San
Antonio, TX 78218

2015 P-15

Warren

San Antonio Brake &
Clutch

905 Avenue B, San
Antonio TX, 78215
150 Days

12/31/2015
12/30/2015

No

$86,344.00
$86,344.00

2016 Freightliner M2-106
Tractor

Cummins ISL 8.9L 270HP
800Ib/ft Torque

Allison 2500 RDS

2 Years Unlimited Miles

Doggett Freightliner of
South Texas, LLC
8700 tH 10 East,

2015 Warren Dumping
Platform
1 Year

San Antonio Brake &
Clutch

905 Avenue B, San
Antonio TX, 78215
120-210 Days

!
12/31/2015
11/1/2015

Yes

Converse, TX 78109].

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015

1 qryxy



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 - Local Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightiiner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LL.C LTD
6100006381 LD 4562 1H 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
tem Description Quantity |[TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78218
210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-380-6772 210-661-8371
2 Cab and Chassis, Minimum GVWR 30,000
Ibs., Heavy Duty Service Bodies, with 6,000
Ib. Crane 4

Price Each:
Total

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Service Body Offered:

Service Body Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Service Body Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off

date:

$110,979.00
$443,916.00,

2016 Ford F750 Reg Cab

Ford Torque Shift HD 6
Speed

Ford Torque Shift HD 6
Speed|

24 Months Unlimited|
Miles|
Grande Truck Center

4562 IH 10 East, San|
Antonio, TX 78219

2015 6132 DLHR-60J
Crane Bodyj

12 Months
UTEC - West
5860 Pfeil Rd.
150 days|

12/31/12015
12/30/2015

No|

$108,643.00]
$434,672.00]

2016 Freightliner M2 106

Cummins I1SB - 250
HP/860 Tq.

Aliison 2500 RDS]

2 Years Unlimited MilesJ

Doggett Freightliner o
South Texas, LLC
8700 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109

2015 Knapheide - 6132
DLHR - 60 J Crane Body|

1 Year

San Antonio Brake &
Clutch|

905 Avenue B, San
Antonio TX, 78215
120-210 Days

12/31/2015
11/1/2015

Yes|

$113,426.00
$453,704.00

2016, Hino 338

Hino JOBE-VB, 260 HP

Allison 2500 RDS

5 years or 250K miles
Rush Truck Center

8810 [H - 10 East,
San Antonio, TX 78219

2016 Warner Bodies
Warner Select two Model
W82132-M-DW-HD-48H-

22D-6K Crane Body

5Yr.

Cobalt Truck Equipment
11218 1H - 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109
120 Days

Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightiiner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LLC LTD
6100006381 LD 4562 14 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description Quantity | TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78218
210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-380-6772 210-661-8371
3 60K GVWR 5th Wheel Tractor 1
Price Each: No Bid $125,572.00) No Bid No Bid
Total: $125,572.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2016-2017 Freightliner]
114SD Haul Tractor
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Detroit DD13 505 HP -
(Include SAE Net HP): 1850 ft. Ib.
Transmission Offered: Eaton Fuller RTLO|
18918B - 18 Speed
Warranty: 1 Year Unlimited Milesfl
Warranty Service Provider Name: Doggett Freightliner of
South Texas, LLC
Warranty Facility Address: 8700 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109
Delivery 120-240 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: 02-31-2016
Last day order can be placed without missing 12-1-15
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes|
date:
4 66K GVWR Concrete Truck 1
Price Each: $158,025.00 $149,964.00, No Bid No Bid
Total: $158,025.00 $149,964.00
Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2016 Mack GU 713 Regli 2016 Freightliner 114SD,
Offered: Cab
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Mack MP& 345 H.P. 1360 Detroit DD13 350 HP -
(include SAE Net HP): Ib. ft. Torque 1350 Tq,|

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Allison 4500 RDS 6 speed
with PTO Provisions!

Allison 4500 RDS|

24 Months or 100,00

Miles

Not Provided
|

Prepared by Purchasing 8/1

82015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Local Local Local

For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LLC LTD

6100006381 LD 4562 1H 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
tem Description Quantity |TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-380-6772 210-661-8371
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center, Doggett Freightliner of|
Name: South Texas, LL.C
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address: 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East,
Antonio, TX 78219 Converse, TX 78109
Year, Make & Model of Concrete Drum Mixer 2015 Beck Industrial 10.512015 Beck Industrial 10.5
Offered: Yd. 3 Yd. Mixer
Concrete Drum Mixer Warranty: Not Provided 1 Year Unlimited Miles
Concrete Drum Mixer Warranty Service Beck Industrial Beck Industrial
Provider Name:
Concrete Drum Mixer Warranty Facility 2003 FM 1518, 2003 FM 1516,
Address: Converse, TX 78109 Converse, TX 78109
Delivery 150- 180 Days| 90-150 Days|
10/31/2015
Production Cut-off Date: 10/30/2015 12/31/2015
Last day order can be placed without missing No 11/1/2015
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes
date:
5 35K GVWR Water Distribution Trucks 3 )

Price Each: $89,858,00 $83,941.00] $119,228.00 No Bid
Total: $269,574.00 $251,823.00 $357,684.00

Year, Make & Modei of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider

Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

2016 Ford F750 Reg Cab|

Ford 6.7 L. 275 H.P. 675
Ib. ft. Torque|

Ford Torque Shift HD 6|
Speed with PTO
Provision

24 Months Unlimited
Miles]

Grande Truck Center]

4562 |H 10 East, San

2016 Freightiiner M2 106

Cummins ISB - 250
HP/660 Tq.
Allison 2500 RDS|

2 Years Unlimited Miles;l
Doggett Freightliner ¢

South Texas, LLC
8700 IH 10 East,

2016 Hino 338
Hino JOBE-VB, 260 HP

Allison 2500 RDS w/Syn
Fluids

5 years or 250K miles
Rush Truck Center

8810 {H - 10 East,

Antonio, TX 78219

Converse, TX 78109

San Antonio, TX 78219

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LLC LTD
6100006381 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
item Description Quantity |TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-380-6772 210-661-8371
Year, Make & Model of Water Distributor 2015 Ledwell 2000 Galion]] 2015 Ledwell - 2000 WT| 2016 Niece WT 2000
Body Offered: Tank|
Water Distributor Body Warranty; 12 monthsjf 1 Year - Unlimited Miles 1Y
Water Distributor Body Warranty Service Relaince Truck San Antonio Brake & Niece
Provider Name: Equipmen] Clutch]
Water Distributor Body Warranty Facility 7200 S. W. W. White| 905 Avenue B, San| 3030 Hwy 71 East,
Address: Road, San Antonio, TX Antonio TX, 78215 Del Valley, TX 78617
78219
120 Days
Delivery 150 Days 120-210 Days| )
Not Provided
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2015 12/31/2015 Not Provided
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/30/2015, 11/1/2015 Not Provided
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No| Yes|
date:
6 35K GVWR 7 Cubic Yard Hydraulic Dump
Trucks 5
Price Each: $80,144.00 $75,421.00 $75,145.00 $76,688.00
Total: $400,720.00 $377,105.00 $375,725.00 $383,440.00

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider

Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered:

2016 Ford F750 R/C

Ford 6.7 L 270 H.P. 675
Ib. ft. Torque:

Ford Torque Shift HD 6
Speed with PTO
Provision

24 Months Unlimited Miles

Grande Truck Center|

4562 IH 10 East, San
Antonio, TX 78218

2015 Warren 6/8 Yard

2016 Freightliner M2 106

Cummins 1SB - 250 HP -
660 Tq.
Allison 2500 RDS|

2 Years - Unlimited Milesj
Doggett Freightiiner of
South Texas, .1.C]

8700 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109

2015 Warren U-10

2016 Hino 338
Hino JO8E-VB, 260 HP,

Allison 2500 RDS w/Syn|
Fluids (PTO)

5 years or 250K miles|
Rush Truck Center,

8810 IH - 10 East,
San Antonio, TX 78219

2016 Herrera Fabricating

2016 International 4300
Cummins ISB

Allison 2500 RDS

See Attached/1 year,

Santex Truck Center,
LTD

1380 Ackerman Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78219

2015 Warren U-10 6/8

Inc)

Yard

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LLC LTD
6100006381 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 H 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity |TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-380-6772 210-661-8371
Dump Body Warranty: . 12 Months| 1 Year - Uniimited Miles| Not Provided 1 Year
Dump Body Warranty Service Provider San Antonio Brake & San Antonio Brake & Not Provided|] Warren Truck & Trailer
Name: Clutch Clutch)
Dump Body Warranty Facility Address: 905 Avenue B, San 905 Avenue B, San| Not Provided Santex Truck Center,
Antonio TX, 78215 Antonio TX, 78215] LTD, 1380 Ackerman Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78219
120 Days| 180 Days
Delivery 150 Days 120-210 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2015 12/31/2015, Not Provided None
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/30/2015 11/1/2015) Not Provided 3-1-2016
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No Yes| Not Provided Not Provided
date:
7 50K GVWR Minimum 10 Cu Yard Hi-Rise
Dump Trucks 7
Price Each: $109,690.00 $102,664.00 No Bid $102,416.00
Total: $767,830.00 $718,648.00 $716,912.00

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Name:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered:
Dump Body Warranty:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Name:

2016 Western Star 4700

Detroit DD13 12.8L, 380
HP - 1450 Lb. Ft. Torque,

Eaton Fuller FRO14210C

12 Month or 100,000
Miles:
Grande Truck Center|

4562 1H 10 East, San
Antonio, TX 78219

2015 Warren 11/14 Yd.
Dump!
12 Months

San Antonio Brake &
Clutch

2016 Freightliner 1148D

Detroit DD13 380 HP -
1450 Ft. Lb. Tq.

Eaton Fuller FRO14210C
1 Year - Unlimited Miles
Doggett Freightliner of]
South Texas, LLC

8700 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109
Warren F-14 Dump Body
1 Year Unlimited Miles

San Antonio Brake &
Clutch

20186 International 7600

International N13, 390HP]
SCR|

Fuller FRO142108)
See Attached/1 Year,

Santex Truck Center,
LTD, 1380 Ackerman Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78219

1380 Ackerman Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78219

2015 Warren U-14 11/14]
Yardage)
One Year Parts & Service|

Santex Truck Center,
LTD, Warren Truck &
Trailer, 1380 Ackerman]
Rd., San Antonio, TX|

78219
Dump Body Warranty Facility Address: 905 Avenue B, San 905 Avenue B, San Santex Truck Center,
Antonio TX, 78215 Antonio TX, 78215 LTD]

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LLC LTD
6100006381 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 8810 I1H - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description Quantity |[TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-380-6772 210-661-8371
Delivery 150 Days, 90-180 Days 180 days|
Nonej
Production Cut-off Date: 10/31/2015 12/31/2015 3/1/2018]
Last day order can be placed without missing 10/30/2015 11/1/2015 Not Provided
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No Yes
date:
8 9 cubic yard Sanitation Truck 3
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $115,942.00) No Bid
Total: $347,826.00

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of 9 Cu Yd Dump Body
Offered:

9 Cu Yd Dump Body Warranty

9 Cu Yd Dump Body Warranty Service
Provider Name:

9 Cu Yd Dump Body Warranty Facility
Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off

date:

2016 Hino 185
Hino JOSE-TP, 210 HP|

Alisin A465 - 6 Speed
Automati

5 years or 175K miles an%

60k miles Maintenance]

Rush Truck Center

8810 IH - 10 East,
San Antonio, TX 78219

2016 Heil , 9 Yard Heil
Mini Rear Loader PT]|
Class|

1 Year|

Heil Of Texas|

503 Pop Gun,
San Antonio, TX 78218

120 Days|

Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers South Texas, LLC LTD
6100006381 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description Quantity | TX 78219 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-380-6772 210-661-8371
9 End Dump 15K Trailer "
Price Each: $49,240.00 $49,800.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $541,640.00, $547,800.00
Year, Make & Model Trailer Offered: 2015 WRDT -~ SS Dumpl 2015 Warren WRDT - SS
Trailer]j - Fuli Frame Dump Trailer|
Trailer Warranty Service Provider Name: San Antonio Brake & Utility Trailer Sales
Clutch|
Trailer Warranty Facility Address: 905 Avenue B, San 3535 FM 1516 N.,
Antonio TX, 78215 Converse, TX 78109
Delivery 120-150 Days; 150-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/31/2015 12-31-15
Last day order can be placed without missing 10/30/2015 11-1-2015
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No| 12-31-15
date:
10 Semi-Trailer, Pusher Rear Ejection, Brush
Trailer 6
Price Each: $66,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $400,200.00

Year, Make & Model Trailer Offered:

Trailer Warranty:

Trailer Warranty Service Provider Name:

Trailer Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

2015 WHDT 3939-2
Horizontal Ejection Trailer|
12 months|

Relaince Truck]
Equipment

7200 S. W. W. White|
Road, San Antonio, TX
78219

120-150 Days|

12/31/2015

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100006381

August 10, 2015
Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks
and Trailers

LD

Local

Local

Local

Local

ftem

Description

Quantity

Grande Truck Center
4562 IH 10 East
San Antonio,

TX 78219
210-666-7112

Doggett Freightliner of
South Texas, LL.C
8700 IH 10 East

Converse,
TX 78109
210-277-4373

Rush Truck Center
8810 IH - 10 East
San Antonio,

TX7821¢
210-380-6772

Santex Truck Center,
LTD
1380 Ackerman Rd.

San Antonio,
TX 78219
210-661-8371

kK

12

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Tri Axle Low Boy Trailer

Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Trailer Offered:
Trailer Warranty:

Trailer Warranty Service Provider Name:
Trailer Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Deleted:

Deleted

Payment Terms:

Total:

12/30/2019%)

No;

No Bid

Net 30

$3,067,653.00

No Bid

Net 30

$2,691,828.00

No Bid

Net 30

$1,534,939.00

No Bid

Net 30

$1,100,352.00

Total Award

$1,027,588.00

$961,931.00

$723,551.00

$716,812.00

Items 12 and 13 were deleted and will be re-bid at a later date.

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-Local Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Ellison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LTD
6100006381 LD {17474 Judson Rd. 9010 {H 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description Quantity {TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-657-5151
1 22K-28K, 15 Platform Dump Truck
1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered:
Dump Body Warranty:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Dump Body Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-Local Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Ellison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LTD
6100006381 LD 17474 Judson Rd. 9010 1H 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description Quantity [TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-657-5151
2 Cab and Chassis, Minimum GVWR 30,000
Ibs., Heavy Duty Service Bodies, with 6,000
Ib. Crane 4
Price Each: No Bid $133,444.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $533,776.00
Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2016 Kenworth T370
Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Paccar PX-7 250 HP
(Include SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered: Allison 2500 RDS
Cab and Chassis Warranty: 1/100 (1yr/100k miles)
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider French Ellison Truck|
Name: Center (Kenworth)
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address: 9010 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109
Year, Make & Model Service Body Offered: 2016 Wabash Auto Crane|

Service Body Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Service Body Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off

date:

1Yr.

Wabash National

1605 Ackerman Rd., San
Antonio TX, 78219
120-210 Days,

9/16/15
9/15/15

9/15/15

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-l.ocal Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Eliison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LTD
5100006381 LD 17474 Judson Rd. 8010 IH 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description Quantity |TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-657-5151
3 60K GVWR 5th Wheel Tractor 1
Price Each: No Bid $133,453.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $133,453.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2016 Kenworth T800
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Paccar MX 500HP
(Include SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered: Fuller RTLO 18918B (18
Speed)
Warranty: 1/100 Chassis - 2/250
Warranty Service Provider Name: French Eflison Truck
Center (Kenworth)
Warranty Facility Address: 9010 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109
Delivery 70 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/15/15
Last day order can be placed without missing 10/15/15
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
4 66K GVWR Concrete Truck 1
Price Each: No Bid $156,560.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $156,560.00

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

2016 Kenworth T800
Cummins ISX 12

Allison 4500 RDS

1100
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-Local Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Elfison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LTD
6100006381 LD 17474 Judson Rd. 8010 {H 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description Quantity {TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-657-5151
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider French Ellison Truck
Name: Center (Kenworth)
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address: 9010 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109
Year, Make & Model of Concrete Drum Mixer 2015 Beck Standard
Offered: Vortex
Concrete Drum Mixer Warranty: 1Yr.
Concrete Drum Mixer Warranty Service Beck industrial
Provider Name:
Concrete Drum Mixer Warranty Facility 2003 FM 1516,
Address: Converse, TX 78109
Delivery 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/1/15
Last day order can be placed without missing 10/1/15
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
5 35K GVWR Water Distribution Trucks 3
Price Each: No Bid $93,135.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $279,405.00

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider

Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

2016 Kenworth T370
Paccar PX-7 250 HP

Allison 3000 RDS

1/100

French Ellison Truck
Center (Kenworth)
9010 [H 10 East,

Converse, TX 78109

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-Local Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Ellison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LTD
6100006381 LD 17474 Judson Rd. 2010 I1H 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity |TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78218
210-657-5151
Year, Make & Model of Water Distributor 2015 Ledwell
Body Offered:
Water Distributor Body Warranty; 1Y
Water Distributor Body Warranty Service Ledwell
Provider Name:
Water Distributor Body Warranty Facility 3300 Waco St.,
Address: Texarkana, TX 75501
Delivery 100 days
Production Cut-off Date: 9/15/15
Last day order can be placed without missing 9/15/15
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
6 35K GVWR 7 Cubic Yard Hydraulic Dump
Trucks 5
Price Each: No Bid $83,050.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $415,250.00

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider

Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered:

2016 Kenworth T370
Paccar PX-7 250 HP

Alfison 2600 RDS

1/100

French Ellison Truck
Center (Kenworth)
8010 IH 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109

2015 WAR-10 Warren

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-Local Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Ellison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LTD
6100006381 LD [17474 Judson Rd. 9010 [H 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description Quantity {TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78218 TX 78219
210-657-5151
Dump Body Warranty: 1Yr.
Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Dump Body Warranty Facility Address: 15768 US Hwy 271 North,
Talco, TX 75487
Delivery 100 days
Production Cut-off Date: 9/15/15
Last day order can be piaced without missing 9/15/15
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
7 50K GVWR Minimum 10 Cu Yard Hi-Rise
Dump Trucks 7
Price Each: No Bid $112,454.00 No Bid $104,216.00
Total: $787,178.00 $729,512.00

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Name:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered:
Dump Body Warranty:

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider
Name:

2016 Kenworth T800

Paccar MX 380HP

Fuller FR15210B (10
Speed)

1/100

French Ellison Truck
Center (Kenworth)
9010 [H 10 East,
Converse, TX 78109
2015 Warren War-14
1Yr.

Warren Truck & Trailer

2016 International 7600
With Air Lift Tailgate
International N13, 390HP
SCR

Fuller FRO14210B
See Attached/1 Year

Santex Truck Center,
LTD, 1380 Ackerman Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78219

1380 Ackerman Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78219

2015 Warren U-14 11/14
Yardage
One Year Parts & Service

Santex Truck Center,
LTD, Warren Truck &
Trailer, 1380 Ackerman
Rd., San Antonio, TX

78219
Dump Body Warranty Facility Address: 15768 US Hwy 271 North, Santex Truck Center,
Talco, TX 75487 LTD

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-Local Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Ellison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LD
6100006381 LD {17474 Judson Rd. 8010 IH 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
item Description Quantity {TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-657-5151
Delivery 100 days 180 days
None
Production Cut-off Date: 9/15/15 3/1/2016
Last day order can be placed without missing 9/15/15 Not Provided
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
8 9 cubic yard Sanitation Truck 3
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis
Cffered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Cab and Chassis Warranty:

Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider
Name:
Cab and Chassis Warranty Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model of 9 Cu Yd Dump Body
Offered:

9 Cu Yd Dump Body Warranty

9 Cu Yd Dump Body Warranty Service
Provider Name:

9 Cu Yd Dump Body Warranty Facility
Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off

date;

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100006381

August 10, 2015
Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks
and Trailers

LD

Local

Non-Local

Local

Local
Alternate Bid

ftem

Description

Quantity

Cooper Equipment Co
17474 Judson Rd.
San Antonio,

TX 78247
210-657-5151

French Ellison Truck
Center
9010 {H 10 East

Converse,
TX 78109

Heil Of Texas
503 Pop Gun

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Santex Truck Center,
LTD
1380 Ackerman Rd.

San Antonio,
TX 78219

End Dump 15K Trailer
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Trailer Offered:

Trailer Warranty Service Provider Name:

Trailer Warranty Facility Address;

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Semi-Trailer, Pusher Rear Ejection, Brush
Trailer

Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Trailer Offered:

Trailer Warranty:

Trailer Warranty Service Provider Name:

Trailer Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

11

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$93,457.00
$560,742.00

2015 Warren WHDT 3939
2

One Year Warraty -
Standard Structure -
Hydraulic warranty - 5
Years

Heil Of Texas - San
Antonio

503 Pop Gun, San
Antonio, TX 78219

180-210 Days

No Production Cut-Off]

No Bid

No Bid

Days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local
Opened: August 10, 2015 Local Non-Local Local Alternate Bid
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Cooper Equipment Co French Ellison Truck Heil Of Texas Santex Truck Center,
and Trailers Center LTD
6100006381 LD  [17474 Judson Rd. 9010 |H 10 East 503 Pop Gun 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description Quantity {TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78219 TX 78219
210-657-5151
Last day order can be placed without missing Pricing will remain
cut-off date: effective for 120 days
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Not Provided
date:
11 Tri Axle Low Boy Trailer 1
Price Each: $70,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $70,950.00
Year, Make & Model Trailer Offered: 2015 Etnyre Blackhawk]
Paver Speciall
Trailer Warranty: 1Yr
Trailer Warranty Service Provider Name: Cooper Equipment
Trailer Warranty Facility Address: 17474 Judson Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78247
Delivery 180
Production Cut-off Date: Dec 01, 2015
Last day order can be placed without missing Oct 01, 2015
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Not Provided
date:
12 Deleted:
13 Deleted
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $70,950.00 $2,305,622.00 $560,742.00 $729,512.00
Total Award $70,950.00

ftems 12 and 13 were deleted and will be re-bid at a later date.
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