

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 30, 2015						
For: Landscaping Equipment						
6100006833		DS				
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Qty	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
			H & V Equipment Services, Inc. 3307 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-5885	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900 W. IH-10 Sequin, TX 78155 830-303-2100	Ag-Pro 3030 N. Austin Sequin, TX 78155 830-379-5477	Holt Texas Ltd. dba Holt Cat 3302 S. WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220
1	Ground Mower Attachments Price Each: Total Price: Year, Make & Model Offered: Equipment Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Production Cut-Off-Date: Last day can place orders without missing production cut-off date: Delivery:	8	\$4,541.72 \$36,333.76 New, 2016, Modern AG Products LTD. 7' Predator WH Front Chain 5 year limited warranty on gear box/10 year limited on Deck Rust thru Modern AG Products LTD & H&V H & V Equipment Services, Inc. 3307 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78222 3/1/2016 3/1/2016 60 days or less	No Bid	\$4,550.00 \$36,400.00 2016 Modern 7' Super Predator 1 year/5 year on Gearbox/10 year rust through deck Ag-Pro 3030 N. Austin Sequin, TX 78155 12/24/16 180 days	No Bid
2	84" Mower Deck Price Each: Total Price: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Equipment Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Production Cut-Off-Date: Last day can place orders without missing production cut-off date: Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price after production cut off date? Delivery:	1	\$4,798.72 \$4,798.72 33.7% \$1,209.72 New, 2016, Modern AG products LTD, 7' Predator W/H Front & Rear Chain 5 year limited warranty on gear box/ 10 year limited on deck rust thru Modern AG Products LTD, & H&V Equipment, Inc. H & V Equipment Services Inc. 3307 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 3/1/2016 3/1/2016 No 60 days or less	\$3,589.00 \$3,589.00 2015 Landpride RCR 1884 24 Months or 2,000 hrs Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900 W. I-10 Sequin, TX 78155 None Planned 12/31/2015 60 days	No Bid	No Bid
3	Deleted			NAS		
4	4X4 Utility Tractors Price Each: Total Price: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Engine Offered: Equipment Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Production Cut-Off-Date: Last day can place orders without missing production cut-off date: Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price after production cut off date? Delivery:	7	No Bid	\$51,351.00 \$359,457.00 2015/2016 Kubota Model M5-111 HDC12 Kubota Diesel V 3800 2 Yr/ 2,000 Hours whichever occurs first Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900 1-10 W. Sequin, TX 78155 None Planned 12/31/2015 Yes 60 days	\$75,417.67 \$527,923.69 2016 John Deere 6110M 4.5L John Deere Power Tech PSS 2 years or 2000 Hours Ag-Pro - Sequin 3030 N. Austin, Sequin, TX 78155 Ag-Pro - Sequin 3030 N. Austin, Sequin, TX 78155 12/24/2016 12/24/2016 Yes 180 days	\$78,500.00 \$549,500.00 4.09% \$21,576.31 2016 Challenger MT455D AGCO Power 49AWI 4.9L 2 year; 2000 hour Total Machine AGCO Corp via Holt Cat 3302 S. WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78222 12/31/2015 12/31/2015 No 140 days

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 30, 2015							
For: Landscaping Equipment							
6100006833		DS		Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Qty	H & V Equipment Services, Inc. 3307 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-5885	Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900 W. IH-10 Sequin, TX 78155 830-303-2100	Ag-Pro 3030 N. Austin Sequin, TX 78155 830-379-5477	Holt Texas Ltd. dba Holt Cat 3302 S. WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220	
5	15' Batwing Mower Deck Price Each: Total Price: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Equipment Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Production Cut-Off-Date: Last day can place orders without missing production cut-off date: Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price after production cut off date? Delivery:	5	NAS \$15,728.27 \$78,641.35 2016, Modern AG Products LTD., 15' Raptor 5 years limited warranty on gear boxes, 10 year limited on Deck Rust Thru Modern AG Products LTD & H & V Equipment Services Inc. (as servicing dealer) H & V Equipment services, Inc. 3307, S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 3/1/2016 3/1/2016 No 60 days or less	NAS \$11,967.00 \$59,835.00 2015/2016 Landpride RC 4015 1 yr Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900 I-10 W. Sequin, Texas 78155 None Planned 12/31/2015 Yes 60 days	\$15,382.07 \$76,910.35 2015 John Deere HX15 1 year/5 year on Gear Box Ag-Pro - Sequin 3030 N. Austin Sequin, TX 78155 12/24/2016 12/24/2016 Yes 180 days	\$18,500.00 \$92,500.00 20.27% \$15,589.65 2015, Woods MFG BW180XHD 1 year limited comprehensive warranty + 6 year limited gear box warranty + 10 year deck rust through warranty (Shredder) Woods Mfg. via Holt Cat 3302 S. WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78222 January 1st, 2016 December 31st, 2015 No 60 days	
6	Mulcher Attachment for Skid Steer Price Each: Total Price: Year, Make & Model Offered: Equipment Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Production Cut-Off-Date: Last day can place orders without missing production cut-off date: Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price after production cut off date? Delivery:	1	No Bid	\$27,751.00 \$27,751.00 2015 Bradco MM60S 1 year Ewald Kubota Tractor 1900 I-10 W. Sequin, TX 78155 None Planned 12/31/2015 Yes 60 days	No Bid	No Bid	
7	Deleted. Payment Terms:		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	
<b>Total:</b>			\$119,773.83	\$450,632.00	\$641,234.04	\$642,000.00	
<b>Total Award:</b>			\$41,132.48	\$27,751.00	\$604,834.04		

Items 3 and 7 are deleted and will be rebid at a later date.