

**City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: May 26, 2017				Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for X Series 12 Lead Defibrillator Accessories				MedWheels Inc.	Mercy Medical Equipment Company	Moore Medical LLC.	Life-Assist Inc.
6100008971		SC		1322 E. Houston San Antonio, TX 78205 210-533-9455	1303 S Comal San Antonio, TX 78207	1690 New Britain Ave. Farmington, CT 06032	11277 Sunrise Park Drive Rancho Cordova, CA 95742
Item	Description	Est. Annual Quantity					
1a.	Patient Cable 4' (red)(LNCS-4)	50 ea				NAS	NAS
	Unit Price		\$189.45	\$243.38	\$136.00	\$142.50	
	Extended Price		\$9,472.50	\$12,169.00	\$6,800.00	\$7,125.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2055	8000-0330	20798	2055	
	Package size		1 box		EA	1	
	Subtotal						
1b.	Patient Cable 10' (red)(LNCS-10)	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$220.45	\$284.63	\$155.00	\$170.00	
	Extended Price		\$11,022.50	\$14,231.50	\$7,750.00	\$8,500.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2056	8000-0331	21540	2056	
	Package size		1 box		EA	1	
	Subtotal						
1c.	Ear Sensor (LNCS E1)	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$273.05	\$350.63	\$205.00	\$20.50	
	Extended Price		\$13,652.50	\$17,531.50	\$10,250.00	\$1,025.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2918	8000-000456	21675	2918	
	Package size		10/box	10/box	10/box	10/box	
	Subtotal						
1d.	Ear Sensor (M-LNCS E1)	50 ea			No Bid		
	Unit Price		\$273.05	\$350.63		\$20.50	
	Extended Price		\$13,652.50	\$17,531.50		\$1,025.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2919	8000-000457		2919	
	Package size		10/box	10/box		10/box	
	Subtotal						
1e.	Patient Cable-4' Rainbow (RC-4)	200 ea					
	Unit Price		\$173.81	\$202.12	\$125.00	\$82.50	
	Extended Price		\$34,762.00	\$40,424.00	\$25,000.00	\$16,500.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2406	8000-0341	21511	2406	
	Package size		1 box	1	EA	1	
	Subtotal						
1f.	Patient Cable-12' Rainbow (RC-12)	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$210.40	\$243.38	\$167.00	\$158.40	
	Extended Price		\$10,520.00	\$12,169.00	\$8,350.00	\$7,920.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2404	8000-0342	21510	2404	
	Package size		1 box		EA	1	
	Subtotal						
1g.	Patient Sensor Adult Rainbow	200 ea					
	Unit Price		\$605.00	\$697.00	\$475.00	\$524.95	
	Extended Price		\$121,000.00	\$139,400.00	\$95,000.00	\$104,990.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2696	8000-000371	14142	2696	
	Package size		1 box		EA	1	
	Subtotal						
1h.	Patient Sensor Pediatric Rainbow	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$605.00	\$697.00	\$475.00	\$524.95	
	Extended Price		\$30,250.00	\$34,850.00	\$23,750.00	\$26,247.50	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		2697	8000-000372	14143	2697	
	Package size		1 box		EA	1	
	Subtotal						
1i.	Sensor M-LNCS DCI Resuable	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$189.45	\$243.38	\$119.00	\$152.95	
	Extended Price		\$9,472.50	\$12,169.00	\$5,950.00	\$7,647.50	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		1863	800-0796-01	20767	1863	
	Package size		1 box		EA	1	
	Subtotal						

**City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: May 26, 2017				Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for X Series 12 Lead Defibrillator Accessories				MedWheels Inc.	Mercy Medical Equipment Company	Moore Medical LLC.	Life-Assist Inc.
6100008971		SC		1322 E. Houston San Antonio, TX 78205 210-533-9455	1303 S Comal San Antonio, TX 78207	1690 New Britain Ave. Farmington, CT 06032	11277 Sunrise Park Drive Rancho Cordova, CA 95742
Item	Description	Est. Annual Quantity					
1j.	Dual Lumen NIBP 10' Hose NIBP 10' Hose	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$50.21	\$103.13	No Bid	\$36.20	
	Extended Price		\$2,510.50	\$5,156.50		\$1,810.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Masimo	
	Part No.		008-0238-00	8000-0796-01		008-0238-00	
	Package size		1 box			1	
	Subtotal						
1k.	Infant/Neonate-8' Single Lumen NIBP Hose	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$50.21	\$53.00	No Bid	\$42.00	
	Extended Price		\$2,510.50	\$2,650.00		\$2,100.00	
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll		Welch Allyn	
	Part No.		008-0265-01	8000-0796-01		008-0265-01	
	Package size		1 box			1 box	
	Subtotal						
1l.	Temperature Skin Probe-Adult	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$90.75	\$103.13	No Bid	no bid	
	Extended Price		\$4,537.50	\$5,156.50			
	Manufacturer		Masimo	Zoll			
	Part No.		8000-0670	8000-0670			
	Package size		1 box				
	Subtotal						
2a.	Temperature Adult Rectal Probe	50 ea					
	Unit Price		\$90.75	\$103.13	No Bid	no bid	
	Extended Price		\$4,537.50	\$5,156.50			
	Manufacturer		Zoll	Zoll			
	Part No.		8000-0668	8000-0668			
	Package size		1 box				
	Subtotal						
2b.	12-Lead Simulator (CS1201)	25 ea					
	Unit Price		\$957.20	\$875.00	No Bid	no bid	
	Extended Price		\$23,930.00	\$21,875.00			
	Manufacturer		Zoll	Zoll			
	Part No.		8012-0206	8012-0206			
	Package size		1 box				
	Subtotal						
2c.	Neonatal BP Cuff Kit (Size 1-5)	100 ea					
	Unit Price		\$28.45	\$246.40	No Bid	\$4.04	
	Extended Price		\$2,845.00	\$24,640.00		\$404.00	
	Manufacturer		Welch Allyn	Zoll		Welch Allyn	
	Part No.		5082-241-9	830-0797-01		5082-241-9	
	Package size		5 in bag			5/box	
	Subtotal						
2d.	Disposal BP Cuff-Soft Infant (2 tube)	100 boxes					
	Unit Price		\$96.00	\$144.38	No Bid	\$5.00	
	Extended Price		\$9,600.00	\$14,438.00		\$500.00	
	Manufacturer		Welch Allyn	Zoll		Welch Allyn	
	Part No.		SOFT-07-2MQ	SOFT-07-2MQ		SOFT-07-2MQ	
	Package size		20/box	20/box		20/box	
	Subtotal						
2e.	Blood Pressure Cuff Child (2 tube)	600 cases					
	Unit Price		\$96.00	\$144.38	No Bid	\$5.00	
	Extended Price		\$57,600.00	\$86,628.00		\$3,000.00	
	Manufacturer		Welch Allyn	Zoll		Welch Allyn	
	Part No.		SOFT-09-2MQ	SOFT-09-2MQ		SOFT-09-2MQ	
	Package size		20/box	20/box		20/box	
	Subtotal						
2f.	Blood Pressure Cuff Adult	800 cases					
	Unit Price		\$130.00	\$160.87	No Bid	\$6.75	
	Extended Price		\$104,000.00	\$128,696.00		\$3,375.00	
	Manufacturer		Welch Allyn	Zoll		Welch Allyn	
	Part No.		SOFT-11-2MQ	SOFT-11-2MQ		SOFT-11-2MQ	
	Package size		20/box	20/box		20/box	
	Subtotal			40 ea total			

**City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: May 26, 2017				Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for X Series 12 Lead Defibrillator Accessories				MedWheels Inc.	Mercy Medical Equipment Company	Moore Medical LLC.	Life-Assist Inc.
6100008971		SC		1322 E. Houston San Antonio, TX 78205 210-533-9455	1303 S Comal San Antonio, TX 78207	1690 New Britain Ave. Farmington, CT 06032	11277 Sunrise Park Drive Rancho Cordova, CA 95742
Item	Description	Est. Annual Quantity					
2g.	Blood Pressure Cuff Large Adult	100 cases					
	Unit Price		\$130.00	\$185.63	No Bid	\$6.75	
	Extended Price		\$13,000.00	\$18,563.00		\$675.00	
	Manufacturer		Welch Allyn	Zoll		Welch Allyn	
	Part No.		SOFT-12-2MQ	SOFT-12-2MQ		SOFT-12-2MQ	
	Package size		20/box	20/box		20/box	
	Subtotal			25 total boxes			
2h.	Filterline Set, Adult/Pediatric	1,800 cases					
	Unit Price		\$199.99	\$218.63	\$240.00	\$8.88	
	Extended Price		\$359,982.00	\$393,534.00	\$432,000.00	\$15,984.00	
	Manufacturer		Oridion	Zoll		Oridion	
	Part No.		10579	8300-0520-01	13219	10579	
	Package size		25/case	20/box	25/box	1	
	Subtotal			90 total boxes			
2i.	Smart CapnoLine Plus O2 Adult	150 cases					
	Unit Price		\$260.65	\$226.88	\$309.00	\$9.70	
	Extended Price		\$39,097.50	\$34,032.00	\$46,350.00	\$1,455.00	
	Manufacturer		Oridion	Zoll		Oridion	
	Part No.		10210	830-0524-01	13218	10210	
	Package size		25/case	25/case	25/box	1	
	Subtotal			6 total CS			
2j.	Blood Pressure Cuff Thigh	50 cases					
	Unit Price		\$173.00	\$292.00	\$8.35	\$8.01	
	Extended Price		\$8,650.00	\$14,600.00	\$417.50	\$400.50	
	Manufacturer			Zoll		Welch Allyn	
	Part No.		SOFT-13-2MQ	SOFT-13-2MQ	29308	SOFT-13-2MQ	
	Package size			20/case	EA	20/box	
	Subtotal			23 total CS			
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	