
LOC 
8/21114 
Item No.9 

AN ORDINANCE 2014 - 08 -21-0 58q 
AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS 
ESTABLISHING UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND 
SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST OF 
$2,803,000.00: (A) GALAXIE BODY WORKS, INC. FOR 
FIRE-EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES VEHICLE 
BODY REPAIR SERVICE, (B) MIDWEST MEDICAL 
SUPPLY, CO., LLC FOR MEDICAL SUPPLIES, AND (C) 
HERTZ EQUIPMENT RENTAL CORPORATION FOR 
RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMJENT. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Galaxie 
Body Works, Inc. for fire-emergency medical services vehicle body repair service, (B) Midwest 
Medical Supply, Co., LLC for medical supplies, and (C) Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation 
for rental of construction equipment; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves one low bid contract, one contract which provides for a 
procurement necessary to protect the public health or safety, and one contract procured utilizing 
cooperative purchasing; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Galaxie 
Body Works, Inc. for fire-emergency medical services vehicJle body repair service, (B) Midwest 
Medical Supply, Co., LLC for medical supplies, and (C) Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation 
for rental of construction equipment on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid 
tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required 
bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets 
are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are 
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Divis:lon of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will 
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2014 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal 
year expenditures are contingent upon future City Council budget approvals. 
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LOC 
8/21114 
Item No.9 

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 21 st day of August, 2014. 

Ivy R. Taylor 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
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Voting Results Interface Page 7 of 57 

Agenda Item: 9 (in consent vote: 4,5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,15,16,17,18, 19A, 19B, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 
25,26,27,28,29,30,32,33 ) 

Date: 08/2112014 

Time: 09:14:51 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services 
for an estimated annual cost of$2,803,000.00: (A) Galaxie Body Works, Inc. for fire-emergency 
medical services vehicle body repair service, (B) Midwest Medical Supply, Co., LLC for medical 
supplies, and (C) Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation for rental of construction equipment. [Ben 
Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group Not 
Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second Present 

Ivy Taylor Mayor x 

Diego Bernal District 1 x 

Keith Toney District 2 x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x x 

Mari Aguirre-Rodriguez District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x x 

http://cosawebNoteInterface/Default.aspx 8/22/2014 



Opened: 

For: 

July 16, 2014 
Annual Contract for Fire-EMS Vehicle Body Repair 
Services 

EXHIBIT I 

Local 
Galaxie Body Works, Inc. 

j..::6:....:.1.;;..oo;;..;o:.:o:....:4.;;..63;;..1;.........,r--__________________ -r-_=L;.;.;M~_i302 Abshire 
San Antonio, 

Item 

1A 
A 
B 
C 
D 
E 

F 

Description 

CHEVROLET PARTS AND MATERIAL 
Percent of discount offered 
Product Identification (Manufacturer) 
Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) 
Price Schedule Number 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) 

1 B Specified Items for Bid Evaluation Only 

2A 
A 
B 
C 
D 
E 

F 

DODGE PARTS AND MATERIAL 
Percent of discount offered 
Product Identification (Manufacturer) 
Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) 
Price Schedule Number 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) 

2B Specified Items for Bid Evaluation Only 

3A 
A 
B 
C 
D 
E 

F 

FORD PARTS AND MATERIAL 
Percent of discount offered 
Product Identification (Manufacturer) 
Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) 
Price Schedule Number 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) 

3B Specified Items for Bid Evaluation Only 

ITEM 4 
A. 

B. 

LABOR RATE FOR SERVICE 
BODYWORK LABOR RATE 
(Estimate 624 annual hours * per hour rate) 

PAINT WORK LABOR RATE 
(Estimate 114 annual hours * per hour rate) 

Delivery 
Business hours are from _ AM to _ PM _ days per 
week 

Re-stocking orders are placed every _ days on _ week 

Prompt Payment Discount 

Quantity TX 78237 
210-435-2193 

15% 
Chevrole 

Dealer 

7/10/2014 

Wholesale 

15% 
Dodge 
Dealer 

7/10/2014 

Wholesale 

15% 
Ford 

Deale 

7/10/2014 

Wholesale 

$30.00 
$18,720.00 

$30.00 
$3,420.00 

8 AM to 5 PM 5 days 

1 days 

1% 10 days 



Opened April 30. 2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Foc Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

6100004347 

.em Description 

A Specified Items 
Adult Disposable Resuscitator with Mask, 02 Supply Tubing 
and Tube Reservoir, and Medical Delivery Port .. AMBU® 
SPUR®U 61BX #521611000: NO SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qly Per Case 
Pnce Each (COSA Net Pnce) 

Extended Total 

Airway. Color Berman 40mm, Non-Sterile, Plastic, Single 
Use, Rusch Brand. Teleflex Medical; SO/BX #121801 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

Airway ColorBerman 50mm, Non- Sterile, Plastic, Single 
Use, Rusch Brand, Teleflex Medical #121850; 50/BX 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qly. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

Airway, I-'VC Nasal, 14F, Single Use, Stenle, ~eveillp, 
Rusch Brand, Teleflex Medical #123314; 10/BX 
NO SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

Airway, Soft PVC Nasal, 16FR, Single Use, Sterile, Bevel 
TIP, Rusch Brand,Teleflex Medical #123316; 10/BX; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

Airway. PVC Nasal, 18FR. Single Use, Sterile, Bevel Tip, 
Rusch Brand, Te!eflex MedIcal #123318; 10/BX 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 
Product # 
Oty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

Airway, I-'V<": Nasal, :dUI--H, t;lngle Use, ~tenle, ~evel liP, 
Rusch Brand TeleflexMedical #123320; 10fBX 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Qty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

Airway, PVC Nasal, 24FR, Single Use, Sten!e, Bevel Tip, 
Rusch Brand,Telef!exMedical #123324; 10/8X; 
NO SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Oty. Per Case 
Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

Albuterol Sulfate Solution tor InhalatIOn, 0.083"10, 3ML 
Nephron Pharm NCO/Item #00487-950125, or approved 
equal. 25/bx 
Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Pnce Each (CaSA Net Price) 

Total 

10 Alcohol. Isopropyl 70%, 16 oz per bottle, Hydrox Lab # 
00022, or approved equal 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Qty Per Case 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Pnce) 
Total 

Midwest Medical Supply Co., B()und Tree Medical, llC Moore Medical, llC 

'00 
SC 13400 Lakefront Onve 

Estimated Earth City, 

Annual MO 63045 

~ 386-252-9960 

630 

Amb 
AM8521-611-00 

6/EA 
$104 

$6,564.6 

101 

Te!efle 

TEL 121801 

50/BX 

$0145 
$14.7 

330 

Telefle 

TEL 12185 
50/B; 

$0.145 
$48.11 

250 

Telefle 

TEL 12331 

10/B 
$2.1 

$537.5 

242 

Telefle 

TEL 123316 
10/BX 
$2.1 

$520.3 

312 

Telef!e 

TEL 12331 
10/8 

$2.1 
$670.8 

220 

Telefle 

TEL 12332 
10/8 
$2.1 

$4730 

120 

Telefle 
TEL 12332 

10/8 
$2.1 

$258.0 

7,725 

Nephro 

00487-95012 
25/B 

$0.15 
$1,1973 

2,354 

Hydro 
HYOOO02 

121EA 
$115 

$2.70710 

Page 1 of 13 

5(100 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 

OIJblin, 
0-143016 

NAS 

Ambu 

521611000 
6/CS 

$9.00 

$5.670.00 

Teleflex Medical 

021001 
50/BX 

$0.14 
$14.14 

Teleflex Medical 
76-121850EA 

50/BX 

$0.14 
$46.20 

Teleflex MedIcal 
023314 

10/BX 
$2.10 

$525.00 

Teleflex Medical 
023316 

10/BX 

$2.10 
$508.20 

Teleflex Medical 
023318 

10/BX 

$2.10 

$655.20 

Te!eflex Medical 

023320 

10/BX 
$2.04 

$448.80 

Telefiex Medical 
023324 

10/BX 
$2.04 

$244.80 

Nephron Pharm 
9501-25 

25/BX sold In lots of 25 EA 

$0.13 
$1,004.25 

QMed Corporation 

201001 

12/CS 

$1.52 
$3,578.08 

1690 New Britain Ave 

Farmington, 
CT 06034 

NAS 

Ambu 

81050 
12 

$999 
$6,293.70 

Moore Medical 

82126 

Each 

$0.23 
$23.23 

Moore Medical 

82127 
Each 

$0.23 
$75.90 

Rusch 
60100 

Each 
$2.10 

$525.00 

Rusch 

60099 
Each 
$2.10 

$508.20 

Rusch 
60098 

Each 
$2.10 

$65520 

Rusch 
60097 

Each 
$2.10 

$462.00 

Rusch 
60095 
Each 
$2.10 

$252.00 

Nephron Pharm 
88283 
24 EA 

"$0.145 
$1,120.13 

Aaron Ind 

81768 

12 
$1.20 

$2.824.80 



Opened: April 30, 2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Midwest Medical Supply Co., Bc,und Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC. 
Inc. 

6100004347 SC 13400 Lakefront Dnve 5COO Tuttle Crossing Blvd. 1690 New Britain Ave 

Estimated Earth City, Dublin, Farmington, 

.em Description Annual MO 63045 011 43016 CT 06034 
OUBntltv 386-252-9960 

11 AspIrin, Adult, Chewable, 81 mg, Each Bottle, or approved 826 
equal. 
Mfg. Name New World Import Geri-Care Gan Care 

Product # NWICCA36 911316 64957 

Qty Per Case 36/BT;24BT/CS 36/8T 8H-36 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $0.5 $0.67 $068 

Total $479.0 $55342 $561.68 

12 Baby Bunting, Sterilized Metahzed Polyester Film, Single use 98 
wrap, Duromed #650-4006-0600 or approved equal 

Mfg. Name Primacare Briggs Healthcare Gam Ind 

Product # PCMCS-683 444006 43842 

Qty Per Case 12/BX,10BX/CS 24/CS Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.3 $3.08 $3.70 

Total $232.26 $301.84 $362.60 

13 ~ag Vomrt ~mesls :;:)Ickness Graduations, Medllne Industries, 14,510 
#NON7066, or approved equal; 25/PK 

Mfg. Name MedlinE Medline Industries Tn-State 

Product # MED NON7060l 1071-32801 93364 

Qty Per Case 1 OO/BX; 586/C' 24/PK sold in lots of 24EA Pkg-24 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.4 $0.815 -$1.0829 

Total $5,8040 $11,825.65 $15,712.88 

14 ~andage, Inangular, 3(·· x 3(·· x ~2··, Woven Cotton MuSlIm 2,916 
Gauze, Dukal Corp. # TB37; or approved equal 

Mfg. Name Medsourc Dukal First Aid Only 

Product # MSOMS-1105 276-TB37 15262 

Qty. Per Case 12/BX; 2036/C 240/CS sold in lots of 240EA 24 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.1 $0.3083 *$0.79125 

Total $554.0 $899.00 $2,307.29 

15 I::llades, Ulsposable Laryngoscope, Miller U Greenllne, 100 
SunMed #5-5333-00; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med 

Product # SUN5-5333-0 025330 80667 

Qty. Per Case 20/C 20/BX Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.~ $3.41 $491 

Total $345.0C $341.00 $491 00 

16 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Miller 1 Greenline, 100 
SunMed #5-5333-01; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med 

Product # SUN5-5333-01 025331 80666 

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.4 $341 $4.91 

Total $345.0 $341.00 $491.00 

17 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Miller 2 Greenline, 300 
SunMed #5-5333-02; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med 

Product # SUN5-5333-0 025332 80665 

Qty Per Case 20/B 20/BX Each 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $3.4 $3.41 $4.91 

Total $1,035.0 $1,02300 $1.473.00 

18 I:lladeS, UISposabl9 Laryngoscope, Miller ;:s ljreenllne, 300 
SunMed #5-5333-03; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med 

Product # SUN5-5333-CK 025333 80664 

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $3.4~ $341 $4.91 

Total $1,035.0( $1,02300 $1.473.00 

19 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Mac 2, Greenline, 300 
SunMed #5-5332-02; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med 

Product # SUNS-5332-0: 025302 80670 

Qty Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $3.41 $341 $491 

Total $1,O35.0( $1,02300 $1,47300 

20 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Mac 3, Greenline, 300 
SunMed #5-S332-03; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Sun Mad Sun Med Sun Med 

Product # SUNS-5332-0 025303 80669 

Qty Per Case 20/C' 20/BX Each 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Pnce) $3.~ $341 $491 

Total $1,035.0( $1,023.00 $1,47300 
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Opened: April 30, 2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non.local 
Midwest Medical Supply Co., BI)und Tree Medical, LlC Moore Medical, LLC 
loc 

6100004347 SC 13400 Lakefronl Drive sooa Tuttle Crossmg Blvd. 1690 New Britain Ave. 

Estimated EarthCrty. DJbhn, Farmington, 

Item Description :.n.nn~! MO 63045 OH 43016 CT 06034 
386-252-9960 

21 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Mac 4, Greenhne, 600 
SunMed #5-5332-04. 201CA, NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Sun Mad Sun Mad Sun Mad 

Product # SUNS-5332-0 025304 80668 

Qty Per Case 20/CS 20lBX Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $34 $341 $4.91 
Total $2,070.0 $2,046 00 $2,946.00 

22 ~lanket, Ught Weight, rleece, Orange. tlO" X 80", laylor 900 
Healthcare # 60-OFBS080. (With the logo "City of San 
Antonio Fire"); NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Taylo Taylor Healthcare NO BID 

Product # TA Y60-0FB5084-SAFD 60-OFB5080 

Qty Per Case 10/CS 10/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.91 $5.75 

Total $5,3190 $5,175.00 

23 Blanket Vlsi, Poly Yellow, 50" x84 , Graham Medical #53382 600 
25/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Graham Graham Medical NOBID 

Product # GRA5338 351-53382 

Qty Per Case 251C; 25/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $63.7 $7000 

Total $38,250.0 $42,000.00 

24 Ganlster, UUlck Heplacement, ::;Ingle Use, ::;-::;cor Inc, 550 
# 2480; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Sscc Sscor, Inc NOBID 

Product # SEES524802 590522 
Qty. Per Case 201C; 20/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $15.0( $12.45 
Total $8,250.0 $6,847.50 

25 L..annUla, Nasal AOUIt, L..onventlOnal, :;,tralQnt, ventLaO L..orp, 
#1007, EACH, 50/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

6,000 

Mfg Name Ventla Ventlab Hudson RCI 

Product # VEN100 14645 50792 

Qty Per Case 501C; SO/CS 50 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.23 $0.23 '$0.0266 
Total $1,398.0 $1,380.00 $159.60 

26 Collar Adjustable, Ace Perfit, Mini, AMBU Inc. #000-281-106 500 
3; 30/8X; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Amb Ambu Ambu 

Product # AMBOOO-281-106 260280 65666 

Qty Per Case 301C; 30/CS 30 
Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $5.0' $4.55 $5.50 

Total $2,530.0 $2,275.00 $2,750.00 

27 Collar Adjustable, Ace Pertll, Adult, AMBU Inc. #000-281- 7,200 
000; 30/BX, NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Amb Ambu Ambu 

Product # AMBOOO-281-00 260281 59897 

Qty. Per Case 30/CS 30/CS 30 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.0€ $4.S5 $5.50 

Total $36,432.0 $32,760.00 $39,600.00 

28 Container, Disposable Sharps Autodrop Collector, Red, 1 700 
Quart Size, Kendall Healthcare #8900SA; 100/BX, NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Kendal Kendall Covidien 

Product # KEN8900SA 298900 47446 

Qty. Per Case 100/CS 20/CS 100 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.5 $1.57 $160 

Total $1,113.0 $1,099.00 $1,120.00 

29 L..Omalner, uisposame ;:,narps 1,..OlleCIOr, Kea, lVIaliDOX StYle 

lid, S Quart SIZe, Kendall Healthcare #85131; NO 
600 

SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Kendal Kendall Covidien 

Product # KEN85131 5810-8513 89994 

Qty. Per Case 201C; 20lCS Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.7 $3.70 $3.50 

Total $2,256.01 $2,220.00 $2,100.00 

30 uresslng MUIQ-Iraums. ::iterlle, I to x,)u. uynarex lJ,)!),).l or 1,200 
approved equal 

Mfg Name ~~;~~E Medstorm Moore Medical 

Product # MSOMS 16353 13873 

Qty. Per Case 2S/CS 50/CS Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.6 $0.85 $112 

Total $984.0 $1,02000 $1,344.00 
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City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 30, 2014 

For" Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-local Non-Local 
Midwest Medical Supply Co, Bound Tree Medical, llC Moore Medical, LLC 
Inc 

~6~'~00~0~04!;;3T47'---_______________ -,-=-:c:=:SC'7-.+!'~34;0"0,,,L~.k~e~fro"n~t D~,.!::;ve:!--I5000 Tuttle CroSSing Blvd. 1690 New Britain Ave. 
Estimated Earth City, DIJblin, Farmington, 

•• m Description Annual MO 63045 0-143016 cr 06034 
no on". 386-252-9960 

31 uressmg VBn! uara Aoun IV ~taoilization. l"..OnMea L..orp 500 
#705-4431; 5BX/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Conmed Conmed ConMed 

Product # CON705-4431 354431 40685 

Q1y. Per Case 1 aO/BX; SBX/CS 500/eS 10D/9X 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $34.7 $34.43 $44.50 
Total $17,370.0 $17,215,00 $22,250.00 

32 Extension Set 8" Standard Bore T ·Port 8 Braun #473443 Ref 40,000 
473443; 100EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name B. Breu B Braun Medical B. Braun 

Product # BBM47344, 355402 73433 

Qty. Per Case 100/CS 100/CS Each 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $2.3 $2.35 $2.80 

Total $95,600,0( $94,000.00 $112,000.00 

33 l:iauze, Impregnatea Wltn white petrolatum, stenia, non- 36 
adherent, 3" x 18", per box, KendaH #8884414600 or 
approved equal 
Mfg. Name Derma Science Kendall Covichen 

Product # DMADKC2005S 1500061k1 08618 

aty. Per Case 12/BX; 6BX/CS 72JCS BXl12 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.3 $8.52 $869 

Total $299.81 $306,72 $31284 

34 Glove I::xam Ulamond Gnp, Mlcrotlex ~Mt--::lUU-~; 1 UI:::IXlG:::i 300 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Microfle Mlcroflex Microfle 

Product # MICMF-300-S 290300 48813 

Qty Per Case 100/BX, 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8 5~ $10.00 $950 
Total $2,565.0C $3,000.00 $2,85000 

35 GlOve I::xam Ulamond Gnp, Mlcrotlex~Mt--::lUU-M, 1UI:::IXlG:::i; 800 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Mlcrofle Microflex Microfle 

Product # MICMF-300-W 290301 48814 

Qty. Per Case 100BX; 10/Co 1000/CS 10/BX 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $8.5~ $10.00 $9.50 
Total $6,840.0C $8,000.00 $7,600.00 

36 Glove I::.xam Ulamond Gnp, Mlcrotlex#Mt--::lUU-L; 1UI:::IXlG:::i; 3,500 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Microfla Microflex Microflax 

Product # MICMF 300-l 290302 48815 

aty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $8.5~ $10.00 $9.50 

Total $29,925.0C $35,00000 $33,250.00 

37 Glove I::xam Diamond Gnp, Mlcrot\ex#MF-300-XL;10t3X1CS; 1,700 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Microfle Microflex Mlcroflex 

Product # MICMF-300-XL 290303 48816 

Qty. Per Case 100BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.55 $10.00 $9.50 

Total $14,535.0C $17,000.00 $16,150.00 

38 GlOve I::xam NrtrlUerm 1:.1-' (extra protection) Urange, Nltnle 500 
Synthetic, Healthcare Corp. #189100 Small; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative 

Product # INN1891Q( 1015-18901 96415 

Qty Per Case 100/BX,10/CS 10/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10,2( $11.50 $12.00 

Total $5,1000( $5,750.00 $6,000.00 

39 Glove Exam NitriDerm EP (extra protection) Orange, Nitrile 1,600 
Synthetic, Heaithcare Gorp. #189200 Medium, NO 
SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg. Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Heaithcare Innovative 

Product # INN18920( 1015-18902 96416 

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $102( $11.50 $12.00 

Total $16,3200( $18,400.00 $19,200.00 

40 Glove Exam NitriDerm EP (extra protection) Orange, Nitrile 11,000 
Synthetic, Healthcare Corp. #189300 Large; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative 

Product # INN18930( 1015-18903 96417 

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/GS 1000/GS 10/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.2( $11.50 $12.00 
Total $112,200.0( $126,500.00 $132,000.00 
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Opened: April 30, 2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

For Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Midwest Medical Supply Co., Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC 
loe 

6100004347 SC 13400 lakefronl Drive 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd. 1690 New Britain Ave. 

Estimated Earth City, OJblin, Farmington, 

Item Description Annual MO 63045 OH 43016 CT 06034 
n, 386-252-9960 

41 Glove Exam NrtriDerm EP (extra protection) Orange, Nitrile 3,000 
Synthetic, Healthcare Corp. #189350 X-Large; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative 

Product # INN 1 S935 1015·18904 96418 

Qly. Per Case 10D/CS, 10/C~ 1 OODleS 10/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.2 $11.50 $12.00 

Total $30,600.0 $34,500.00 $36,000.00 

42 ulucagon t:.mergency "It, "I Ml:J "I ML 1\ I, 1:11 Lilly fAJUUUL- 320 
803101; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Eli UII Cardincal Health Rx Bedford Lab 

Product # 00002-803101 000002145001 71375 

Qty. Per Case EI 1/EA Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $208.1 $186.99 $133.00 
Total $66,6176 $59,836.80 $42,560.00 

43 Hand Sanitizer, 4 FI oz, No Rinse, Safetec, #SAF17350 or 5,000 
approved equal; 25EA/BX; or approved equal 

Mfg. Name NewWorl Safetec Safetec 

Product # NWIHS R3119 55123 

Qty Per Case 60/C, 24/CS Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.5 $1.00 $0.93 

Total $2,650.0 $5,00000 $4,650.00 

44 Holder, Endotracheal Thomas Tube, Pediatric Size, Laerdal 100 
#600-20000; 25EA/pk; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Laerda Laerdal Laerdal 

Product # LAE600-2000 020400 54288 

Oty. Per Case 25/EA; 4/C, 100/CS BXl24 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $63.41 $61.75 "$64.56 

Total $6,341.0 $6,175.00 $6,456.00 

45 Holder, t.ndotracheal I homas I ube, Adult ::>Ize, Laerdal 1,000 
#600-10000, 25EA/pk; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Laerda Laerdal Laerdal 

Product # LAE600-1000 020500 54246 

Qty. Per Case 25/PK; 4/C, 100/CS BOXl24 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $63.41 $6175 "$64.56 

Total $63,410.0 $61,75000 $64,560.00 

46 ::;;iodlum ChlOnde, Imgant, YOO mg/1000mL; NUC U::!::!Ij-OU4Ij- 200 
04, or approved equal 

Mfg. Name Baxte Baxter NOBID 

Product # BAX2F712 607124 

Oty Per Case 12/C, 121CS 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $1.9 $1.67 

Total $384.0 $334.00 

47 InJectton, Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 500ML, in ViaFlex 1,000 
container, Baxter#2B13230; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Baxte Baxter Baxter 

Product # BAX2B1323C 601323 37072 

Oty. Per Case 24/C, 24/CS 24/Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $34.8 $30.00 *$30.00 

Total $34,800.0 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 

48 InJection, ::>odlum ChlOride, 0.9%, 100ML, In VISt-IeX 10 
container, Baxter#2B1307; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Baxte Baxter Baxter 

Product # BAX2B130 358437 86724 

Oty Per Case 96/CS 96/CS 96/Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $14( $1.17 $1.25 

Total $14.0 $11.70 $12.50 

49 Jelly, Sterile Lubricating, 2.7g Packets,144 packets per box, 4,000 
Oynarex, #DYN1250, or approved equal. 

Mfg. Name Dynare Nlce-Pak Dynare 

Product # OYN125 440128 15/25 

Qty. Per Case 144/BX, 12BXlC' 1728/CS BXl144 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.66 $8.64 $5.40 

Total $22,640.0 $34,560.00 $21,600.00 

50 Lancet Surgllance Safety Grey, Medipurpose Inc, #SLN200, 1,200 
15BXlCS; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Medipurpo~ Medi Purpose Medipurpose 

Product # SURSLN20 782-SLN200BX 68661 

Oty. Per Case 100/BX, 15BX/CA 1500/CS BXl100 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $106 $14,50 $14.50 

T01al $12,780.0 $17,40000 $17,400.00 
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Opened: April 30, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Midwest Medical Supply Co, Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC. 

6100004347 

Item Dest:ription 

51 lice Bedding Spray, 5 oz Perrigo Co , #49348-023787 or 
approved equal. 

Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Q1y. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

52 lice Killing Shampoo, 4 oz Perngo Co, #49348-044334, or 
approved equal 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Qty, Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

53 Nebulizer, Micro-Mist Nebulizer wtree, Tubing Mouthpiece 
and Reservior Teleflex Hudson Rei Ref 1883, 50EA/BX, or 
approved equal. 

Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

54 Needle, 18G x 1 % inches, Stencan B Braun #4665120; 
1 OOEA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Qty, Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

SC 
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantitv 

50 

101 

3,400 

1,000 

55 Needle, L1GA x, % Inches, t:.cllpse ~ecton Ulcklnson 7,000 
#305765 B/D305765; 100EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

56 Nltrostat, .4 mg taOl9ts, lUU taOlets per DOttle, I-'Tlzer 
#041824 EA (Bottle); NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

57 Non-Kebreathlng Mask, Adult t:.longated wlo satety vent, 
Hudson RCITeleflex Medical #1060;50EA/BX or approved 
equal. 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

220 

12,000 

58 OXYGEN PREFILLED HUMIDIFIER; Prefilled Humidifier 520 
500ml filled with bacteriostatic water. Comes with humidifier 
adapter; Par1#002620 or approved equal 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Qty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

59 Nose Clip, (white thermoplastic), Grooved A-M Systems 
PACK (Each) #166000 or approved equal 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

60 Obstetrical Kit, Dynarex, #4902; 10/BX or approved equal 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 
Total 

300 

200 

inc 

13400 Lakefront Drive 

Earth City, 
MO 63045 
386-252-9960 

Perngo 

49348.02378 

EA 
$5.0 

$251.0 

Perrig 

49348-04433 

EA 
$64 

$6494 

Ventla 

VEN500 

50/CS 
$0.61 

$2,0740 

B Brau 

BBM4665120-0 

100/BX; 10/C' 
$0021 

$219 

BO 
BID 30576 

100/BX; 121CS 
$0.20 

$1,442.0 

Pfize 

00071-04182 

100/8T 
$24.20 

$5,324.0 

Ventla 

VEN210 

50lC 

$061 
$7,3200 

Allegiance 

ALG00262C 
12/CS 

$2.11 

$1,097.2C 

AM-System 

AMS16600C 
100lCS 
$0.386 

$115.8C 

Motion Medica 

MM01723 
10/CS 
$3.75 

$750.00 
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5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 

Dublin, 
OH 43016 

CardinalOTC 

0004-21 

1/EA 
$6.35 

$317.50 

Cardinal Health Rx 

0931-90-60 ML 

101/EA 
$103.20 

$10,423.20 

Teleflex Medical 

411883 

50/CS 
$077 

$2,61800 

B Braun 

1641-12018 

1000/CS 
rold in lots of 1 OOEA or 1 BX 

$00232 
$2320 

Becton Dickinson 

1641-76521 
1000/CS 

;old in lots of 1 OOEA or 1 BX 

$02352 

$1,646 40 

Cardinal Health Rx 

0418-24 

100/BT 

$21.80 
$4,796.00 

Ventlab 

87-2102 
50/eS 

sold in lots of 50EA 

$067 
$8,040.00 

Carefusion 303 

022520 
12/C5 
$1.89 

$9B2.80 

Allied Healthcare 

1410-64019 

100/CS 
$0.24 

$72.00 

Dynarex 

F1652BAG 

10/CS 
$5.63 

$1,126.00 

1690 New Britain Ave 

Farmington, 
CT 06034 

Bayer 

10938 

Each 

$4.99 
$249.50 

BSH 
91116 

Each 

$279 

$281.79 

Hudson 

63464 

50/Case 
*$0.9198 

$3,127.32 

NO BID 

BO 
74870 

Bx/l00 

*$0.195 

$1,365.00 

Pfizer 

64757 

BTU100 

$2205 
$4,851.00 

Hudson 

50799 

BX/50 

$1.05 
$12,60000 

NO BID 

SOl Diagnostics 

62057 

Ca58/25 
·$0.64 

$192.00 

Russe 

68221 

Each 

$5.79 
$1,158.00 



Opened April 30, 2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Fo, Annual Contract for MedIcal Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Midwest Medical Supply Co .. Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC 

6100004347 

hem Description 

61 Pack, Instant Cold Compress, up to 25 degrees F, 6" x 9", 
BasIc Medical Industries, #ICE 1069 or approved equal 

Mfg Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 
Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

62 Pack, Instant Heat (Hot), up to 140 degrees F, Epsom 
formula, 4~ x 8" Morrison Medical. #6610 or approved equal. 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Qty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

63 Pad Prep Alcohol Large 1.25" x 1.75", 100ea/bx; Dynarex. 
#DYN11 06 or approved equal 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Qly. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

64 .... ad .... rep .... ovldlne, Medium 1 x 1.:l~ , uynarex, lFUYN11Uts. 

or approved equal 
Mfg. Name 
Product # 

Oty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

65 I-'enllgnt wltn I-'UpU yauge blpK, Aaron Medical Irld inC, 

#66RN: NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Oty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

66 Shears, (EMT) Medical. 7 V.". Red or Black or Orange 
Stainless Steel Blade. Easily cuts through Clothing, American 
Diagnostics. #320NO, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name 
Product # 

Oty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

SC 
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantltv 

11,000 

1.400 

1,736 

1,100 

940 

400 

67 Sheet Drape 3-PIy 40" x 48~. White Graham Medical 400 
Products, #302, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Oty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 
Total 

68 ::::'pllnt, AnKlelroot, AlrWltn t-'ustvt-'ull valves, AdUlt, 
Mayflower Splint Co., #703; NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg Name 
Product # 
Oly. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

69 Splint. Full Arm, Air with Push/Pull Valves. Adult Mayflower 
Splint Co., #702: NO SUBSTITUTIONS 
Mfg Name 
Product # 

Oty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

400 

140 

70 Splint. Full Leg. Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult Mayflower 300 
Splint Co., #705; NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Oty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) 
Total 

Inc 

13400 Lakefront Drive 
Earth City, 
MO 63045 
386·252-9960 

Oynare 
DYN451 

241CS 
$0.36 

$3,960.00 

Oynare 

DYN4516 

24/CS 

$0.5 
$7280 

Duka 
OUK861 

100/BX,10/eS 
$1.5E 

$2,706.1E 

Dynare 
DYN110E 

100/BX; 10lCS 

$0032 
$359 

Aaro 

AAR66RN 
61PK 
$1.2~ 

$1,175.0C 

American Dieg. 

AME320NO 
EA 

$2.0 
$63600 

Graham Medica 
GRA30 

100lCS 
$19.1 

$7,648.0 

Mayflowe 
MSC70 

EA 
$7.6 

$3,136.0C 

Mayflowe 

MSC70 
EA 

$90 
$1,2670 

Mayflowe 
MSC70 

$10.3 
$3,114.0 
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5)00 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 

Dublin, 
CH 43016 

Briggs Healthcare 

1431-11210 
24fCS 

$032 
$3,52000 

Medstorm 

11406 
24/CS 
$0.25 

$350.00 

Dynarex 
F1654 

1 OODleS 
$1.97 

$3,419.92 

Dynare 
609153 

10DD/eS 

$0.0329 
$36.19 

Aaron Medical 

*00012 
6/PK 

$1.563 
$1,488.02 

American Diagnostic Corp 

400005 
1EA 

$1.79 
$71600 

Graham Medical 

GRA 302 
100leS 
$24.38 

$9,752.00 

Mayflower Splint Co. 
660025 

1EA 
$8.10 

$3,240.00 

Mayflower Splint Co. 

660020 
1EA 

$9.35 

$1,30900 

Mayflower Splint Co. 
NIA 
NIA 

$10.72 
$3,216.00 

1690 New Brrtain Ave 

Farmington, 
CT 06034 

Swift First Aid 

92931 

Each 

$0.95 
$10,450.00 

Nortech Lab 
80550 

Each 
$0.51 

$714.00 

Covidien 
93055 

BXJ200 
$2.39 

$4,149.04 

Dynarex 

96650 
BXJ100 

"$0.0325 

$35.75 

Moore Medical 

81238 
6/PK 

$3.69 
$3,46860 

ADC 
42407 

Each 

$2.10 
$840.00 

NOBID 

Allied Heatthcare 
76266 

Each 
$8.70 

$3.460.00 

Allied Healthcare 
76263 

Each 
$899 

$1,25660 

Allied Healthcare 
76265 
Each 

$1125 
$3.37500 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Opened" April 30, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-local Non-Local Non~Local 

Midwest Medical Supply Co., BJund Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC 
Inc. 

6100004347 se 13400 Lakefront Dnve 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 1690 New Britain Ave. 

Estimated Earth City, Dublin, Farmington, 
Item Description Annual MO 63045 OH 43016 CT 06034 

cu.nmv 386-252-9960 

71 Splint, Half Arm, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult Mayflower 192 
Splint Co . #701, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 
Mfg. Name Mayflowe NOT PROVIDED Allied Heelthcare 

Product # MSC701 76262 
Qty. Per Case EA Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $7.26 $8.00 
Total $1,393.9 $1,536.00 

72 ::;pllnt, Halt Leg, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult Mayflower 300 
Splint Co., #704; NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name Mayflowe NOT PROVIDED Allied Healthcare 

Product # MSC70 76264 
Qty. Per Case E Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $9.0 $9.25 
Total $2,715.0 $2,77500 

73 ::;)pllnt, Hand and Wnst, Alrwrth I-'usl\ll-'UII Valves, Adult 300 
Mayflower Splint Co., #700; NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg Name Mayflowe NOT PROVIDED Allied Heatthcare 

Product # MSC70 76267 
Oty. Per Case E Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $62 $7.20 
Total $1,884.0 $2,16000 

74 ::;,pllnl, t:.conomy, WOOa,:l2 I"oam t'aaaea tsoara, l:l lengm, 300 
Morrison Medical, #1815, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name Morriso NOT PROVIDED Moore Medical 

Product # MOR181 79691 

Oty. Per Case E Each 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.1 $2.15 

Total $630.0 $645.00 

75 spbnt, t:.conomy, WOOd, Y2 I"oam I-'added tJoard, ;,its'" length 100 
Morrison Medical, #1836; NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name Mornso NOT PROVIDED Moore Medical 

Product # MOR1836 79692 

Oty. Per Case EA Each 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $3.3 $3.50 

Total $330.0 $350.00 

76 Sponge, 4 X 4, 4 Ply, NonWoven, Dynarex #DYN3254, 900 
EACH or approved equal 

Mfg. Name Dynare NOT PROVIDED Dukel 

Product # DYN325 73952 

Qty. Per Case 200/BX,10/CS 100/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $001 "$00525 

Total $9.0 $47.25 

77 ::;,ynnge I"IUSn, ::;,allne, lUCC I"'reT1l1 ts tsraun ~l":l/b U.\:I 62,000 
Sodium Chloride Injection, USP or approved equal 
Mfg Name ExcelslO NOT PROVIDED B. Braun 

Product # EMCE0100-01 69606 
Oty. Per Case 100/BX,6BXlCS 100/BX 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) $0.36 "$0.4599 
Total $22,3200 $28,513.80 

78 Synnge, Omnifix 10cc Luer-Lok B Braun #4617100V-02; NO 1,350 
SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name B Brau NOT PROVIDED NOBID 

Product # BBM4617100V-O 

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 121e, 
Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $0.078 
Total $106.11 

79 Synnge, Becton Dickinson 30cc Luer-Lok, latex tree, 700 
#302832; NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name B[ NOT PROVIDED BD 

Product # 81030283 13974 

Qty, Per Case 56SP; 4SP/C BX156 

Price Each (CaSA Net Price) $0.32 "$0.32125 
Total $2303 $224.88 

80 Synnge, Omnlfix, 5ee, Luer-lok B Braun #4617053V-02; NO 3,600 
SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name B Brau B. Braun NO BID 

Product # BRM4617053V-0 1633-05305 

Oty, Per Case 1 OO/BX; 20/BXlC 2000/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2~~~[ $007 
Total $266.00 
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Opened. Apnl 30, 2014 

For" Annual Contract for Medical Supplies 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Midwest MedIcal Supply Co, Bound Tree Medical, llC Moore Medical, LLC 
Inc 

~6~1~00~0~04!:23:;.47C-_______________ -'-E::-."tI:o:~C"".t:-.-'dt.:~",,!4"rt~E'0c",L,,,,ayk"',.",fro,,n,,,t o",r"''''''''---I ~~~~n~uttle Crossing Blvd ~:~~i~;t:n~rnain Ave 

Item Description :'~:n~~~ ~~-~~~~:960 CH 43016 CT 06034 

81 Synnge. Eclipse 3cc, 23 9 x 1", Luer-Lok with detachable 
needle, Becton Dickinson #305782, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Pnce Each (GaSA Net Price) 
Total 

100 

82 Synnge. Tubereu~n. lee. 26 9 x 318". Luer-Lok. SafetyGlide. 700 
Becton Dickinson #305946. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

83 I est :strips. ~Iood Glucose. Gontour ;!:/UYYG, t:layer L4bXlcs, 3,000 
50ea/bx: NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

84 Meters tsayer t:llood t..:ilucose Gontour t-ree With l-'urchaSlng 200 
of Test Strips For Test Strips #7099C As needed, NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

85 HI and LOW :;:'olutlon Tor Meters t:layert:llOoa l:>lucose vomour 300 
1858, NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

86 Saline 250 mL 0.9 Sodium Chloride Inj. #2813220, NO 20 
SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Oty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

87 Sodium Chloride, InJectIOn, SolutIOn. 9 g/1000mL; #NDC 700 
0338-0049-48, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg Name 
Product # 
Oty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

88 Mask. Non-Rebreathlng, Elongated PediatriC, w/Safety Vent, 1,500 
Hudson TeleflexRCI Ref: 1058;50EA/BX; NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

89 :;:,neet rltted :;:,tandard I sylor Heanncare I-'rOducts ine KerR' 1,100 
92-SFS3084; NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qly Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

90 Kesuscltator I-'edlatflc ~pur II Ambu Ket t>31tl1 (000, 1,500 
6EA/BX: NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) 
Total 
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Bo 
81030578 

50SP,6SP/CS 
$024 
$247 

Be 
810305946 

1 DO/BX, 4/CS 

$0,37 
$261.1 

Baye 

BA Y0670724~ 
501B> 

$0290 
$871,2[ 

$00 
$O.O( 

BaY" 
7109/7110/7111 

"' $4.2< 
$1,278.0 

Baxte 

BAX2B1322C 
36/CS 

$13 
$27.6[ 

Baxte 

BAX2B1324X 

141C~ 

$1,5 
$1,106.0 

Telafla 

TEL10S< 
50/CS 

$0.9 
$1,380.0 

Taylo 

TAYCO-SFS30a. 

50/CS 

$0.996 
$1.0956 

Amb 
AMB531-617-00 

6/CS 
$13.2 

$19.8750 

Becton DIckInson 

"305782 
-'VUlLo;::' 

sold in lots of 300EA 
$0,2103 

$21.03 

Becton Dickinson 
"305946 
4UUIt,...~ 

sold in lots of 400EA 
$03559 
$24913 

Bayer Healthcare 

2763"09950 
120Q/CS sold in lots of 50EA 

$03098 
$929.40 

$0.01 

$2.00 

Bayer Healthcare 

121-1858 

1EA 
$458 

$1,37400 

Baxter 

601322 

36/CS 
$1.24 

$24,80 

Baxter 

358437 

96/CS 

$117 
$81900 

TelaflaxMedical 

D6141 

50/CS 
$1.33 

$1,99500 

Taylor Healthcare 

14339 

50/CS sold in lots of 50EA 

$1.02 
$1,122.00 

Ambu 

11723 

6/CS 
$2319 

$34,785.00 

Bo 
74874 

BX/50 

"$02598 
$2598 

Bo 
88516 

BXl100 

*$0.3599 

$251 93 

Bayer 

80658 

50/BX 

"$0.40 
$1,200.00 

$0.00 

$0,00 

Bayer 

807018-80705 

Each 

$433 

$1,29900 

Baxter 

48663 

36/Case 

$1.25 

$2500 

NO BID 

Hudson 

50808 

50/Case 

$1.29 

$1,93500 

NOBID 

Ambu 

81049 

12/Case 

$1379 
$20,68500 



Opened: April 30, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 
Midwest Medical Supply Co., 
Inc 

6100004347 SC 13400 Lakefront Dnve 

Estimated Earth City, 

Item Description Annual MO 63045 

Ou.nlllv 386-252-9960 

91 :;:'OlutlOn :;:,et wltn UUU-VI=N I :::,plKe ~ ... "earLlnKllntenmK :;:,yste 400 
NonDEHP 92"(2.3m), Luer Activated Valve Intertink Injection 
Site Male LueT lock Adapter#EMS3110: NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Saxte 

Product # BAXEMS311C 

Qty. Per Case 48/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.3' 
Total $556.0( 

92 Tubing Suction Non Conducttve Latex Free Stenle 3/16"xti' 2,500 
with Straw Connector Dynarex Reorder No 4682, 50EA/BX; 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Dynare 

Product # DYN468 

Qty. Per Case 501C, 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.41 

Total $1.025.0( 

93 1 V. Loatnetert:iU Autoguara 14ga 1,(olnx1.(oln, L.1X40mm 50 
Ref 381467 4BOXICASE; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name Be 
Product # BID38146 

Qty Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $107.7 
Total $5.3865( 

94 LV, t,;atheter t;SU Insyte Autoguara t:lt,; lb ga 1 ltiln 120 
1 7X30mm Ref 382554 Becton Dickinson; 4BOXICASE; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg. Name BD 
Product # BID38255 

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.0( 

Total $12.600.0( 

95 I.V. Catheter BO Insyte Autoguard BG 18ga 1,16m 530 
1.3x30mm Ref 382544 Becton Dickinson;4BOXlCASE, NO 
SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg. Name Be 
Product # BID382544 
Qty, Per Case 501BX; 41CS 
Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) $105.00 
Total $55.650.00 

96 I.V. Catheter BD Insyte Autoguard BC 20ga 1.16in 700 
1,3x30mm; Ref 382534 Becton Dickinson;4BOXlCASE; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name BD 

Product # BID38253 

Qty Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.0C 

Total $73.500.0C 

97 LV. Catheter BD Insyte Autoguard BC 22ga 0.9in 25mm ; 120 
Ref 382523 Becton Dickinson; 4BOX/CASE; NO 

Mfg. Name BO 

Product # BID38252 

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.0( 

Total $12.600.0( 

98 IV. Catheter BO Insyte Autoguard BC 24ga 0,751N 70 
0.7inx19mm: Ref 382512 Becton Dickinson; 4BOXICASE; 
NO SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg Name BIC 

Product # B1038251; 

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.0( 

Total $7.350.0( 

99 OWlvel t;lbow :super oet LLmm wlUl:Il Intersurglcal 200 
Incorporated Ref: 3509031; 50EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Intersurgica 

Product # 1ST 3509031 

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.3' 
Total $476 Of 

100 Yankauer Suction Amsino Ref AS833: 50EA/BX; NO 600 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name Amsin 

Product # AMSAS83! 

Qty Per Case 501C, 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.5 
Total $324.0( 

Page 10 of 13 

Non-Local Non-Local 
Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LlC 

5)00 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 1690 New Britain Ave 

Dublin, Farmington, 
CH 43016 CT 06034 

Baxter Baxter 

118·EMS3110EA 81839 

481CS 48/Case 

$1.50 $1.49 

$600.00 $596.00 

Medline Industries Covidien 

325021 65090 

50/CS 50/Case 

$046 $0.70 

$1,15000 $1,750.00 

Becton Dickinson BD 
355141 66412 

200/CS B)(I50 
$104.50 $115.00 

$5.225.00 $5.750.00 

Becton Dickinson BD 
1612-55416 14575 

200fCS BXl50 

$104.50 $115.00 

$12.540,00 $13.800,00 

Becton Dickinson BD 
1612-54418 12984 

200/CS BXl50 

$10250 $110.00 

$54.325.00 $58.300.00 

Becton Dickinson BD 
1612-53420 12979 

200lCS BXI50 
$102.50 $110.00 

$71.750.00 $77.000.00 

Becton Dickinson BD 
1612-52322 12220 

200/CS BXl50 

$10250 $110.00 

$12.300.00 $13.200.00 

Becton Dickinson BO 

1612-52224 14571 
200/CS BXl50 

$102.50 $110.00 

$7.175.00 $7.700.00 

Intersurgicallncorp NO BID 
2421~99450 

50/CS 
$115 

$230.00 

Amsino International Amsino 

16104 15093 

50/CS Each 

$1.16 $1.10 
$69600 $660.00 



Opened Apn130.2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Midwest Medical Supply Co., Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC 

6100004347 

Item Description 

101 ::salem ::sump lbtrlch (b.Jmm) x411 (lLLCm) Kef:llllllll.!bblJl 
Covidien Silicone Dual lumen Stomach Tube, 10EA/BX; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

102 LJUIKl.,lOt l.,omoat (..;Iauze Hemostatic uresslng L-MeOlca 
Ref:150. 50EA/8X, NO SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg. Name 

Product # 

Qty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

103 Micro Pin Non-Vented vial access pin for withdrawal or 
injectIOn: Ref 4150198 8raun; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 
Product # 
Qty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

104 ~traps UM~ I-'art# 111b2MA Color Maroon, or approved 
equal 
Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Qty. Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

105 ~traps I::.xtenslOn I-'art# 12HS Color !;Slack., or approved equal 
Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

106 Strap Wrist Part# 1290 Color Black, or approved equal 
Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Pnce) 
Total 

107 Glutose 15 Oral Glucose Gel (Low Blood Sugar): lemon 
Flavor 3/Pk, or approved equal 

Mfg Name 
Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

SC 
Estimated 

Annual 
O'~ntl" 

100 

300 

5,000 

1,600 

700 

80 

3,000 

108 AmKldarone HydrochlOfide InjectIOn ltlUmgf:i:imi (tlUmgfmL); 3,000 
10x3ml Single use Vials NDC 0143-9875-10; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 
Product # 
Qty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

109 I::.plnephnne InJection. USI-' 1.1,OUU (lmgfml) 1ml2b Ampuls 1,710 
Hospria NDC 0409-7241-01, NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Qty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

110 Meloprolol lartrate InJection. U~I-', bmglbml(lmglml). NUC 300 
63323-660-05. APP Pharmaceuticals. llC, NO 
SUBSTITUTION 
Mfg Name 
Product # 
Qty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 
Tolal 

Inc 

13400 Lakefront Drive 
EarthCrty, 
MO 63045 
386-252-9960 

KendalVCovidie 

KEN888826513 

10/8 
*$1516 
$1516 

Z-Medlca 

ZME15 

50/es 
$358 

$10,740.0 

B Brau 

BBM41501 

tOO/CS 

$0.2 
$1,350.0 

DM' 
DKM11152MA 

E' 
$8.8 

$10,880.0 

DMS 
DKMll048' 

E' 
$6.4 

$1,2960 

Mornso 
MOR129C 

EA 
$8.3 

$666.4 

Leve 

lFll0340 

3/P" 

$0.9 
$2,790.0 

WestWard 

00143-98750 
10/C 

$166 
$4,980.0 

Hosplra 

ABB07241-01 
25/8) 
$33 

$5,7798 

AppPharm 
63323-66000 

10/C 
$1.13 

$340.5 
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5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 
Dublin, 
OH 43016 

Kendall 

2231·96016 
sOles 
$1.74 

$174.00 

Z-Medica 
969-150EA 

sOles 
$33.90 

$10,170.00 

8. Braun 

CB84386 
100les 

$0.27 
$1,350.00 

DMS 
506022M 

lEA 
$6.50 

$10,400 00 

Morrison Medical 

56-1200BK-9 

lEA 
$8.25 

$1,650.00 

Morrison Medical 

*1290 

lEA 
$9.25 

$740.00 

level Foods 

0030-37-Madarin Flavor 
36/CS sold in lots of 3EA or 

lPK 
$09367 

$2,81010 

West-Ward Pharma 

987510 
10/BX 

$2.12 
$8,360.00 

Hosplra 

0641142035 
400/CS 

$243 

$4,15530 

Sagent Pharma 
303-05 
10tBX 
$1.30 

$390.00 

1690 New Britain Ave 

Farmington, 
GT 06034 

Covidlen 

85614 
Each 
$179 

$17900 

Z-Medica 

84794 
Each 

$36.00 
$10,800.00 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

Paddock 
80915 
Pkg/3 

-$3.666 
$10,998.00 

NOBID 

NO 810 

Hosplra 
87402 

Pkg/10 
*$0.999 
$29970 



Opened" April 30, 2014 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

For" Annual Contract fOf Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 

6100004347 

Item Description 

111 Stenia Water for injection, USP 25x5ml Single dose VlSls 
NDC 0517-3005-25; Amencan Regent; or approved equal 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 
Total 

112 t::Iandage Got-lexbOYU u- t::Ilue ANUUVt;.I-<; ;jf::iKlIC::l 

5200BL; NO SUBSTITUTiON 
Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (GOSA Net Price) 

Total 

113 l:iandage Gol-lex ;jXbYU LI- l:ilue ANUOVt:K ,l4KUG::> 
5300Bl; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

114 Tourniquet lx18 LF Orange Donovan Reorcler# NL T44250R 
Dawn Mist Ultra LFLatex Free 250EAJPK 4PKlCA; NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

115 Epinephrine 1:10,000 In) USP, (O.lmg/ml) 1mg per 10mL; 
NDC: 0548-3316-00; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

116 ::>odlum I:::!lcarbonate tl4"/o; ::>Umt:.q (1mt:.q)mL, with male luer 
lock adapter and 18-guage protected needle, NDC 0409-
6637-34 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

117 Uextrose OU"/O; lograms(U.og/mL) oUmL; with male luer lock 
adapter and 18-guage protected needle; NDC 0409-4902-34 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

118 CalCium 10%; 19ram(100mg/ml) represents 27mg 
(1.4mEq)c+/mL; Needless; NDC 0409-1631-10 NO 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

119 Naloxone Hydrochloride; (1 mg/mLl 2mg per 2mL; Needless, 
NDC 76329-3369-1 NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

120 ulazepam; 10mg/2ml(5mg/ml), Needless; NLJC:0409-1213-
32; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty. Per Case 

Price Each (GOSA Net Pnce) 
Total 

Midwest Medical Supply Co, Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC 
Inc 

SC 13400 Lakefront Drive 

Estimated Earth City, 
Annual MO 63045 

n, ,n". 386-252-9960 

300 

Amer Regen 
00517-30052 

25/C 
$3.3 

$1,002.0 

350 

Andove 

AND5200BL-03 
36/CS 
$1.2 

$437.5 

300 

Andove 

AND5300BL-02 

24/CS 
$1.5 

$462.0 

33,000 

DukaVDunova 

DONNl T 4425-0~ 

250/PK; 4PKlCS 

$0105 

$3,488.1 

4,000 

IMS 

IMS76329-3316-1 

10/C 
$3.76 

$15,040.0 

4,000 

Hospira 

A8B06637-3 

10/8 
$7.2 

$29,160.0 

4,000 

Hospira 

ABB04902-3 
10/C 

$11.1 

$44,720.0 

2,000 

Hospira 

ABB01631-1 
10lC 

$5.4 
$10,860.0 

6,000 

1M' 
IMS 76329-3369-1 

10lC 
$168 

$101,100.0 

1,500 

Hosplra 

00409-12733 

10/C 

$177 
$26,6100 
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5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 

Cublin, 
OH 43016 

Hospira 

0074488710 
400/CS 

$110 
$330.00 

Andover Healthcare 

12525BL 

36/GS 
$1.37 

$479.50 

Andover Healthcare 

12526BL 

24/CS 
$1.72 

$516.00 

Dukal 

1880-42515 
1000/CS sold in lots of 

1000EA or 1 case 

$0.131 

$4,323.00 

IMS Limited 

373316 

1EA 
$2.70 

$10,800.00 

Hospira 

376637 

50/CS 

$5.89 
$23,560.00 

Hospira 

0074490201 

50/CS 
$10.69 

$42,76000 

Hosplra 

371631 
1EA 

$8.50 
$17,000.00 

IMSLimited 

373369 

10/CS 
$14.96 

$89,760.00 

Hospira 

371104 
10/BX sold in lots of 

10EA or 1 box 

$12.633 
$18,949.50 

1690 New Britain Ave. 

Farmington, 
CT 06034 

NOBID 

Andover 

89947 

36/Case 

-$0.999 
$349.65 

Andover 

83095 

24/Case 

'$2.39 
$717.00 

NO BID 

IMS 

12536 

Each 

$4.99 

$19,960.00 

Hospira 

56192 

Each 

$5.99 

$23,96000 

Hospira 

56197 

Each 

$9.89 
$39,560.00 

IMS 

15645 
Each 

$5.15 
$10,300.00 

IMS 

11216 

Each 

$17.99 
$107,940.00 

Hospira 

87268 

Each 

$11.14 
$16,710.00 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Opened Apnl 30, 2014 

Fo, Annual Contract for MedIcal Supplies Non-Local Non-local Non-Local 
Midwest MedIcal Supply Co., Eloulld Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LlC 
Inc 

~6,-"",00"0"04",3q47'---_______________ --,-=-::=.SC"-,,--+.'~3:;40e:0,,,,L~ak~e"fco~n!!.' ~D,~;ve~_-lE'OOO Tuttle Crossing Blvd 1690 New Britain Ave 
Estimated Earth Crty, Dublin, Farmington, 

Item Description Annual MO 63045 OH 43016 CT 06034 
n, n'" 386-252-9960 

121 Morphine, lumg/ml, Needless;NUC:U4UY-l~Y~-Ul, NU 1,500 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 
Product # 
Qly. Per Case 

Price Each (GaSA Net Price) 

Total 

122 Atrophlne :::;ultate, lmg(U 1mg/mL) lUml; Needless; NUt,;" 4,000 
76329-3339-1, NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 
Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (CaSA Net Pnce) 

Total 

123 Meret Magnum Oxygen Regulator PN" EMSMREG8725-
B2D; 0-25 LPM EMS Oxygen Regulator CGA870, Barbed 
Outlet, 2 Diss Check Valves Cleaned for Oxygen Service 
M4L LifeTime Warranty; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

100 

124 :stethosope :Sprague Amencan LJlagnostlc L:orporatlon; Het 100 
641 AD$COPE 641 Size 22~ Black; NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

125 Backboard Ultra Plastic Short Color: Red Iron Duck with the 
logo ~San Antonio Fire 210·207·7744~:NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

10 

126 Backboard Ultra wf12 pin Color· yellow Iron Duck with the 260 
logo ~San Antonio Fire 210·207·7744~Product # 35900·P; 
NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 

Product # 
Qty Per Case 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

127 GylirlOer U Jumoo wlloggte valve Meret; NU 
SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg. Name 

Product # 
Oty Per Case 

Pnce Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

128 Blue Sensor, Adult Foam Electrode 48mm w/snap 25/pk, 
MFG Ambu Part # . ROOS25, NO SUBSTITUTION 

Mfg Name 
Product # 

Oty Per Case 
Price Each (COSA Net Price) 

Total 

81. Catalog Discount, Medical Supplies 
Percent of Discount Offered 

Catalog/Price list Title and/or Number 

Price Schedule Column on Which Ulscount IS ~ased 
(I e Distributor. Net. Wholesale, List) 

Date of Catalog/Pnce List 

82. Catalog Discount, Medical Equipment 
Percent of Discount Offered 

CatalogfPrice List Title and/or Number 
I-'nce ~Cheaule t....Olumn on VVhlCh viscount IS tsasea 
(I.e. Dlstnbutor, Net. Wholesale, List) 

Date of Catalog/Price List 

Payment Terms 

Total Award 
-Prices adjusted for evaluatIOn purposes 

50 

55,000 

Hospira 

00409·189301 

10/C 

$2.5' 
$3,825.0( 

IMS 
96329·3339·1 

10lC 
$376 

$15,040.0 

Mere 

MEPEMSMREG8725·B2D 

EA 
$114.5 

$11.455.0 

Hospira 

1893·01 

10fBX 

$2.05 

$3,07500 

IMS Limited 

371006 

10/PK 

$3.28 

$13,120.00 

Meret 

661294 

1EA 
$13090 

$13,09000 

Ameri Dia American Diagnostic Corp 

AME641B~ 540220 

EA 20/CS 

$7.6 $6,67 
$765.0 $66700 

Iron Duc 

IR035955~R·w/pnn 

Iron Duck 

265775R -+ logo 
1EA 

(Pricing is the backboard and 
logo) 

$65.4 $157.23 

$654.0 $1,572 30 

Iron Duc 

IR035900·P· 

Iron Duck 

265900PY -+ logo 
10A 

E (Pricing is the backboard and 

$154.0 $136.85 

$40,040.0 $35,581.00 

Mece Meret 

MEPK870MJD CRAK870MJDZ 

EA 1EA 
$76,0 $6749 

$3,8000 $3,37450 

Amb Ambu 

AMBR·OO·S/2 230026 

25/PK,40/CS 1000/CS 

$73 $744 

$405,9000 $409,20000 

20% 35% with exctusion letter 

EMS Product Catalog Bound Tree Medical Current 
Catalog or Website 

Sugg Lis List Pnce 

3/121201 
..... urrem 

(Bound Tree IS ready to 
release 2014-2015) Catalog 

20% 20% with exctuslOn letter 

EMS Product Catalog Hound 1 ree Medical Current 
Catalog or WebSIte 

Sugg LIs List Price 

3/12/201 
(Bound Tree is ready to 

release 2014·2015) Catalog 

1.5% 15 Days Net 30 

$1,686,741.7E Incomplete 
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Hosplra 

12112 

Boxt10 

-$210 
$3,150.00 

IMS 
15811 

Each 

$450 
$18,000.00 

Meret 

11002 

Each 

$137.00 

$13,700.00 

ADC 
70200 

Each 
$7.25 

$72500 

NOBID 

NO BID 

Meret 

95182 

Each 
$72 50 

$3,62500 

Ambu 
68738 

Pkg/25 
$899 

$494.45000 

15% 

www.mooremedlcal.com 
NfA 

NfA 

15% 

www mooremedical.com 
NfA 

NfA 

Net 30 

Incomplete 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 15, 2014 US Communities 

For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment 
Hertz Equipment Rental 
Corporation 

6100004840 AJ 668 North W.W. White Rd. 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX i'8219 
210·661-4281 

1 Trencher Walk Behind 
Make & Model Barreto E1324 or equivalent 
Price per Day $100.00 
Price per Week $200.00 
Price per Month $540.00 

2 Trencher Riding 
Make & Model D-W 3700 
Price per Day $240.00 
Price per Week $665.00 
Price per Month $1,560.00 

3 Loader Backhoe 
Make & Model Case 580M 
Price per Day $210.00 
Price per Week $520.00 
Price per Month $1,495.00 

4 Dump Truck 
Make & Model 
Price per Day $175.00 
Price per Week $590.00 
Price per Month $1,495.00 

5 Loader, Skid·Steer 
Make & Model Bobcat S130 
Price per Day $145.00 
Price per Week $325.00 
Price per Month $775.00 

6 Scissor Lift, 20' 
Make & Model Genie GS2032 
Price per Day $65.00 
Price per Week $135.00 
Price per Month $315.00 

7 Scissor Lift, 26' 
Make & Model Genie GS2632 
Price per Day $75.00 
Price per Week $150.00 
Price per Month $395.00 

8 Air Compressor Portable 
Make & Model Doosa 5WKU-TS 
Price per Day $55.00 
Price per Week $130.00 
Price per Month $400.00 

9 Jack Hammer 601b 
Make & Model Breaker 
Price per Day $25.00 
Price per Week $35.00 
Price per Month $85.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 7/18/2014 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 15, 2014 US Communities 

For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment 
Hertz Equipment Rental 
Corporation 

6100004840 AJ 668 North WW, White Rd, 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX 78219 
210··661-4281 

10 Jack Hammer 90lb 
Make & Model Breaker 
Price per Day $30.00 
Price per Week $45.00 
Price per Month $115.00 

11 Construction Forklift 
Make & Model Case 580G 
Price per Day $165.00 
Price per Week $435.00 
Price per Month $1,250.00 

12 8 Ton Roller 
Make & Model I-R SD-70D 
Price per Day $310.00 
Price per Week $805.00 
Price per Month $2,380.00 

13 3 Ton Roller 
Make & Model I-R DD-24 
Price per Day $105.00 
Price per Week $500.00 
Price per Month $990.00 

14 Dozer 
Make & Model Deere 550J 
Price per Day $320.00 
Price per Week $900.00 
Price per Month $2,480.00 

15 Dozer 
Make & Model Deere 650J 
Price per Day $335.00 
Price per Week $950.00 
Price per Month $2,995.00 

16 Track Excavator 
Make & Model Case CX225 
Price per Day $505.00 
Price per Week $1,500.00 
Price per Month $4,505.00 

17 Track Excavator 
Make & Model Case CX135 
Price per Day $390.00 
Price per Week $1,025.00 
Price per Month $3,210.00 

18 Water Truck 
Make & Model Chevy C7500 
Price per Day $200.00 
Price per Week $600.00 
Price per Month $1,565.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 7/18/2014 Page 2 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 15, 2014 US Communities 

For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment 
Her1z Equipment Rental 
Corporation 

6100004840 AJ 668 North W.w. White Rd. 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX 78219 
210··661-4281 

19 10 Ton Equipment Trailer 
Make & Model Anderson TA10TC 
Price per Day $90.00 
Price per Week $245.00 
Price per Month $740.00 

20 1 Ton Roller 
Make & Model I-RDD-12 
Price per Day $105.00 
Price per Week $500.00 
Price per Month $990.00 

21 11 Ton Roller 
Make & Model Bomag BW211D-4 
Price per Day $325.00 
Price per Week $900.00 
Price per Month $2,795.00 

22 Dump Truck 
Make & Model Ford F750 
Price per Day $175.00 
Price per Week $590.00 
Price per Month $1,495.00 

23 Ride on Trencher 
Make & Model D-W 3700 
Price per Day $240.00 
Price per Week $665.00 
Price per Month $1,560.00 

24 Track Excavator 
Make & Model Bobcat 325 
Price per Day $145.00 
Price per Week $385.00 

Price per Month $1,200.00 

25 Dump Truck 
Make & Model Freight M2 
Price per Day $420.00 
Price per Week $1,400.00 
Price per Month $3,195.00 

26 3 Yd Loader 
Make & Model Case 621D 
Price per Day $390.00 
Price per Week $1,300.00 
Price per Month $3,400.00 

27 1 Ton Wacker 
Make & Model I-RDD-12 
Price per Day $105.00 
Price per Week $500.00 
Price per Month $990.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 15, 2014 US Communities 

For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment 
Hertz Equipment Rental 
Corporation 

6100004840 AJ 668 North w.w. White Rd. 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX 78219 
210-661-4281 

28 Manlift 1 Towable Trailer 135' 
Make & Model JLG T350 
Price per Day $155.00 
Price per Week $465.00 
Price per Month $1,400.00 

29 Boom·125·4W Telescopic 
Make & Model Genie (FF) 
Price per Day $930.00 
Price per Week $2,655.00 
Price per Month $6,795.00 

30 8S' Boom Lift Diesel 4WD 
Make & Model JLG 860SJ 
Price per Day $410.00 
Price per Week $1,200.00 
Price per Month $3,795.00 

31 80' Boom Lift Diesel 4WD 
Make & Model Genie 580 
Price per Day $385.00 
Price per Week $1,050.00 
Price per Month $3,450.00 

32 SO' Boom Lift 
Make & Model Genie 560 or JLG 6005 
Price per Day $270.00 
Price per Week $615.00 
Price per Month $1,999.00 

33 Chipping Hammer 13·18# Air/Retainer 
Make & Model Kent KCB-3, I-R W1A1 
Price per Day $30.00 
Price per Week $75.00 
Price per Month $150.00 

Delivery/Pick up Charge for Rental Equipment $60.00 per hour port to port 

Payment Terms Net 30 
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