LOC
2/12/15
Item No. 7

ANORDINANCE 2 015-02-12-0079

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $1,163,000.00: (A) FORTILINE WATERWORKS
AND EJ FOR MANHOLE RINGS, COVERS AND GRATES, (B) U.S.
STANDARD SIGNS AND VULCAN, INC. D/B/A VULCAN
ALUMINUM/VULCAN SIGNS FOR ALUMINUM SIGNS, (C) SAT
RADIO COMMUNICATIONS, LTD D/B/A INDUSTRIAL
COMMUNICATIONS FOR FIRE DECAL  STRIPING, (D)
STRUCTURAL AND STEEL PRODUCTS FOR FLEX BEAMS AND
GUARD POSTS, AND (E) CHEMSEARCH, A DIVISION OF NCH
CORPORATION, FOR WATER TREATMENT SERVICES &
CHEMICALS FOR VARIOUS BESD LOCATIONS.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Fortiline
Waterworks and EJ for manhole rings, covers and grates, (b) U.S. Standard Signs and Vulcan,
Inc. d/b/a Vulcan Aluminum/Vulcan Signs for aluminum signs, (¢) SAT Radio Communications,
Ltd d/b/a Industrial Communications for fire decal striping, (d) Structural and Steel Products for
flex beams and guard posts, and (¢) Chemsearch, a division of NCH Corporation, for water
treatment services & chemicals for various BESD locations; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves six low bid contracts and one contract procured utilizing
cooperative purchasing; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (a) Fortiline
Waterworks and EJ for manhole rings, covers and grates, (b) U.S. Standard Signs and Vulcan,
Inc. d/b/a Vulcan Aluminum/Vulcan Signs for aluminum signs, (¢) SAT Radio Communications,
Ltd d/b/a Industrial Communications for fire decal striping, (d) Structural and Steel Products for
flex beams and guard posts, and (e) Chemsearch, a division of NCH Corporation, for water
treatment services & chemicals for various BESD locations on an annual contract basis as shown
on the attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the
deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The
bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit 1.
Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the
Finance Department.
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SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2015 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals.

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 12" day of February, 2015.

st

M A Y O R
Ivy R. Taylor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

: Ety/Clerk/ Martha G. Sepeda, Acﬁng{}:ity Attorney

LA

.V




City Of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened December 8, 2014

For Annual Contract for Manhole Rings, Covers and Grates
LOCAL NON-LOCAL
EJ Fortiline Waterworks
12019-B Nacogdoches 3011 North Pan Am
6100005015 AJ Rd Expy
ESTIMATED |San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description ANNUAL [TX 78217 TX 78219
QUANTITY |210-946-3224 210-444-11 &

| Manhole Rings

A EJIW Part # 00184611
31/2“HT, 17" CO, 184621 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00184611f| EJIW Part # 00184611
Unit Price $153.15) $135.14
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $153.15) $135.14
Extended Price $3,828.75] $3,378.50
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $450.25)
EJIW Part # 00184621

B UND HL1 CV, 1846C 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00184621|| EJIW Part # 00184621
Unit Price $117.80 $103.94
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $117.80 $103.94
Extended Price $2,945.00] $2,598.50
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $346.50
EJIW Part # 35552510

C M53 CHN LK JUST STM DR ASY (STORM/DRAIN) 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 35552510 EJIW Part # 35552510
Unit Price $164.93)f $145.53
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%,
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $164.93] $145.53
Extended Price $4,123.25) $3,638.25
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $485.00
EJIW Part # 35152510

D M53 CHN LK STM DRN CV 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 35152510 EJIW Part # 35152510
Unit Price $84.76) $74.79
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $84.76 $74.79
Extended Price $2,119.00] $1,869.75)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%]
Price differential $249.25)
EJIW Part # 31164803

E 275 24 TF UND CPH2 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00275021f| EJIW Part # 00275021
Unit Price $245.85) $216.93)
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $245.85) $216.93|
Extended Price $6,146.25| $5,423.25
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $723.00
EJIW Part # 00202351
2923A UND SAN SW 300-24 2/EJIW CV (SANITARY

F SEWER) 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00202351 EJIW Part # 00202351
Unit Price $229.58, $202.56
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $229.58, $202.56
Extended Price $5,739.50 $5,064.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%
Price differential $675.50
EJIW Part # 41342949
V1342 UND 2PB TY4A SN SW R/0 134221 (SANITARY

G SEWER) 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00134221f| EJIW Part # 00134221
Unit Price $196.35 $173.25
Prompt Payment Discount 0%, 0%)]
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $196.35 $173.25
Extended Price $4,908.75 $4,331.25
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%
Price differential $577.50
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City Of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened December 8, 2014

For Annual Contract for Manhole Rings, Covers and Grates
LOCAL NON-LOCAL
EJ Fortiline Waterworks
6100005015 A 12019-B Nacogdoches |3011 North Pan Am
Rd Expy
ESTIMATED [San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description ANNUAL |TX 78217 TX 78219
QUANTITY [210-946-3224 210-444-1199

EJIW Part # 00134311

H 1342Z2 UND RING 5" 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00134311 EJIW Part # 00134311
Unit Price $129.60 $114.35]
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%,
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $129.60 $114.35|
Extended Price $3,240.00 $2,858.75)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $381.25
EJIW Part # 00185457
1854C1 STM SA SCALE LO R/O 185465

| COSA/TEXAS LOGO (STORM DRAIN) 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00185465) EJIW Part # 00185465
Unit Price $115.86 $102.23f
Prompt Payment Discount o%l 0%}
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $115.86 $102.23
Extended Price $2,896.50 $2,555.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $340.75
EJIW Part # 00185411

J 1854Z UND REV RING TXDOT 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00185411} EJIW Part # 00185411
Unit Price $115.86 $102.23]
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $115.86 $102.23
Extended Price $2,896.50 $2,555.75)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $340.75
Total for Item 1 SSG,MS.SOW $34,273.75(

[} Inlet Grates & Frames
EJIW Part # 45754010

A V5754 UND FRAME 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 45754010 EJIW Part # 45754010
Unit Price $179.99 $158.81
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $179.99 $158.81
Extended Price $4,499.75) $3,970.25|
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%j
Price differential $529.50
EJIW Part # 45754030

B V5754 UND GR W/1.5 SLT R/O 45754130 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 45754130 EJIW Part # 45754130
Unit Price $323.69 $285.61
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $323.69 $285.61
Extended Price $8,092.25 $7,140.25]
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $952.00
EJIW Part # 45752010

Cc V5752 UND FRAME 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 45752010)] EJIW Part # 45752010
Unit Price $93.59| $82.59)
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $93.59 $82.59|
Extended Price $2,339.75) $2,064.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $275.00)
EJIW Part # 45752030

D V5752 UND GRATE 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 45752030) EJIW Part # 45752030
Unit Price $179.53 $158.41
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $179.53 $158.41
Extended Price $4,488.25| $3,960.25
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $528.00)
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City Of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened December 8, 2014

For Annual Contract for Manhole Rings, Covers and Grates
LOCAL NON-LOCAL
EJ Fortiline Waterworks
12019-B Nacogdoches 3011 North Pan Am
6100005015 AJ Rd Expy
ESTIMATED |San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description ANNUAL  [TX 78217 TX 78219
QUANTITY |210-946-3224 210-444-1199

EJIW Part # 45724010

E V5724 UND FRAME 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 45724010f| EJIW Part # 45724010
Unit Price $74.66) $65.88
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $74.66) $65.88
Extended Price $1,866.50) $1,647.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)]
Price differential $219.50
EJIW Part # 45724130
V5724-1 UND DNW TROUT LO GR R/O 431 DUMP NO

F WASTE! DRAINS TO WATERWAYS TROUT LOGO 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 45724431|| EJIW Part # 45724431
Unit Price $114.04 $100.63
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $114.04] $100.63
Extended Price $2,851.00| $2,515.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $335.25
EJIW Part # 45753030

G V5752 UND GRATE 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 45752030 EJIW Part # 45753030
Unit Price $179.53] $158.38
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $179.53] $158.38]
Extended Price $4,488.25) $3,959.50|
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%
Price differential $528.75)
EJIW Part # 5055M1

H 35" x 18" 350
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00505531 EJIW Part # 00505531
Unit Price $241.76 $213.32
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $241.76 $213.32]
Extended Price $84,616.00) $74,662.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $9,954.00
Total for Item 2 $113,241.75) $99,919.75|

mn |Manhole Covers
EJIW Part # 00184629
1846C SAN ANT NO DMP LO HL1 CV
COSA (FISH LOGO)
NO BASURA! NO DUMPING

A DRAINS TO WATERWAY 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00184629|| EJIW Part # 00184629
Unit Price $117.80 $103.94
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%]
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $117.80 $103.94
Extended Price $2,945.00 $2,598.50
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%]
Price differential $346.50
EJIW Part # 35104202

B 104L LK STM DRN CV R/O 00303400 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00303427|| EJIW Part # 00303427
Unit Price $98.18 $86.63||
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $98.18| $86.63|
Extended Price $2,454.50] $2,165.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $288.75
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City Of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened December 8, 2014

For Annual Contract for Manhole Rings, Covers and Grates
LOCAL NON-LOCAL
EJ Fortiline Waterworks
6100005015 A 12019-B Nacogdoches |3011 North Pan Am
Rd Expy
ESTIMATED |[San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Description ANNUAL [Tx 78217 TX 78219
QUANTITY |210-946-3224 210-444-1199

EJIW Part # 41600120

Cc V1600-1 UND CPH2 CV 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 41600120 EJIW Part # 41600120
Unit Price $106.97 $94.39
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $106.97 $94.39(
Extended Price $2,674.25 $2,359.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $314.50
EJIW Part # 35102109
102L NL BASS STM DRN LO CV BH 184L
STORM DRAIN/DUMP NO WASTE!

D BASS LOGO 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 35102109 EJIW Part # 35102109'
Unit Price $113.09 $99.79
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $113.09( $99.79
Extended Price $2,827.25 $2,494.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $332.50
EJIW Part # 00303408
3034 LK SAN ANTONIO NO DUMP LO CV
COSA/FISH LOGO
NO BASURA! NO DUMPING

E DRAIN TO WATERWAYS 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00303408 EJIW Part # 00303408||
Unit Price $112.90 $99.61
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $112.90 $99.61
Extended Price $2,822.50 $2,490.25
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%
Price differential $332.25
EJIW Part # 00303428
3034 NO LK SAN ANTONIO NO DUMP LO
COSA/ FISH LOGO
NO BASURA! NO DUMPING

F DRAIN TO WATERWAYS 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00303428 EJIW Part # 00303428
Unit Price $98.18 $86.63|
Prompt Payment Discount 0%, 0%]
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $98.18, $86.63
Extended Price $2,454.50 $2,165.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $288.75
EJIW Part # 00295522

G 2955A FACTORY DIR INT ACI CONST CV 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00295522 EJIW Part # 00295522
Unit Price $199.97 $176.45
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $199.97| $176.45
Extended Price ) $4,999.25 $4,411.25|
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $588.00
EJIW Part # 00185558
1855A SAN ANTONIO NO DUMPING LO CV
COSA
NO BASURA! NO DUMPING

H DRAIN TO WATERWAYS (FISH LOGO) 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00185558) EJIW Part # 00185558
Unit Price $170.71 $150.63]
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $170.71 $150.63
Extended Price $4,267.75) $3,765.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $502.00
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City Of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened December 8, 2014

For Annual Contract for Manhole Rings, Covers and Grates
LOCAL NON-LOCAL
EJ Fortiline Waterworks
6100005015 A ;2019-8 Nacogdoches |3011 North Pan Am
d Expy
ESTIMATED |San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description ANNUAL |TX 78217 TX 78219
QUANTITY |210-946-3224 210-444-1199

EJIW Part # 41339129
V1339-1 SAN ANTO NO DMP LO PB2 CV
COSA (FISH LOGO)
NO BASURA! NO DUMPING

| DRAIN TO WATERWAYS 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 41339129 EJIW Part # 41339129
Unit Price $310.40 $273.89
Prompt Payment Discount 0%)| 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $310.40 $273.89
Extended Price $7,760.00| $6,847.25)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $912.75]
EJIW Part # 00197529
1975A CPH2 SAN SW CV

J SANITARY SEWER 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00197529 EJIW Part # 00197529
Unit Price $297.96| $262.90)
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $297.96 $262.90)
Extended Price $7,449.00 $6,572.50)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%,
Price differential $876.50
EJIW Part # 00370524

K 3705C HL11 DRN CV 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00370524]] EJIW Part # 00370524}
Unit Price $215.73] $190.35)
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%)]
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $215.73| $190.35
Extended Price $5,393.25 $4,758.75)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $634.50)
EJIW Part # 00185465
1854C3 UND HL1 NO DUMP SAN ANT TCI
NO BASURA! NO DUMPING
DRAIN TO WATERWAYS

L COSA 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00185465| EJIW Part # 00185465
Unit Price $115.86) $102.23)
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $115.86 $102.23
Extended Price $2,896.50 $2,555.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%]
Price differential $340.75
EJIW Part # 00370524

M 3705C HL1 DRN CV 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00370524|| EJIW Part # 00370524
Unit Price $215.73 $190.35
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $215.73) $190.35
Extended Price $5,393.25 $4,758.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $634.50)
EJIW Part # 00185465
1854C3 UND HL1 NO DUMP SAN ANT TCI
NO BASURA! NO DUMPING
DRAIN TO WATERWAYS

N COSA 25
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00185465 EJIW Part # 00185465
Unit Price $115.86)| $102.20
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%,
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $115.86 $102.20
Extended Price $2,896.50) $2,555.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $341.50
Total for Item 3 557.233.50| $50,499.75)
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City Of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened December 8, 2014

For Annual Contract for Manhole Rings, Covers and Grates
LOCAL NON-LOCAL
EJ Fortiline Waterworks
12019-B Nacogdoches |3011 North Pan Am
6100005015 AJ Rd Expy
ESTIMATED |San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description ANNUAL [TXx 78217 TX 78219
QUANTITY [210-946-3224 210-444-1199
v Manhole Risers
EJIW Part # M
ADJ RG 24-26DIA, 1=-2THK, 1-2 RISE TY7
A FOR COVER 24"-26" DIA, 1"-2" THK
RISE 1"-2"
NON-EXPANDABLE 100
EJIW EJIW
Brand quoting and part number Part #M724-261-212 Part #M724-261-212|
Unit Price $264.95 $233.78
Prompt Payment Discount 0%| O%I
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $264.95 $233.78
Extended Price $26,495.00] $23,378.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%]
Price differential $3,117.00
Total for item 4 $26,495.00|( $23,378.00|
v Lockable Manhole Covers
EJIW Part # 1000058
A 23 1 % NON LOCKING COVER MARKED STORM 125
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00100058} EJIW Part # 00100058
Unit Price $313.38 $276.51
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%)
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $313.38 $276.51
Extended Price $39,172.50 $34,563.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%|
Price differential $4,608.75
EJIW Part # 41418240A01
B 23 x 1% LOCKABLE MANHOLE COVER 125
EJIW| EJIW
Brand quoting and part number Part # 41418240A01 Part # 41418240A01||
Unit Price $245.96 $217.00
Prompt Payment Discount O%I 0%)}
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $245.96 $217.00
Extended Price $30,745.00 $27,125.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%]
Price differential $3,620.00
EJIW Part # 291026
C 23 x % NON LOCKING COVER MARKED STORM 125
Brand quoting and part number EJIW Part # 00291026) EJIW Part # 00291026
Unit Price $1 MAOZH $127.08|
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $144.02 $127.08|
Extended Price $18,002.50 $15,885.00)
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $2,117.50
EJIW Part # 00185480A01
D 255/8 x 1% LOCKABLE MANHOLE COVER 250
EJIW EJIW|
Brand quoting and part number Part # 00185480A01 Part # 00185480A01
Unit Price $237.69 $209.73
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $237.69 $209.73(|
Extended Price $59,422.50 $52,432.50
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%]
Price differential $6,990.00
EJIW Part # 35102116A01
E 18-7/8" x 7/8 LOCKING MANHOLE COVER 400
EJIW EJIW
Brand quoting and part number Part # 35102116A01 Part # 35102116A01
Unit Price $185.98 $164.10
Prompt Payment Discount 0%, 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $185.98 $164.10
Extended Price $74,392.00 $65,640.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%]
Price differential $8,752.00
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City Of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened December 8, 2014

For Annual Contract for Manhole Rings, Covers and Grates
LOCAL NON-LOCAL
EJ Fortiline Waterworks
12019-B Nacogdoches |3011 North Pan Am
6100005015 AJ Rd Expy
. ESTIMATED |San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description ANNUAL [TX 78217 TX 78219
QUANTITY |210-946-3224 210-444-1199
EJIW Part # 00184650A01
F 17-7/8" x 1" LOCKING MANHOLE COVER 350

EJIW EJIW
Brand quoting and part number Part # 00184650A01 Part # 00184650A01
Unit Price $275.09| $242.73
Prompt Payment Discount 0%) 0%,
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $275.09 $242.73
Extended Price $96,281.50 $84,955.50
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 13%)
Price differential $11,326.00
Total for Item 5 $318,016.00, 2 7!
Tooling charge for change of artwork on material (One time $5,000.00) No Bid

Vi charge)
Delivery 21 days| 7 to 28 days
Payment Terms Net 30| Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $488,673.00
|Estimated Annual Award 35!000.00! $488,673.00)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs
Non-Local Non-Local
Vulcan Inc., d/b/a Vulcan|U.S Standard Sign
Aluminum/
Vulcan Signs 11400 W. Addison Ave.
6100005216 DS 400 East Berry Ave.
Item Description Estimated |Foley, Franklin Park,
Annual |AL 36535 IL 60131
Quantities |888-846-2745 847-447-2236
1 24" Octagonal (Stop), .080" thickness, Wt. 3.74# 2,000
Unit Price $7.74 $7.94
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $7.78
Extended Price $15,480.00 $15,562.40
2 30" Octagonal (Stop), .080" thickness, Wt. 5.84# 1,200
Unit Price $12.08 $12.42
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $12.17
Extended Price $14,496.00 $14,605.92
3 36" Octagonal (Stop), .100" thickness, Wt. 10.52 # 200
Unit Price $21.77 $22.34
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $21.89
Extended Price $4,354.00 $4,378.64
4 30" Square (A) /Diamond,.080" thickness, Wt. 7.03# 1,500
Unit Price $13.00 $13.32
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $13.05
Extended Price $19,500.00 $19,580.40
5 36"Circle, .100" thickness, Wt. 9.94# 300
Unit Price $21.37 $24.99
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $24.49
Extended Price $6,411.00 $7,347.06
6 36" Pentagon, .100" thickness, Wt. 9.50# 900
Unit Price $21.10 $22.65
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $22.20
Extended Price | $18,990.00 $19,977.30
7 18" x 18" Square A/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 2.53# 800
Unit Price $4.85 $4.79
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $4.69
Extended Price $3,880.00, $3.755 ggl
8 9" x 12" Horizontal Rectangle, .080" thickness 500
Unit Price $1.82 $1.95
Prompt Payment Discount ’ 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $1.91
Extended Price $910.00 $955.50
9 9" x 24" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 2.64# 3,000
Unit Price $5.00 $5.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $4.90
Extended Price $15,000.00 $14,700.00
10 9" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.30# 3,000
Unit Price $6.28 $6.24
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $6.12
Extended Price $18,840.00 $18,345.60
11 9" x 36" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.96# 2,000
Unit Price $7.36 $7.50
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $7.35
Extended Price $14,720.00 $14,700.00
12 9" x 42" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 4.62# 1,500
Unit Price $8.93 $8.74
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $8.57
Extended Price $13,395.00 $12.847.80]

Prepared by Purchasing 1/6/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs
Non-Local Non-Local
Vulean Inc., d/b/a Vulcan|U.S Standard Sign
Aluminum/
Vulcan Signs 11400 W. Addison Ave.
6100005216 DS 400 East Berry Ave.
Item Description Estimated (Foley, Franklin Park,
Annual (AL 36535 IL 60131
Quantities |888-846-2745 847-447-2236
13 9" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 5.28# 1,500
Unit Price $9.82 $10.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $9.80
Extended Price $14,730.00 $14,700.00
14 9" x 54" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 5.94# 1,000
Unit Price $11.26 $11.24
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $11.02
Extended Price $11,260.00 $11.015.20
15 12" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125 thickness 3,000
Unit Price $7.93 $8.34
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $8.17
Extended Price $23,790.00, $24,519.60
16 18" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 3.38# 3,000
Unit Price $6.08 $6.39
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $6.26
Extended Price $18,240.00 $18,786.60
17 18" x 60" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 13.19# 100
Unit Price $24.22 $26.74
Prompt Payment Discount $0.02
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $26.21
Extended Price $2,422.00 $2,620.52
18 18" x 72" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 15.83# 100
Unit Price $29.05 $32.06
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $31.42
Extended Price $2,905.00 $3,141.88
19 24" x 30 Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 5.63# 1,000
Unit Price $10.28 $10.67
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $10.46
Extended Price $10,280.00 $10,456.60
20 6" x 18 Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 84# 300
Unit Price $1.76 $1.95
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $1.91
Extended Price $528.00 $573.30
21 30" x 36" Rectangle, .080 thickness, Wt. 10.55# 1,000
Unit Price $15.63 $15.99
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $15.67
Extended Price $15,630.00 $15,670.20
22 15" x 72" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 13.19# 200
Unit Price $23.70 $27.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $26.46
Extended Price $4,740.00 $5,292.00
23 15" x 60" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 10.99# 200
Unit Price $19.57 $22.49
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $22.04
Extended Price $3,914.00 $4,408.04
24 15" x 48" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 8.79# 200
Unit Price $15.63 $17.99
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $17.63
Extended Price $3.126.00) $3,526.04

Prepared by Purchasing 1/6/2015




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs
Non-Local Non-Local
Vulean Inc., d/b/a Vulcan|U.S Standard Sign
Aluminum/
Vulcan Signs 11400 W. Addison Ave.
6100005216 DS 400 East Berry Ave.
Item Description Estimated |Foley, Franklin Park,
Annual |AL 36535 IL 60131
Quantities [888-846-2745 847-447-2236
25 5" x 7 3/4 " Vertical Rectangle, .060" thickness, Wt. .24# 1,000
Unit Price $0.69 $1.25
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $1.23
Extended Price $690.00 $1,225.00
26 12" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6# 500
Unit Price $6.40 $6.39
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $6.26
Extended Price $3,200.00 $3.131.10
27 24" x 24" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 4.5# 500
Unit Price $8.27 $8.53
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $8.36
Extended Price $4,135.00 $4,179.70
28 24" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6.75# 500
Unit Price $12.58 $12.78
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $12.52
Extended Price $6,290.00( ___________ $6.262.20
29 36" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle ©,.080" thickness, Wt. 13.5# 500
Unit Price $25.03 $25.59
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $25.08
Extended Price $12,515.00 $12,539.10
30 36" x 36" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 10.13# 500
Unit Price $18.76 $19.19
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $18.81
Extended Price $9,380.00 $9,403.10
31 12" x 18" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 1.69# 500
Unit Price $3.09 $3.34
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $3.27
Extended Price $1,545.00 $1,636.60
32 20" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 5.63# 500
Unit Price $10.51 $11.24
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $11.02
Extended Price $5,255.00 $5,507.60
33 24" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle Vertical Rectangle ©, .100" 500
Unit Price $20.70 $21.31
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $20.88
Extended Price $10,350.00 $10,441.90
34 30" x 60" Horizontal Rectangle Vertical Rectangle ©, .100" 500
Unit Price $32.74 $33.31
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $32.64
Extended Price $16,370.00 $16.321.90
35 36" Equilateral Triangle, .100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500
Unit Price $11.32 $13.52
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $13.25
Extended Price $5,660.00 $6,760.00
36 48 x 60" Vertical Rectangle, .100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500
Unit Price $51.59 $53.31
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $52.24
Extended Price $25,795.00) $26,655.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Aluminum Signs
Non-Local Non-Local
Vulean Inc., d/b/a Vulcan|U.S Standard Sign
Aluminum/
Vulcan Signs 11400 W. Addison Ave.
6100005216 DS 400 East Berry Ave.
Item Description Estimated |Foley, Franklin Park,
Annual [AL 36535 IL 60131
Quantities |888-846-2745 847-447-2236
37 R1-1, 30 inch x 30 inch - Sign, Stop 1,000
Unit Price $21.55 No Bid
Extended Price $21,550.00
38 S1-1, 36 inch X 36 inch - Sign, School 1,000
Unit Price $49.95 No Bid
Extended Price $49,950.00
39 SW 16-9P, 24 inch x 12 inch - Sign, Ahead 750
Unit Price $10.58 No Bid
Extended Price $7,935.00
40 S7-1T, 24 inch x 18 inch - Sign, Cell Phone Use Prohibited 1,000
Unit Price $13.10 No Bid
Extended Price $13,100.00
41 S5-1, 24 inch x 18 inch - Sign, School Speed Limit XX When 1,000
Unit Price $36.86 No Bid
Extended Price $36,860.00
42 S6-1T (20 mph), 84 inch x 36 inch - Sign, School Speed Limit 400
Unit Price $145.24 No Bid
Extended Price $58,096.00
43 SW16-7P, 24 inch x 12 inch - Sign, Diagonal Arrow 750
Unit Price $10.58 No bid
Extended Price $7,935.00
44 S$5-2aTP, 24 inch x 10 inch - Sign, End School Zone 1,000
Unit Price $7.70 No bid
Extended Price $7,700.00
45 12" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness 500
Unit Price No Bid $4.25
Extended Price $2,125.00
46 10" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness 500
Unit Price No Bid $3.74
Extended Price $1.870.00
Delivery 30 days 30 days
Payment Terms Net 30 2% 10 days
Estimated Annual Total $561,852.00 $334,862.78
Estimated Annual Award $444,167.00 $119,774.16

Prepared by Purchasing 1/6/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 24, 2014
For: Annual Contract For Fire Decal Striping LOCAL
SAT Radio Communications, LTD
d/b/a Industrial Communications
6100005185 LM 1019 East Euclid Ave
San Antonio,
Item Description Estimated Annual |Tx 78212
Quantity 210-226-3682
1 Ford and Dodge Vehicle Graphic Kits and 3
Installation
2006 (or newer) Ford F-250, 350, Dodge 2500,
3500 4x4 Crew Cab Pick-up LWB — First
Responder
Unit Price Each Kit
Total Price
2 Chevrolet, Ford, Dodge Vehicle Graphic 2
Kits and Installation
2006 (or newer) Chevrolet Suburban,
Ford F250, F350, Dodge 2500, 3500 Crew Cab-
Incident Commander
Unit Price Each Kit
Total Price
3 Ford F150 and Rangers Vehicle Graphic 2
Kits and Installation
2008 (or newer) Ford F150 and Rangers -
Admin Vehicle
Unit Price Each Kit
Total Price
4 EMS Command Unit Vehicle Graphic Kits 2
and Installation
2006 (or newer) Ford or Dodge
Unit Price Each Kit
Total Price
5 Technical Rescue Vehicle Graphic Kits and 2
Installation
2006 (or newer) Ford or Dodge
Unit Price Each Kit
Total Price
6 SAFD Shield Individual Graphics and 12

Installation

Size: 12 3/8"W x 15" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

$912.00
$2,736.00

$912.00]
$1,824.00

$512.00]
$1,024.00

$789.00
$1,578.00

$912.00
$1,824.00

$30.00,
$360.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

For:

6100005185

November 24, 2014

Annual Contract For Fire Decal Striping

LM

LOCAL

Item

Description

Estimated Annual
Quantity

SAT Radio Communications, LTD
d/b/a Industrial Communications
1019 East Euclid Ave

San Antonio,

TX 78212

210-226-3682

10

11

12

13

Star of Life Individual Graphics and
Installation

Size: 12W x12"Hor9 %2"Wx 9 2" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Our Family Protecting Your Family
Individual Graphics and Installation

Size: 10 "W x 9 %"Hor 77 W x 6 %" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Ghost Decal - Individual Graphics and
Installation

Size: 52" W x 4.5" Hx 52" L
(5 Right side and 5 Left side)

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Chevron - Individual Graphics and
Installation

Size: 4" yellow stripe x 3" red stripe

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Hazmat - Individual Graphics and
Installation

Size: 12 3/8"W x 15" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Fire Dept (Black) — Individual Graphics and
Installation

Size: 12 3/8"W x 15" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Fire Technical Rescue - Individual Graphics
and Installation

Size: 12 3/8"W x 15" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

12

12

10

$30.00
$360.00

$30.00
$360.00

$165.00]
$1,650.00

$750.00
$1,500.00

$30.00
$180.00,

$30.00
$180.00

$30.00
$180.00)




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

For:

6100005185

November 24, 2014

Annual Contract For Fire Decal Striping

LM

LOCAL

Item

Description

Estimated Annual
Quantity

SAT Radio Communications, LTD
d/b/a Industrial Communications
1019 East Euclid Ave

San Antonio,

TX 78212

210-226-3682

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

Gold Striping = Individual Graphics and
Installation

Size: 4" Wide

Unit Price Each Foot
Total Price

Red Striping = Individual Graphics and
Installation

Size: 3" Wide

Unit Price Each Foot
Total Price

2” Numbers Black (0 = 9) = Individual
Graphics and Installation

Size: 2"Hx 1 1/4" W
(Any combination as needed)

Unit Price Each
Total Price

2” Numbers White (0 = 9) Individual
Graphics and Installation

Size: 2"Hx 11/14" W
(Any combination as needed)

Unit Price Each
Total Price

SAFD Shield Individual Graphics Only
Size: 12 3/8"W x 15" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Star of Life Individual Graphics Only
Size: 12"Wx12"Hor9 2”Wx 9 %" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Our Family Protecting Your Family
Individual Graphics Only

Size: 10 4" Wx 9 %" Hor7”W x 6 %" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

50

50

400

50

$22.50
$1,125.00

$22.50
$1,125.00

$1.65
$660.00]

$1.65]
$82.50

$25.00
$125.00

$25.00
$125.00

$25.00
$125.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

For:

6100005185

November 24, 2014

Annual Contract For Fire Decal Striping

LM

LOCAL

Item

Description

Estimated Annual
Quantity

SAT Radio Communications, LTD
d/b/a Industrial Communications
1019 East Euclid Ave

San Antonio,

TX 78212

210-226-3682

21

22

23

24

25

Hazmat - Individual Graphics Only
Size: 12 3/8"W x 15" H
Unit Price Each

Total Price

Fire Dept (Black) - Individual Graphics Only
Size: 12 3/8" W x 15" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Fire Technical Rescue = Individual Graphics
Only

Size: 12 3/8"W x 15" H

Unit Price Each
Total Price

2” Numbers Black (0 = 9) = Individual
Graphics Only

Size: 2"Hx 1 1/4"W
(Any combination as needed)

Unit Price Each
Total Price

2” Numbers White (0 = 9) Individual
Graphics Only

Size:2"Hx 11/14"W
(Any combination as needed)

Unit Price Each
Total Price

Payment Terms

Estimated Annual Total

5

100

50

$25.00
$125.00

$25.00
$125.00

$25.00
$125.00]

$1.50]
$150.00

$1.5
$75.00

Net 30

$17,723.50]

Estimated Annual Award

$17,723.50|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 17, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Flex Beams and Guard Posts Non-Local
Structural & Steel Products
6100005411 AJ|1320 South University Drive
Fort Worth,
Estimated |TXx 76110
Item Description Quantity |[g1 7-332-7417
Section |
1 Flex Beam Sections
Unit Price 120 $90.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $89.55
Extended Price $10,746.00
2 Terminal Anchor Sections
Unit Price 10 $250.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $248.75
Extended Price $2,487.50
3 Terminal Anchor Posts
Unit Price 10 $110.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $107.80
Extended Price $1,078.00
<+ Wood Dome Guard Post 7"X6'
Unit Price 500 $22.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $21.89
Extended Price $10,945.00
5 15/8 X 10" Guard Rail Bolt
Unit Price 700 $1.75
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1.74
Extended Price $1,218.00
6 |5/8 X 18" Guard Rail Bolt
Unit Price 600 $2.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1.99
Extended Price $1,194.00
T Terminal Anchor Rail, 12 Gauge
Unit Price 100 $150.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $149.25
Extended Price $14,925.00
8 Flared End Terminal
Unit Price 15 $25.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $24.88
Extended Price $373.13
9 Bridge Shoe Terminal
Unit Price 10 $50.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $49.75
Extended Price $497.50
Prepared by Purchasing 1/14/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 17, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Flex Beams and Guard Posts Non-Local
Structural & Steel Products
6100005411 AJ|1320 South University Drive
Fort Worth,
Estimated (Tx 76110
Item Description Quantity [817-332-7417
10 |Buffer End Section
Unit Price 10 $50.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $49.75
Extended Price $497.50
11 |3/4 End Terminal
Unit Price 10 $100.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.50%
Unit Price with Prompt Payment Discount $99.50
Extended Price $995.00

Payment Terms 1/2% 10 days

Estimated Annual Total $44,956.63

Estimated Annual Award $44,956.63
Prepared by Purchasing 1/14/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 21, 2014 Non Local
For: Annual Contract for Water Treatment Services and
Chemicals for Various BESD Locations Chemsearch a Division of NCH Corporation
6100005330 JF 2727 Chemsearch Blvd.
Estimated (Iving.
Item Description Annual [TX 75062
Usage |972-438-0563
A Annual Service
1 Emergency Operations Center (EOC) 4
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each $160.00]
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00
Price Total $576.00]
2 Public Safety Tech Center (PSTC) 4
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each $160.00,
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00
Price Total $576.00
3 Public Safety Tech Center (PSTC) 4
Boiler - Quarterly Service
Price Each No charge|
Buyboard Discount
Extended Price
Price Total
3A Emergency Dispatch Center (PSAP) 4
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each $160.00
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00
Price Total $576.00
4 City Hall 4
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each $160.00]
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00]
Price Total $576.00]
5 City Hall 4
Boiler - Quarterly Service
Price Each No charge
Buyboard Discount
Extended Price
Price Total
6 Cliff Morton Development Business Service Center (One Stop) 4
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each $160.00
Buyboard Discount 10.00%!
Extended Price $144.00]
Price Total $576.00
g Municipal Plaza Building 26
Open Loop - Biweekly Service
Price Each $160.00
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00]
Price Total $3,744.00|
8 Municipal Plaza Building 4
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each No charge|
Buyboard Discount
Extended Price
Price Total
9 Municipal Plaza Building 4
Boiler - Quarterly Service
Price Each No charge
Buyboard Discount
Extended Price
Price Total

Prepared by Purchasing 1/13/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100005330

November 21, 2014

Annual Contract for Water Treatment Services and

Chemicals for Various BESD Locations

JF

Non Local

Item

Description

Estimated
Annual
Usage

Chemsearch a Division of NCH Corporation
2727 Chemsearch Bivd.

Irving,

TX 75062

972-438-0563

10

1

19

Municipal Courts (Frank D. Wing) Building
Open Loop - Biweekly Service

Price Each

Buyboard Discount

Extended Price

Price Total

Municipal Courts (Frank D. Wing) Building
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service

Price Each

Buyboard Discount

Extended Price

Price Total

Municipal Courts (Frank D. Wing) Building
Boiler - Quarterly Service

Price Each

Buyboard Discount

Extended Price

Price Total

Public Safety Headquarters (PSHQ)
Open Loop - Biweekly Service

Price Each

Buyboard Discount

Extended Price

Price Total

Public Safety Headquarters (PSHQ)
Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each

Buyboard Discount

Extended Price

Price Total

Traffic Building

Boiler - Quarterly Service
Price Each

Buyboard Discount
Extended Price

Price Total

Market Square

Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each

Buyboard Discount

Extended Price

Price Total

Market Square

Boiler - Quarterly Service
Price Each

Buyboard Discount
Extended Price

Price Total

Fire Training Academy

Closed Loop - Quarterly Service
Price Each

Buyboard Discount

Extended Price

Price Total

Fire Training Academy
Boiler - Quarterly Service
Price Each

Buyboard Discount
Extended Price

Price Total

Subtotal

26

26

$160.00
10.00%
$144.00
$3,744.00

No charge|

No charge

$160.00
10.00%
$144.00
$3,744.00,

No charge

$160.00|

10.00%
$144.00]
$576.00

$160.00!

10.00%
$144.00
$576.00]

No charge|

$160.00|

10.00%!

$144.00|
$576.00,

No charge

$15,840.00

Prepared by Purchasing 1/13/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 21, 2014 Non Local
For: Annual Contract for Water Treatment Services and
Chemicals for Various BESD Locations Chemsearch a Division of NCH Corporation
6100005330 JF 2727 Chemsearch Blvd.
Estimated |I™Ving,
Item Description Annual | TX 75062
Usage |972-438-0563
B Chemicals (excluding acid)
1 Chemsearch 8500MTP 120
Price per gallon $51.65
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $46.49
Price Total $5,578.80|
2 MB-215 30
Price per gallon $64.27|
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $57.84
Price Total $1,735.20|
3 Brommax 7.1 600
Price per pound $8.48
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $7.63
Price Total $4,578.00,
4 Handipak 22MT-BL 2
Price per Case (44 pounds per case) $1,564.24
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $1,407.82
Price Total $2,815.64
5 TowerChlor 2
Price per Case (20 pounds per case) $1,048.24
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $943.42
Price Total $1,886.84
6 AP Tech Durocide C100-G 1
Price per Case (10 pounds per case) $1,546.74
Buyboard Discount 10.00%!
Extended Price $1,392.07
Price Total $1,392.07
Subtotal $17,986.55)
Cc Hourly Rate for Labor Repairs
1 Standard Work Hours Labor Rate 10
Price Each $160.00
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00
Price Total $1,440.00
2 Overtime Work Hours Labor Rate 4
Price Each $160.00
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00
Price Total $576.00|
D Additional Locations Maintenance
1 Additional Location - Biweekly Service Rate 1
Price Each $160.00]
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00
Price Total $144.00
2 Additional Location - Quarterly Service Rate 1
Price Each $160.00
Buyboard Discount 10.00%
Extended Price $144.00
Price Total $144.00
Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $36,130.55
|Estlmated Annual Award $36,130.55

Prepared by Purchasing 1/13/2015
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