
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services
Bayer Health Care LLC
Animal Health Division

Butler Animal Health Supply, LLC
d/b/a Henry Schein Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply Zoetis Inc.

6100002941 VF
P.O. Box 390 400 Metro Place North 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 1481 County Road 357

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841

Dublin,
OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

1 Acepromazine Injectable 10mg/ml Vial 12
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Butler PVL Vedco No Bid
Product No. BS#003845 002433
Unit Price $14.88 $14.20
Price Total $178.56 $170.40

2 Acepromazine Tablets, 25 mg, 100 Tablets/Bottle 3
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Butler PVL Vedco No Bid
Product No. BS#003847 004761
Unit Price $32.40 $31.03
Price Total $97.20 $93.09

3 Advantage Multi for Cats, 2-5 lbs, 3 Tubes/Box 84
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8890342 8511 (Revolution)
Unit Price $25.73 $24.23
Price Total $2,161.32 $2,035.32

4 Advantage Multi for Cats, 6-9 lbs, 6 Tubes/Box 108
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8891438 8512 (Revolution)
Unit Price $56.73 $53.60
Price Total $6,126.84 $5,788.80

5 Advantage Multi for Cats, 10-18 lbs, 6 Tubes/Box 48
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8891446 8530 (Revolution)
Unit Price $57.56 $53.60
Price Total $2,762.88 $2,572.80

6 Albon Oral Suspension, 5%, 16oz Bottle 13
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8436
Unit Price $55.80
Price Total $725.40

7 Aminophylline Injectable 25x10ml Vial 40
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Capital Hospira No Bid
Product No. BS#004935 592101 033107
Unit Price $2.00 / $1.98** $2.00
Price Total $79.20 $80.00

8 Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services
Bayer Health Care LLC
Animal Health Division

Butler Animal Health Supply, LLC
d/b/a Henry Schein Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply Zoetis Inc.

6100002941 VF
P.O. Box 390 400 Metro Place North 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 1481 County Road 357

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841

Dublin,
OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

9 Amoxicillin Oral, 250mg, 100ml Bottle 10
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Westward Westward No Bid
Product No. BS#032869 143988915 037793
Unit Price $2.75 $2.76
Price Total $27.50 $27.60

10 Animax Ointment, 15ml Tube 11
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Dechra Dechra No Bid
Product No. BS#008901 122-15 015885
Unit Price $5.72 $5.94
Price Total $62.92 $65.34

11 Deleted 285

12 Aquacillin (Pen G Procaine), 250ml Bottle 25
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Butler PVL VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#022821 502021
Unit Price $7.39 $7.97
Price Total $184.75 $199.25

13 Azithromycin Oral, 200mg/5ml, 30ml Vial 35
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Butler PVL ABC No Bid
Product No. BS#043807 615740 900479
Unit Price $11.33 $84.06
Price Total $396.55 $2,942.10

14 Baytril Injectable, 20ml Vial 5
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid No Bid
Product No. 8713254
Unit Price $33.56
Price Total $167.80

15 Beuthanasia D - Special RX 100ml ORM-D C3N Bottle 50
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck No Bid
Product No. BS#001848 67906 011168
Unit Price $45.42 $53.45
Price Total $2,271.00 $2,672.50
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services
Bayer Health Care LLC
Animal Health Division

Butler Animal Health Supply, LLC
d/b/a Henry Schein Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply Zoetis Inc.

6100002941 VF
P.O. Box 390 400 Metro Place North 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 1481 County Road 357

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841

Dublin,
OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

16 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 25x1Dose 25,000
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No. BS#022339 65313 022346 4275 (Vanguard - B (1N)
Unit Price $51.74 (25x1ds) / $2.0696* $2.07 $2.23
Price Total $51,740.00 $51,750.00 $55,750.00

17 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 150x1Dose 25,000
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No. BS#022340 65315 022347 4275 (Vanguard - B (1N)
Unit Price $310.48 (150x1ds) / $2.07* / $2.049** $2.07 $2.23
Price Total $51,072.50 $51,750.00 $55,750.00

18 Butroject (Butorphanol) Injectable 10mg/ml, 50ml C4 Vial 62
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No. BS#029088 17070 017669 2210 (Torbutrol)
Unit Price $179.83 $179.84 $205.53
Price Total $11,149.46 $11,150.08 $12,742.86

19 Cerenia Injection, 20ml Vial 6
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8178
Unit Price $106.90
Price Total $641.40

20 Deleted

21 Deleted

22 Cestoved, 50ml Vial 3
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid Bimeda No Bid
Product No. 1PRA004 047216
Unit Price $300.00
Price Total $900.00

23 Chlor-Hex Q Scrub, 1 Gallon Jug 9
Name of Manufacturer No Bid First Priority Vedco No Bid

Product No. BS#030186 (Dermachlor 2% Scrub) 003605
Unit Price $17.53 $19.25
Price Total $157.77 $173.25

24 Chlorihexidine Solution, 1 Gallon Jug 15
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Vetoquinol VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#017890 501027
Unit Price $20.95 $6.84
Price Total $314.25 $102.60

25 Deleted

26 Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services
Bayer Health Care LLC
Animal Health Division

Butler Animal Health Supply, LLC
d/b/a Henry Schein Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply Zoetis Inc.

6100002941 VF
P.O. Box 390 400 Metro Place North 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 1481 County Road 357

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841

Dublin,
OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

27 Deleted

28 Deleted

29 Convenia 80mg/10ml, 10ml Vial 45
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 1520
Unit Price $245.20
Price Total $11,034.00

30 Nobivac 30-Rabies, 1 Dose (Rabies Vaccine) 50,000
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No. BS#011539 65448 017651 4996 (Defensor 3)
Unit Price $44.99 (50x1ds) / $0.8998* $0.90 $1.33
Price Total $44,990.00 $45,000.00 $66,500.00

31 Deleted

32 Deleted

33 Dexamethasone Injectable, 2mg/ml, 100ml Vial 8
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Bimeda VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#002459 501012
Unit Price $3.81 $3.97 
Price Total $30.48 $31.76

34 Deleted

35 Dextrose 50% Solution, 500ml Bottle 8
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Vedco VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#002460 501053
Unit Price $2.32 $2.20 
Price Total $18.56 $17.60

36 Diazepam Injectable 5mg CIV, 10ml, 5mg/ml Vial 8
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Hospira No Bid No Bid
Product No. BS#048000
Unit Price $19.16 
Price Total $153.28

37 Dolorex (Butorphanol) Injectable, 10mg/ml, 50 ml Vial 12
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No. BS#029088 17070 017669 2210 (Torbutrol)
Unit Price $179.83 $179.84 $205.53 
Price Total $2,157.96 $2,158.08 $2,466.36
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services
Bayer Health Care LLC
Animal Health Division

Butler Animal Health Supply, LLC
d/b/a Henry Schein Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply Zoetis Inc.

6100002941 VF
P.O. Box 390 400 Metro Place North 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 1481 County Road 357

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841

Dublin,
OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

38 Delete

39 Delete

40 Ephineprine MDV 1mg/ml, 30ml Vial 32
Name of Manufacturer No Bid IMS ABC No Bid
Product No. BS#044858 10108081 900714
Unit Price $6.96 $12.27 
Price Total $222.72 $392.64

41 Epi Otic Advanced Ear Cleaner, 8 oz Bottles 18
Name of Manufacturer Bayer DVM (12oz Bottle) Virbac Virbac No Bid
Product No. 815834439/T8 Keto Flush BS#031897 3108 028254
Unit Price $14.25 / $9.50* $9.60 $8.73 
Price Total $171.00 $172.80 $157.14

42 Fatal Plus Solution CII, 250ml Multiple Dose Vial 175
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Vortech Vortech No Bid
Product No. BS#035946 298937268 015198
Unit Price $54.79 $65.43 
Price Total $9,588.25 $11,450.25

43 Nobivac Feline 1-HCPCh, per Dose 15,000
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No. BS#006489 65266 007415 4310 (Felocell 4)
Unit Price $40.24 (25x1ds) / $1.6096* $1.61 $1.98 
Price Total $24,144.00 $24,150.00 $29,700.00

44 Deleted

45 Formalin Filled Jar, 120ml Jar 2
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Jorgensen Jorgensen No Bid
Product No. Not Provided J0552B 023048
Unit Price $12.29 (10pk) / $1.229* $11.72/10pk / $1.172*
Price Total $2.46 $2.34

46 Formalin Filled Jar, 60ml Jar 2
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Jorgensen Jorgensen No Bid
Product No. BS#022264 J0552C 025039
Unit Price $12.29 (10pk) / $1.229* $11.72/10pk / $1.172*
Price Total $2.46 $2.34

47 Gentamicin Solution, 100mg/ml, 100ml Vial 3
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Sparhawk VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#006913 510209
Unit Price $16.04 $15.87 
Price Total $48.12 $47.61
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: June 7, 2013
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Butler Animal Health Supply, LLC
d/b/a Henry Schein Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply Zoetis Inc.
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Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841
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OH 43017
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ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

48 Heparin, 30ml Vial 10
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Sagent Sagen No Bid
Product No. BS#040980 25021040030 038325
Unit Price $8.25 $8.45 
Price Total $82.50 $84.50

49 Hydrogen Peroxide 3%, Gallon 22
Name of Manufacturer No Bid First Priority VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#002522 510105
Unit Price $3.31 $3.86 
Price Total $72.82 $84.92

50 Isoflourane WVS 250ml ORM-D Bottle (Isothesia) 180
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Abbott Abbott No Bid
Product No. BS#029405 52600405 018627
Unit Price $19.28 $31.97 
Price Total $3,470.40 $5,754.60

51 Iverhart Max, 6-12 lbs, 6 Count Card 160
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Virbac Virbac No Bid
Product No. BS#035343 0196-DT00 036101
Unit Price $160.66/10x6 dose / $16.06* $12.66 
Price Total $2,570.56 $2,025.60

52 Iverhart Max, 13-25 lbs, 6 Count Card 180
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Virbac Virbac No Bid
Product No. BS#035344 0196-DS00 030277
Unit Price $162.69/10x6 dose / $16.269* $12.66 
Price Total $2,928.42 $2,278.80

53 Iverhart Max, 26-50 lbs, 6 Count Card 200
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Virbac Virbac No Bid
Product No. BS#035345 0196-DM00 030278
Unit Price $210.43/10x6 dose / $21.043* $17.45 
Price Total $4,208.60 $3,490.00

54 Iverhart Max, 50-100 lbs, 6 Count Card 280
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Virbac Virbac No Bid
Product No. BS#035346 0196-DL00 030275
Unit Price $259.89/10x6 dose / $25.989* $23.00 
Price Total $7,276.92 $6,440.00

55 Lactated Ringers Solution, 1000ml Bag 156
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Hospira Hospira No Bid
Product No. BS#009851 795309 003953
Unit Price $1.42 $1.32 
Price Total $221.52 $206.18
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: June 7, 2013
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Bayer Health Care LLC
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Butler Animal Health Supply, LLC
d/b/a Henry Schein Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply Zoetis Inc.

6100002941 VF
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Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841

Dublin,
OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

56 K9 Advantix II, Small Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 50
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid No Bid
Product No. 4458463
Unit Price $699.84/carton
Price Total $34,992.00

57 K9 Advantix II, Medium Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 100
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid No Bid
Product No. 4461618
Unit Price $700.08/carton
Price Total $70,008.00

58 K9 Advantix II, Large Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 100
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid No Bid
Product No. 4461634
Unit Price $716.64/carton
Price Total $71,664.00

59 K9 Advantix II, Extra Large Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 50
Name of Manufacturer Bayer No Bid No Bid No Bid
Product No. 4461650
Unit Price $733.80/carton
Price Total $36,690.00

60 Ketocanazole Tablets, 200mg, 100 Count Bottle 6
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Taro Phama Taro No Bid
Product No. BS#034972 4026-01 035211
Unit Price $17.09 $15.23 
Price Total $102.54 $91.38

61 Ketaved (Ketamine) 100mg/ml, 10ml C3N Vial 1,575
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Vedco Vedco Zoetis
Product No. BS#036911 047799 2040 Ketaset CIII
Unit Price $5.68 $5.16 $11.10 
Price Total $8,946.00 $8,127.00 $17,482.50

62 Marcaine (Bupivacine) MDV 0.5%, 50ml Vial 40
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Capital Hospira No Bid
Product No. BS#020600 161050 029545
Unit Price $5.32 $3.16 
Price Total $212.80 $126.40

Page 7 of 20



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
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Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
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OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

63 Metacam Injectable 10ml, 5mg/ml Vial 65 NAS
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Norbrook (Loxicom Inj 10ml) Boehringer No Bid
Product No. BS#045320 601511000 022642
Unit Price $83.76 $15.30 
Price Total $5,444.40 $994.50

64 Metronidazole Tablets 250mg, 250 Count Bottle 16
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Watson Teva No Bid
Product No. BS#043213 50111033306 040977
Unit Price $45.83 $54.01 
Price Total $733.28 $864.16

65 Metronidazole Tablets 500mg, 500 Count Bottle 16
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Watson Teva No Bid
Product No. BS#043026 50111033402 040201
Unit Price $182.14 $191.36 
Price Total $2,914.24 $3,061.76

66 Neomycin Polymyxin B, Bacitracin Ointment, 3.5gm Tube 80
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Butler No Bid No Bid
Product No. BS#039750
Unit Price $8.67 
Price Total $693.60

67 Panacur Suspension, 1000ml Vial 15
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck No Bid
Product No. BS#001555 69267 006634
Unit Price $105.09 $105.10 
Price Total $1,576.35 $1,576.50

68 Panacur Granules, 22.2% Strength, 1lb Tub 5
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck No Bid
Product No. BS#001557 69269 005284
Unit Price $252.34 $308.76 
Price Total $1,261.70 $1,543.80

69 Prednisone, 5mg, 1000 Count Bottle 10
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid Roxanne No Bid
Product No. 54472831 047429
Unit Price $18.56 
Price Total $185.60

70 Deleted
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Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841
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OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

71 Primor Tablets 120mg, 100 Count Bottle 4
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8438
Unit Price $28.70 
Price Total $114.80

72 Primor Tablets, 240mg, 100 Count Bottle 2
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8440
Unit Price $50.75 
Price Total $101.50

73 Deleted
 

74 Deleted

75 Deleted 9

76 Deleted 8

77 Rimadyl Injectable, 50ml/mg, 20ml Vial 360
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Pfizer Zoetis Zoetis
Product No. BS#024751 8507 026357 8507
Unit Price $101.42 $92.20 $85.10 
Price Total $36,511.20 $33,192.00 $30,636.00

78 Deleted 15

79 Deleted 10

80 Tattoo Ink, Green, 1 Ounce Tube 5
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Jorgensen Jorgensen No Bid
Product No. BS#003061 (2 oz Roll On) J0276PGS 027640
Unit Price $4.20 $5.06 
Price Total $21.00 $25.30

81 Terramycin Ointment, 1/8 Ounce Tube, 12 Tubes/Box 23
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 7995
Unit Price $10.20 
Price Total $2,815.20

82 Deleted 10

83 Tramadol 50mg, 500 Count Bottle 5
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Amneal Amnea No Bid
Product No. BS#034947 65162-0627 030938
Unit Price $7.56 $8.16 
Price Total $37.80 $40.80

Page 9 of 20
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Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201-0390
913-268-2841
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OH 43017
800-282-5162 x5532

Boise,
ID 83705
208-955-9547

Adkins,
TX 78101
210-286-2156

84 Nobivac Canine 1-DAPPv, per Dose 30,000
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No. BS#011276 65288 010626 5303 (Vanguard Plus 5)
Unit Price $49.74/25x1dose / $1.989* $1.99 $1.92 
Price Total $59,688.00 $59,700.00 $57,600.00

85 Vitamin B-12, 100ml, 5000mcg/ml Vial 3
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Neogen VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#005554 09088-18 502052
Unit Price $11.63 $11.34 
Price Total $34.89 $34.02

86 Vitamin K-1 Injectable, 100ml, 100mg/ml Vial 2
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Bimeda VetOne No Bid
Product No. BS#004355 501051
Unit Price $7.82 $8.03 
Price Total $15.64 $16.06

87 Vitamin K-1 Capsules 25mg, 50 Count Bottle 1
Name of Manufacturer No Bid Butler Bimeda No Bid
Product No. BS#005793 031265
Unit Price $7.65 $6.90 
Price Total $7.65 $6.90

88 Deleted

89 Zenequin 25mg, 100 Count Bottle 7
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8485
Unit Price $106.05 
Price Total $742.35

90 Zenequin 100mg, 50 Count Bottle 8
Name of Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid Zoetis
Product No. 8490
Unit Price $184.05 
Price Total $1,472.40

Payment Terms Net 30 1% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total
Estimated Annual Award $213,521.80 $214,752.07 $24,505.01 $116,279.97
*Prices adjusted for evaluation purposes.
**Prices reflect application of prompt payment discount.
Deleted Items: 8, 11, 20, 21, 25, 26, 27, 28, 31, 32, 34, 38, 39, 44, 70, 73, 74, 75, 76, 78, 79, 82, and 88 will be rebid at a later date.
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity
1 Acepromazine Injectable 10mg/ml Vial 12

Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

2 Acepromazine Tablets, 25 mg, 100 Tablets/Bottle 3
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

3 Advantage Multi for Cats, 2-5 lbs, 3 Tubes/Box 84
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

4 Advantage Multi for Cats, 6-9 lbs, 6 Tubes/Box 108
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

5 Advantage Multi for Cats, 10-18 lbs, 6 Tubes/Box 48
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

6 Albon Oral Suspension, 5%, 16oz Bottle 13
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

7 Aminophylline Injectable 25x10ml Vial 40
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

8 Deleted

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

NAS NAS
No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid

VEDC207
$15.50

$186.00

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
VEDC189

$33.75
$101.25

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid Hospira No Bid No Bid
409592101

$2.50
$100.00

Page 11 of 20



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity
9 Amoxicillin Oral, 250mg, 100ml Bottle 10

Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

10 Animax Ointment, 15ml Tube 11
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

11 Deleted 285

12 Aquacillin (Pen G Procaine), 250ml Bottle 25
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

13 Azithromycin Oral, 200mg/5ml, 30ml Vial 35
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

14 Baytril Injectable, 20ml Vial 5
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

15 Beuthanasia D - Special RX 100ml ORM-D C3N Bottle 50
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

No Bid Top RX No Bid No Bid
00143988901

$2.43
$24.30

No Bid Dechra No Bid No Bid
1703312215

$5.94
$65.34

No Bid Clipper No Bid No Bid
PHO5731948506

$9.32
$233.00

No Bid Bloodworth No Bid No Bid
00093202631

$10.78
$377.30

No Bid Bayer No Bid No Bid
08713254-186599

$33.56
$167.80

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
067906 00061047305
$45.43 $44.11

$2,271.50 $2,205.50
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity
16 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 25x1Dose 25,000

Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

17 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 150x1Dose 25,000
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

18 Butroject (Butorphanol) Injectable 10mg/ml, 50ml C4 Vial 62
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

19 Cerenia Injection, 20ml Vial 6
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

20 Deleted

21 Deleted

22 Cestoved, 50ml Vial 3
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

23 Chlor-Hex Q Scrub, 1 Gallon Jug 9
Name of Manufacturer

Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

24 Chlorihexidine Solution, 1 Gallon Jug 15
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

25 Deleted

26 Deleted

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
065316 065316

$2.07 $2.07
$51,750.00 $51,750.00

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
065315 065315

$2.07 $2.07
$51,750.00 $51,750.00

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
017070 57926072250
$179.84 $161.85

$11,150.08 $10,034.70

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid IVAX No Bid No Bid
600135-11

$300.00
$900.00

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid

VINV-CLOR-SCRB
$20.93

$188.37

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
VINV-CLOR-SOLN

$6.82
$102.30
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

27 Deleted

28 Deleted

29 Convenia 80mg/10ml, 10ml Vial 45
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

30 Nobivac 30-Rabies, 1 Dose (Rabies Vaccine) 50,000
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

31 Deleted

32 Deleted

33 Dexamethasone Injectable, 2mg/ml, 100ml Vial 8
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

34 Deleted

35 Dextrose 50% Solution, 500ml Bottle 8
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

36 Diazepam Injectable 5mg CIV, 10ml, 5mg/ml Vial 8
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

37 Dolorex (Butorphanol) Injectable, 10mg/ml, 50 ml Vial 12
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
065448 065448

$0.90 $0.90
$45,000.00 $45,000.00

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
D295304000

$4.07 
$32.56

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
VINV-DEXT-Roun

$2.44 
$19.52

No Bid Abbott No Bid No Bid
00409321312

$4.75 
$38.00

No Bid Intervet No Bid No Bid
57926072250

$161.85 
$1,942.20
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

38 Delete

39 Delete

40 Ephineprine MDV 1mg/ml, 30ml Vial 32
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

41 Epi Otic Advanced Ear Cleaner, 8 oz Bottles 18
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

42 Fatal Plus Solution CII, 250ml Multiple Dose Vial 175
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

43 Nobivac Feline 1-HCPCh, per Dose 15,000
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

44 Deleted

45 Formalin Filled Jar, 120ml Jar 2
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

46 Formalin Filled Jar, 60ml Jar 2
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

47 Gentamicin Solution, 100mg/ml, 100ml Vial 3
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

No Bid McKesson No Bid No Bid
76329906100

$10.73 
$343.36

Intervet/Merck Virbac No Bid No Bid
058675 (215g. Bottle) 003108

$149.91 / $158.13* $8.73 
$2,846.43 $157.14

No Bid Vortech No Bid No Bid
00298937368

$63.95 
$11,191.25

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
065266 065266

$1.61 $1.61 
$24,150.00 $24,150.00

No Bid Jorgensen No Bid No Bid
JO552C

$12.75 (10pk) / $1.275*
$2.55

No Bid Jorgensen No Bid No Bid
JO552B

$12.75 (10pk) / $1.275*
$2.55

No Bid Phoenix No Bid No Bid
PHO5731928605

$17.55 
$52.65
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity
48 Heparin, 30ml Vial 10

Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

49 Hydrogen Peroxide 3%, Gallon 22
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

50 Isoflourane WVS 250ml ORM-D Bottle (Isothesia) 180
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

51 Iverhart Max, 6-12 lbs, 6 Count Card 160
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

52 Iverhart Max, 13-25 lbs, 6 Count Card 180
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

53 Iverhart Max, 26-50 lbs, 6 Count Card 200
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

54 Iverhart Max, 50-100 lbs, 6 Count Card 280
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

55 Lactated Ringers Solution, 1000ml Bag 156
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

No Bid Sagent Pharm No Bid No Bid
25021040030

$8.15 
$81.50

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
VINV-PERX-GALS

$3.75 
$82.50

No Bid Piramel No Bid No Bid
6679401325

$22.95 
$4,131.00

NAS NAS
Intervet/Merck Virbac No Bid Zoetis

052716 (TriHeart Plus) 0196DT 8513 (Revolution)
$10.35 $126.50 (10x6 dose) / $12.65* $55.30 

$1,656.00 $2,024.00 $8,848.00

NAS NAS
Intervet/Merck Virbac No Bid Zoetis

052716 (TriHeart Plus) 0196DS 8514 (Revolution)
$10.35 $126.60 (10x6 dose) / $12.66* $56.40 

$1,863.00 $2,278.80 $10,152.00

NAS NAS
Intervet/Merck Virbac No Bid Zoetis

049636 (TriHeart Plus) 0196DM 8515 (Revolution)
$13.91 $174.47 (10x6 dose) / $17.447* $59.95 

$2,782.00 $3,489.40 $11,990.00

NAS NAS
Intervet/Merck Virbac No Bid Zoetis

073919 (TriHeart Plus) 0196DL 8516 (Revolution)
$18.12 $230.00 (10x6 dose) / $23.00* $61.35 

$5,073.60 $6,440.00 $17,178.00

No Bid Hospira No Bid No Bid
00409795309

$18.90/12 bags / $1.575*
$245.70
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

56 K9 Advantix II, Small Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 50
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

57 K9 Advantix II, Medium Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 100
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

58 K9 Advantix II, Large Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 100
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

59 K9 Advantix II, Extra Large Dog, 72 Doses/Carton 50
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

60 Ketocanazole Tablets, 200mg, 100 Count Bottle 6
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

61 Ketaved (Ketamine) 100mg/ml, 10ml C3N Vial 1,575
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

62 Marcaine (Bupivacine) MDV 0.5%, 50ml Vial 40
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

NAS NAS
Intervet/Merck No Bid Intervet Zoetis

111632 (Activyl Tick Plus) 111632 (Activyl Tick Plus) 8513 (Revolution)
$7.10/dose / $511.20* $265.15/36 / $530.30* $55.30/ 6 dose / $663.60*

$25,560.00 $26,515.00 $33,180.00

NAS NAS
Intervet/Merck No Bid Intervet Zoetis

104721 (Activyl Tick Plus) 104721 8514 (Revolution)
$7.12/dose / $512.64* $266.05/36 / $532.10* $56.40/6 dose / $676.80*

$51,264.00 $53,210.00 $67,680.00

NAS
Intervet/Merck No Bid Intervet Zoetis

108760 (Activyl Tick Plus) 108760 8515 (Revolution)
$7.27/dose / $523.44* $271.58/36 / $543.16* $59.95/6dose / $719.40*

$52,344.00 $54,316.00 $71,940.00

NAS
Intervet/Merck No Bid Intervet Zoetis

117105 (Activyl Tick Plus) 117105 8516 (Revolution)
$7.44/dose / $535.68* $278.10/36 / $556.20* $61.35/6 dose / $736.20*

$26,784.00 $27,810.00 $36,810.00

No Bid Taro Phama No Bid No Bid
51672402601

$16.07 
$96.42

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
5098916106

$5.69 
$8,961.75

No Bid Hospira No Bid No Bid
0409161050

$3.00 
$120.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

63 Metacam Injectable 10ml, 5mg/ml Vial 65
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

64 Metronidazole Tablets 250mg, 250 Count Bottle 16
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

65 Metronidazole Tablets 500mg, 500 Count Bottle 16
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

66 Neomycin Polymyxin B, Bacitracin Ointment, 3.5gm Tube 80
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

67 Panacur Suspension, 1000ml Vial 15
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

68 Panacur Granules, 22.2% Strength, 1lb Tub 5
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

69 Prednisone, 5mg, 1000 Count Bottle 10
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

70 Deleted

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

No Bid Norbrook No Bid No Bid
VIN-LOXI-10ML

$83.76 
$5,444.40

No Bid Teva No Bid No Bid
50111033306

$51.19 
$819.04

No Bid Teva No Bid No Bid
50111033402

$189.65 
$3,034.40

No Bid Akorn No Bid No Bid
17478023535

$8.47 
$677.60

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
069267 069267
$105.10 $105.10 

$1,576.50 $1,576.50

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
069269 069269
$252.35 $252.35 

$1,261.75 $1,261.75

No Bid Bloodworth No Bid No Bid
0054472831

$36.99 
$369.90
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity

71 Primor Tablets 120mg, 100 Count Bottle 4
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

72 Primor Tablets, 240mg, 100 Count Bottle 2
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

73 Deleted

74 Deleted

75 Deleted 9

76 Deleted 8

77 Rimadyl Injectable, 50ml/mg, 20ml Vial 360
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

78 Deleted 15

79 Deleted 10

80 Tattoo Ink, Green, 1 Ounce Tube 5
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

81 Terramycin Ointment, 1/8 Ounce Tube, 12 Tubes/Box 23
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

82 Deleted 10

83 Tramadol 50mg, 500 Count Bottle 5
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid Pfizer No Bid No Bid
8507

$85.10 
$30,636.00

No Bid Jorgensen No Bid No Bid
JO276PGS

$5.50 
$27.50

No Bid Pfizer No Bid No Bid
7995

$12.00 
$3,312.00

No Bid Bloodworth No Bid No Bid
65162062750

$11.10 
$55.50
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 7, 2013
For: Veterinarian Vaccines and Pharmaceuticals for Animal Care 

Services

6100002941 VF

Item Description
Est. Annual

Quantity
84 Nobivac Canine 1-DAPPv, per Dose 30,000

Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

85 Vitamin B-12, 100ml, 5000mcg/ml Vial 3
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

86 Vitamin K-1 Injectable, 100ml, 100mg/ml Vial 2
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

87 Vitamin K-1 Capsules 25mg, 50 Count Bottle 1
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

88 Deleted

89 Zenequin 25mg, 100 Count Bottle 7
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

90 Zenequin 100mg, 50 Count Bottle 8
Name of Manufacturer
Product No.
Unit Price
Price Total

Payment Terms

Estimated Annual Total
Estimated Annual Award
*Prices adjusted for evaluation purposes.
**Prices reflect application of prompt payment discount.
Deleted Items: 8, 11, 20, 21, 25, 26, 27, 28, 31, 32, 34, 38, 39, 44, 70, 73, 7

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL Alternate Alternate

Intervet Inc.,
d/b/a Merck Animal Health

Patterson Veterinary Patterson Veterinary Zoetis Inc.

29160 Intervet Ln 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 103 1481 County Road 357

Miusboro,
DE  19966

San Antonio,
TX 78247

San Antonio,
TX 78247

Adkins,
TX 78101

Intervet/Merck Intervet No Bid No Bid
065288 065288

$1.99 $1.99 
$59,700.00 $59,700.00

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
5098955812

$12.08 
$36.24

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
5098921412

$10.29 
$20.58

No Bid Vedco No Bid No Bid
5098992249

$8.37 
$8.37

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Net 30 1% 10 Days 1% 10 Days Net 30
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